
Engaging with a healthy tourism “offer”: strategies to improve place 
perceptions 
 
Abstract 
Purpose – The purpose of this paper is to explore how engagement with a healthy 
tourism “offer”could improve place perceptions through the development of 
collaborative strategies to promote a wellbeing destination. 
Design/methodology/approach – This paper takes a constructivist grounded 
theory approach drawing on semi-structured interviews conducted with local 
members of council from public health and tourism teams, in a seaside town in the 
South of England. 
Findings – Study findings indicate that the historical roots of the town’s creation 
have a bearing on current planning challenges and strategies. Findings confirm that 
collaborative strategies to engagewith a healthy tourism “offer” will improve place 
perceptions and promote a wellbeing destination. 
Implications The paper concludes that strategies to engage with a healthy tourism 
offer include interventions to curb alcohol consumption, regenerate areas, and 
promote eudaimonic wellbeing –which could ultimately improve place perceptions. 
Originality/value - This paper proposes that the development of a strategic alliances 
bridged through the construct of wellbeing could improve place perceptions and 
promote a wellbeing destination. 
Keywords Public health, tourism, wellbeing, grounded theory, place, south of 
England 
Paper type Research paper 

 

Introduction 
 
Researchers posit that there is an increasing focus on promoting health and 
wellbeing which is reflected in both tourism and public health government planning 
agendas (Daniel et al.2012; McCabe et al. 2010; Fayers and Machin 2007; 
Skevington et al. 2004). It is further offered that tourism and public health planning 
and practice are currently moving towards a new paradigm that considers overall 
societal health rooted in the wellbeing of individuals and communities. (Hair et al. 
2010; Local Government Improvement and Development 2010). 
 
These trends in thinking about tourism and public health offer opportunities for 
synergies in local development and planning. Within this context, there is an 
opportunity to develop a community culture that supports health creation and also 
presents a rebranding opportunity within the destination management approach. 
The tourism and travel industry are argued to play an important role in enhancing 
societal wellbeing and improving quality of life and ultimately creating healthier 
communities (Wise and Perić 2016; Munthe 2008). The role of tourism policy is to 
develop a socio-economic environment enabling the sector to sustainably prosper 
(Ritchie and Crouch 2003), while the diversity within the tourism industry presents 
opportunities for synergies with public health. To date, the potential for tourism and 
public health to cooperate in cultivating public wellbeing has not been assessed. This 
study aims to critically evaluate the potential for a strategic alliance between tourism, 
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public health and wellbeing at the destination level, in order to improve place 
perceptions and present rebranding opportunities. 
 
Through the lens of the eudaimonic approach to wellbeing, there lies an opportunity 
to promote sustainable, healthy lifestyles across the UK. The pairing of wellbeing 
(public health) and tourism as a strategic alliance presents a theoretical gap and 
area and thus, an area for research inquiry. Currently, the direct annual healthcare 
costs of physical inactivity in the UK are ￡1.6 billion, with an additional impact on 
the economy of ￡8 billion in indirect costs (which refers to the economic value of 
healthy lives lost to premature immortality). In the UK, nearly half the population fail 
to meet physical activity targets, where physical inactivity is responsible for 
approximately 17% of all deaths in the UK. It is estimated that interventions targeting 
one fifth of Britons that are currently inactive may achieve economic benefits valuing 
￡2.4 billion (ISCA/Cebr 2015). 
 
Defining the term ‘wellbeing’ 
 
Eudaimonic theorising emerged originally as a challenge to subjective wellbeing with 
its focus oncontentment, feeling good and life satisfaction (Bryant and Veroff 1982; 
Andrews and Withey 1976). Eudaimonic wellbeing theory (EWB) denotes the quality 
of life a person derives from fulfilment of their goals to reach their greatest potential 
(Waterman 2008;Sheldon 2002). Eudaimonic wellbeing is proposed to have 
emerged to accompany and diverge from subjective wellbeing as a means of 
studying and understanding quality of life (Kashdan et al. 2008; Ryan et al. 2008). 
Moreover, there are some researchers that use EWB synonymously with positive 
psychological functioning (Seligman 1999). Eudaimonic theories of wellbeing affirm 
the significance of achieving a person’s full potential through engagement in 
meaningful activities (Steger et al. 2008). Studies indicate that eudaimonic 
behaviours are more strongly related to wellbeing than hedonic behaviours (Steger 
et al. 2008). This paper therefore approaches wellbeing from the eudaimonic 
perspective as a means of promoting a tourism destination product that nurtures a 
greater quality and quantity of life. 
 
Methodological approach 
 
The findings presented within this paper are drawn from a wider study which 
evaluated the potential for synergies between wellbeing, public health and tourism at 
a coastal destination. This paper focuses on the most widely discussed strategies for 
intradepartmental synergies, in the context of place, or the coastal environment. The 
study was conducted between September and December 2013 in a town in the 
south of England, in a county with 142 kilometres of coastline. 
 
A constructive grounded theory approach was used in the development of this study. 
A purposive sample of sixteen participants was recruited from public health and 
tourism departments in the local authority (8 from each team). The aim of the 
interviews was to understand the meanings participants associated with wellbeing 
and explore how wellbeing may be operationalised in collaborative public health and 
tourism planning agendas. 
 



Data collection and analysis was conducted simultaneously, where interviews were 
coded as soon as they were transcribed. All study data was coded using an 
organising scheme (coding paradigm) that focused on: the conditions, the 
circumstances and situations that form the structure of the studied phenomenon; 
actions/interactions, participants routine or strategic responses to issues, events or 
problems; and consequences; the outcomes of the studied actions and interactions. 
Finding ways of engaging with a healthy tourism “offer” emerged as the core 
category, the context of place category, explored in this paper, highlights the 
influence of place on the core category. 
 
Findings 
 
Four main themes emerged from interview data – understanding place through 
health and tourism roots, a healthy offer for locals and for tourists, reshaping the 
public space and using wellbeing to define the destination. Study evidence is 
evaluated within this section alongside key theoretical constructs drawn from the 
literature in order to explain the range of perceptions held about the town and the 
strategies identified to develop a wellbeing destination. 
 
Understanding place through health and tourism roots 
 
 
As noted by Nunn (1906), since the 1870s the town had gained itself a reputation of 
being a health resort. Walton (1981) suggests a connection between the Victorian 
growth of seaside resorts and the white collar demand for health-related recreation 
opportunities. Participants within the study recognised the historical connections of 
the town with health and wellbeing: 
 
“There were a lot of pine trees, so it was seen as a very good place for people with 
breathing difficulties. So a lot of spas and hotels grew up to accommodate the 
people who were travelling to be down by the sea and have a break from the hectic 
life that was London, and that was the beginning of the tourism industry”. 
 
Other participants also identified the role of the pine trees and the associated 
benefits, with the town’s tourism growth and development: 
 
“The town grew up as a tourist place, but one of the main things was 
health…and that doctor who visited the pine trees”. 
 
The early development of seaside towns was due to the eighteenth century medical 
professionals advising their patients to visit seaside resorts for their health benefits 
(Gilbert 1939). The town’s medical officer connected pine trees to being a wind 
screen for aseptic respiration, providing a health influence to the town’s climate. 
From this perspective, visiting and bathing was not seen as a pleasure but, a 
medicinal bath. Gilbert (1939) argues that many places flourished as resorts as a 
result of them being selected by court doctors as places where royals may improve 
their health. 
 
Historical research similarly reveals that the town had, since the 1870’s gained itself 
a reputation of being a health resort (Nunn 1906). Historical research supports the 



connection between the Victorian growth of the seaside resorts and the white collar 
demand for health related recreation opportunities (Walton 1981). It is also put 
forward, however, that from an early stage, railways ran cheap trips to the south of 
England, opening up seaside travel to the masses (Gilbert 1939). Historical research 
suggests that the working-class seaside holiday diversified demands for leisure 
activities, attracting tourists who sought pleasures from the beach as well as the beer 
house (Walton 1974). 
 
Role of tourism 
 
Tourism was identified as being central to the town’s identity. Participants from both 
public health and tourism teams recognise that it’s “a huge part of the town”, “a shop 
window to the world”, and “one of the market leading seaside resorts in the country”. 
Study evidence highlights the pivotal role of tourism in the town, suggesting its 
impact on council business, by virtue of the strength of the tourist economy. 
Participants from both public health and tourism teams acknowledge the impacts of 
the tourism industry: 
 
“For a town our size, we punch a little above our weight because we have a 
long coastal strip that attracts people in”. 
 
“It’s a town that doubles in size in the summer…how on earth does the 
infrastructure cope with that?” 
 
Linked to the impacts of tourism, past literature contends that economic benefits of 
tourism can be eroded when tourists negatively impact daily patterns of life (Ryan et 
al 1998; Doxey 1975). Additionally, it is suggested that residents’ perceptions of 
tourism impacts and their support, are linked to the destination’s stage within the 
destination lifecycle (Gursoy et al. 2009). If the destination is in the stagnation phase 
of the tourism lifecycle, then there are more negative attitudes to both tourism and 
tourists (Butler 1989). 
 
In the past, host perceptions of tourism have focused on the economic impacts 
(Walpole and Goodwin 2000; Li 1987). This is similar to some of the participants’ 
views about the connections between the tourism industry and greater infrastructure 
and service developments. The exploration of social dimensions, a more recent 
research focus, predominantly employs the social exchange theory to investigate the 
topic (Gursoy and Rutherford 2004). The social exchange theory is guided by the 
principle that more people are likely to participate in a social exchange when they 
perceive that they will accrue benefits without any unacceptable costs (Allen et al. 
1993). Participants revealed a wide range of perceptions held about the town 
ranging from it being one of the happiest places to it being full of out of control 
teenagers. During interviews, many participants mentioned their perceptions about 
the town in relation to levels of happiness: 
 
“I think the town is one of the happiest places to live officially”. 
 
From another perspective, selected study evidence reveals some of the negative 
views that have been associated with the town: 
 



 “You know people around the country may have perhaps a slightly negative 
view of what [the town] is…a bit sort of old fashioned, a bit like a Victorian lady in a 
crinoline skirt or some people may have a view that it’s all about nightclubs and 
teenagers out of control, that kind of stuff”. 
 
Findings are consistent with current literature which confirms that the considerable 
expansion of the ‘night-time’ economy in British cities and towns (Roberts and Turner 
2005; Hobbs et al. 2003), relaxed liquor licensing laws (Elvins and Hadfield 2003) on 
UK high streets targeting 18-24 year olds (Mintel 2004) have impacted the public 
space on the street at night (Roberts 2006). While local councils may be criticised for 
allowing such expansion, it could be argued that permissive attitudes were based on 
the desire to promote urban regeneration in ailing town centres (Roberts 2006). 
 
Participants also identified some of the negative place perceptions held regarding 
areas of deprivation: 
 
 “Because some of the areas they are tackling around drug dependency and 
alcohol have quite a negative impact on how people view [area of deprivation] and 
might keep people away.” 
 
“You wouldn’t get tourists in areas of deprivations…you might, if you make it a 
nicer place to be”. 
 
Healthy offer for locals and tourists 
 
In an effort to reduce the negative perceptions held by the host community, 
participants recognised the important role of locals in shaping the destination 
offerings. Many participants acknowledged how the majority of seafront use is by 
local residents:  
 
“Our guaranteed seafront users year round, it’s the residents and even in the 
height of the summer…nearly 60% of our beaches is our residents, so if you get the 
offer right for the residents then the tourism offer sort of follows behind”. 
 
“Because it’s a destination, it’s by the sea, it is a recreational destination, they 
have a lot of wellbeing activities…if you look at the usage on the beach, it tends to 
be lots of local people that do it, it’s not just people coming in”. 
 
Recreation and tourism have been identified as agents of change in landscape 
development (Palang et al 2005; van der Vaart 2003), further suggesting that 
resident place relations and their needs are equally important considerations to 
those of the tourists (Klanika et al. 2006). Thus, one of the strategies identified to 
improve the local perceptions of tourism, is to involve residents in the tourism 
planning process to determine the overlapping demands and expectations of locals 
and tourists. 
 
Reshaping the public space 
 
Several participants recognised opportunities to reshape the public space and 
potentially rebrand the destination to promote a healthier tourism “offer”. 



 
“If you are thinking about defining your future tourism offer, what’s different 
about the town, how are they going to shape that? How are they going to sharpen it? 
They could really start to differentiate that tourism offer and link it more strongly to 
wellbeing”. 
 
The concept of ‘arts-led’ regeneration has been explored in places like Glasgow, 
Barcelona and Bilbao as a means to utilising cultural initiatives as catalysts for urban 
regeneration (Garcίa 2004). Further, it is recommended that if a cultural project is 
going to lead regeneration efforts it requires strong destination brand (Tibbot 2002). 
Participants with the public health team in particular, recognise the potential of arts-
led initiatives within one of the town’s areas of deprivation: 
 
“That’s where we are going to be trying to raise the level of wellbeing in that 
area, which could raise the level of the whole area up”. 
 
“People will hopefully view [area of town] as the type of place to come if you 
are a bit arty and creative and go along and see all this interesting art….and start to 
turn it into a quirky artsy kind of place…it creates a unique feel to it”. 
 
Wellbeing defining the destination 
 
In exploring areas for departmental synergies and rebranding, participants identified 
their perspectives about the town as a wellbeing destination: 
 
“Its creation was really based on wellbeing because the first house that was 
built in town was so people could get out of smoky London, and come down and 
enjoy the fresh healthy sea air. So it started off being a wellbeing destination and I 
think there is a need to have an investment, to make wellbeing be more of a 
wellbeing product” “For the destination, we’ve always said that it’s about the 
prosperity, about a prosperous healthy destination, that isn’t just about economic 
health, but wider considerations, like is it contributing to people’s happiness and 
wellbeing?”. 
 
Reflecting on the role of the coastal environment, participants connected 
experiences in the natural environment with the promotion of happiness and 
wellbeing. Similarly, Kyle and colleagues (2004), contend that people search for 
environments to recuperate from stressful aspects of their lives and that people have 
a greater sense of attachment to places which provide a means to escaping from 
daily pressures. Additionally, Ulrich (1983) suggests that nature may permit 
psychophysiological stress recovery through responses to natural environment 
attributes which include spatial openness and water features. 
 
Conclusion 
 
Study evidence highlighted how the historical roots of the town’s creation have a 
bearing on current perceptions, planning challenges and strategies, as the area was 
originally popularised for both its seaside health benefits and also for its beer 
houses. Currently, while there is an interest in promoting a healthier or wellbeing 
tourism destination, there remains a thriving night-time economy which features 



excessive alcohol consumption. Similarly, study evidence highlights the diversity of 
perceptions that are held about the area which range from the “happiest place in the 
UK” through to one that is “all about nightclubs and teenagers out of control”. 
Furthermore, the study findings acknowledge that areas of deprivation and the 
associated negative health behaviours have a negative impact on place perceptions 
and the local tourism industry. Thus, one of the area of potential synergy between 
public health and tourism may be around interventions to curb alcohol consumption 
and regenerate areas. Participants from local public health and tourism teams 
underscored the significant role of the natural seaside environment, in promoting 
wellbeing. In understanding the host community expectations of tourism, locals could 
be engaged in the tourism planning process, further assessing the intersections of 
local and tourist expectations. Furthermore, this strategy could bridge collaboration 
between public health and tourism local departments. The health benefits of 
experiencing the natural environment provides an avenue for co-located wellbeing 
interventions that benefit residents and tourists alike. In building a healthier tourism 
strategy, both public health and tourism teams may be interested in the reduction of 
binge drinking, regeneration and the promotion of alternative forms of tourism 
product. For example, arts-led regeneration efforts may address the public health 
agenda issues, while presenting a destination branding opportunity through the 
reshaping of place. The engagement with a healthy tourism “offer” at the destination 
level, provides an opportunity to alter place perceptions through intradepartmental 
strategies, which promote wellbeing as a destination. 
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