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Management of Chronic Non-malignant Pain in Nursing Homes
Residents

Abstract
Pain in nursing homes remains underassessed, underreported and undertreated, consequently, becoming a
growing concern in the United States. The purpose of this inquiry is to review the current evidence guiding
the management of chronic non-malignant pain among nursing home residents. Twelve articles relevant to
this topic were obtained from a search of the electronic databases PubMed and Cumulative Index of Nursing
and Allied Health (CINAHL). Findings underscore an urgent need to improve assessment, documentation,
and management of pain in nursing home residents.
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 Nursing home residents experience under-
recognized and undertreated pain that adds to the 
decline in their quality of life.  Among nursing home 
residents, pain has a prevalence of 49% to 83%, while 
its occurrence is less than 10% to 40% in the general 
community and 60% in hospitalized patients (Herman, 
Johnson, Ritchie, & Parmelee, 2009).  Only about half 
of nursing home residents experiencing pain receive 
analgesic medications on an as-needed basis and 25% 
of residents reporting daily pain receive no analgesic 
medications.  Untreated pain can lead to depression, 
impaired ambulation, sleep disturbance, less social 
interaction, and greater utilization of healthcare.  Pain 
can also aggravate some conditions, delay recovery, 
impair physical functioning, and lead to polypharmacy 
(Herman et al., 2009). 
 With such a high percentage of nursing home 
residents receiving inadequate pain control, it is 
important to understand the current practices as these 
relate to pain management for nursing home residents 
DQG�¿QG�WKH�EHVW�PHWKRGV�WR�FRQWURO�QRQ�PDOLJQDQW�
pain.  The purpose of this paper is to review the lit-
erature related to treatment of chronic, non-malignant 
pain in nursing home residents.  Research studies 
ZHUH�REWDLQHG�XVLQJ�RQOLQH�GDWDEDVHV���6SHFL¿FDOO\��
this paper analyzes pain prevalence, detection of pain, 
improving pain assessment practices, and approaches 
to effective pain management in managing pain in 
nursing home residents. 

Methods
 A literature search was conducted to iden-
tify recent research reports addressing any aspect of 
pain assessment or management in the nursing home 
setting using two databases: Cumulative Index of 

Nursing and Allied Health (CINAHL) and PubMed.  
3XEOLFDWLRQV�ZHUH�OLPLWHG�WR�WKH�ODVW�¿YH�\HDUV�DQG�WKH�
snowball technique was emplyed to identify additional 
relevant articles through reviewing the reference list 
of included articles.  A total of twelve relevant articles 
were found, which are used as evidence for this paper.
 

Presentation of Empirical Evidence
Pain Prevalence
 Pain is a common problem in older individuals 
living in nursing homes, with the incidence of persis-
tent pain between 49% and 84% and one-quarter of 
residents experiencing daily episodes of pain (Won, 
Lapane, Vallow, Schein, Morris, & Lipsitz, 2004).  
From a cross-sectional study that analyzed pain preva-
lence among 21,380 nursing home residents in 10 
states, occurrence of persistent pain was highest for 
nursing home residents with musculoskeletal pain 
and those with a history of falls, fractures, or surgery 
(Won et al., 2004).  Chronic pain is characterized by at 
least one of the following criteria: usually lasts three 
months or longer, lasts at least one month beyond the 
usual course of an acute disease or the reasonable 
time for an injury to heal, is associated with a chronic 
pathological process that causes continuous pain, 
recurs intermittently for months or years, and is often 
correlated with a long-standing functional and psycho-
logical impairment. 
 Hanlon and colleagues (2010) investigated 
pain in nursing home hospice and palliative care 
residents.  This study used a cross-sectional design 
to evaluate 303 patients from 1174 nursing homes.  
Facility staff was asked if, in the past 7 days, the 
residents reported or showed evidence of pain.  Medi-
cation use data were derived from medication admin-

Management of Chronic Non-malignant 
Pain in Nursing Homes Residents 

Therese Y. Parker

 Pain in nursing homes remains underassessed, underreported and undertreated, consequently, becoming 
a growing concern in the United States.  The purpose of this inquiry is to review the current evidence guiding 
the management of chronic non-malignant pain among nursing home residents.  Twelve articles relevant to this 
topic were obtained from a search of the electronic databases PubMed and Cumulative Index of Nursing and Al-
lied Health (CINAHL).  Findings underscore an urgent need to improve assessment, documentation, and man-
agement of pain in nursing home residents.

Abstract

Vol 5, Iss 1, 2012   Journal of Nursing Student Research              19

Parker, T.Y.

1

Parker: Management of Chronic Non-malignant Pain

Published by ScholarlyCommons, 2012



istration records and demographic information and 
health status were retrieved from the Minimum Data 
Set records.  Pain symptoms were present in over one-
third of elderly nursing home hospice or palliative care 
residents despite use of opioids for pain relief among 
two-thirds of patients experiencing pain.  Acetamino-
phen was administered in 31% of residents. Hanlon et 
DO���������FRQGXFWHG�RQH�RI�WKH�¿UVW�QDWLRQDO�VWXGLHV�
of pain prevalence in older nursing homes hospice and 
palliative care residents.  They found that when com-
paring patients in pain to those without pain, patients 
enduring pain had longer lengths of stay in hospice/
palliative care and were more likely to be incontinent 
RI�ERZHO�DQG�EODGGHU���5DFH�ZDV�QRW�D�VLJQL¿FDQW�IDF-
tor as to whether residents received adequate pain con-
trol in this study.  Because of the cross-sectional study 
design, it was not possible to establish causal-effect re-
lationships in determining effective pain management.  
5HVHDUFKHUV�DOVR�GLG�QRW�KDYH�VXI¿FLHQW�GDWD�WR�UHSRUW�
information about pain severity and analgesic dosages, 
and with the small sample size, meaningful multivari-
able analyses could not be performed. 

Detection of Pain
 Buhr and White (2006) trace the lack of ap-
propriate treatment of pain to the inability of nursing 
facility staff members to recognize and distinguish 
chronic pain from acute pain.  Differentiating acute 
pain from chronic pain in patients with cognitive 
impairments is an additional challenge.  In a study to 
¿HOG�WHVW�D�VWDQGDUGL]HG�UHVLGHQW�LQWHUYLHZ�DQG�PHGL-
cal record review protocol to assess and score qual-
ity indicators relevant to pain, Cadogan et al. (2005) 
noted that physicians infrequently assessed for pain.  
This descriptive study of 794 nursing home residents 
and medical records from 542 patients showed that 
during the patient interview, 48% reported symptoms 
of chronic pain and 81% of the group reported a need 
for pain medication.  However, nearly half of these 
patients had no physician assessment of pain in the 
last year.  Overall, physician pain assessments were 
infrequent or incomplete (Cadogan et al., 2005).  This 
study included evidence-based quality indicators with 
explicit selection and scoring criteria for each indica-
tor to permit reliable data recording.  Interviews iden-
WL¿HG�FKURQLF�SDLQ�LQ�D�VWDEOH�IDVKLRQ�ZKLFK�DOORZV�IRU�
judgments to be made about the quality of physician 
and nursing home staff documented pain assessment.  
It was noted that the cross-sectional methodology used 
did not allow determination of the direction of the re-

lationship between documented physician pain assess-
ment and Minimum Data Set documentation of pain, 
which is a limitation of the study. 
 Edelen and Saliba (2010) investigated effec-
tive tools to assess for pain in nursing home residents.  
Two of the most common and supported methods are 
the 0-10 numeric rating scale (NRS) and the verbal 
descriptor scales (VDS), which asks the patient to 
choose a verbal description of pain such as mild, mod-
erate or severe on a 4-5 point scale.  These researchers 
(2010) chose to use the item response theory (IRT) as 
a cross-calibration of the two scales to test NRS and 
VDS (Edelen & Saliba, 2010).  They sampled over 
three thousand nursing home residents from 71 nurs-
ing homes across 8 states and demonstrated that either 
of the two scales can be used in practice depending on 
physician preference.  Eden and Saliba (2010) did not 
discuss the cognitive status of their patients.  
 Another method of determining pain in older 
adults in nursing homes was examined by Jones, Vojir, 
Hutt and Fink (2007).  Authors compared three dif-
ferent pain assessment instruments (VDS, Faces Pain 
Scale and NRS) to examine the equivalency of pain 
intensity scores for 135 nursing home residents.  They 
found that the pain levels across the three tools were 
highly correlated although residents were found to 
underrate pain intensity on the Faces Pain Scale.  They 
noted that nursing home residents generally preferred 
WKH�9'6�EXW�UHVLGHQWV�ZLWK�ODQJXDJH�GLI¿FXOWLHV�DS-
peared to prefer the Faces Pain Scale.  A study limita-
tion was the inclusion of nursing homes from only one 
state, however, generalizability was enhanced by the 
fact that rural and urban nursing homes were included 
in the study along with a meaningful number of His-
panic subjects represented in the sample. 

Improving Pain Assessment
 Buhr and White (2006) researched methods to 
improve pain assessment in nursing homes.  Their in-
tervention was the formation of a quality improvement 
team that reviewed current clinical practice guidelines, 
updated policies and procedures, developed tools for 
pain assessment, and educated the staff in pain assess-
ment and management.  This intervention involved a 
“Plan-Do-Study-Act” (PDSA) methodology that was 
carried out in one nursing home in North Carolina 
with three related facilities as secondary sites.  The 
staff’s pain-related knowledge was measured with 
multiple choice tests as well as the completeness of 
pain assessments before and after the education.  Re-
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sults showed that education and the use of the PDSA 
paradigm improved staff knowledge as well as patient 
and family satisfaction with chronic pain evaluation.  
This was evident by increased scores on the multiple 
choice test for all l members of the nursing team and 
measurable improvements in documentation.  A limita-
tion was the fact that the program was carried out over 
a short time span, and therefore assessment of continu-
ous quality improvement was not possible.  There was 
also a lack of involvement of nurses and other direct 
care workers in the planning process.  A strength of 
Buhr’s and White’s (2006) work was related to their 
focus on quality of care as perceived by the patients 
and families rather than merely improving documenta-
tion practices.  Educational strategies engaged pro-
IHVVLRQDO�QXUVHV��OLFHQVHG�SUDFWLFDO�QXUVHV��FHUWL¿HG�
nursing assistant, physicians and nurse practitioners as 
well as patients and families.  Their approach under-
scored the need to involve all health care providers in 
pain assessment practice.

Detection of Pain in Patients with Cognitive Im-
pairment
 Not all nursing home residents are able to 
answer questions about pain.  Special consideration 
needs to be taken when detecting pain in nursing 
home residents with cognitive impairments.  In a 
study conducted by Leone et al. (2009), researchers 
analyzed verbal as well as nonverbal pain scales for 
nursing home residents.  They selected their sample of 
40 participants from two of the major skilled care and 
dementia units at a Columbia, NY area nursing home.  
Verbal tools that were reviewed included the visual 
analog scale, faces pain scale, Wong-Baker pain scale 
and others.  These scales have been used extensively 
in different age groups with good results but require 
verbal communication with a patient and sometimes 
require abstract thinking, making them suitable for 
patients with intact cognition.  Nonverbal tools were 
chosen based on their ability to detect pain in patients 
ZLWK�FRJQLWLYH�GH¿FLWV�DQG�VRPHWLPHV�QR�DELOLW\�WR�
communicate their pain status.  These researchers used 
a cycle of the PDSA model.  The tools chosen for the 
study were the visual analog scale for verbal patients 
and for the cognitively impaired, the Non-communi-
cative Patient’s Pain Assessment Instrument (NOP-
PAIN), Assessment in Advanced Dementia (PAINAD), 
DQG�WKH�1RQ�9HUEDO�,QGLFDWRUV�IRU�3DLQ�VFDOHV�IXO¿OOHG�
the requirements of the researchers.  These tools were 
FKRVHQ�DV�WKH�PRVW�VHQVLWLYH��VSHFL¿F��DSSURSULDWH��

time sensitive and widely accepted.  Leone and col-
leagues (2009) concluded that tools such as the above 
mentioned are necessary for both verbal and nonverbal 
evaluation of pain in nursing homes.  In addition, they 
found that regular cognitive and behavioral assessment 
may help assess pain by providing additional informa-
tion to physicians, nurses, and other caregivers when 
treatment becomes more complex and challenging.  
One limitation of this study was its small sample size.  
However, the participants were randomly chosen and 
both verbal and nonverbal pain scales were studied. 

Pain Management
 Won, Lapane, Vallow, Schein, Morris and 
Lipsitz (2004) found that pain is highly prevalent in 
nursing homes and that there is suboptimal compli-
ance with geriatric prescribing recommendations.  A 
total of 21,380 nursing home residents were included 
in this cross-sectional study.  The Minimum Data Set 
assessments on pain, analgesics, cognitive, functional, 
and emotional status were summarized.  The study 
¿QGLQJV�VKRZHG�WKDW�DFXWH�SDLQ�ZDV�WKRXJKW�WR�EH�DQ�
important contributory source of chronic pain, and that 
physicians may not always properly prescribe analge-
sics and many residents do not always receive analge-
sic medications.   Although The American Geriatrics 
Society guidelines state that most analgesics should be 
given as standing doses for chronic pain, only 46% of 
these drugs were given as standing doses and analge-
sics were typically only prescribed on an as needed 
basis.  Weaknesses of this study included the lack of 
instruments for evaluating pain in patients with cogni-
tive or communication impairments.  The fact that the 
MDS coordinator completed the MDS raised concerns 
as this individual may not have been directly involved 
in clinical care.  This may have lead to the underesti-
mation of prevalence of pain. 
 Baier and colleagues (2004) conducted a 
collaborative quality improvement project to amelio-
rate pain in nursing homes.  This quasi-experimental 
design used pretests and posttests to study 21 nursing 
home facilities.  The project consisted of a multifacet-
ed collaborative intervention involving audit feedback 
of pain management, education, training, coaching, 
and using rapid-cycle-quality-improvement techniques 
as well as inter-nursing home collaboration.  Each 
nursing home had a quality improvement team com-
posed of directors of nursing, unit nurses, and certi-
¿HG�QXUVLQJ�DVVLVWDQWV���7KH�¿YH�FRPSRQHQWV�RI�WKH�
interventions were: education on pain management, 
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audit and feedback, a systematic quality-improvement 
approach focusing of PDSA cycles, one-on-one 
mentoring for each nursing home, and collaboration 
between participating facilities.  The results of the 
study showed that this intervention improved pain-
management process and outcome measured in nurs-
LQJ�KRPHV���7KLV�LV�RQH�RI�WKH�¿UVW�SURMHFWV�FRQGXFWHG�
in the nursing home setting demonstrating that a mul-
tifaceted intervention using a collaborative quality-
LPSURYHPHQW�PRGHO�VLJQL¿FDQWO\�UHGXFHG�WKH�SUHYD-
lence of pain and improved adherence to processes of 
care recommended in clinical care guidelines.  One 
weakness was that sustainability of the results was not 
addressed. 
 A study by Horner and co-investigators (2005) 
examined whether a quality improvement intervention 
can improve pain management in nursing homes.  In 
this study, experts in quality improvement and clini-
cal pain management provided nursing home staff 
leaders with feedback on pain quality indicator data, 
pain management education, and technical assistance 
to apply the PDSA model.  After the intervention, 
residents in pain who underwent pain assessments 
increased from 8% to 29% and residents receiving 
non-pharmacological pain treatments increased from 
31% to 42%.  Pain medication prescription, however, 
did not change.  For residents with daily moderate or 
excruciating pain, complete pain assessment was as-
sociated with an increase in likelihood of pain medi-
cation prescription.  This study suggests that quality 
improvement methods can be used to improve pain 
management for nursing home residents as previous 
research has shown success in pain management in 
acute care hospitals with quality improvement ef-
forts.  The intervention did not change pain medication 
prescribing practices, although it may have reinforced 
the relationship between assessment and prescription 
of scheduled medications for residents in more severe 
GDLO\�SDLQ���7KLV�¿QGLQJ�HPSKDVL]HV�WKH�QHHG�IRU�WKRU-
ough assessment of pain to ensure adequate treatment 
strategies, particularly among residents with the worst 
pain.  The pre-post study design included a baseline 
chart data collection on three established quality indi-
cators.  However, researchers did not measure resident 
UHVSRQVH�WR�WUHDWPHQW��DQG��WKHUHIRUH��FDQQRW�GH¿QH�WKH�
clinical effect of current prescribing practices.
 Jones et al. (2004) tested a multifaceted, 
culturally competent intervention to improve nurs-
ing home pain practices, improve staff, resident, and 
physician knowledge and attitudes about pain and its 

management, improve actual pain practice in nurs-
ing homes, and improve nursing home policies and 
procedure related to pain.  In this study, six Colorado 
nursing homes were studied as the control group while 
six others were chosen as the intervention group.  The 
intervention successfully improved the percentage 
of residents reporting constant pain but there was no 
reduction in percentage of residents reporting pain or 
moderate/severe pain.  Researchers found that in-
terventions to improve pain management in nursing 
homes must target residents, nursing home staff, and 
primary care physicians.  Jones et al. (2004) included 
an equal number of rural and urban nursing homes 
and employed both educational and behavioral change 
strategies.  However, authors reported several chal-
lenges that occurred during implementation that had 
WR�EH�PRGL¿HG�WR�HQKDQFH�WUDQVODWLRQ�VWUDWHJLHV�EHLQJ�
used. 
 When comparing pain management for hospice 
nursing home patients and non hospice patients, Miller 
and colleagues (2002) found that analgesic manage-
ment of daily pain is better for residents enrolled in 
hospice than nursing home residents not enrolled 
in hospice.  The study found that many dying nurs-
ing home residents in daily pain receive no analgesic 
administration or are receiving analgesic treatment 
inconsistent with the American Medical Directors 
Association and other pain management guidelines.  
Although analgesic prescribing patterns for hospice 
residents were more consistent with recommended 
prescribing guidelines, there was a high prevalence 
of undesirable prescribing practices found for all 
dying residents.  A high proportion of all dying resi-
dents received analgesics only on an as needed basis 
and opioid prescriptions were used more frequently 
by hospice residents that non hospice residents.  The 
investigators concluded that it is necessary to improve 
analgesic management of pain in nursing home resi-
dents if high quality end-of-life care is to be achieved.  
This study was a retrospective and comparative cohort 
VWXG\���7KH�¿QGLQJV�ZHUH�VLPLODU�WR�WKRVH�RI�FRPSD-
rable studies of pain management in nursing homes 
that used different data sources than the Minimum 
Data Set and studies have shown that most MDS data 
are reliable and valid.  One reported limitation of the 
study was that multivariate analyses could not control 
for all patient or facility selection bias and the study 
could not control for all patient characteristics that 
predispose them to elect hospice care.
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Assessment of the State of the Science of the Em-
pirical Evidence

 Publications assessed in this paper included 
cross sectional studies, quasi-experimental, pretest 
and posttest, quality improvement models, descrip-
tive studies, multifaceted and culturally competent 
interventions, qualitative and quantitative methods and 
retrospective and comparative cohort studies.  Of the 
twelve articles, only two mentioned populations that 
were not Caucasian. Jones et al. (2007) included His-
panics in their study, while Jones et al. (2004) was the 
only study that mentioned cultural competency.  The 
majority of the studies did not include residents with 
cognitive impairments, only Buhr et al. (2006) and 
Cadogan et al. (2005) mentioned residents with cogni-
tive disorders and Buhr et al. (2006) merely mentioned 
that the residents with cognitive disorders could not 
¿OO�RXW�WKH�1+3���&DGRJDQ�HW�DO���������ZDV�WKH�RQO\�
study that mentioned nonverbal tools to assess pain. 
 Overall, the empirical literature reviewed 
suggests that pain is not adequately treated in nursing 
home settings.  Whether it is a problem with detect-
ing or assessing pain or physicians misunderstanding 
residents’ pain, both hospice and non hospice patients 
do not report adequate pain management in nurs-
ing homes.  There are a variety of tools available to 
adequately assess pain and there are many quality 
improvement methods that can and should be imple-
mented to improve pain management in nursing home 
residents.

Recommendations
� %DVHG�RQ�¿QGLQJV��UHFRPPHQGDWLRQV�IRU�SUDF-
tice include frequently assessing all nursing home pa-
tients for pain.  This included using both the VDS and 
NRS since different patients report greater satisfaction 
with different tools (Edelen & Salibe, 2010).  Using a 
variety of the tools from the Leone et al. (2009) study 
is a recommendation for residents who are nonverbal 
or who have cognitive impairments.  The visual analog 
scale should be used for verbal patients and for the 
cognitively impaired, the Non-communicative Pa-
tient’s Pain Assessment Instrument (NOPPAIN), As-
sessment in Advanced Dementia (PAINAD), and the 
Non Verbal Indicators For Pain scales should be used.  
After the intensity and frequency of pain is found and 
a baseline is noted, nursing home staff should ensure 
that standing orders of pain medication are available 
when appropriate.  There are guidelines and evidence 
for how to manage pain in nursing home residents, it 

is now necessary to implement these guidelines and 
translate evidence into practice. Using the quality im-
provement tools and teaching nursing home staff are 
ways to improve pain control that are proven effective 
(Buhr et al., 2006). 
 Policies should be developed and implemented 
in nursing homes settings to guide clinicians in select-
ing the most appropriate pain evaluation measures, 
VSHFL¿FDOO\�WKH�IUHTXHQF\�IRU�KRZ�RIWHQ�SDLQ�LV�DV-
sessed, and when it is necessary, administering stand-
ing orders for pain medications.  Buhr and White 
(2006) noted that a quality improvement team which 
utilizes a “Plan-Do-Study-Act” paradigm improves 
pain assessment in nursing homes.  Updating policies 
and procedures and employing tools for rating pain 
based on reviews of current literature will improve the 
likelihood that pain will be assessed and addressed in 
nursing homes settings. 
 Since acute pain may be an important contrib-
uting source of pain, more effective provider educa-
tion and research is needed to determine whether the 
treatment of acute pain could prevent persistent pain 
(Won et al., 2004).  Substantial knowledge gaps and 
suboptimal attitudes and beliefs about pain and its 
treatment demonstrated by nursing home staff and 
pharmacological knowledge must be addressed to 
promote better pain assessment practices.  Educational 
content on pain should be expanded in medical and 
nursing school curriculum, and licensing and certify-
ing exams should have an emphasis on gero-pharma-
cology (Jones et al., 2004). 
 Future studies should be conducted to look 
at minority population who might differ in the terms 
of the quality of their pain management in nursing 
homes.  More research on how effective pain con-
trol can improve quality of life, sleep patterns, ADL, 
and recovery will provide a stronger foundation for 
evidence-based practice in nursing homes.  Greater 
attention should be given to testing pain assessment 
scales and intervention in older adults receiving pallia-
tive care or hospice in nursing homes.
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