
Methods: This prospective study evaluated the germline B1/B2 mutations in 250 high-
risk breast cancer pts tested between 02.2015-12.2016 at IOCN. Inclusion criteria se-
lected pts diagnosed with triple negative breast cancer under the age of 50, or having
conventional family history criteria. All pts signed an informed consent. B1/B2 testing
was performed using an AmpliSeq-based sequencing analysis, on the Ion Torrent
Personal Genome Machine at RCFG. Pathogenic mutations were validated using
Sanger technology. MLPA was performed for all pts.

Results: Of the 250 pts with breast cancer, 44 (17.6%) carried pathogenic mutations,
29 pts (11.6%) in B1 and 15 (6%)in B2, while 18 patients (7.2%) carried a Variant of
Uncertain Significance (VUS). Patient features analysis confirmed the prevalence of
younger age, higher grade, hormone receptor negative and Her2 negative status among
mutated patients (data not shown). Out of the 16 distinct deleterious mutations identi-
fied, 7 (43.75%) occurred in B1 and 9 (56.25%) in B2. The founder mutations identi-
fied in B1 gene were: c.5329_5330insC (c.5266dupC) 11 pts (37.93%), c.3607C>T 9 pts
(31.03%) and c.181T>G 4 pts (13.79%). Other B1 mutations where c.1687C>T 2 pts
(6.89%), and c.4218delG (3.44%), c.212þ 1G>T (3.44%), c.68_69delAG (3.44%) in
one patient respectively. For B2 gene, c.9371A>T (46.66%) was identified as founder
mutation (7 pts, 46.66%). Other mutations were found each in one patient (6.66%):
c.1528G>T, c.4022C>G, c.7007G>A, c.8695C>T, c.9253delA, c.8680C>T, c.8755-
1G>A, c.8695C>T. Of the founder mutations identified, two (c.3607C>T and
c.9371A>T) have not been previously identified as founder mutations in any Eastern
European country.

Conclusions: This prospective study presents the first extensive results of germline B1/
B2 mutations in Romanian high-risk breast cancer pts. Our results indicate that at least
four recurrent B1/B2 mutations qualify as founder mutations; two being newly identi-
fied as carrying a founder effect. ClinicalTrials.gov Identifier: NCT02317120.
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Background: CD146 has several putative (patho)physiological roles in breast cancer.
The most prominent is its involvement in the induction of epithelial-to-mesenchymal
transition, which might have an effect on cancer phenotype and aggressiveness. Here,
we investigated the prevalence of CD146 expression and its prognostic role in breast
cancer subtypes.

Methods: In total, 1,025 breast cancer patients were available for this retrospective
study. From all patients, formalin-fixed paraffin-embedded primary breast cancer tis-
sue was collected and embedded in tissue microarrays, which were stained for CD146.
CD146 expression was defined as> 1% of the tumor cells showing CD146 membrane
staining. Clinical data were available from all patients (median follow up 118 months,
range 4-120). For subtype analysis the Pearson chi-square test was used and the Cox
proportional hazards model for survival analyses. Only patients who were lymph node
negative and did not receive (neo)adjuvant systemic treatment were included in the
survival analyses (n¼ 551).

Results: 113 (11%) out of 1,025 tumors showed CD146 expression. Of these, 43% of
the tumors had> 50% of the tumor cells showing CD146 membrane staining. From
the molecular subtypes, CD146 positive tumors are often of the triple negative subtype
(76 out of 119 (64%), p< 0.001) and histologically of the medullary type (11 out of 23
(48%), p< 0.001). In univariable analysis, CD146 was a prognostic factor for both
poor metastasis-free survival (MFS) and overall survival (OS) (respectively HR 1.65,
95% CI 1.02-2.66, p¼ 0.041 and HR 1.66, 95% CI 1.03-2.69, p¼ 0.037). When correct-
ing for the traditional prognostic factors (including age, tumor size and grade, ER, PR
and HER2) in multivariable analysis, CD146 was not an independent prognostic factor
for MFS and OS (respectively HR 1.63, 95% CI 0.93-2.87, p¼ 0.088 and HR 1.46, 95%
CI 0.82-2.61, p¼ 0.197).

Conclusions: CD146 protein expression is present in 11% of the primary breast cancer
tumors and is most prevalent in the triple negative and medullary subtypes. CD146 is a
prognostic factor for MFS and OS in breast cancer patients, but it is not independent of
the traditional prognostic factors. Its potential impact on outcome to systemic treat-
ment such as endocrine therapy, remains to be established.
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Background: Immunity plays a pivotal role in cancer progression and prognosis. A
high neutrophil-to-lymphocite ratio (NLR) or a low lymphocyte-to-monocyte ratio
(LMR) are respectively associated with systemic inflammation and immune suppres-
sion and have been associated with a poor outcome. Aim of this study is to further in-
vestigate the interaction between the immune system and breast cancer (BC) through
the NLR and LMR.

Methods: This retrospective study analyzed a consecutive cohort of 657 patients (pts)
with a diagnosis of pT1 BC, without restrictions regarding lymph node status (T1BC),
or metastatic BC (MBC) treated between 2004 and 2017 at the Department of
Oncology of Udine (Italy). Differences in terms of NLR and LMR among the two co-
horts and between clinico-pathological characteristics in the T1BC subgroup were
explored through the Kruskal-Wallis test. The prognostic impact in terms of OS in the
T1BC population was investigated through uni- and multivariate Cox regression.

Results: Both NLR and LMR were significantly different between the T1BC and the
MBC cohorts. In particular, pts with T1BC had a higher median LMR (3.9 vs 2.9;
P¼ 0.0001) and lower NLR (2 vs 2.7; P¼ 0.0001). After stratification according to mo-
lecular profile, T1BC and MBC cohorts of Luminal B-like subtype were significantly
different in terms of both LMR (4.2 vs 3; P¼ 0.0001) and NLR (2 vs 2.5; P¼ 0.0001). In
triple negative subtype, the difference between TB1C and MBC was observed for NLR
(1.9 vs 3.2; P¼ 0.0272) only. On the other hand, no differences between TB1C and
MBC were highlighted for the other subtypes. When focusing on the clinico-
pathological characteristics of the T1BC cohort, LMR was associated with progesterone
receptor (PR) expression (P¼ 0.0261) and marginally with the estrogen receptor (ER)
expression, while NLR with tumor diameter (P¼ 0.0240) and marginally with grading.
Furthermore, among T1BC pts, NLR had no prognostic impact in terms of OS, while
LMR was associated with a better outcome also when corrected for ER, PR and HER2
status (HR 0.44, 95%CI 0.28 - 0.71, P¼ 0.001).

Conclusions: These results suggest a role for systemic inflammation and immune-
suppression in breast cancer, especially in the triple negative and luminal B-like
subtypes.
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Background: Triple negative breast cancer remains without a target therapy.
Interventions that could improve pathological complete response (pCR) rates are
required. Metabolits of vitamin D could be involved in chemotherapy response.

Methods: A series of 147 patients with early or locally advanced triple negative breast
cancers was retrospectively analyzed from 2007 to 2016. Patients from 2015 to 2016
period were supplemented with vitamin D and calcium (880UI/1000mg). Analysis of
clinicopathological, immune variables and vitamin D pathway were correlated to pCR.

Results: Median age was 53, median tumor size 30mm, 48% had nodal involvement,
and median ki67 expression was of 70%. Androgen receptor was expressed in 28% of
tumors analyzed, EGFR in 89%, CK5/6 in 63%. Mean stromal T lymphocytes infiltrates
(sTILS) was of 28%, mean PDL1 expression of 128, mean 53BP1 expression of 125, and
mean VDRnuc expression of 132. pCR rate was of 40%, and within patients with vita-
min D supplementation was 64% (16/25). Only VDRnuc expression was associated
with pCR (p¼ 0.047) in the univariate and multivariate analysis. Patients with high ex-
pression of VDRnuc in tumor had no evidence of relapse (p¼ 0.024), with similar
curves than those who achieve pCR (p¼ 0.000).

Conclusions: VDRnuc expression is a strong predictive (p¼ 0.047 with pCR) and
prognostic (p¼ 0.024 with relapse) in triple negative breast cancer. Role of supplemen-
tation needs to be tested if it could improve VDRnuc levels; whereas in our series pa-
tients with supplementation had better pCR rates.
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