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To: nyilo@fk.unair.ac.id

Dear Nyilo,

Further to the email | sent you on 2 February, | wanted to check if you have any queries regarding my comments on your manuscript. | would appreciate if you could confirm receipt of this
email, and additionally if you could let me know when you expect to send your revisions.

If there’s anything we can help you with regarding your submission, please do let me know. | look forward to hearing from you within the next few days.
Best regards,

Tabitha
The Editorial Team, F1000Research

F1000Research is the trading name of F1000 Research Limited. This e-mail is confidential and should not be used by anyone who is not the original intended recipient. If you are
not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure, distribution, copying or use of this message or taking any action in reliance on the contents of it is strictly
prohibited. If you have received this electronic message in error, please destroy it immediately, and notify the sender. F1000 Research Limited does not accept liability for any
statements made which are clearly the sender's own and not expressly made on behalf of F1000 Research Limited. No contracts may be concluded on behalf of F1000 Research
Limited by means of e-mail communication. F1000 Research Limited is Registered in England and Wales with Company Number 8322928, Registered Office Howick Place, London
SW1P 1WG, UK.

Do not delete (filing code): FIKROOCDE F1R-VER120389-A (end code)

Nyilo Purnami <nyilo@fk.unair.ac.id> Thu, Feb 17, 2022 at 8:52 AM

To: editorial@f1000research.com

Thank you for your email.
[Quoted text hidden]

Dr. Nyilo Purnami,dr. Sp. THT-KL(K)
08155100081

Nyilo Purnami <nyilo@fk.unair.ac.id> Thu, Feb 17, 2022 at 11:20 AM

To: editorial@f1000research.com

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=acab5e537 1&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:17249325014094 10221 &simpl=msg-f:1724932501409410221&simpl=msg-a:r-73711157337830004 74 &simpl=msg-a:r46793...

117



5/15/23, 9:59 AM Airlangga University Mail - Manuscript 108944 conditionally accepted for publication

| have uploaded the questionnaire and | have attached the DOI to the manuscript.
i attached my manuscript with DOI questionnaire.

On Wed, Feb 16, 2022 at 10:03 PM <editorial@f1000research.com> wrote:
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Nyilo Purnami <nyilo@fk.unair.ac.id> Thu, Feb 17, 2022 at 12:29 PM
To: editorial@f1000research.com

Thank you for your mail,,

| have uploaded the questionnaire and | have attached the DOI to the manuscript.

| attached my manuscript with the DOI questionnaire and | attached a new revision of my manuscript.

if possible, | would like to ask about the APC invoice

Thank you n Best Regards

On Wed, Feb 16, 2022 at 10:03 PM <editorial@f1000research.com> wrote:
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Dear Nyilo,
Thank you for sending your revised article. There are several comments remaining in the manuscript; please address these.
Please do get in touch with any questions you have about the APC. | look forward to hearing from you.

Best wishes,
Tabitha
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From: Nyilo Purnami <nyilo@fk.unair.ac.id>

Sent: 17 February 2022 05:29

To: F1000.Research.Editorial <editorial @F1000Research.com>
Subject: Re: Manuscript 108944 conditionally accepted for publication
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Nyilo Purnami <nyilo@fk.unair.ac.id> Tue, Feb 22, 2022 at 9:26 AM

To: "F1000.Research" <research@f1000.com>

Thank you for your response.

| attached the new file revision,

| want to ask, how much should | pay for this APC? and how to pay?
Thank you
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To: Nyilo Purnami <nyilo@fk.unair.ac.id>

Dear Nyilo,
Thank you for sending your revised article, there are several important comments remaining in the manuscript, including:

e Please provide ZIP codes for all affiliations.

¢ Please state whether informed consent was obtained from participants and whether this was oral or written consent. If verbal rather than written
consent has been obtained, we ask authors to provide a description of the reasons for this, confirm that verbal consent was approved as adequate
by the ethics committee and describe how consent from each participant was documented.

* Please provide details on how the data were analysed, including the software (with version number and URL/reference).

¢ Please clarify why the ethics statement in the methods section differs from the ethics statement in the declarations section. Please ensure that the
correct information has been stated (including the approval number).
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¢ Please align the reference list with our guidelines on references (please see comment in the article for more information).

Please address these comments in order to continue onto the next stage.

Payment: The APC is $1350.00 after any discounts you are eligible for have been applied. Please provide us with the details of the
individual/organization taking responsibility for paying the fee as soon as possible. Please sign in with the credentials you used to submit the article or
you will not be able to access this page. Our Accounts department will be in touch regarding payment.

Best wishes,
Tabitha
The Editorial Team, F1000Research

From: Nyilo Purnami <nyilo@fk.unair.ac.id>
Sent: 22 February 2022 02:26

To: F1000.Research <research@f1000.com>
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To: "F1000.Research" <research@f1000.com>

Thank you for your response.
| attached the new file revision,
Thank you and best Regards
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Thank you for sending your revised article, however unfortunately, we cannot proceed with the article until it is clear whether participants provided
informed consent to take part in the study. Please state whether participants gave informed consent and whether it was oral or written, and provide a
copy of the consent form.

Furthermore, please ensure that in-text reference numbers are in numerical order, ensuring to update the reference list as appropriate.
Please see the attached article and address all of the remaining comments.

Kind regards,
Tabitha
The Editorial Team, F1000Research

From: Nyilo Purnami <nyilo@fk.unair.ac.id>
Sent: 28 February 2022 03:16
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Nyilo Purnami <nyilo@fk.unair.ac.id> Tue, Mar 1, 2022 at 10:45 AM
To: "F1000.Research" <research@f1000.com>

Thank you for the clarification.

Data collection is based on a google form. At the beginning of the questionnaire, it was asked whether the respondent was willing to participate in the study? If the answer is
yes, then the questionnaire will be opened. This can be seen in the master data where the answer is YES.

| attached a screenshot informed consent in this study.
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F1000.Research <research@f1000.com> Wed, Mar 2, 2022 at 6:51 PM
To: Nyilo Purnami <nyilo@fk.unair.ac.id>

Dear Nyilo,
Thank you for clarifying this, we can accept this as consent.

There are no further comments in the article that need addressing, however we do need you to ensure that all references have been
mentioned in the main text. Please do the following in the most recent version of the article (Compared 3 - TL):

+ Cite reference 1 in the main text as a hyperlink in the text and remove the reference from the reference list.
» Cite reference 2 in the main text.
+ Reorder the reference list so the in-text reference numbers are in numerical order, ensuring to update the reference list as appropriate.

Kind regards,
Tabitha
The Editorial Team, F1000Research

From: Nyilo Purnami <nyilo@fk.unair.ac.id>

Sent: 01 March 2022 03:45
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To: "F1000.Research" <research@f1000.com>

Thank you for the clarification. | attached the new revision manuscript.
Thank you and Best Regards
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The PDF of your article 108944 is ready for checking
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Nyilo Purnami <nyilo@fk.unair.ac.id>

production@f1000research.com <production@f1000research.com> Mon, Mar 7, 2022 at 11:49 PM

To: nyilo@fk.unair.ac.id

Dear Nyilo

The level of community behaviour towards hearing loss in Indonesia
Purnami N, Zachreini |, Bashiruddin J, Tamin S, Priyono H, Mayangsari ID, Indrasari SR, Haryuna TSH et al.

Please click here to download the PDF proof of your F1000Research article.
Please look through the article and let me know if it requires any corrections or if you are happy for it to be published as it is. Please also confirm the following details are correct:

e All author names are spelled correctly

e Authors are listed in the correct order

o Affiliations for all authors are accurate

¢ The information in the Copyright section is correct
e All figures and figure legends are correct

¢ All external files, including data files are correct

¢ All links within the article are working, and correct

Please note that connecting an ORCID account to F1000Research requires the account holder to sign in to both F1000Research and ORCID, therefore it isn't possible for us to add
ORCID badges for your co-authors on their behalf. When the article is published, they will receive an email encouraging them to connect their ORCID account to F1000Research. If they
do this, their ORCID badge will be displayed next to their name.

Corrections at this stage may require further typesetting and therefore cause some delays. If any corrections are necessary, please mark them directly on the PDF file using the commenting
and markup tools in software such as Adobe Reader.

Please return your proof corrections to us via email - please note that after the article has been published, any requests for minor corrections will only be considered on a case-by-case basis.
Therefore, we encourage you to check your proofs carefully at this stage.

If there are any outstanding queries on your reviewer suggestions, then we will be in touch with you shortly.
Best regards,

Jessica
The Editorial Team, F1000Research

F1000Research is the trading name of F1000 Research Limited. This e-mail is confidential and should not be used by anyone who is not the original intended recipient. If you are
not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure, distribution, copying or use of this message or taking any action in reliance on the contents of it is strictly
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prohibited. If you have received this electronic message in error, please destroy it immediately, and notify the sender. F1000 Research Limited does not accept liability for any
statements made which are clearly the sender's own and not expressly made on behalf of FL000 Research Limited. No contracts may be concluded on behalf of F1000 Research
Limited by means of e-mail communication. F1000 Research Limited is Registered in England and Wales with Company Number 8322928, Registered Office Howick Place, London
SW1P 1WG, UK.
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Nyilo Purnami <nyilo@fk.unair.ac.id> Thu, Mar 10, 2022 at 5:09 AM
To: production@f1000research.com

i will check and send you back soon,
Thank you
[Quoted text hidden]

Dr. Nyilo Purnami,dr. Sp. THT-KL(K)
08155100081

Nyilo Purnami <nyilo@fk.unair.ac.id> Fri, Mar 11, 2022 at 9:12 AM
To: production@f1000research.com

Dear Jessica,
| attached proof PDF my article and ORCID ID all co-author.
please proceed it

ORCID ID:

Dr. dr. Indra Zachreini : 0000-0003-2327-1308

Prof. Dr. dr. Jenny Bashiruddin : 0000-0001-9712-4963
Dr. dr. Susyana Tamin : 0000-0002-6402-7021

dr. Harim Priyono : 0000-0002-4391-7359

dr. lka Dewi Mayangsari : 0000-0003-1851-4520

dr. Sagung Rai Indrasari : 0000-0002-4281-8105

Prof. Dr. dr. Tengku Siti Hajar Haryuna : 0000-0003-2779-3285
dr. Tjandra Manukbua : 0000-0003-3400-4870

dr. Respati W. Ranakusuma : 0000-0002-6678-7876
Dr. dr. Ronny Suwento : 0000-0002-2578-4556

dr. Yanuar Iman S : 0000-0003-4234-5544

Prof. Dr. dr. Eka Savitri : 0000-0003-0783-5046

Thank you and Best Regards

On Mon, Mar 7, 2022 at 11:49 PM <production@f1000research.com> wrote:
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F1000.Production.Research <production.research@f1000.com> Fri, Mar 11, 2022 at 8:45 PM
To: Nyilo Purnami <nyilo@fk.unair.ac.id>

Dear Nyilo,

Thank you for the response. Unfortunately we do not have the capacity to add ORCID ID’s on behalf of co-authors because it requires an email sign in. All authors will be
emailed instructions on how to link their own ORCIDs once the article goes live.

Can you confirm there are no other corrections to the article?

Many thanks,

Jess
Jess Fenn

Production Editor

E jessica.fenn@f1000.com

F1000

240 Blackfriars Rd
London SE1 8BF

www.f1000.com
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Dear Nyilo

The level of community behaviour towards hearing loss in Indonesia
Purnami N, Zachreini I, Bashiruddin J, Tamin S, Priyono H, Mayangsari ID, Indrasari SR, Haryuna TSH et al.

Please click here to download the PDF proof of your F1000Research article.

Please look through the article and let me know if it requires any corrections or if you are happy for it to be published as it is. Please also confirm the following
details are correct:

¢ All author names are spelled correctly

e Authors are listed in the correct order

o Affiliations for all authors are accurate

¢ The information in the Copyright section is correct
¢ All figures and figure legends are correct

o All external files, including data files are correct

e All links within the article are working, and correct

Please note that connecting an ORCID account to F1000Research requires the account holder to sign in to both F1000Research and ORCID, therefore it isn't
possible for us to add ORCID badges for your co-authors on their behalf. When the article is published, they will receive an email encouraging them to
connect their ORCID account to F1000Research. If they do this, their ORCID badge will be displayed next to their name.

Corrections at this stage may require further typesetting and therefore cause some delays. If any corrections are necessary, please mark them directly on the PDF
file using the commenting and markup tools in software such as Adobe Reader.

Please return your proof corrections to us via email - please note that after the article has been published, any requests for minor corrections will only be
considered on a case-by-case basis. Therefore, we encourage you to check your proofs carefully at this stage.

If there are any outstanding queries on your reviewer suggestions, then we will be in touch with you shortly.
Best regards,

Jessica
The Editorial Team, F1000Research

F1000Research is the trading name of F1000 Research Limited. This e-mail is confidential and should not be used by anyone who is not the original intended recipient. If
you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure, distribution, copying or use of this message or taking any action in reliance on the contents
of it is strictly prohibited. If you have received this electronic message in error, please destroy it immediately, and notify the sender. FL000 Research Limited does not accept
liability for any statements made which are clearly the sender's own and not expressly made on behalf of F1000 Research Limited. No contracts may be concluded on behalf
of F1000 Research Limited by means of e-mail communication. F1000 Research Limited is Registered in England and Wales with Company Number 8322928, Registered
Office Howick Place, London SW1P 1WG, UK.
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Dr. Nyilo Purnami,dr. Sp. THT-KL(K)

08155100081

Information Classification: General

Nyilo Purnami <nyilo@fk.unair.ac.id> Sat, Mar 12, 2022 at 5:23 PM
To: "F1000.Production.Research" <production.research@f1000.com>

Yes, | confirm.
[Quoted text hidden]

Nyilo Purnami <nyilo@fk.unair.ac.id> Sat, Mar 12, 2022 at 7:08 PM
To: "F1000.Production.Research" <production.research@f1000.com>

Thank you for your email

| attached proof of payment APC journal
please proceed with it.

Thanks

On Fri, Mar 11, 2022 at 8:45 PM F1000.Production.Research <production.research@f1000.com> wrote:
[Quoted text hidden]
[Quoted text hidden]
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F1000.Production.Research <production.research@f1000.com> Mon, Mar 14, 2022 at 7:25 PM
To: Nyilo Purnami <nyilo@fk.unair.ac.id>

Dear Nyilo,
Thank you for the confirmation, we will proceed with publication.

Kind Regards,
Manahil

Manabhil Aslam
on behalf of F1000 Research

Production Assistant

E manahil.aslam@f1000.com
F1000
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Dr. Nyilo Purnami,dr. Sp. THT-KL(K)

08155100081

Information Classification: General

Nyilo Purnami <nyilo@fk.unair.ac.id> Mon, Mar 14, 2022 at 9:04 PM
To: "F1000.Production.Research" <production.research@f1000.com>

Great, thank you so much!

there is a slight revision in my manuscript for academic requirements. Here | attach the FINAL proof check.
Thank you and please proceed it

[Quoted text hidden]

ﬂ Proof check naskah_108944 - nyilo_purnami FINAL new.pdf
492K

F1000.Production.Research <production.research@f1000.com> Tue, Mar 15, 2022 at 7:07 PM
To: Nyilo Purnami <nyilo@fk.unair.ac.id>

Dear Nyilo,

Thanks for this. Could you clarify the new revision? | can’t see any comments on the attached pdf.
[Quoted text hidden]
Dr. Nyilo Purnami,dr. Sp. THT-KL(K)
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08155100081

Information Classification: General

Nyilo Purnami <nyilo@fk.unair.ac.id> Wed, Mar 16, 2022 at 9:43 AM
To: "F1000.Production.Research" <production.research@f1000.com>

Thanks for your response,

clarify the new revision in the keyword manuscript (add SDGs keyword).

please help proceed with it. Thank you and best regards
[Quoted text hidden]

F1000.Production.Research <production.research@f1000.com> Wed, Mar 16, 2022 at 10:43 PM
To: Nyilo Purnami <nyilo@fk.unair.ac.id>

Dear Nyilo,

Thanks for the response.

The current Keywords are: Behavior, knowledge, attitude, action, hearing loss

What would you like to add to that list?

Many thanks,

Jess
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08155100081

Information Classification: General

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=acab5e5371&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1726660491045817033&simpl=msg-f: 1726660491045817033&simpl=msg-a:r8097497334814169810&simpl=msg-a:r114721...  8/9



5/15/23, 9:58 AM Airlangga University Mail - The PDF of your article 108944 is ready for checking
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To: "F1000.Production.Research" <production.research@f1000.com>

Yes, please proceed.

New keyword : "Human health, Behaviour, Knowledge, Attitude, Hearing loss, Public health”

please proceed it.

Thank you and best regards
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