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From: Hartini sulistijono (hartini_unair@yahoo.com)
To: vijaykumarjha2015@gmail.com; vijaykumarjha2017 @gmail.com; asri.wijayanti@fh.um-surabaya.ac.id

Date: Monday, October 30, 2017, 07:18 AM GMT+7

Dear Mr.Vijay

Relating to Mrs Asri Wijayanti,my close friend who inform about the langkawi conference, | do hope you available to
help me to publish in your journals.

Here my paper attach , please found may paper attach

Regard

Hartini,Airlangga University

@ journal intern langkawi.docx
38.2kB
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LETTER OF ACCEPTANCE for oral presentation

From: ICEBSS 2017 (icebss17@gmail.com)
To: hartini_unair@yahoo.com

Date: Monday, October 30, 2017, 01:06 PM GMT+7

ARF/VKJ 2017

30, October 2017

Re: 8TH INTERNATIONAL CONFERENCE ON ECONOMIC, BUSINESS AND SOCIAL SCIENCES, 15-16 NOVEMBER 2017; VENUE:
BERJAYA LANGKAWI RESORT; LANGKAWi, MALAYSIiA

Dear Dr. Sri Hartini

Sub: LETTER OF ACCEPTANCE FOR ORAL PRESENTATION

Greetings from Academic Research Foundations, New Delhi (India)

Many thanks for submitting your article entitled ‘Relationships Consumer Characteristic and Perceive Business Ethics of
Creative Industry in Indonesia: Study of Y Generations ‘for 8TH INTERNATIONAL CONFERENCE ON ECONOMIC, BUSINESS
AND SOCIAL SCIENCES, 15-16 NOVEMBER 2017; VENUE: BERJAYA LANGKAWi RESORT; LANGKAWI, MALAYSIA. We are glad to
inform you that your article has accepted for this conference and publication on ‘ International Journal of Applied
Business and Economic Research (Scopus Index Journal) Vol. 15 (2017) issue.

I request you to kindly send the registration fees US $ 850-00

The payment may be made by a cheque/Bank draft \ Online Payment\ Pay by Bank Transfer\ in favour of ¢ VIJAY KUMAR
JHA’ and We are enclosing our Bank details.

And, hereby | am enclosing the registration form along with this e-mail. Kindly fill it and send it to us along with the
payment.

Thanking you,

Yours Sincerely
for Academic Research Foundations

Vijay Jha
Conference Organizer: ICEBSS-2017
Academic Research Foundations

4383/4A, Ansari Road, Darya Ganj,
New Delhi-110002 (India)

Ph.: 011-23259212 (M) 08826561892
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E-mail: vijaykumarjha2017@gmail.com

Registration Form-ICEBSS-2017.pdf

49.6kB
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From: Hartini sulistijono (hartini_unair@yahoo.com)
To: vijaykumarjha2015@gmail.com; vijaykumarjha2017@gmail.com; icebss17@gmail.com
Date: Wednesday, November 1, 2017, 11:30 AM GMT+7

Dear Mr Vijay,

| am pleased to hear that my article has been accepted for presentation in the conference ICBESS and publish
in International journal of applied business and economic research Volume 15 (2017)

Please Kindly receive registration form and receipt of payment.
best regard,

Hartini
Management Department of Airlangga University

r&‘j Payment langkawi.pdf
1.9MB
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From: Hartini sulistijono (hartini_unair@yahoo.com)
To: asri.wijayanti@fh.um-surabaya.ac.id

Date: Sunday, November 5, 2017, 03:10 AM GMT+7

----- Forwarded Message -----

From: Vijay JHA <vijaykumarjha2015@gmail.com>

To: @ <undefined>

Sent: Wednesday, November 1, 2017, 4:50:21 PM GMT+7

Subject: PROGRAMME SCHEDULE - 8th-ICEBSS-2017:::::PLEASE CONFIRMIIINIIM

Dear Participant,

First of all, we are very thankful to you for sending your article for the presentation in the 8th-
ICEBSS-2017 conference. Please bring your POWER POINT PRESENTATION (PPT FOR 7-
8 Mins) of your paper which is going to be present during the conference day.

Conference Venue:-

Berjaya Langkawi Resort,
Langkawi, Kedah, Malaysia
The programme schedule is attached along with this mail. Please go through it.

We request you to kindly plan your trip accordingly and send confirmation of your participation as
soon as possible.

Awaiting for your positive reply.

Thanking you.

Yours Sincerely,
Vijay Kumar Jha

(Conference organizer)

Programme Schedule-November-2017.xlsx
24.2kB
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From: Vijay Jha (vijaykumarjha2017@gmail.com)
To: hartini_unair@yahoo.com; jovisulityawan@yahoo.com; asri.wijayanti@fh.um-surabaya.ac.id

Date: Saturday, November 4, 2017, 06:45 PM GMT+7

Re: SuBMISSION ARTICLE FOR CORRECTION

Dear Sir,
We are enclosing your article.

You are requested to please return corrected proof copy to us with TWO days after received of this letter by E-MAIL
immediately, so that we will be printed very soon with in week days. “

The journal copy and reprints will be mailed to your under registered cover as and when the (2017) issues comes
out of the press.

Please subscribe or recommend the above journal in your institute of department library.

Thanking you for your interest in our journal.

Yours sincerely,

For Serials Publications

Vijay JHA
International Journal of Applied Business and Economic Research

Serials Publications

4383/4A, Ansari Road,
Darya Ganj, New Delhi-110002

(Mobile) no. 08826561892

E-mail: vijaykumarjha2015@gmail.com

‘_Lj 34_Sri Hartini.pdf
728.7kB
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