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1 message

dewi melani hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id> Wed, Jan 15, 2020 at 12:37 PM
To: drug delivery <ijddtjournal@gmail.com>

Dear Editor,

| would like to know the progress of my current manuscript (ID 315). Thank you and looking forward to receive any
corrections.

Kind Regards,
Dewi Melani Hariyadi, PhD,Apt.

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: dewi melani hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id>
Date: Sun, Dec 1, 2019 at 9:36 AM

Subject: Manuscript submission Dewi Hariyadi et al 2019
To: drug delivery <ijddtjournal@gmail.com>

Dear Editor,

We have tried many times to submit our manuscript via online website IJJDT, however we found many difficulties.
Herewith we would like to publish an article entitled “OPTIMIZATION PERFORMANCE AND PHYSICAL STABILITY OF
CIPROFLOXACIN HCL-Ca ALGINATE MICROSPHERES : EFFECT OF DIFFERENT CONCENTRATION OF ALGINATE
AND CACL2 7 in International Journal of Drug Delivery Technology as an Original Article.

On behalf of all the contributors | will act and guarantor and will correspond with the journal from this point onward.
Thank you and looking forward to waiting for your positive response.

Yours’ sincerely,
Dewi Melani Hariyadi, PhD, Apt.
Faculty of Pharmacy, Universitas Airlangga

Surabaya, Indonesia
email: dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id
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2 messages
dewi melani hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id> Thu, Mar 19, 2020 at 4:50 PM
To: Anupama Srivasatava <editor@mripub.com>
Cc: drug delivery <ijddtjournal@gmail.com>
Dear Editor,

| would like to ask galley proof of my paid manuscript?
Thank you.

Kind Regards,
Dewi Melani Hariyadi

On Wednesday, March 4, 2020, dewi melani hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id> wrote:
The date of payment is today 4 March 2020.
Thank you

Kind Regards,
Dewi

On Wednesday, March 4, 2020, Anupama Srivasatava <editor@mripub.com> wrote:

Please, confirm the date of payment done.

Regards,

Pradeep

From: dewi melani hariyadi [mailto:dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id]
Sent: 04 March 2020 13:17

To: Anupama Srivasatava

Subject: Payment sent Re: FW: Provisional Acceptance

Dear Editor,

Thank you for the acceptance. | paid already through BNI Bank to your mentioned account number. Please find
attached the payment proof of USD $225 and also additional fee from our Bank. Hope now | can see my paper
published online in 1st week of March issue.

Kind Regards,

Dewi Melani Hariyadi

On Tuesday, March 3, 2020, Anupama Srivasatava <editor@mripub.com> wrote:
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Airlangga University Mail - Update Galley Propf Re: Payment sent Re: FW: Provisional Acceptance
Dear Dewi Melani Hariyadi,

Your manuscript "315-309-1-SM" with title ® OPTIMIZATION PERFORMANCE AND
PHYSICAL STABILITY OF CIPROFLOXACIN HCL-Ca ALGINATE
MICROSPHERES : EFFECT OF DIFFERENT CONCENTRATION OF

ALGINATE AND CACL2" has been provisionally accepted in the upcoming March issue of
Journal, "International Journal of Drug Delivery Technology". It may be published in the upcoming
issue of the journal subject to deposition of Open Access Fee $ 200 + $.25 (bank transaction
charges).

Bank Name:-----======memmum- State Bank of India
Account holder name------ MRI Publication Pvt. Ltd
Bank account number------ 00000034416717004
Branch-----------=--ccecceaua- Dubeypur, Sultanpur, U.P. India
IFSC Code------- SBIN0015675

SWIFT Code -------======mmmememmmmmmen SBININBB

Note:

1. ATM/Net banking/NEFT/RTGS transfer is acceptable and do not involves any transaction charges.

In case the ATM machine do not provide any slip, the exact date and time has to be mailed for
identification.

2. PayTM is acceptable. The number for PayTM transfer is 9696263646

3. International authors(outside India) are required to use the bank transfer in account no given
above. available at the website under the instructions area.

4. Charges are $220 + $25 Transaction charges.

Regards,

Seema T

International Journal of Drug Delivery Technology
India

To: dewi melani hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id>

Dear Author,

This is to inform you that offices are partially closed dur KORONA issue. It will be sent to you as soon as possible.

Regards,

Seema T
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From: dewi melani hariyadi [mailto:dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id]

Sent: 19 March 2020 15:20

To: Anupama Srivasatava

Cc: drug delivery

Subject: Update Galley Propf Re: Payment sent Re: FW: Provisional Acceptance

Dear Editor,

| would like to ask galley proof of my paid manuscript?

Thank you.

Kind Regards,

Dewi Melani Hariyadi

On Wednesday, March 4, 2020, dewi melani hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id> wrote:
The date of payment is today 4 March 2020.

Thank you

Kind Regards,

Dewi

On Wednesday, March 4, 2020, Anupama Srivasatava <editor@mripub.com> wrote:

Please, confirm the date of payment done.

Regards,

Pradeep

From: dewi melani hariyadi [mailto:dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id]
Sent: 04 March 2020 13:17

To: Anupama Srivasatava

Subject: Payment sent Re: FW: Provisional Acceptance

Dear Editor,

Thank you for the acceptance. | paid already through BNI Bank to your mentioned account number. Please find
attached the payment proof of USD $225 and also additional fee from our Bank. Hope now | can see my paper
published online in 1st week of March issue.

Kind Regards,
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Dewi Melani Hariyadi

On Tuesday, March 3, 2020, Anupama Srivasatava <editor@mripub.com> wrote:

Dear Dewi Melani Hariyadi,

Your manuscript "315-309-1-SM" with title * OPTIMIZATION PERFORMANCE AND
PHYSICAL STABILITY OF CIPROFLOXACIN HCL-Ca ALGINATE
MICROSPHERES : EFFECT OF DIFFERENT CONCENTRATION OF

ALGINATE AND CACL2" has been provisionally accepted in the upcoming March issue of

Journal, "International Journal of Drug Delivery Technology". It may be published in the upcoming
issue of the journal subject to deposition of Open Access Fee $ 200 + $.25 (bank transaction

charges).
Bank Name:------========ouuo State Bank of India
Account holder name------ MRI Publication Pvt. Ltd
Bank account number------ 00000034416717004
Branch---------=--ceeemeaaaaan Dubeypur, Sultanpur, U.P. India
IFSC Code-------=========commmuun SBIN0015675
SWIFT Code —------========-ommmmmmmeun SBININBB
Note:

1. ATM/Net banking/NEFT/RTGS transfer is acceptable and do not involves any transaction
charges. In case the ATM machine do not provide any slip, the exact date and time has to be
mailed for identification.

2. PayTM is acceptable. The number for PayTM transfer is 9696263646

3. International authors(outside India) are required to use the bank transfer in account no given
above. available at the website under the instructions area.

4. Charges are $220 + $25 Transaction charges.

Regards,

Seema T

International Journal of Drug Delivery Technology
India
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4 messages

Anupama Srivasatava <editor@mripub.com> Wed, Apr 1, 2020 at 11:42 PM

To: dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id

Dear Hariyadi DM,

Please, find enclosed author proof of your article submitted for publication in IJDDT
March Issue. You are supposed to go through the proof and and do the needful.

Regards,
Seema T
Editor IJDDT
9956616864

%) Q Hariyadi DM yash315-309-1-SM (1) (1).edited.pdf
769K

dewi melani hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id> Thu, Apr 2, 2020 at 6:19 PM

To: Anupama Srivasatava <editor@mripub.com>
Dear Editor,

Thank you for your information. Please find attached the pdf of the revised note for the galley proof. Hope now the
manuscript can be published.

Kind Regards,
Dewi Melani Hariyadi

On Wed, Apr 1, 2020 at 11:45 PM Anupama Srivasatava <editor@mripub.com> wrote:

Dear Hariyadi DM,

Please, find enclosed author proof of your article submitted for publication in IJDDT
March Issue. You are supposed to go through the proof and and do the needful.

Regards,

Seema T
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dewi melani hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id> Mon, Apr 13, 2020 at 7:09 PM
To: Anupama Srivasatava <editor@mripub.com>

Dear Editor,

Considering after | finished final checking my galley proof two weeks ago, could you please advise which volume and
number of my published article in 2020? Thank you.

Kind Regards,
Dewi Melani H

On Thu, Apr 2, 2020 at 6:19 PM dewi melani hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id> wrote:
Dear Editor,

Thank you for your information. Please find attached the pdf of the revised note for the galley proof. Hope now the
manuscript can be published.

Kind Regards,

Dewi Melani Hariyadi

On Wed, Apr 1, 2020 at 11:45 PM Anupama Srivasatava <editor@mripub.com> wrote:

Dear Hariyadi DM,

Please, find enclosed author proof of your article submitted for publication in IJDDT
March Issue. You are supposed to go through the proof and and do the needful.

Regards,
Seema T
Editor IJDDT
9956616864

dewi melani hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id> Sat, Apr 18, 2020 at 10:12 AM
To: drug delivery <ijddtjournal@gmail.com>

Dear Editor,

Considering after | finished final checking my galley proof two weeks ago, could you please advise which volume and
number of my published article in 20207 Thank you.

Kind Regards,
Dewi Melani H

On Thu, Apr 2, 2020 at 6:19 PM dewi melani hariyadi <dewi-m-h@ff.unair.ac.id> wrote:
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Dear Editor,

Thank you for your information. Please find attached the pdf of the revised note for the galley proof. Hope now the
manuscript can be published.

Kind Regards,
Dewi Melani Hariyadi

On Wed, Apr 1, 2020 at 11:45 PM Anupama Srivasatava <editor@mripub.com> wrote:

Dear Hariyadi DM,

Please, find enclosed author proof of your article submitted for publication in IJDDT
March Issue. You are supposed to go through the proof and and do the needful.

Regards,
Seema T
Editor IJDDT
9956616864
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