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Abstract— "The budget of a nation is a crucial component 

of its economic development plan, as it reflects the core values 

and objectives of the government's economic policies, and is 

expected to deliver the desires of the public. Despite this, 

Nigeria's budget has failed to deliver the desired benefits for 

over three decades, indicating the presence of violations that 

have yet to be confirmed empirically. This article aims to 

identify the infractions unique to Nigeria's budget system and 

propose solutions. Data was gathered by surveying government 

agencies and the general public, and the Mann-Whitney U test 

was used to assess consistency in perception between the two 

groups. The study revealed that budget indiscipline, official 

corruption, poor allocation efficiency, and inadequate budget 

governance are the most significant violations in Nigeria's 

budgeting process. Therefore, the study recommends budget 

transparency, target budgeting, zero tolerance for corruption, 

and budgetary discipline as the most effective remedies for 

addressing the shortcomings in Nigeria's budgetary system”. 

Key Words: Budget Management, Budget Discipline, Budgeting 

Problems, Budgeting Remedies, Nigeria.  

I. INTRODUCTION  

The national budget continues to play a crucial role in the 
economic development plan of any country. Through its 
strategic planning and regulatory functions, the budget 
projects anticipated levels of income and expenditure allocates 
limited resources for optimal economic utilization and 
navigates competing interests among various groups. [18]. 
Besides, the budget reflects the fundamental values 
underlying the government’s economic policies and 
objectives and whose execution is expected to realize public 
objectives [25; 8]. The budget is indeed a critical document in 
any nation and is often considered as the second most 
important document after the constitution, or even the most 

important instrument of development in any given year. ([17; 
34] 

However, for a budget to deliver the lofty macro-economic 
objectives enshrined in it from the outset and achieve its 
purpose as an important instrument of development, the 
process and management of the budget requires effectiveness, 
efficiency and equity. In other words, the success or failure of 
any organisation or government is largely determined by how 
effectively the budget process is handled [6]. The reality, 
however, is that the budget processes in different countries are 
more often than not marred by infractions, albeit, at varying 
levels of severity, hence, the objective of the budget is seldom 
achieved. 

In Nigeria, after decades of budgetary operations, 
empirical data on the economy is far from being cheering [19]. 
The Nigerian budgetary system has been adjudged to be 
ineffective, suggesting the existence of impediments in the 
processes and management [11].  Accordingly, several factors 
had been identified as culpable. These include; legal 
limitations, political constraints, budget indiscipline, 
corruption, lack of linkage between budget and policy among 
others.  Worst still is the fact that these factors seem to 
exacerbate the efficiency and efficacy of the national budget 
[20; 23]. 

Consequently, because of the seemingly obvious nature of 
budget infringements in Nigeria, past studies [18; 21] have 
assumed these problems in their studies, hence provided little 
or no experiential shreds of evidence in support of their 
claims. The focus of this paper, therefore, is to empirically 
identify the main and peculiar problems of budgeting in 
Nigeria as well as their preferred solutions from the standpoint 
of stakeholders. The paper is organized into five main sections 
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namely: introduction, review of extant literature, 
methodology, data analysis/discussion, and conclusion. 

II. LITERATURE REVIEW 

 Budgeting Problems in Nigeria 

The problems of budgeting in Nigeria are multifaceted and 
pervasive throughout the entire budget process, which 
includes budget formulation, budget approval, budget 
implementation, and budget appraisal/audit. Some of the key 
problems associated with each stage of the budget process in 
Nigeria, as well as those identified by extant literature, are 
highlighted in the following section. 

According to [24], various shortcomings have been found 

during the budget formulation stage. These flaws include 

improper consultation, scant coverage of pertinent problems, 

waning participant excitement, and unfavorable scheduling 

of the pre-budget consultations. The inconsistency between 

the Medium-Term Expenditure Framework (MTEF) and the 

annual budget, which contravenes the provisions of the Fiscal 

Responsibility Act (FRA) passed in 2007 to ensure prudent 

management of national resources in accordance with Section 

16 of the 1999 Constitution, is another weakness that has 

been identified, as noted by [27]. According to the FRA, the 

annual budget should be derived from the MTEF and serve as 

the basis for the preparation of revenue and expenditure 

estimates, as well as the sectorial compositional distribution 

of the estimates, as highlighted by [12]." 

The identified major shortcomings at the approval stage of 

the budgetary process include: Unnecessary delays in budget 

screening and approval: The lack of legal timing for budget 

presentation, screening, and approval, as the 1999 

constitution does not specify the duration for each stage, can 

result in unnecessary delays. This can lead to difficulties in 

the timely implementation of budgetary plans and programs 

(6). Secondly, Political squabbles between the executive and 

legislature: The budget process is sometimes used as a tool 

for settling political disputes between the executive and 

legislature. This can result in budget approval being 

influenced by political considerations rather than the actual 

needs of the country, leading to compromised budgetary 

decisions. 

Thirdly, Imposition of extra-budgetary conditions: There is a 

tendency to impose extra-budgetary conditions on the budget 

approval process, such as requiring certain projects or 

programs to be included in the budget as a condition for 

approval. This can lead to budgetary decisions that are not 

based on merit or fiscal prudence, but rather on political or 

personal interests. Fourthly, Poor implementation and 

inadequate monitoring of previous budgets: If previous 

budgets are not effectively implemented and monitored, it 

can result in a lack of accountability and transparency in the 

budgetary process. This can lead to recurring budgetary 

issues and inefficiencies in resource allocation. 

Fifthly, Low priority given to budget debates by legislators: 

Budget debates in the legislative chambers may not receive 

the necessary attention and priority they deserve, resulting in 

inadequate scrutiny and oversight of the budget. This can lead 

to suboptimal budgetary decisions and lack of proper checks 

and balances. 

Another is the confusion and inexperience of some 

legislators: Some legislators may lack the necessary expertise 

and experience in budgetary matters, which can result in 

confusion and inefficiencies in the approval stage. This can 

lead to uninformed decisions, delays, and subpar budgetary 

outcomes. (24). 

Addressing these shortcomings may require reforms in the 

budgetary process, such as establishing clear timelines for 

budget presentation, screening, and approval, ensuring that 

budget decisions are based on merit and fiscal prudence 

rather than political considerations, improving 

implementation and monitoring mechanisms, providing 

adequate training and resources for legislators, and enhancing 

the accountability and transparency of the budgetary process  

The implementation phase of the budgeting process is 
fraught with various shortcomings, including delays in fund 
disbursement, non-compliance with budgetary rules, failure to 
adhere to budget estimates, unpredictability and fluctuation in 
allocated funds, and other issues [24]. Ministries, 
Departments, and Agencies (MDAs) also show significant 
deviation between allocated funds and actual spending, which 
can be attributed to factors such as policy changes, 
reallocation of expenditure, inability to implement policies, 
inadequate counterpart funds, inaccurate determination of 
budget ceilings for MDAs, and poor estimation of expected 
revenue by revenue generation and collection agencies [23]. 
A study of budget implementation during the first term of 
Obasanjo's administration (2000-2003) also found weak 
budget performance, which was traced back to the legacy of 
the military era characterized by a lack of clear linkage 
between policy, planning, and budget, weak legal framework 
resulting in budget indiscipline, and mismanagement of 
resources [23]. 

During the auditing phase, the challenges with budgeting 
primarily revolve around inadequate infrastructure for budget 
audits, limited understanding of the auditing process, non-
compliance with auditing rules, and delays in publishing audit 
reports. The International Budget Partners (IBP) (2011) noted 
that when audit reports are available in a timely manner, they 
often reveal numerous instances of poor expenditure practices, 
leakages, and procurement irregularities. These findings, 
when widely disseminated, can enhance accountability and 
support reform efforts. Additionally, other weaknesses of 
budget audits in Nigeria include the lack of focus on results 
when discussing audit findings, as well as issues related to the 
independence and credibility of internal auditors, among other 
challenges [24]. 
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Apart from looking at the budgeting problems concerning 
the stages in the budgeting process, some of the problems 
identified in the literature are pervasive and affect all the 
stages of budgeting. These include but not limited to 
constitutional limitation, corruption, budget indiscipline, low 
level of transparency and accountability among others. Some 
of these general challenges are discussed next. 

Legal/Constitutional Gap 

The Federal Republic of Nigeria's 1999 Constitution serves 

as the country's main legal foundation for public sector 

budgeting. It describes the roles and responsibilities of 

several government agencies in the budgeting process and 

outlines the authority and justification for national resource 

management [12]. It also establishes the framework for 

budget planning, enactment, implementation, and 

monitoring. However, the Constitution has certain significant 

flaws. For instance, Section 81 (1) does not establish a 

deadline and permits the President to propose the budget to 

the National Assembly at any time during the year.  

One of the shortcomings of the 1999 Constitution is the lack 

of a clear timetable for budget presentation, discussion, and 

approval. In addition, Section 82 enables the President to 

accept withdrawals from the CRF for a maximum of six 

months or up until the budget is approved, whichever comes 

first. These provisions permit laxity in the budgeting process, 

which may cause the annual budget for Nigeria to be poorly 

implemented [3;12] as well as delayed budget presentations 

and approvals. 

Additionally, while the constitution outlines the obligations 

of different participants in the budget process, such as the 

legislature's role in influencing the budget and exercising 

oversight functions on budget execution to ensure effective 

and efficient service delivery and positive impacts on 

underprivileged communities, in practice, these expectations 

are frequently not met. The development, management, and 

monitoring of budgets are tasks shared by several institutions, 

which causes inconsistencies and inefficiencies [3;24].  

Overall, while the Constitution provides valuable provisions 

for effective budgeting in Nigeria, its limitations, such as the 

lack of a budget calendar and inconsistencies in roles and 

responsibilities, contribute to the inefficiencies in budget 

management in the country. 

Late Passage of Budget 

Late passage of the annual budget is seen as a contributing 
factor to budgetary difficulties in Nigeria. The hope is that the 
annual appropriation Act (the budget) will be executed over 
the course of 12 months, from January to December. 
However, for many years, the budget has been implemented 
for just 10 months or less after its passage. The 2008 budget 
was implemented poorly, and while some blamed the global 
economic downturn and its impact on Nigeria's oil revenue, 

others attributed the problem to the National Assembly's delay 
in passing the Appropriation bill. More recently, the 2016 and 
2017 budgets were passed in May of their respective years, 
leaving only seven months for their execution. This delay not 
only affects the implementation of the budget but also disrupts 
planned programs and projects. In 2017, for instance, no funds 
were released to MDAs for the execution of capital projects 
budgeted for up to the end of the second quarter, mainly due 
to the late passage of the budget, as highlighted in the BOF's 
second-quarter report [13].                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

Budget Indiscipline 

Indiscipline, as it relates to budgetary operations, is 
associated with; flagrant disregard to budgetary rules and 
policies; non-adherence to estimates as enshrined in the 
approved budget or supplementary budget; funds diversion; 
scandalous insertions into the budget; blatant breaches in the 
timing of the budget process among others [10;11]. It connotes 
a desecration of the doctrine of discipline expected in budget 
governance and management, which has been adjudged to be 
iniquitous to the economic progress of any nation. It has been 
opined that any country, organization, family or even an 
individual that does not spend according to budget is likely to 
fail and cannot grow. This may have accounted for why 
budget failure has become the country’s (Nigeria) 
development albatross. Budget indiscipline also results from 
unnecessary flexibility, financial haphazardness and 
recklessness. Financial recklessness distorts the budgetary 
plan in the short, medium and even long term [22;29] 

In Nigeria, budget indiscipline has been identified as a serious 

problem in the budgetary process. Scholars have noted that 

the principle of strict budget discipline has been lacking in 

the implementation of the federal budget, and this issue has 

been attributed to the legacy of long years of military rule in 

the country. Despite the transition to democratic governance, 

budget implementation failures due to indiscipline have 

persisted. This concerning fiscal management practice 

prompted the inclusion of budget discipline improvement in 

the public sector reform agenda of Obasanjo's administration. 

Low level of Transparency and Accountability: 

Based on [29], it is recommended that budget reports 
should be published in a clear and factual manner, fully, 
promptly, and routinely, and should be easily accessible to 
citizens. Accessibility means that the budget document should 
be available online in a downloadable format, and the budget 
data and informational content should be written in non-
technical language that can be easily understood by citizens.  

This budget management tenet, however, is not being used 
in Nigeria. Nigeria received a score of 16 out of 100 on the 
2012 Open Budget Index, while English-speaking West 
African nations like Ghana, Liberia, and Sierra Leone 
received scores of 50, 43, and 39, respectively. According to 
this result, Nigeria's rating has been dropping since the study's 
biannual beginning in 2006, when it scored 20 points. From 
there, Nigeria's rating fell to 19 in 2008, 18 in 2010, and finally 
a record-low 16 in 2012 [26]. The effectiveness of public 
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decision-making, accountability, and supervision are all 
enhanced by a transparent budgetary framework. 

Corruption 

Corruption is a major obstacle to Nigeria's budget 
implementation, not merely another budgeting infringement. 
10% of Nigeria's Gross Domestic Product (GDP) is 
corruption, according to reference [15]. Nigeria, however, was 
classified as the 136th least corrupt nation in the world out of 
174 nations in a recent Transparency International report [15].  
This number goes hand in hand with the finding that 
combatting corruption in Nigeria is viewed as an exercise in 
futility since it has seeped so deeply into the system's 
foundation [37].  

Government employees who are entrusted with public 
monies misappropriate or, better yet, misdirect cash for their 
own personal gain. Budget execution suffers as a result of 
them hiding the monies intended for it in their personal 
accounts in foreign nations. Public resources are typically 
perceived as private benefits for holding public offices, and 
public offices are transformed into private empires. 
Unwavering commitment and determination are necessary in 
the fight against corruption. In the case of Nigeria, individuals 
must first change in order to combat corruption. It is a 
widespread issue that affects people at all levels of society 
rather than just the top. Because corrupt behavior is continued 
by those who ascend to positions of influence from lower 
levels, corruption continues. [37]. 

Budget Padding has become a common phenomenon in 
recent times and reaching its crescendo in 2016, 2017 and 
2018 budget years. For instance, the 2016 budget was 
surrounded with a lot of controversies, from missing budget to 
allegations of high volume insertions. The chairman of the 
House of Representative Appropriations Committee, 
Abdulmumin Jibrin, alleged that about two thousand (2000) 
projects worth about N284b (Two Hundred and Eighty-Four 
Billion Naira) where illegally inserted into the 2016 budget  
[8].  The 2017 and 2018 budget were not free from the fears 
of this illegal insertions either. The consequence of a padded 
budget among others is that it undermines economic progress 
and retard growth and development. This is because, padding 
like financial corruption, budget padding tends to divert, 
resources meant for critical infrastructure into illicit 
enrichment of few individuals [1]. 

Studying the adequacy of budgetary allocation to the 
educational institutions in Nigeria, [30] observed that the 
education budget was insufficient and far below the 26% 
UNESCO benchmark. He averred that the fallen standard of 
education was a direct consequence of low funding, hence, 
recommended an increase in internally generated revenue as 
an alternative source of additional revenues to boost the 
revenue-based of educational sector. 

Reference [21] identified many budgeting constraints 
including ignoring or undermining the influence of 
technology in the planning and budgeting, weak database, 
political constraints in public policy implementation such as 
lack of political will to implement plans and budgets, spatial 
development, lack of managerial effectiveness, funds 

diversion from rural to urban projects among others. Budget 
indiscipline resulting from unnecessary flexibility. Financial 
haphazardness and recklessness (for instance, Nigeria planned 
to move its capital from Lagos to Abuja by the year 2000, 
while construction commenced in 1981, but General Ibrahim 
Babagiida for spurious security reasons moved the federal 
capital in December 1991 after the abortive Orkar coup [21]. 
Such financial recklessness distorts the budgetary plan in the 
short, medium and even long term.   

2.2 Remedies to Budgetary Challenges 

The remedies to budgeting maladministration lie in the 
adoption of best budget practices, taking into consideration all 
the other pillars of good public governance, including, 
transparency, openness, accountability, integrity and strategic 
planning among others (Organisation for European 
Cooperation and Development) [29]. Accordingly, they are 
ten principles of good budgetary governance which when 
imbibed is expected to “give clear guidance for designing, 
implementing and improving the budget system to address the 
challenges of the future” (Organisation for Economic 
Cooperation and Development [29]. The following are these 
guidelines: 

i. Manage spending plans within the explicit, believable, 
and predictable parameters of fiscal policy. 

ii. Make sure that the budgets are in line with the 
government's midterm strategic aims. 

iii. Create the capital budgeting framework to efficiently 
and cost-effectively address the nation's development needs. 

iv. Ensure that budget documentation and statistics are 
clear, transparent, and available v. Establish a realistic, 
inclusive discourse on fiscal options. 

Present a thorough, accurate, and trustworthy assessment 
of the public finances. 

Plan, oversee, and actively track budget execution. 

viii. Ensure that the budget process incorporates 
performance, evaluation, and value for money. 

ix. Recognize, evaluate, and prudently manage additional 
financial and longer-term sustainability concerns. 

x. Promote the integrity and quality of budgetary forecasts, 
fiscal plans and budgetary implementation through rigorous 
quality assurance including independent audit. 

The overall intention of the principles according to [29] is 
to assist practitioners and policy-makers to plan, manage and 
use public resources effectively to make a positive impact on 
citizens’ lives’. Asides of the OECD principles for good 
budget governance, other specific remedies to budget 
challenges are considered in turn. 

 

 

 

Budget Discipline 
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The fundamental aspect of effective budget management 
for an institution or state is the ability to adhere to approved 
expenditure limits outlined in the budget or supplementary 
budget, regardless of whether it is a deficit, surplus, or 
balanced budget strategy. Discipline in budgeting is crucial 
and encompasses three dimensions: timing discipline, policy 
discipline, and numerical discipline, all of which are essential 
for the budget to work effectively. Any breach of these 
disciplines constitutes indiscipline, which hinders economic 
progress. 

Recent studies on budget discipline in Nigeria have 
highlighted that the country still has a long way to go in terms 
of adhering to budget disciplines, including timing, policy, 
and numerical disciplines. Lack of discipline in budgeting is 
often due to innovative ways of circumventing expenditure 
controls and corruption, among other reasons as identified in 
previous research. 

To improve budget discipline, it is necessary to implement 
a budgeting system that establishes a sustainable fiscal 
framework for the medium and long term. Budgets should be 
prepared in a timely manner and approved by the National 
Assembly before the start of the financial year to ensure a 
meaningful cash plan by the Accountant-General in line with 
the provisions of the Fiscal Responsibility Act (2007). Budget 
implementation should also follow due process as outlined in 
the Public Procurements Act of 2007 

 

Target budgeting 

The traditional concept of Target Budgeting has been 

described differently by various authors. Wenz and Nolan 

(1982) perceive target-based budgeting as a financial tool that 

emphasizes allocating budgetary growth within the 

constraints of existing revenue resources. Another 

perspective by [31] views target-based budgeting as a 

mechanism that sets limits on budget requests from 

departments, with provisions for additional funding based on 

available revenues and competing priorities. However, these 

earlier views differ significantly from the approach proposed 

in this paper. 

A closer alignment with the authors' thinking is reflected in 

the definition provided by [14], which defines target 

budgeting as the amount of money allocated by the legislature 

or through the department's budget process for a specific set 

of services, including projected changes in caseload or 

vendor rate increases. 

In essence, in this paper, target budgeting is considered as a 

budgetary process that allocates a specific amount for a 

particular project and closely monitors the utilization of the 

allocated funds to ensure the achievement of the targeted 

project or objective within the budget year. This 

approach prevents the inclusion of projects in the 
capital budget that are not intended for implementation, only 

to be used as excuses for non-implementation later. Target 

budgeting enables focused implementation of budget 

provisions, leading to the efficient delivery of public goods 

to society. 

Prompt Release of Funds 

To ensure that Ministries, Departments, and Agencies 
(MDAs) prioritize the implementation of capital budgets, it is 
crucial to have a consistent commitment of funds. This allows 
MDAs to plan with the assurance that funds will not be 
abruptly cut off during the implementation stage. 
Additionally, MDAs should proactively prepare project and 
procurement documents in a timely manner, and fulfill the 
requirements for obtaining a certificate of no objection for 
contract awards. This will facilitate their access to the 
necessary funds at the right time and in the right amount [37]. 

III. RESEARCH METHODS 

This study used a survey research design to collect 

information on the difficulties budget practices face in 

Nigeria and their solutions. Two sample groups, the general 

public (GP) and government agencies (GAs), each received 

400 questionnaires in total. The researcher specifically 

identified participants based on their expertise or experience 

linked to the study's goal and purpose. As a result, the sample 

size and sample groups were carefully chosen. It was decided 

to use the stakeholder's purposive sampling strategy, which 

involves identifying the important parties involved in 

creating, delivering, receiving, or managing the program or 

service under evaluation. The Budget Office of the 

Federation (BOF), the Office of the Accountant General of 

the Federation (AGF), the Debt Management Office (DMO), 

and the Central 

The administered questionnaire was used to address the 

features of the sampled groups (75 from GA, 94 from GP), 

and while the response rate of 169 out of 400 reflecting 

42.25% at first glance may seem low, it was deemed 

appropriate in the context of the research purpose. There is 

no response rate that is universally acceptable, according to 

the Institute of Citizens-Centered Service (ICCS), which also 

asserted that the representativeness of the views or opinions 

is more significant than the response rate. 

The ICCS also emphasized that a low response rate may not 

add bias to the findings provided the opinions of the 

respondents who did respond are not noticeably different 

from those of the respondents who did not. This implies that 

even with a somewhat low response rate, the analysis' 

findings may still be reliable provided the respondents are 

typical of the greater community and if the non-respondents 

are not expected to hold radically divergent beliefs or ideas. 

When assessing the suitability of a response rate, it's critical 

to take the research's particular context, the traits of the 

sampled groups, and the research purpose into account. When 

analyzing the study's conclusions, it's important to take into 

account additional elements such as; the survey's 
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methodology, the way data was collected, and any potential 

biases. 

The study's questionnaire was divided into three sections. Six 

questions in Section 'A' connected to the respondent's 

information were followed by Sections 'B' and 'C', which 

discussed Nigerian budgetary problems and their potential 

remedies. The combined sections 'B' and 'C' featured a total 

of 14 questions, including 10 that used a 5-point Likert scale, 

2 open-ended questions, and 2 that needed factor rankings on 

a scale of 1–5. Respondents were able to base their answers 

on their knowledge and skills thanks to the open-ended 

questions. 

In order to determine the most important issues and the most 

effective ways to solve them, descriptive statistics, such as 

tables and charts, were utilized to compute percentages. The 

opinions of the sampling group were compared using the 

Mann Whitney U Test (MWT), a non-parametric alternative 

to an Independent-Samples t-test. 

When the assumption of normality is violated, the Mann 

Whitney U Test (MWT) is used to compare two independent 

groups on a continuous measure. The MWT compares 

medians instead of means, which makes the actual 

distribution of the scores irrelevant [20;33;36]. This is in 

contrast to the t-test, which compares means. When working 

with data that is not normally distributed or with tiny sample 

sizes, this test is especially helpful. 

 Overall, when comparing two independent groups on a 

continuous measure and working with non-normally 

distributed data, the Mann Whitney U Test (MWT) in 

combination with descriptive statistics offers a reliable 

method for data analysis in this study. The outcomes of these 

analyses can offer important insights into the variations and 

patterns found in the data, which can aid in the development 

of relevant conclusions and the formulation of well-informed 

judgments based on the study's findings. 

IV. DATA PRESENTATION, ANALYSIS AND 
DISCUSSION 

This section of the paper captures the presentation of the 
response rate from the survey, the analysis of the data gathered 
from the administered questionnaire as well as the discussion 
of the result. 

A. Data Presentation 

According to Table 1, the survey was administered to a 
total of 400 questionnaires. Out of these, 169 questionnaires 
were retrieved, representing a response rate of 42.25%. 
However, 231 questionnaires were not retrieved, accounting 
for the remaining 57.75%. The analysis of data in this study 
was based on the 169 retrieved questionnaires, which 
constituted the 42.25% response rate.  

Table 1: Response Rate from Questionnaire 

Source: Field Survey (2013)       

The study's participating organizations are listed in Table 2, 

along with the matching response rates to the questionnaires 

that were distributed. The Central Bank of Nigeria (CBN), the 

Budget Office of the Federation (BOF), the Debt 

Management Office (DMO), and the Accountant General 

Office (AGO) were among the government organizations that 

were sampled. BOF, CBN, and DMO each received 50 

questionnaires, while AGO and DMO received 30 and 40 

questionnaires, respectively. These agencies had response 

rates of 44%, 40%, 60%, and 37.5%, respectively. 

 Agents of Change (AOC) received 30 questionnaires from 

the non-governmental organizations (NGOs) sampled, while 

the other four organizations—the Nigerian Labour Congress 

(NLC), the Nigerian Bar Association (NBA), the Nigerian 

Union of Teachers (NUT), and the Nigerian Union of 

Journalists (NUJ) each received 50. For the NLC, NBA, 

NUT, NUJ, and AOC, respectively, the retrieval rates or the 

percentage of completed surveys that were returned were 

72%, 34%, 10%, 46%, and 43.33%. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 Frequency  Per cent  Cumulative 

Percent 

Retrieved  169 42.25 42.25 

Not Retrieved 231 57.75 100 

Total  400 100.00  

Authorized licensed use limited to: Durban University of Technology. Downloaded on May 23,2023 at 12:15:07 UTC from IEEE Xplore.  Restrictions apply. 



Table 2: Response Rate by Organisation 

 
Source: Field Survey (2013). 
 

B. Data Analyses 

Both descriptive analysis and inferential analysis were 

performed on the data collected. 

 

Descriptive Analysis of the Personal Bio-Data of 

Respondents 

An overview of the respondents' personal bio-data is given in 

Table 3. It shows that of the 169 people who responded to the 

questionnaires, 110 (65.1%) identified as men and 59 

(34.9%) as women. This implies that there was a greater 

representation of men among the respondents, which may be 

explained by the sampling procedure, where men were more 

common in the firms that were chosen. 

In terms of the organizations to which the respondents 

belonged, the table reveals that 94 respondents (55.6%) were 

connected to non-governmental organizations (NGOs), 

whereas 75 respondents (44.4%) were. The table shows that, 

with the exception of the National Labour Congress (NLC), 

individual organizations' response rates were generally 

higher among government agencies, even though the 

response rate from NGOs was greater in absolute numbers. 

Table 3 further shows that 64 respondents had a master's 

degree as their greatest educational qualification, 101 

respondents had a first degree, and 4 respondents had an 

OND/NCE (Ordinary National Diploma/National Certificate 

of Education) as their highest academic qualification. This 

suggests that all of the respondents were educated, and as a 

result, were very likely to comprehend the problems with 

Nigerian budgeting that were brought up in the survey. 

Table 3: Bio-Data of the Respondents 

Source: Field Survey (2013) 

For the length of service or experience, only 21.9%, or 37 

respondents, had less than three years of work experience in 

the study, whereas the majority of respondents, or 78.1%, or 

132 people, had at least three years. This shows that rather 

than just theoretical academic knowledge, the responses 

Organization No.  

Admi

nister

ed 

No. 

Retri

eved 

% 

Retriev

ed 

Affiliation 

Budget Office 

of the 

Federation 

(BOF) 

Central Bank of 

Nigeria (CBN) 

Debt 

Management 

Office (DMO) 

Accountant 

General Office 

(AGO) 

 

50 

 

50 

 

30 

 

40 

 

22 

 

20 

 

18 

 

15 

 

44 

 

40 

 

60 

 

37.5 

Governmen

t 

Agency 

Nigerian 

Labour 

Congress 

(NLC) 

Nigerian Bar 

Association 

(NBA) 

Nigerian Union 

of Teachers 

(NUT) 

Nigeria Union 

of Journalist 

(NUJ) 

Agents of 

Change (AOC) 

Total 

 

50 

 

 

50 

 

50 

 

50 

30 

400 

 

36 

 

 

17 

 

5 

 

23 

13 

169 

 

72 

 

 

34 

 

10 

 

46 

43.33 

42.25 

  

Non- 

Governmen

tal 

Organisati

ons (NGO) 

VARIABLE FREQUENCY PER 

CENT 

CUM. PER 

CENT 

GENDER 

Male 

Female 

Total 

110 

59 
169 

65.1 

34.9 
100.0 

65.1 

100.0 
  

ORGANISATION 

Government Agency 

Non-Governmental 

Organisation 
Total 

75 

94 

169 

44.4 

55.6 

100.0 

44.4 

100.0 

  

HIGHEST ACADEMIC QUALIFICATION 

OND/NCE 

First Degree 
Master’s Degree 

Total 

4 

101 

64 
169 

2.4 

59.8 

37.9 
100.0 

2.4 

62.1 

100.0 
  

LENGTH OF SERVICE 

0-2 Yrs 

3-5 Yrs 
5- 10 Yrs 

10 Yrs and Above 

Total 

37 

36 
32 

64 

169 

21.9 

21.3 
18.9 

37.9 

100.0 

21.9 

43.2 
62.1 

100.0 

  

AFFILIATED DISCIPLINE 

Accounting 

Economics/Statistics 

Business Administration 
Law 

Public Admin/Pol 

Science 
Others 

Total 

34 

49 
12 

18 

7 
49 

169 

20.1 
29.0 

7.1 

10.7 
4.1 

29.0 
100.0 

20.1 
49.1 

56.2 

66.9 
71.0 

100.0 
  

PROFESSIONAL AFFILIATION 

ICAN/ CIBN/other 

Accounting/Finance 
Professional Bodies 

NES/NSA/Economics 

Prof. Bodies 
NBA 

Others/None 

Total 

33 

23 

16 

97 

169 

19.5 

13.6 

9.5 

57.4 

100.0 

19.5 

33.1 

42.6 

100.0 
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provided by the respondents were probably based on their 

real-world experience. 

According to the results, 34 respondents, or 20.1%, studied 

accounting, 49 respondents, or 29%, studied economics or 

statistics, 12 respondents, or 7.1%, studied business 

administration, 18 respondents, or 10.7%, studied law, 7 

respondents, or 4.1%, studied public administration, and 49 

respondents, or 29%, took other courses. Given that 

budgeting is frequently covered in the curricula of disciplines 

like Accounting, Economics, Business, Law, and Public 

Administration, it is implied that the majority of the 

respondents had prior exposure to topics connected to 

budgeting. 

Additionally, 73 respondents, or 42.6%, belonged to 

professional organizations that value budgeting highly. These 

professional organizations included the Nigerian Bar 

Association (NBA), the Nigerian Economic Society (NES), 

the Nigerian Statistical Association (NSA), and the Institute 

of Chartered Accountants of Nigeria (ICAN). But 57.4% of 

the respondents, or 97 people, either belonged to other 

professional organizations that weren't mentioned in the 

survey or had no affiliation with any professional group. 

Reliability Test 

A commonly used indicator of internal consistency 

reliability, Cronbach's Alpha evaluates the consistency of 

replies within items of a scale or questionnaire. The validity 

of scales or measures designed to measure a single construct 

or notion is frequently assessed in research and statistical 

analysis. A high Cronbach's Alpha value suggests that the 

scale's items are consistently assessing the same underlying 

construct because they are highly correlated with one another. 

. Using Cronbach's Alpha coefficient to measure reliability is 

useful in the context of the analysis of qualities of sound 

budget management and detection of budgeting issues in 

Nigeria. It enables researchers to evaluate the internal 

coherence of the metrics or markers used to gauge budgeting 

issues or characteristics of good budget management. If the 

items used in the study are consistently measuring the 

intended construct, as shown by a high Cronbach's Alpha 

value, the study's conclusions may be more accurate. 

Cronbach's Alpha is a well-known and commonly 

acknowledged measure of internal consistency reliability, 

therefore mentioning it as a favored measure of reliability 

lends credibility to the research. It shows that the researchers 

utilized a reputable and accepted approach to evaluate the 

accuracy of their measurements, which strengthens the 

trustworthiness and validity of their conclusions. 

In light of the unique study setting and the characteristics of 

the data being evaluated, researchers may take into account 

additional reliability metrics in addition to Cronbach's Alpha. 

However, in this instance, the application of the Cronbach's 

Alpha coefficient is appropriate and consistent with best 

practices in scientific investigation and statistical analysis. 

Table 4: Reliability Test of Sound Budget Management 

Attributes  

Source: Field Survey (2013) 

The results shown in Table 4 show that there were no 

violations of the internal consistency of the 10 items related 

to budget management attributes, as shown by the higher-

than-required Cronbach's Alpha coefficient of 0.714 (with a 

standardized coefficient of 0.712) for scale reliability. The 

scales for odd budgeting issues and their solutions, however, 

may have breached the dependability standard, according to 

the results, as their Cronbach's Alpha coefficients were 

determined to be less than 0.7. 

It is significant to remember that, as highlighted by Pollant 

(2011), Cronbach's Alpha is sensitive to the amount of 

elements in a scale. For a scale with only five elements, a 

coefficient of 0.5 is typical. According to this claim, the two 

scales in question—the five-item measures measuring 

budgeting difficulties and budgeting solutions—did not fail 

the reliability test because their Cronbach's Alpha 

coefficients were roughly 0.5 apiece. 

Descriptive Statistics of Peculiar Budgeting Problems in 

Nigeria 

 

 The low mean score of 2.71 and the high standard deviation 

of 1.217 suggest that the majority of respondents did not 

concur that a lack of cash is one of the main issues with 

budgeting in Nigeria, according to the descriptive results 

shown in Table 5. Of the total respondents, 30 (17.8%) 

strongly disagreed, 52 (30.8%) disagreed, 38 (22.5%) were 

unsure, 35 (20.7%) agreed, and 14 (8.3%) strongly agreed 

that a key issue with Nigerian budgeting is a lack of funds. 

 
 

Cronbach's 

Alpha 

Cronbach's Alpha 

Based on 

Standardized Items N of Items 

Budget Management 

Attributes 
.714 .712 10 

Peculiar Problems of 

Budgeting 
.450 .462 5 

Remedies to Budgeting 

Problems 
.577 .584 5 
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It's crucial to remember that these findings may not apply to 

the full population of Nigeria as they are based on the replies 

of a sample of those who took the survey. However, the 

findings do offer some understanding into how Nigerians 

perceive budgeting problems, particularly those connected to 

the issue of inadequate funding. 

 Table 5: Descriptive Statistic of Peculiar Budgeting Problems 

in Nigeria 

Source: Field Survey (2013) 

According to the results, a sizable majority of respondents 

(60.4%) believed that Nigerian budgeting is severely 

hampered by the annual budget's tardy passage, with only 

18.4% disagreeing and 21.3% expressing no opinion. The 

majority of respondents appear to tend to concur with this 

statement, according to the mean score of 3.63 and the 

standard deviation of 1.045. 

Similar findings are shown for item three, where a large 

majority (78.1%) of respondents believed that budget 

indiscipline has been a significant issue in Nigerian budget 

administration. Only a tiny portion of respondents (7.7%), 

strongly disagreed (2.4%), or were unsure (11.8%) of the 

statement. The respondents' strong agreement on this topic is 

further supported by the high mean score of 4.01 and the low 

standard deviation of 0.997. 

Overall, based on the results, it appears that Nigeria's 

budgeting and budget management are seen to have big 

problems, as evidenced by the majority of respondents who 

agreed that the yearly budget's late passage and disregard for 

its rules and limits are significant issues. 

According to the statistics in this area, a sizable portion of 

respondents agreed or strongly agreed that Nigeria's budget 

management has been badly impacted by public debt and the 

culture of borrowing. Only 3.6% very opposed and 20.7% 

disagreed with this statement, whereas around 33.7% agreed 

and 20.7% strongly agreed. The majority of respondents 

appear to be inclined toward agreement, as indicated by the 

mean response score of 3.47 and standard deviation of 1.139. 

Furthermore, the data reveals that a sizable majority of 

respondents—with a mean response score of 3.04 and a 

standard deviation of 1.157—believe that Nigerian budget 

changes cannot be put into practice. In particular, 11.2% 

strongly opposed, 21.9% were indecisive, and 7.1% strongly 

agreed with this statement, whereas 36.1% agreed and 

23.7% disagreed with it. 

The respondents ranked Nigeria's budgeting issues in order 

of importance, with budget indiscipline combined with 

corruption receiving a mean score of 4.63 (about 5) on a 

scale of 1 to 5. With a mean score of 3.51 (about 4), 

allocating resources inefficiently came in second, showing 

that people consider it to be highly influential. Public debt 

came in second with a mean score of 2.86, followed by poor 

budget reforms in third place with a mean score of 3.22. 

With a mean score of 2.02, it was determined that financial 

insufficiency was the least significant issue. 

Overall, the data indicates that respondents see public debt, 

borrowing tendencies, budget reforms, and budget 

indiscipline along with corruption as major obstacles to 

Nigeria's budget management, whereas they see a lack of 

finances as less of an issue. 

 

    

                                                                                                                                        
Figure 1: Respondents Ranking of Major Budgeting Problems in 

Nigeria 

Source: Field Survey (2013) 

In addition to the issues described in section six, the 

respondents identified five more budgeting issues in Nigeria 

in Figure 2. These issues include: 

 i. Poor government agency revenue generation, which was 

mentioned by 10.89% of the respondents. 

ii. Unstable policies and poor governance, which were 

mentioned by 29.70% of the respondents. 

 

 SD D NS A SA Mean  Std. 

Dev. 

Insufficiency 

of Funds 

30 

17.8% 

52 

30.8% 

38 

22.5% 

35 

20.7% 

14 

8.3% 

2.71 1.217 

Late Passage 
of Annual 

Budget 

2 
1.2% 

29 
17.2% 

36 
21.3% 

65 
38.5% 

37 
21.9% 

3.63 1.045 

Disregards 

to Budget 
Rules and 

Limits 

4 

2.4% 

13 

7.7% 

20 

11.8% 

73 

43.2% 

59 

34.9% 

4.01 0.997 

Public Debts 6 
3.6% 

35 
20.7% 

36 
21.3% 

57 
33.7% 

35 
20.7% 

3.47 1.139 

Poor 

Budgetary 
Reforms 

19 

11.2% 

40 

23.7% 

37 

21.9% 

61 

36.1% 

12 

7.1% 

3.04 1.157 

Valid 

Number of 

Observation 

169 169 169 169 169 169 169 
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iii. The most responders (43.56%) highlighted fiscal 

irregularity combined with overall mismanagement as the 

problem. 

iv. Insufficiently skilled staff to deal with budget concerns, as 

reported by 8.91% of the respondents. 

v. Government organizations and agencies having conflicts 

of interest, which was mentioned by 6.93% of the 

respondents. 

These extra budgeting concerns in Nigeria bring to light 

problems including ineffective revenue production, unstable 

governance and policy, fiscal mismanagement, a lack of 

manpower, and conflicts of interest between government 

departments. These results imply that in order to increase the 

efficacy and efficiency of budgeting procedures in Nigeria, a 

number of difficulties in the process need to be addressed.

   

 

 
Figure 2: Other Problems of Budgeting in Nigeria 
Source: Field Survey (2013) 

 

Remedies to Budget Problems 

The results of the descriptive analysis of the replies to the 

questions 1 through 7 in section D of the survey, which 

focuses on budgeting problem solutions, are shown in Table 

6. This section discusses the first five items.. 

Only 53 respondents (31.4%) indicated that boosting the 

government's revenue capacity will reduce poverty through 

budgeting, while 116 respondents (68.7%) disagreed with 

this proposition. The majority of respondents disagree with 

this statement, as shown by the mean score of 2.71 and the 

standard deviation of 1.347. In other words, the majority of 

respondents do not think that boosting government money 

will end poverty. This result is similar with the first finding 

in the budgeting problem section, where the majority of 

respondents disagreed that a major issue in Nigeria is a lack 

of cash. 

This implies that the respondents do not view raising 

government revenue as a practical means of reducing poverty 

through budgeting. As it suggests that there may be other 

factors or issues that are considered more relevant or 

significant in addressing poverty in Nigeria than simply 

increasing government revenue, this finding may have 

implications for policymakers and practitioners involved in 

budgeting and poverty reduction efforts. For the purpose of 

guiding policy and decision-making processes, more 

investigation and analysis of the underlying causes for this 

view among respondents may be required. 

Table 6: Descriptive Statistics of Remedies to Nigeria’s Budget 

Problems 

 
Source: Field Survey (2013) 

Table 6 shows that 139 out of the total respondents 

(representing 82.2% of the sample) had a favorable opinion 

of the specified target financial allocation to programs aimed 

at reducing poverty. A lesser percentage of respondents 

disagreed with the suggested goal financial allocation (14 

respondents, or 8.3%), were unsure (7 respondents, or 4.1%), 

or strongly disagreed (9 respondents, or 5.3%) with it. As the 

mean score is above the midpoint of the scale (which 

typically represents neutrality) and the standard deviation is 

relatively low, indicating a relatively narrow spread of 

responses around the mean, the suggested target budgetary 

allocation is further supported by the mean score of 4.06 and 

the standard deviation of 1.132. 

It's crucial to remember that without further context, it is 

impossible to assess the motivations underlying the 

respondents' opinions or the significance of these results in 

regard to programs for reducing poverty. For a thorough 

understanding of the findings, additional investigation and 

consideration of other aspects may be required. 

The third item in this area, early budget passage, had the 

following results: 11.8% strongly agree, 33.7% agree, 26.6% 

were not sure, 14.2% disagree, and 13.6% severely disagree. 

The replies to the alternatives were fairly distributed, as 

shown by the mean and standard deviation of 3.16 and 1.217, 

respectively.  

10.89%
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The majority of respondents (55.6%) agree with the claim 

made in item 4 that regular reviews of budget reforms and 

enforcement of compliance will enhance budget management 

and help Nigeria eradicate poverty. Additional support for 

this claim comes from the average score of 3.34 and the 

standard deviation of 1.314, which indicate that a substantial 

majority of respondents concur with it. 

Concerning transparency and accountability, an even bigger 

majority of respondents (62.7%) think that poverty will be 

greatly decreased if the ideals of transparency and 

accountability are incorporated into Nigeria's public 

budgeting process. A mean score of 3.62, which shows that 

the majority of respondents agree with the topic, supports 

this. It is important to note that some respondents disagreed 

with or were unsure about these claims, with 10.7% 

disagreeing with the claim about transparency and 

accountability, and 26.6% disagreeing with the claim about a 

periodic review of budget reforms. A minor portion of 

respondents also strongly disagreed or were unsure 

about these concerns. Overall, the data indicates 

that a sizable majority of respondents think that 

budget reforms, enforcement of compliance, 

openness, and accountability in Nigeria's public 

budgeting process are crucial elements that can 

improve budget management and aid in the 

alleviation of poverty. 

The respondents were asked to select a few possible solutions 

to the Nigerian budgeting issue on a scale of one to five (5) 

in response to item 6 of section D of the questionnaire. 'Not 

important' is denoted by a score of 1, 'important' by 

2,'moderately important' by 3,'very important' by 4, and'most 

important' by 5. 

 

 

 
Figure 3: Ranking of Remedies to Budget Problems 

Source: Field Survey (2013) 

 

Figure 3 shows that the most significant cure to address 

Nigeria's budgeting issues was regarded to be transparency 

and accountability in budgeting, which obtained the highest 

mean score of 4.45. Target budgeting came in second place 

with a mean score of 4.21, while timing the budget process 

came in third place with a mean score of 3.5. An increase in 

government revenue had the lowest mean score of 2.44, 

suggesting that it was thought to be the least significant 

solution to Nigeria's budgeting problems. Review and 

enforcement of budgets received a mean score of 3.14 and 

were ranked fourth. 

Along with the five options proposed by the researcher, 

Figure 4 also summarizes the extra ideas offered by the 

respondents based on their knowledge and experiences. There 

were four primary issues that needed to be resolved: strict 

financial control, participatory budgeting, zero tolerance for 

corruption, and increased capital spending. The importance 

of tackling corruption, enhancing budget management 

procedures, including stakeholders in the budgeting process, 

and allocating more funds to capital projects is emphasized 

by these additional solutions, which were suggested by the 

respondents as possible ways to address Nigeria's budgeting 

challenges. 

 

 

 

 
Figure 4: Other Remedies to Budgeting in Nigeria 

Source: Field Survey (2013) 

However, it seems that budget management discipline was 

thought to be the most important element in addressing 

budget management issues and reducing poverty in Nigeria 

based on the associated percentage frequencies provided, as 

it received the highest percentage frequency score of 41.96% 

from the respondents. This shows that the majority of 

respondents consider budget management discipline to be 

essential for resolving these difficulties.  
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The respondents also rated the other three factors—zero 

tolerance for corruption, participatory budgeting, and 

increased capital allocation—in varied degrees as important. 

The respondents recommended participatory budgeting 

(21.69%), zero tolerance for corruption (27.97%), and 

increasing capital allocation (8.39%). This shows that even 

while these elements were thought to be significant solutions, 

the respondents did not rate them highly as a discipline in 

budget management.  

Although the respondents viewed each of these qualities as 

significant, the percentage frequencies indicate that 

respondents felt budget management discipline to be the most 

important. Policymakers and other stakeholders in Nigeria's 

attempts to manage the budget and reduce poverty may find 

this information useful in helping them prioritize their plans 

and activities. 

 

Mann-Whitney U Test (MWT) on Budgeting Problems and 

Suggested Remedies in Nigeria 

 

The disparities in opinions on budgeting issues and solutions 

in Nigeria between government agencies and non-

governmental groups were examined using the Mann-

Whitney test (MWT). Table 7 shows the summary results of 

the MWT for budgeting issues, and Table 8 shows the 

summary results of the MWT for remedies. These findings 

are likely to support the study's goal and research question by 

showing that there may be statistically significant 

discrepancies between government and non-government 

groups' assessments of Nigeria's budgetary problems and 

potential remedies. However, it is impossible to provide a 

more thorough explanation or analysis of the data without 

more precise information or the real results from Tables 7 and 

8. 
Table 7: Result of the Mann-Whitney U Test on Peculiar Problems 

 

 N Mea
n 
Ran
ks 

Me
dia
n 

Mann 
Whitne
y U 

Z Assym
p. Sig  
(2 
tailed) 

Govern
ment 
Agencie
s 

75 84.3
9 

3.4
00
0 

3479 
-
.146 

0.884 Non-
Govern
ment 
Organiz
ation 

94 85.4
9 

3.4
00
0 

Total 169    
Source: Field Survey (2013) 

According to the data, government agencies (GAs) and non-

governmental organizations (NGOs) have the same median 

score, although their mean ranks differ somewhat (perhaps 

because there were 75 and 94 cases, respectively). However, 

the Mann-Whitney U test indicates that there is no 

statistically significant difference between Nigeria's 

budgeting issues as perceived by government agencies and 

those perceived by non-governmental organizations, with a 

z-approximation of -0.146 and an asymptotic significance 

(Assymp. Sig) of 0.884. 

This indicates that both government agencies and non-

governmental groups share the same identified and rated 

budgeting concerns, as well as other problems raised by 

respondents. Discipline and corruption, financial 

irregularity/general mismanagement, inefficiencies in 

budgetary allocation, and poor governance/policy instability 

or inconsistency are a few of the significant issues mentioned. 

Additionally, Table 8 demonstrates that there is no 

discernible difference in how government agencies (GAs) 

and non-governmental organizations (NGOs) see proposed 

solutions to the budgeting issues. 

In conclusion, the data in Tables 7 and 8 show that there are 

no statistically significant differences between government 

organizations and non-governmental organizations in Nigeria 

in terms of how they perceive budgeting issues and potential 

solutions. 
 

Table 8: Result of the Mann-Whitney U Test on Suggested Remedies 

Source: Field Survey (2013) 

According to the table, the two groups' mean ranks are 

different, with the "GAs" group's mean rank being 86.57 and 

the "NGOs" group's mean rank being 83.75. The median for 

the two groups, nevertheless, is the same. 

The two groups were compared using the Mann-Whitney U 

test; the estimated U statistic has a z-approximation of -0.373 

and is 3407.500. According to the asymptotic significance (2-

tailed) value of 0.709, the result is not significant at the 5% 

level of significance. Given that the MWT compares medians 

rather than means, this implies that there is no statistically 

 N Mean 

Ranks 

Median Mann 

Whitney 

U 

Z Assymp. 

Sig  

(2 

tailed) 

Government 

Agencies 

75 86.57 3.4000 

3407.500 
-

0.373 
0.709 

Non-

Government 

Organisation 

94 83.75 3.4000 

Total 169 

 

Authorized licensed use limited to: Durban University of Technology. Downloaded on May 23,2023 at 12:15:07 UTC from IEEE Xplore.  Restrictions apply. 



significant difference between the two groups based on the 

median. 

The identified and graded budget therapies as well as 

additional recommendations are the same for the two groups. 

Strict financial discipline, goal budgeting, zero tolerance for 

corruption, and enhanced transparency and accountability in 

budget administration are a few of the noteworthy treatments 

offered. 

 V. CONCLUSION 

This study was fixated at diagnosing the problems and 

remedies of budgeting in Nigeria, from the perspectives of 

stakeholders. Government agencies on the one hand and Non-

Governmental Organisations on the other hand. The study 

arrived at a consensus for both the peculiar problems of 

budgeting and their possible remedies. 

 

The most notorious among the problems were budget 

indiscipline compounded with corruption. These twin evils 

have bedeviled state financial operations and undermine 

government fiscal cum budgetary intentions. 

 

The paper recommended in tandem with the suggested 

remedies by the stakeholders, that government should uphold 

the virtue of discipline and eschew corruption at all levels and 

all strategies of the budget process. It is also our recommendation 

that target budgeting should be adopted. Projects and programs for which 

budgetary provisions are made should be followed through 

for execution. Such projects/programs should be monitored 

to ensure that funds are not diverted and the implementations 

are done according to specifications. 
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