
care remains a platinum-based regimen (cisplatin or carboplatin) combined with gem-
citabine, vinorelbine or taxanes for up to 4-6 cycles. In non-squamous NSCLC, mainte-
nance therapy (MTx) by continuing pemetrexed as single-agent after induction
treatment has led to a 3-months improvement in OS. On the contrary, no randomized
study has shown a significant benefit from MTx in Sq-NSCLC patients (pts), yet. More
recently, nivolumab has become the standard of care as second line therapy.
Unfortunately, 30-40% of Sq-NSCLC pts do not have access to second-line therapy
because of rapid progression and decline of performance status (PS). Nivolumab as
switch MTx would represent a strategy to anticipate its use, allowing more patients to
benefit from immune check-points inhibitors.

Trial design: Eligible pts: age�18, stage IIIB/IV or recurrent Sq-NSCLC, no disease
progression (PD) after 4-6 cycles of first-line platinum-based Ctx, ECOG PS� 2, no
symptomatic and/or progressive treated brain metastases, good bone marrow, liver and
renal functions. 388 pts will be randomized 1:1 to Nivolumab flat dose 240 mg i.v (Arm
A) every 2 weeks or best supportive care (BSC) followed by Nivolumab 240 mg i.v at
PD (Arm B), and stratified by centre and tumor response to first-line induction Ctx
(complete response and partial response vs stable disease). Pts enrolled into Arm A will
receive Nivolumab until PD or intolerable toxicity; at PD, they will be treated with Ctx
according to local policy. Patients enrolled into Arm B will receive Nivolumab only
after radiologic evidence of PD. Nivolumab treatment beyond initial PD will be allowed
in both arms. Primary endpoint: OS. Secondary end-points: progression-free survival
(PFS), PFS from induction (PFS-ind), time to treatment failure (TTF) and OS from
induction (OS-ind). At January 5th 2019, 49 pts were enrolled.

Clinical trial identification: NCT03542461.

Legal entity responsible for the study: Gruppo Oncologico Italiano di Ricerca Clinica
(GOIRC), Parma, Italy.

Funding: BMS.

Disclosure: L. Cavanna: Personal fees for serving in a consultant and/or advisory role:
Astrazeneca, Merck; Honoraria: Celgene, Pfizer, Ipsen. A. Ardizzoni: Research grant
support: BMS, Celgene; Personal fees for serving in a consultant and/or advisory role:
BMS, MSD, Boehringer Ingelheim; Honoraria: Eli Lilly, Pfizer. All other authors have
declared no conflicts of interest.

187TiP Tumor treating fields concurrent with standard of care therapy for
stage IV NSCLC following platinum failure: Phase III LUNAR study

U. Weinberg, O. Farber, M. Giladi, Z. Bomzon, E. Kirson

Novocure Ltd, Haifa, Israel

Background: Tumor Treating Fields (TTFields), a non-invasive anti-mitotic treat-
ment, added to temozolomide significantly extended survival in newly diagnosed glio-
blastoma. TTFields is eficacious in preclinical in vitro and in vivo NSCLC models. A
phase I/II study [NCT00749346] of advanced NSCLC of TTFields plus pemetrexed
detected no serious adverse events; median overall survival (OS) of 13.8 months. The
Phase 3 LUNAR study [NCT02973789] investigates if TTFields added to immune
checkpoint inhibitors or docetaxel following platinum failure will increase overall sur-
vival (OS).

Trial design: Patients (N¼ 534) with squamous or non-squamous NSCLC, are strati-
fied by therapy (immune checkpoint inhibitors or docetaxel), histology (squamous vs.
non-squamous) and geographical region. Key inclusion criteria: disease progression on
or after platinum-based therapy, ECOG 0-2, no electronic medical devices in upper
torso, and absence of brain metastases. Docetaxel or immune checkpoint inhibitors are
given at standard doses. TTFields (150 kHz) are applied to the upper torso for
>18 hours/day. TTFields are continued until progression in the thorax and/or liver.
Follow up is performed once q6 weeks, including CT scans of the chest and abdomen.
On progression in the thorax and/or liver, patients have 3 post-progression follow up
visits and are then followed monthly for survival. The primary endpoint is superiority

in OS between patients treated with TTFields in combination with the standard of care
treatments versus standard of care treatments alone. Key secondary endpoints compare
the OS in patients treated with TTFields and docetaxel versus docetaxel alone, and
patients treated with TTFields and immune checkpoint inhibitors vs those treated with
immune checkpoint inhibitors alone. An exploratory analysis will test non-inferiority
of TTFields with docetaxel compared to checkpoint inhibitors alone. Secondary end-
points include progression-free survival, radiological response rate, quality of life based
on the EORTC QLQ C30 questionnaire and severity and frequency of adverse events.
The sample size is powered to detect a HR of 0.75 in TTFields-treated patients versus
control group.

Clinical trial identification: NCT02973789.

Legal entity responsible for the study: Novocure.

Funding: Novocure.

Disclosure: U. Weinberg, O. Farber, M. Giladi, Z. Bomzon, E. Kirson: Full time
employee, stock options: Novocure.

188TiP Metformin 1/- cyclic fasting mimicking diet in combination with
platinum-pemetrexed chemotherapy for advanced LKB1 inactive
lung adenocarcinoma: The FAME trial

G. Galli1, D. Signorelli1, C. Vernieri1, M. Ganzinelli1, M. Moro1, A. Fabbri1, E. Tamborini1,
M. Marabese2, E. Caiola2, M. Broggini2, L. Hollander2, R. Gallucci1, C. Gavazzi1,
A.M. Rizzo3, P. Corsetto3, G. Pruneri1, F. de Braud1, G. Sozzi1, V. Torri2, M.C. Garassino1

1Fondazione IRCCS Istituto Nazionale dei Tumori, Milan, Italy, 2Istituto di Ricerche
Farmacologiche "Mario Negri", Milan, Italy, 3Universit�a degli Studi di Milano, Milan, Italy

Background: LKB1 inactive (LKB1i) lung adenocarcinoma (LA) has an aggressive
behavior and is resistant to immunotherapy (IO). LKB1i cells are vulnerable to nutrient
starvation. Based on preclinical data showing a synergy cisplatin-metformin, we
hypothesized that combining platinum-based chemotherapy (CT) with metforminþ/-
a calorie-restricted, low-carbohydrate, low-protein diet known as Fasting Mimicking
Diet (FMD) may improve the efficacy of CT in patients (pts) with LKB1i LA.

Trial design: FAME is a monocentric, open label, double arm, non comparative,
randomized, single stage, pick-the-winner phase II trial. Primary objective is
Progression Free Survival (PFS), evaluated in comparison with a historical cohort of
pts treated with CT. Secondary objectives consist in studying experimental treatment
toxicity, response rate, overall survival, metabolic changes in blood, urine and stool,
correlation between LKB1 mutation status and LKB1 protein expression. Main inclu-
sion criteria are: advanced LKB1i LA, absence of EGFR mutations and ALK/ROS1 rear-
rangements, PDL1 expression< 50%, performance status 0-1. Main exclusion criteria
are: body mass index<20 kg/m2, weight loss�5% in the previous 3 months, diabetes
mellitus, active brain metastases, baseline fasting glucose�65 mg/dL, arterial pO2
<70 mmHg, high blood lactates. Eligible pts will be randomized 1:1 to up to 4 cycles of
platinum-pemetrexed CTþmetformin, or up to 4 cycles of platinum-pemetrexed CT
þmetforminþ FMD. After 4 cycles, stable/responding pts will continue pemetrexedþ
metformin until progression or toxicity. Forty-one pts per arm will be necessary to
identify a 4.4 mos increase in median PFS. Brookmeyer-Crowley test will be used with
an a tail of .15 and a power of .8 mos. Assuming a dropout rate of 5%, the number of
pts to enroll will be 88.

Clinical trial identification: NCT03709147, first posted on 17 October 2018;
EudraCT: 2018-000788-95.

Legal entity responsible for the study: Fondazione IRCCS Istituto Nazionale dei
Tumori, Milan, Italy.

Funding: AIRC (Associazione Italiana per la Ricerca sul Cancro) Investigator Grant
2017.

Disclosure: All authors have declared no conflicts of interest.
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