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Letter

Laparoscopic procedures can be performed concurrently 
in a single setting.1 Laparoscopic entry sites for combined 
upper and lower abdominal surgeries are a controversial 
issue with no international recommendations. As the um-
bilicus is the optimum primary entry point for laparoscopy, 
it is typically used in such cases. The Darwish point was 
recently identified as a secure (primary) laparoscopic entry 
point in exceptional situations.2 It is a right-sided meeting 
point of an imaginary transverse line at the umbilical level 
and a vertical line 2.5 cm medial to the anterior superior 
iliac spine. It can subsequently serve as a right-sided aux-
iliary (secondary) laparoscopic entry site in some cases of 
combined upper abdominal (e.g., cholecystectomy, adhe-
siolysis) and lower abdominal laparoscopic surgeries (e.g., 
appendectomy, myomectomy, and ovarian cystectomy) 

in female patients. In such cases, an additional left-sided 
auxiliary (secondary) portal should be prepared laterally to 
the left inferior epigastric vessels, as high as possible, but 
below the umbilical level. In this way, both upper and lower 
abdominal surgeries can be easily done, with the advantage 
of minimizing secondary laparoscopic portal numbers and 
resulting in a better aesthetic appearance of the abdomen. 

In conclusion, the Darwish point may be used as an al-
ternative “primary,” as well as a “secondary,” laparoscopic 
portal in combined upper and lower abdominal laparoscopic 
surgeries. Figure 1 shows the entry portals suggested for 
most combined upper and lower abdominal laparoscopic 
surgeries. We performed many combined upper and low-
er abdominal surgeries via this approach, with successful 
results in terms of ease of access to the surgical site and 
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minimized portal numbers.2 Regarding upper abdominal 
surgery via this approach, the French position (lithotomy) 
is recommended for better access and surgeon comfort by 
maintaining a perfect azimuth angle. Using the Darwish 
point as a secondary portal may pave the way for random-

ized controlled trials to compare this new approach with 
conventional laparoscopic entry portals for this type of sur-

gery. 
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Figure 1. Abdominal access in combined upper and lower abdominal 
laparoscopic surgery.


