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Abstract 

Ethnogenetic studies have had a long tradition in the archaeology of the former Soviet 
Union, but related theoretical debate was constricted by the bounds of official ideology, 
which laid a basis for the ethnic misuse of archaeology. This article discusses the present 
situation in the theory of Slavonic colonization, which has often served the purposes of id­
eological and political speculation. The author claims that after the numerous ad hoc modi­
fications concerning the origin of the long barrows and the sopka mounds the whole nation­
al-romantic theory of Slavonic immigration should be rejected. The descent of the Russians 
of North-West Russia can be explained by the substitution of the local Balto-Finnic langua­
ges by the Slavonic languages. The distribution of the 'Old Russian' culture over a large 
area may be interpreted as an example of the use of material culture in social strategies. 
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The interrelationship of archaeology and politics 
and its consequences for our view of prehistory 
have been a topic of discussion for several dec­
ades. However, keen interest in these questions has 
not become especially apparent until today (e.g. 
Kristiansen 1993a). In Eastern Europe, the col­
lapse of communism and the emergence of new 
states have created a new situation for the disci­
pline of archaeology (e.g. Neustupny 1993; Gring­
muth-Dallmer 1993). Rapid political and ideologi­
cal change has also had a strong effect on archae­
ology, and its future development promises to be 
quite contradictory. Ian Hodder (1991a; 1991b) 
has recently expressed concern about the possible 
nationalistic and ethnic uses of archaeology under 
conditions of ethnic unrest to justify regional 
claims in Eastern Europe. He has called for a con­
tinuous critique of reconstructions of the past as 
ideological. Hodder feels that an uncritical link be­
tween archaeological theory and nationalist claims 
has inhibited theoretical discussion in many parts 
of Europe. He sees the main reason for this in the 
shadow cast by the misuse of the past for national­
istic purposes in the Third Reich. 

I would claim that Hodder is only partly correct. 
It is highly typical for a Western archaeologist to 

speak about the damages brought on by the Third 
Reich while completely forgetting the former So­
viet empire. In the West, Soviet archaeology was 
often seen in much too positive a vein (e.g. Trigger 
1989; Lamberg-Karlovsky 1989). This was partly 
due to language barriers and partly a product of 
naive 'Marxist solidarity'. There is no question 
that Soviet archaeology had its positive sides and 
its many gifted scholars who produced serious 
achievements, but I feel that many Western arch­
aeologists have not fully understood the constric­
tions placed by official Soviet Marxist ideology on 
theoretical discussion and debate (cf. Tilley 1991; 
Klejn 1991). In speaking about the nationalistic 
misuses of archaeology it is important to bear in 
mind the long tradition of ethnogenetic studies in 
the former Soviet Union, and the consequences of 
its limitations on theoretical discussion there. So­
viet archaeology is also a good example of the 
necessity of Hodder's warning. On the other hand, 
the Soviet experience also shows that in the near 
future the ideological reconstruction of the past 
might very well become a problem for archae­
ology within the European Community as well. 
There are already signs of creating some kind of 
'Ee archaeology' (e.g. Randsborg 1991), and in a 
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struggle against the Ee a reaction might well be 
the resurrection of ethnic archaeology in Europe 
(cf. Rowlands 1984, 111, 112). 

In the former Soviet republics archaeology is al­
ready being misused in the press in connection 
with political disputes. The only ones to halt such a 
development are the archaeologists themselves, 
but I am afraid that they are often not ready to do 
so. Archaeological speculation figures, for ins­
tance, in territorial debates between Estonia and 
Russia. In Estonia, the assertion 'Finno-Ugrians 
were here long before the Slavs' is very popular, 
whereas in Russia the superiority of the Slavs over 
the autochtonous 'Finns' was openly emphasized, 
a view that was slightly hidden during the Soviet 
period. It is also a paradox that both 'sides' use the 
concept of the Slavonic colonization theory. This 
article presents a critical survey of the present situ­
ation in the theory of Slavonic colonization in 
North-West Russia. My aim here is to discuss 
whether there is any real basis for any of the ideo­
logical approaches mentioned above. 

Despite serious Soviet contributions to archae­
ological theory on the interrelationships of archae­
ological cultures and ethnic groups (Leo Klejn and 
others), there were areas of archaeology which, in 
my view, were hardly influenced by them, particu­
larly the archaeology of the Baltic countries and 
the 'Slavonic-Russian archaeology' of North-West 
Russia. Also isolated from Western archaeological 
thought, these fields pursued their own quiet life 
under the strong, though indirect, influence of 
Gustaf Kossinna's methodology of identifying 
prehistoric ethnic groups. A typical feature of this 
situation is that Kossinna was always strongly 
criticized in the Soviet archaeological literature. 
This criticism, however, was not methodological, 
but purely political. The only exception was L. 
Klejn, whose 1974 study on Kossinna was not 
published in the Soviet Union. Both in the Baltics 
and in North-West Russia much energy was chan­
nelled into searching for early ethnic borders by 
using 'ethnic indicators'. The data of physical 
anthropology were also widely used for these pur­
poses. The national-romantic 'paradigm' of Sla­
vonic colonization was created to explain the 
origin of the Russian nation. Some details of this 
theory, concerning certain grave types, met with 
resistance among individual Russian scholars and 
particularly in Estonian archaeology. 

Western scholars would consider such archae­
ology 'nationalistic', and they would be right. 
However, before voicing such comments and dra­
wing parallels with the Third Reich, one should al­
ways try to understand the concrete political back­
ground and to find out the interests actually served 
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by archaeology. In the present case, one has to bear 
in mind a certain positive role played by national­
ism under the Soviet empire. Firstly, the Russian 
nation, though being the 'leading' one, still faced a 
certain threat to its cultural identity in the concept 
of the' Soviet nation'. Consequently, interest in the 
origin of the Russians offered a kind of escape 
from that situation. This was even more the case 
with the Estonians (and Latvians, Lithuanians, Uk­
rainians etc.) who had forfeited their independence 
and whose future was directly threatened through 
mass deportation and official assimilation policies. 
On these grounds, I would prefer the term 
'national romanticism' in this context. Further­
more, in the former Soviet Union the term 'nation­
alism' still bears associations with the Stalinist re­
pressions of intellectuals. 

Estonian archaeology is a good example of how 
ethnic archaeology is perhaps best made attractive 
by changing political borders. Before the Second 
World War, ethnic interpretations of archaeologi­
cal materials were only a kind of by-product ofEs­
tonian archaeology, which was to a large extent in­
fluenced by the functionalist views of A. M. 
Tallgren. While Professor of Archaeology at Tartu 
University from 1920 to 1923, Tallgren was the 
founder of Estonian national archaeology, and he 
was very critical about the ethnic uses of the disci­
pline (see Tallgren 1937). After Estonia was incor­
porated into the Soviet empire, ethnogenetic rese­
arch, which was becoming more and more popular 
in the Soviet Union, was 'borrowed' from the East 
to become the main direction of Estonian archae­
ology. Research (see Moora 1956) was carried out 
in a solid interdisciplinary way, complementing 
archaeological data with that of ethnography, 
linguistics, physical anthropology and folklore 
studies. The same process occurred somewhat 
later in Latvia and Lithuania. The political grounds 
for such change were obvious. The ideological im­
portance of the archaeologists' claims to the Es­
tonian people at that time - 'our ancestors have 
lived here for thousands of years' - cannot be 
underestimated. This statement was one of the few 
ways available to resist the ideology of the Soviet 
Communist Party, which maintained that smaller 
nations were to disappear sooner or later. There is 
also a great deal of irony in the fact that as the main 
complex ethnogenetic study produced in Estonia 
(Moora 1956) was also published in a parallel ver­
sion in Russian, it became a veritable lesson in 
methodology for corresponding research through­
out the Soviet Union. 

National romantic interpretations of the past 
were a logical consequence of the totalitarian 
regime. Russian national romanticism, however, 



was not only used to oppose the regime - the 
regime itself utilized it in its own policies of assi­
milation. The theory of Slavonic colonization was 
very useful in that it presumed that cultural superi­
ority of the Slavs, and it found use primarily in the 
sphere of education (the official glorification of 
Russian history, Russia as the Big Brother of other 
nations) as the historical justification for the domi­
nance of the Russian language in the Soviet Union 
and the Russification of smaller nations. These 
policies were naturally reflected in the structure of 
archaeological institutions as well. It is no accident 
that the Leningrad branch of the Institute of Arch­
aeology of the Soviet Academy of Sciences - the 
leading institution in the study of North-West 
Russia - had no Bronze or Iron Age section deal­
ing with this area. The section of Slavonic archae­
ology renamed, 'Slavonic-Finnic' in the 1970s (in 
order to develop foreign contacts?), studied only 
the 'Slavonic period' . As a result, no one dealt sys­
tematically with these 'non-Slavonic' periods of 
prehistory in this area. From this alone it is diffi­
cult to understand how large-scale immigration 
could be demonstrated. The prehistory of the local 
Balto-Finnic groups was studied in the context of 
their relations with the Slavs and the Old Russian 
state. 

But let us take a closer look at the paradigm of 
Slavonic colonization. Both Estonian and Russian 
researchers share the opinion that at least until the 
middle of the first millennium AD North-West 
Russia was inhabited by various Finno-Ugrian 
groups. It would lead us too far to discuss whether 
such a claim is fully justified. I only note here that 
the whole theory is based, first of all, on the identi­
fication of archaeological cultures and physical 
types with ethnic groups. In fact, we do not know, 
of course, what the linguistic situation was during 
the Stone and Bronze Ages. But it should be cer­
tain that the local population did not speak any 
proto-Slavonic dialects during the Early Iron Age. 
Estonian and Russian scholars also agree that the 
autochtonous population was mostly assimilated 
after Slavonic colonization took place. Differences 
in opinion emerge in identifying the earliest Sla­
vonic antiquities. Most Russian scholars maintain 
that the long barrows and the sopka mounds of the 
second half of the first millennium AD were built 
by the Kriviches and the Novgorodian Slovenes 
respectively, and can be interpreted as the earliest 
Slavonic graves. Estonian archaeologists have 
usually rejected these claims, and have attributed 
these antiquities to the 'Finns' (Laul 1971; Aun 
1980; Jaanits et al. 1982; Selirand 1983). The Es­
tonian literature of the past decades, however, 
never attempted to answer the question of the 

origin of the present Russian population of North­
West Russia. It should be clear that an answer to 
this question would be essential if one is to inter­
pret all the known burial remains as non-Slavonic. 
At the same time it would be incorrect not to men­
tion that, for political reasons, it was impossible 
for Estonian archaeology in the 1950s and '60s to 
openly debate the ethnic identification of antiqui­
ties which Russian scholars had declared to be Sla­
vonic. Debate did not become possible until some 
of the Russian scholars had raised their own 
doubts. 

I would see the problem of the origin of the 
Russian population in the former Novgorod Land 
in quite a different light. I have previously written 
about the impossibility of demonstrating any kind 
of pattern of Slavonic colonization in the area of 
the long-barrow culture in the middle of the first 
millennium (Ligi 1989), or in North-East Estonia, 
Ingria or the Votic Land (Ingermanland) in the 
11th - 13th centuries (Ligi 1986;1988). Here, I 
will try to argue for the position that the origin of 
the Russians of North-West Russia should first and 
foremost be explained by language replacement 
and that no large-scale Slavonic colonization can 
be proved. On that point I share the opinion ofVik­
tor Paranin, whose study (1990) has so far been al­
most totally ignored by scholars, perhaps partly 
because of his neglect of archaeological data. The 
idea itself is of course much older and, in principle, 
can be traced as far back as the 18th century (see 
Tatischev 1979, 96). My own explanation of the 
process of language replacement is not far re­
moved from certain ideas already expressed by 
some Russian scholars 15 years ago, who claimed 
that towns played a decisive role in this area 
(Bulkin et al. 1978). Their study can be charac­
terized, however, as a 'softer' version ofthe theory 
of Slavonic colonization. 

Although the theory of Slavonic colonization 
has undergone several essential ad hoc modifi­
cations, its basic ideas have remained very much 
the same (for a general review see Kirpitschnikow 
& Ryabinin 1987). The paradigm that has formed 
over the past four decades argues that after the first 
waves of Slavonic immigrants had arrived into the 
almost uninhabited lands in the second half of the 
first millennium AD, the Slavs continued to co­
lonize more and more areas during the so-called 
Old Russian period. The mounds and zhalnik inter­
ments of the 11th - 14th centuries are interpreted 
as signs of a growing Slavonic population, which 
assimilated the local 'tribes'. To show what seems 
to be wrong about the whole theory I will discuss 
its most obvious ad hoc modifications. 

Until the beginning of the 1950s, it was gen-
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erally maintained that already in the Pre-Roman 
and Roman Iron Age early Slavonic tribes in­
habited the headwaters of the Dniepr and the 
Dvina rivers, from where they later moved to­
wards the north (fretyakov 1953). One reason 
why the long barrows and sopka mounds were at­
tributed to the Slavonic immigrants was the state­
ment that these graves had no local 'roots' (Early 
Iron Age antiquities were almost completely un­
known in North-West Russia, and this situation 
has not appreciably changed even by now). The 
first serious problem for the immigration theory 
emerged when it became obvious that oldest sou­
thernmost long barrows (the Smolensk group) 
were at least four hundred years younger than the 
early northern long barrows (the Pskov group). 
Now the first ad hoc modification was introduced. 
According to the new version (Sedov 1960), the 
Krivich tribes had originated from eastern Poland, 
from where they first moved to the Pskov region, 
and only then to the south. 

By the 1970s the need for the next ad hoc modi­
fication became obvious, as no suitable candidates 
could be found for the earlier 'roots' of the long 
barrows in the assumed initial territory of the Kri­
viches. According to the new theory (Sedov 1974; 
1982), the Krivich immigrants invented the new 
grave type (the long barrow) only after they had 
arrived in North-West Russia. The fact that the 
main argument for denying the 'Finnish' origin of 
the long barrows (the lack of local 'roots') should 
no longer have been used was never discussed. To 
prove the Slavonic origin of the long barrows Va­
lentin Sedov used a Kossinna-style retrospective 
method proceeding from the later antiquities - the 
semispherical mounds with cremation burials. For 
some reason, he took their Slavonic origin for 
granted. New discoveries of pit cremations with 
the same type of pottery as is characteristic of the 
long barrows also seemed to be in accordance with 
the latest version. It was now discussed (Nosov 
1982) whether the early Slavs of the Novgorod 
Land could still have originated from the south, as 
similar pit cremations with somewhat similar pot­
tery were to be found there (the Tuschemlya-Ban­
cerovo culture, 5th-7th centuries AD). But as these 
antiquities were spread over a comparatively lim­
ited area, and were of the same age as the early 
long barrows, they could not be used to locate the 
'homeland' . 

Moreover, the geographical distribution of the 
long barrows proved to be much broader than pre­
viously assumed (Nosov 1981), which in itself 
eroded the plausibility of the immigration theory. 
Paleodemographic estimates showed that the 
population to whom the long barrows belonged 
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was very sparse (Lesman 1985; Ugi 1989), which 
again was not in accordance with the immigration 
theory. Admittedly, these calculations only gave a 
picture of the burials in the barrows, and there is no 
certainty that the whole community was buried in 
them. Despite this, the supporters of the Slavonic 
theory have always referred to the barrows as 
proof of a sudden increase of population resulting 
from immigration. Finally, a number of Roman 
Iron Age pit cremations with typical 'Finnish' tex­
tile-impressed pottery were discovered in the eas­
tern part of the area of distribution of the sites and 
antiquities concerned (Baschenkin 1990). It had 
been claimed previously that the 'Finns' never 
practised urn-pit cremations. At present, an in­
creasing number of scholars have rejected the idea 
of the Slavonic origin of the long barrows. Instead, 
the main emphasis is now on the sopka mounds. 
The different locations of these grave types are 
underlined, the soplaJ mounds being normally on 
heavier soils than the long barrows (Dolukhanov 
1986). Accordingly, the economy of the Slavonic 
immigrants is considered to have been much more 
advanced than that of the autochtonous population. 
And yet, this 'stake' seems very much a bluff. 

Until the 19808 the soplaJ culture was dated to 
precisely the same period as the long-barrow cul­
ture (6th -10th centuries). However, by now it se­
ems certain that the earliest sopka mounds date 
from the 8th century, and the majority are of the 
9th - 10th centuries. It would be methodologically 
interesting to discuss how the theory of Slavonic 
immigration could be constructed with the help of 
an erroneous chronology. But even this is not the 
main point here. It is more essential that the 
Slovenes are always assumed to have initially 
settled around Lake Dmen, where the Russian 
chronicles of the 11th and 12th centuries place 
them and where the largest concentration of sopka 
mounds can be observed. From there, they were 
assumed to have moved at a later date to the north. 
Now, however, it is clear that the earliest sopka 
mounds are those in the north (in the Lake Ladoga 
area), and the ones in the limen region are only 
from the 9th - 10th (11th) centuries. In fact, the 
situation became very much the same as in the case 
of the long barrows twenty years previously, and 
an ad hoc modification of the theory was again re­
quired to solve the puzzle. The invention of the rite 
of building sopka mounds now began to be ex­
plained through Scandinavian-Slavonic contacts in 
the Lake Ladoga area. The sopkas were now inter­
preted as the burial monuments of the elite and not 
as the graves of the whole community (Konetski 
1989). Such an explanation seems very likely, but 
as we are dealing here with a theory of migration 



we should perhaps ask why the Slovenes had to 
travel so far before honouring their leaders with 
such displays of mortuary architecture. In view of 
the whole paradigm, I would like to refer to one 
more interesting moment: in the minds of scholars, 
the Slovenes proved to be as lucky as the Kriviches 
in not having to face the embarrassing question of 
the 'roots' of their burial monuments. As noted 
above, this question was fatal for the autochtonous 
population for whom such 'roots' were obligatory. 

Despite the lack of early sopka mounds in the 
limen region, scholars have not abandoned the 
idea that this was the area where the Slovenic im­
migrants first arrived in the 8th century. According 
to the latest version of the theory, this colonization 
had the character of a rapid, large-scale process of 
immigration (Konetski 1992). The sopka mounds 
are no longer necessary to prove it, since the first 
pit cremations have been found adjacent to them. 
Following the logic of the modification strategy of 
the paradigm, these cremations were attributed at 
once to the Slovenes (Konetski 1989), although 
there is nothing that would indicate their ethnicity. 
These are not the only facts which I see as 
'counterinstances' and not as 'puzzles' for the 
paradigm, to use Thomas S. Kuhn's (1970) terms. 
Let us also take a look at the other essential points. 

Firstly, I would like to refer to the method of 
'ethnic indicators' which was widely used in So­
viet archaeology. It is interesting to note that for 
the early Slavonic immigrants, unlike the other 
ethnic groups, the existence of such indicators was 
not considered necessary. Instead, the statement of 
Niderle (1956) was often referred to, claiming that 
the Slavs always used non-Slavonic ornaments in 
the areas of contact with other ethnic groups. 
Though such a phenomenon of displaying 'soli­
darity' is actually possible (see Hodder 1982, 
Odner 1983), it cannot be regarded as a specifi­
cally Slavonic ethnic feature, nor can it be used to 
prove immigration. The display of such solidarity 
would rather presume that in the contact areas the 
Slavs would have been the ones that were assi­
milated. 

Another essential point concerns the interpre­
tation of the most numerous category of finds - the 
pottery of the so-called Ladoga type. This ware is 
characteristic of the town of Old Ladoga and also 
of the sopka mounds. As the sopkas are attributed 
to the Slovenes, the pottery often follows suit. For 
example, rural settlements containing this type of 
pottery are usually attributed to the Slovenes. 
Here, we are in fact dealing with an obviously 
tautological explanation. Furthermore, Ladoga­
type pottery is interpreted as an innovation in 
North-West Russia. However, similar ware was 

typical of neighbouring Estonia already from the 
Bronze Age, and also of the Dyakovo culture 
(Lang 1991). 

The next problem is the question of the 'home­
land' of the assumed Slavonic immigrants. Defin­
ing its exact location appears to have been a puzzle 
postponed for the future. However, it is clear that 
most scholars have started to believe in a West Sla­
vonic origin for the immigrants (see Sedov 1982; 
1986; Nosov 1990; Yanin 1992; Konetski 1992), 
although the evidence does not appear to be at all 
sufficient. Anything seems to merit as proof of the 
new version: certain common features of West 
Slavonic and Ladoga pottery (despite the fact that 
the former was wheel-turned and the latter was 
made by hand!); a number of arrowheads found at 
the hillfort of Novgorod; even dwellings with hor­
izontal beams and an oven in the comer (!); certain 
similarities of physionomy between the assumed 
Slovenes and the Western Slavs; and some western 
features of the Novgorod dialect in the 12th - 14th 
centuries. There was no discussion whatsoever of 
alternative explanations (for instance, the role of 
the Viking Period international trade routes) or the 
actual evidence for the migration route (was it re­
ally a large-scale maritime campaign undertaken 
by farmers?). 

Another essential problem is the lack of any ex­
planation of the social, economic and demographic 
preconditions for large-scale Slavonic migration 
(this is of course too much to ask, since even the 
location of the homeland is unknown). Nor is there 
any discussion of the curious phenomenon of the 
enormous backwardness of the society and econ­
omy of the autochtonous population of North­
West Russia in comparison with their neighbours. 
According to Vassily Konetski (1992), the econ­
omy of the local 'tribes', which was based on 
slash-and-burn cultivation, had come to an 
impasse, and therefore they had to disappear from 
the historical scene. This claim differs from the 
earlier modifications of the paradigan by its more 
explicit ideological superstructure: the autochton­
ous population is assumed to have been primitive 
and to have played only a passive role in the early 
history of Russia. But how can one then explain 
that the settlement pattern of the Bronze and Early 
Iron Age has come to be discovered on the same 
soils on which the sopkas are situated (see Nosov 
& Plokhov 1989; Nosov 1991)? We may also ask 
what the Pre-Roman and Roman Iron Age settle­
ment pattern of neighbouring Estonia would have 
looked like if the rite of burying in stone settings 
had not been practised there. To date, only a few 
dwelling sites and settlements of these periods are 
known in Estonia. Furthermore, the archaeological 
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data is insufficient for conclusions concerning the 
economy of a prehistoric society, and there is no 
palynological evidence for the primitive state of 
the local economy. 

Finally, we must also keep in mind the fact that 
Marxist archaeology has always emphasized the 
importance of internal factors in the development 
of society. It has also emphasized the priority of 
the establishment of private property in land in the 
formation of classes and the state. In the present 
case, however, Soviet Marxist archaeologists tried 
to combine migrationist concepts with those of 
orthodox Marxism. The 'real' internal develop­
ment of a society towards the formation of a state 
is thought to have begun at a fixed point in time. 
But how can one combine the extensive develop­
ment of agriculture under conditions of enormous 
reserves of available land, which were always 
available to the surplus population, with rapid 
social development? According to the theory, it 
took only one century after the assumed migration 
for the process of state formation to be completed. 
It is of no importance here whether we look at 
these developments from a Marxist position or not 
- an historical process of this kind is simply not 
likely. There is no doubt that the existence of free 
land would have slowed societal development (cf. 
Hedeager 1992). 

In my opinion, the above problems are enough 
to show that the national-romantic paradigm of 
Slavonic colonization has reached a point of crisis 
and should be rejected. To continue research 
within this paradigm would mean that the early 
history of North-West Russia will remain das Ding 
fUr uns, and we would come no closer to das Ding 
an sich. All the difficulties could be avoided if the 
changes in the settlement pattern and culture were 
explained as a result of internal development and 
not by migration. Intending to strengthen the para­
digm, Evgeny Nosov put the question in these 
terms over ten years ago (Nosov 1982): if we reject 
the Slavonic attribution of the long barrows and 
the sopka mounds, are there any other antiquities 
or remains that would trace the course of Slavonic 
immigration? His answer was negative. Now we 
may ask if any such immigration ever occurred. 
My answer is also in the negative. But before go­
ing on to the problem of language replacement we 
must briefly review the archaeological and anth­
ropological data of the 'Old Russian colonization 
period' from the 11th to the 13th centuries. 

How can we explain that in several peripheral 
areas of NorthWest Russia we can observe the re­
placement of the local 'Finnish' cultures by the 
'Old Russian' culture in the 11th -12th centuries? 
In some of these areas, burials of the 10th - 11th 
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centuries displaying a 'pure Finnish' culture have 
been excavated (e.g. in the South Ladoga area). In 
other places, the earliest known graves share both 
'Finnish' and 'Russian' features, as in Ingria, and 
on the east coast of Lake Peipsi. The interpretation 
of culture change as a result of migration is, of 
course, typical of the culture-historical school of 
archaeology. The 'Slavonic-Russian archaeology' 
of the former Soviet Union always equated the dis­
tribution of 'Old Russian' material culture (pri­
marily women's ornaments) with colonization, 
linguistic and assimilation processes (the concept 
of an ethnically mixed population). However, 
alternative explanations can also be found. In my 
opinion, the idea of material culture being used in 
social strategies (Hodder 1982; 1986) is appropri­
ate here, and we may well rely on the concept of 
'solidarity display'. The distribution of the 'Old 
Russian' culture over a large area can be under­
stood as the cultural consolidation of groups shar­
ing common economic and political interests, 
whose cultural differences were levelled as a result 
of the concentration of political power in Nov­
gorod (cf. Hodder 1982, 105-124). At the same 
time, it is certain that, as in Finland (see Taavitsai­
nen 1987; 1990), new wilderness regions were co­
lonized in the northern parts of the Novgorod Land 
by a surplus population between the 11th and 13th 
centuries. This process may have been caused, at 
least partly, by the intensification of the fur econ­
omy. The colonization, however, cannot be ident­
ified with the spread of the Slavonic language. 

There is no doubt that the data of physical anth­
ropology is of great value in trying to solve the 
problem of the origin of the Russian population in 
the Novgorod Land, especially when DNA analy­
sis is applied. But at present it can be noted that 
Soviet scholars always tried to interpret their data 
of diversity in the physical composition of the 11-
th-14th-century population of North-West Russia 
within the bounds of the theory of Slavonic co­
lonization. There was also a tendency to place mi­
gration processes in periods from which skeletal 
material is available, which was not only typical of 
research in North-West Russia. In the Novgorod 
Land the oldest available skulls are from the 11th 
century, but the history of human settlement there 
is over 10,000 years old. Leaving aside the cem­
etery of Olennyi Ostrov in the periphery of the re­
gion, we know almost nothing about the physical 
anthropological types which were present in the 
Mesolithic, Neolithic, Bronze Age and most of the 
Iron Age. But we do know, for example, that the 
European physical type, characterized by a narrow 
face and a gracile odontological complex, was al­
ready present in the East-European forest zone 



during the Bronze Age (Denisova et al. 1985). 
How can one then be sure that the similar type, at­
tributed to the Slovenes, did not appear in the Nov­
gorod Land until the 8th century AD? Further­
more, the odontological complexes of the typical 
'Slovenic' craniological series, which have been 
referred to repeatedly (Kositskoye, Khreple) have 
proved to represent typical 'Finnish' types (nor­
thern gracile and North-European relic). Also the 
present population of North-West Russia belongs 
primarily to these odontological types (Gravere 
1987; 1990). 

On the whole, the present linguistic situation 
remains the only argument to support the theory of 
Slavonic colonization. Therefore we must answer 
the question whether the local languages could 
have been replaced by the Slavonic one without 
large-scale immigration and assimilation pro­
cesses. Colin Renfrew (1987) has suggested sev­
eral models for the replacement of language, of 
which the elite-dominance one is worth consider­
ing here, although the situation in North-West 
Russia was somewhat specific. In the present case, 
the main factor could have been the concentration 
of power in towns which formed as a result of 
rapid socio-economic progress. The latter was 
caused by international trade routes passing 
through North-West Russia. The trade and craft 
centres attracted representatives of different ethnic 
groups, and it was in the polyethnic towns where 
the Slavonic dialects first gained dominance. This 
was not determined by the specific ethnic features 
or the higher level of development of the Slavs but 
by the fact that the Novgorod Land was made part 
of the economic, religious and political system of 
the Russian state, in which the Slavonic ethnic el­
ement dominated. Under the conditions of a sym­
biosis of the towns and its agricultural hinterland 
with its 'Finnish' population, the local dialects 
were gradually replaced by the Slavonic language. 
The local elite must have been the first to change 
its language, and I would regard this process as a 
variant of the elite-dominance model (see also 
Hodder 1982, 109). The non-Slavonic elite 
changed its language in order to maintain its social 
position in the old Russian state and the rest of 
society followed suit. Christianization must have 
had a very important role as well. It is clear that the 
speed of this process of language replacement was 
not the same in all parts of the Novgorod Land. 
However, I do not believe that analyses of the 
composition of grave-goods or material culture 
change as a whole can define the precise time of 
language replacement. 

It could be argued that my scheme does not ex­
plain why some of the Balto-Finnic groups kept 

their own language and material culture (Kare­
lians, Ingrians, northern Votes). I think, however, 
that the reason lies in the specific political and 
economic relations of these groups with Nov­
gorod. They all had political autonomy for a long 
time and were not orientated exclusively towards 
Novgorod but also to the West and the North. In 
case of Karelia, for example, we can observe a 
long-term Swedish-Russian competition while in 
northern Ingria there were even more competitors. 

Finally, some general observations are required. 
One methodological conclusion from the present 
discussion could be that though the Marxism 
which was practised in Soviet archaeology is often 
called dogmatic, there were clearly cases where 
the dogmatic Marxist scheme of development of 
prehistoric society came into conflict with Russian 
national romantic ideas and, consequently, 're­
visionism' was immediately possible, and Marxist 
views had to take second place. It might be 
claimed that in this case such archaeology cannot 
even be called Marxist. I remain convinced that if 
we are to speak of Marxist archaeology at all (see 
Klejn 1991), the use of the term is justified only in 
the case of the former Soviet Union and its satelli­
tes, and not in the West where it is clearly misused 
(cf. Kristiansen 1984, 96; 1993b, 192). What I 
mostly react against is the use of Karl Marx's 
name in archaeology. We do not speak of 'Dar­
winist' archaeology when speaking of the impact 
of evolutionary thought, do we? Western 'neo­
Marxist' archaeology could very well be called 
'dialectical archaeology' instead, keeping in mind 
the importance of dialectical epistomology for this 
tradition (cf. Saitta 1989). In the case of the Soviet 
Union the term 'Marxist archaeology' would be 
correct, perhaps, because consciously or uncon­
sciously, the great majority of Soviet archaeol­
ogists (including those of the Baltic republics and 
even those opposed to communism) accepted the 
classical Marxist scheme of development of 
society, and used it in their studies. As an official 
policy, Marxism made it possible for national ro­
manticism and Marxist ideology not to exclude but 
to complement each other. 

I am quite aware that my own interpretation of 
the origin of the Russians may also be considered 
ideological. In Russia, some would perhaps de­
scribe it as nationalistic, whereas in Estonia ap­
praisals might be quite the opposite (e.g. too 
'cosmopolitan'). Michael Shanks and Christopher 
Tilley claim that 'archaeology, as the product of 
social conditions and forms of social existence, is 
always produced in terms of specific interests and 
values' and that 'archaeology is always dependent 
on the political and social position of the investi-
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gator and his or her awareness of the social con­
ditions in which archaeological production takes 
place' (1987, 200). I myself would agree if my po­
sition were considered a phenomenon of the pol­
itics of compromise. I must also confess here that 
my viewpoint is partly shaped, perhaps, by my 
own social experience. This experience reminds 
me what happened with the non-Russian elite of 
the 'national' republics of the previous Soviet 
Union. It was impossible for this elite to keep their 
social position without the knowledge of the 
Russian language. It was absolutely necessary to 
belong to the 'Orden', i.e. to the communist party, 
too. And very often the local leaders married a 
Russian wife and put their children in a Russian 
school which was a good way to prove one's loy­
alty. 

But what would be the political and ideological 
consequences if the language replacement hypo­
thesis proves to be mostly correct and the para­
digm of Slavonic colonization were abandoned? 
Firstly, it would help Estonians to rid themselves 
of certain 'masochistic 'national-romantic features 
of their view of the history of the Finno-Ugrian 
people, who are thought to have suffered for cen­
turies from the pressure of the Slavs driving them 
out of their ancient territories. Secondly, it would 
help the Russians realize that their ancestors were 
not relatively late immigrants but that their roots in 
present-day NorthWest Russia are much older, as 
their language is not the decisive factor in this con­
nection. Therefore there should not be any need for 
archaeologists to try to prove that the Slavonic im­
migrants settled in an almost empty territory, 
sparsely populated by 'Tchuds' whose society -
for some strange reason - was far behind those of 
all other peoples in Northern Europe, and whose 
fate it was to be assimilated by the much more ad­
vanced Slavs. And thirdly, archaeology could in a 
way even selVe as a balancing ideological factor 
between the two countries. 
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