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Even though circular economy (CE) is crucial for sustainable performance, not all circularity activities are 
automatically more sustainable as some trade-offs may occur (e.g., major environmental impacts due to 
intensive processing of wastes or social effects when production/treatment locations change). In the position 
paper of the Life Cycle Initiative, Peña et al. (2021) stated the importance of combining CE and life cycle 
approaches to avoid burden shifting. Apart from economic factors, the recent focus of research in CE is on 
environmental impacts and how to measure them. Sassanelli et al. (2019) identified life cycle assessment (LCA) 
as the most used tool for assessing environmental consequences of CE. To ensure that circularity holistically 
contributes to sustainable behavior, besides economic and environmental aspects, also the third pillar of 
sustainability, namely social aspects, must be considered. However, Kirchherr, Reike and Hekkert (2017) found 
that research on social impacts resulting from a shift from a linear to a circular economy is still lacking. Thus, 
aim of this research is to identify social implications of circular economy and to investigate in what manner 
circularity aspects currently are assessed in social life cycle assessment (S-LCA). The research starts with a 
literature review on social consequences of CE. As CE mostly replaces former linear business models, the 
research includes identifying affected stakeholders in both the former linear and new circular strategies. Based 
on this analysis, the identified implications will be linked to the relevant stakeholders and S-LCA subcategories. 
Adequate indicators for assessing the social performance of CE strategies will be proposed referring to 
indicators presented in the Methodological Sheets for Subcategories in Social Life Cycle Assessment (S-LCA) 
2021 but also by identifying relevant new indicators that cover social implications of CE that are not covered by 
existing indicators. Moreover, further CE indicators that should be considered to link circularity performance and 
S-LCA will be proposed. Hence, a combination of indicators will be presented that will outline how circularity, for 
example, influences regional employment, cultural changes, education, and other social aspects. 
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