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Hemostatic Patch for Accelerated
Hemostasis After Transradial Procedures
A Step Further?*
Olivier F. Bertrand, MD, PHD,a Zoltan Ruzsa, MD, PHDb
L ike many trials and investigations studying the
clinical impact of transradial access for diag-
nostic angiography and interventions, Safirst-

ein et al1 developed an original protocol, set up a
network of enthusiastic collaborators, managed the
multicenter randomized trial, and analyzed the re-
sults independently and without any industry sup-
port. In this issue of JACC: Cardiovascular
Interventions, they report the results of the STAT-2
trial (Radial Hemostasis Is Facilitated With a Potas-
sium Ferrate Hemostatic Patch [Statseal]: the Ran-
domized Controlled Statseal With TR Band
Assessment Trial II). The investigators should be
congratulated for this accomplishment.
SEE PAGE 810
Although radial access has been widely used for
more than 2 decades, Class Ia recommendation has
only appeared recently in the American College of
Cardiology/American Heart Association/Society for
Cardiovascular Angiography and Interventions
guidelines for revascularization.2 Beyond clear bene-
fits over standard femoral access in vascular compli-
cations and periprocedural bleeding, transradial
access has paved the way to same-day discharge after
uncomplicated percutaneous coronary interventions
(PCIs), not only for elective procedures in stable
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angina patients, but also after complex procedures in
acute coronary syndrome patients.3,4 The current
COVID pandemic has been a major impetus to shorten
hospital stays, and this applies for many invasive
medical procedures.

Hence, strategies to reduce hemostasis duration
might lead to faster hospital discharge. Obviously, the
superficial nature of the radial artery offers a unique
and optimal situation to secure fast hemostasis,
because it allows the patient to stand up and ambu-
late right after the procedure. This is also another
reason why “radial lounges” built upon the concept of
airport business lounges have started to spread
around the globe. In these dedicated environments,
free of hospital beds, patients use reclining chairs
instead of beds, and spaces can also accommodate
technologies for TV and Internet access in a cozier
set-up.5 There is little doubt that radial lounges built
as recovery rooms close to catheterization labora-
tories will continue to expand in the next decade.

Because significant cost benefit has been associ-
ated with outpatient practice, there is evidence that
speeding up hospital discharge after diagnostic angi-
ography and/or PCI can result in significant savings,
regardless of the health care system environment.6-8

A prerequisite for a short hospital stay is to obtain a
fast and safe hemostasis. Whereas for femoral access,
there have been a flurry of suture-based and non–
suture-based closure devices developed over the
years, hemostasis devices for radial/ulnar access are
less complex and less expensive. Basic single artery
compression devices, usually divided into pneumatic
or nonpneumatic, have remained the most popular.
However, occlusive compression to hemostasis could
be associated with the main drawback of radial artery
access, that is, radial artery occlusion (RAO).8-11

RAO is a multifaceted issue that results from the
complex interplay between vessel injury, and local
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parameters such as spasm and flow disturbances and
thrombosis. Although RAO has usually little clinical
consequences, it now commonly admitted that every
effort should be made to minimize RAO. A recent
consensus paper has specifically recommended that
good clinical practice with radial access should be
associated with a <5% risk of RAO.9

Beyond dedicated radial small-sized sheaths and
catheters and intravenous anticoagulation, the 2
main factors linked to reduced RAO risk are: 1) the use
of nonocclusive radial artery compression until he-
mostasis is completed; and 2) the limited compres-
sion time. “Patent-radial artery hemostasis” can be
obtained in w75% of the cases by early decompres-
sion and finger-oximetry monitoring with dedicated
nursing protocols or >90% using prophylactic ulnar
compression.11 The optimal duration for radial artery
compression is presently unknown. The tradeoff for
reducing the compression time must be balanced
against the risks of rebleeding, hematoma formation,
and possibly pseudoaneurysm formation.

In the STAT-2 trial reported in this issue, the
invesigators1 investigated the potential of using a
potassium ferrate hemostatic patch (StatSeal, Biolife)
as a topical prothrombotic agent to reduce hemostasis
time after transradial diagnostic angiography and/or
PCI. Compared with a standard deflation protocol
using a commonly used pneumatic band (TR-band,
Terumo), patch-assisted hemostasis was associated
with a w40% reduction in compression time, both
after diagnostic and PCI procedures. Importantly, no
differences in hematoma or RAO were observed be-
tween the 2 groups. Furthermore, rebleeding
requiring repeat device inflation were observed
significantly more often in the nonpatch group. No
adverse reaction was observed with the use of the
patch-assisted hemostasis.

In relative terms, reducing hemostasis time around
1 hour instead of 2 hours after transradial diagnostic
angiography and/or PCI is a dramatic improvement.
Significant reduction in hemostasis time has also
been demonstrated with the same and other hemo-
static patches by other investigators, which brings
external validation for this study.12-14 It is worth
noting that a number of patients did not receive
intravenous heparin. A word of caution remains
because systematic intravenous anticoagulation is
strongly recommended because it plays a substantial
role in limiting the risks of RAO.9

Yet, a caveat should be mentioned. Indeed,
obtaining an effective and safe hemostasis within 1
hour after diagnostic angiography might reduce use
of hospital resources and allow very rapid discharge
(w2 hours), however, this is less evident for pa-
tients having undergone PCI. For PCI patients, the
safety parameter that is paramount is the risk of
ischemic complications in relation with the coronary
intervention itself. Based on numerous studies on
same-day discharge after uncomplicated PCI, an
observation period of 4 to 6 hours after PCI has
been considered mandatory.3,4,15,16 Therefore, a 1-
hour hemostasis time would not lead to earlier
hospital discharge compared with a 2-hour
compression time.

In a time of increased pressure for cost contain-
ment, further cost analysis will be required.
Compared with closure devices used for femoral ac-
cess, radial hemostatic devices are much less expen-
sive, but the cost of these hemostatic patches is not
trivial. Ultimately, it will be worth studying the
detailed impacts of patch-assisted radial hemostasis
on patient safety and comfort, and reduction in use of
hospital resources and, ultimately, costs.
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