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The Formation of New Immigrant Chinese Communities 

Under the background of globalization, the 
integration of overseas Chinese is experiencing 
a transformation from traditional Chinatown to 
new immigrant Chinese community. Empirical 
materials are urgently needed to illustrate how 
the transformation occurs. Thus, by interview-
ing 25 Chinese operators in Ikebukuro, this pa-
per aims to reveal the formation mechanism of 
new immigrant Chinese community by using 
‘the structure of social support’ as an analysis 
framework. The findings show that the social 
support which new overseas Chinese receive 
presents a diversified structure. When abundant 
formal support can be easily accessed, new 
overseas Chinese need not rely heavily on infor-
mal networks and dwell  in traditional 
Chinatown to get support. The mixed support 
structure has further affected the integrated 
choice of new overseas Chinese. A boundless, 
ethnically diverse new immigrant Chines com-
munity has eventually come into being.

1. Introduction: transformation of 
immigrant Chinese community

Since the reform and opening up, the inte-
gration of overseas Chinese is experiencing a 
transition to a new form. As a place where all 
economic and social activities of early over-
seas Chinese take place（Wei Wang, 2014）, 
old Chinatown is closed, exclusive and cohe-
sive（Min Zhou & Mingang Lin, 2004）. 
Individuals who wish to obtain survival and 
development resources are fixed in this spe-
cific place. Relying on relatives and fellow 
townsmen is the favorable integration strate-
gy. In recent years, however, in the context of 
globalization, new immigrant Chinese com-
munities which have no visible geographical 
boundaries have emerged worldwide. In con-
trast to traditional ethnic enclaves such as 
“Chinatown”, these new Chinese communities 
have a diversified inner structure and mean-
while are open to the mainstream society. The 
reason why new overseas Chinese（also re-
ferred as “new immigrants” in the following）

2021 年 12 月 6 日掲載承認

The Formation of New Immigrant 
Chinese Communities : 
The Structure of Social Support as an Analytical 
Perspective Based on a Field Survey in Ikebukuro

社会イノベーション研究　第 17 巻第 2 号（073-089）2022 年 3 月

	 南京大学社会学院副教授＊	 南京大学社会学院修士課程＊

朱　安新 ZHU, Anxin，張　珏 ZHANG, Jue

＊ These two authors contributed equally to this work and should be considered co-first authors.



074

社会イノベーション研究

who emigrated abroad since the 1970s have 
shown this integrated commonality needs to 
be explained based on empirical analysis. The 
transformation of immigrant Chinese com-
munities has thus become a new topic in the 
field of immigration studies.

On the question of “how the transformation 
happened”, multiple analytical perspectives 
can be adopted as immigration research 
methods are diverse. Capturing the sociologi-
cal characteristics of new immigrant Chinese 
communities is one approach. Current re-
search mainly focuses on Chinese communi-
ties in Europe and America, among which the 
study in the United States is typical. Min Zhou

（2003）, a well-known Chinese sociologist who 
noticed and studied the transformation earli-
er in the field, found that new immigrants’ 
high level of wealth, skill and educational 
background were the important factors that 
led to the transformation. By studying two 
new immigrant Chinese communities in the 
U.S.,  Monterey Park in California and 
Flushing in New York, Zhou discovered new 
overseas Chinese who had above characteris-
tics chose to purchase houses in local mid-
dle-class neighborhoods, intentionally by-
passing old Chinatown at the beginning. As a 
result, a new community which is different 
from the traditional settlements has come 
into being. In view of the characterization of 
“Asian-dominated, multi-ethnic mixed” and “a 
wide variety of Chinese business enterprises” 
in the new immigrant Chinese community

（Min Zhou & Mingang Lin, 2003:117）, Zhou 
and Lin（2004）condensed a theoretical 
framework centered on “ethnic capital”. By 
exploring the interactive process of financial 
capital, human capital and social capital in 
the community, their paper analyzed the 
causes of the transformation in American 

new immigrant Chinese communities.
In the same year of Min Zhou and Mingang 

Lin’ s publication（2003）, East Asian scholars 
had also made remarkable field-based discov-
eries. Yamashita Kiyomi（2003）, a Japanese 
human geographer, observed the existence of 
Japan’ s first new immigrant Chinese commu-
nity “Ikebukuro Chinatown” in Toshima, 
Tokyo, by personal visits. Although Ikebukuro 
is densely populated with Chinese shops, 
Ikebukuro Chinatown is not an “imagined 
community” in essence compared with tradi-
t i o n a l  C h i n a t o w n  s uch  a s  Yokoh a m a 
Chinatown. But ten years after the concept of 
“Ikebukuro Chinatown” was put forward, only 
Wei Wang（2014）and Qin Li（2018）in 
China had conducted follow-up researches on 
this issue. Based on text analysis, Wei Wang

（2014:266）pointed out that low land prices 
and embracing heterogeneity were the histor-
ical background for Ikebukuro to be por-
trayed as “multi-national and multi-level liv-
ing space”. Qin Li（2018）, by analyzing 
second-hand empirical materials, addressed 
that it was the more proactive attitude of new 
overseas Chinese towards integration that 
made Ikebukuro become a network-based 
n e w  i m m i g r a n t  C h i n e s e  c o m m u n i t y. 
Compared with existing academic achieve-
ments in Europe and America, it is still neces-
sary to obtain some empirical materials to re-
veal the formation mechanism of “Ikebukuro 
Chinatown”. Under the background that im-
migration theory on new immigrants needs to 
be developed, this kind of supplement in East 
Asian context is likely to enrich the analytical 
dimension of the causes of new overseas 
Chinese’ integration.

Thus, in order to better analyze the forma-
tion mechanism of “Ikebukuro Chinatown”, 
the research process of this paper is divided 
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into two stages: field investigation and data 
collation. In view of the close relationship be-
tween the formation of a community and in-
dividual integration choices, this paper in-
tends to establish i ts  own theoretical 
framework after conducting semi-structured 
interviews with 25 Chinese operators in 
Ikebukuro.

2. Literature review and explora-
tion of new ideas

2.1 �Causes of new immigrant Chinese 
communities’ formation

The demographic prerequisite for the for-
mation and development of new immigrant 
Chinese communities is a certain number of 
new overseas Chinese. Since the 1970s, the 
global distribution of capital generated by 
globalization has enabled many countries to 
loosen their immigration restrictions and in-
troduce a series of preferential policies to at-
tract talents. At the same time, after the re-
form and opening up,  China has  also 
deregulated the control of private overseas 
trips. Therefore, Chinese citizens began a 
large-scale cross-border movement, and new 
immigrant  groups  were  thus  formed. 
According to statistics, the number of Chinese 
who went on private overseas trips in 1949-
1978 was only 210,000. But from 1978 to 1998, 
the number jumped to 4 million, including 
more than 2 million permanent immigrants

（Jin Zhao, 1998）. Up to now, the number of 
new immigrant Chinese（including their chil-
dren）has exceeded 13 million（Guotu 
Zhuang, 2020）.

The transformation of immigrant Chinese 
communities caught scholars’ attention when 
the place new immigrants set foot in was no-
ticeably different from their successors’. Years 

before, with a singular ethnic composition, 
the traditional Chinatown formed overseas 
was separated from the mainstream society. 
This is reflected in the fact that common cul-
tural belief and ethnic language are the basis 
of forming a traditional Chinatown（Qiwen 
Huang, 1991）, highlighting the preference of 
early overseas Chinese to live together with 
fellow townsmen and family（Yuhua Ju, 
2003）. However, with the development of glo-
balization and the influx of new immigrants, 
traditional Chinatown is no longer a place for 
new immigrants to settle in foreign countries. 
It has been confirmed worldwide that new 
overseas Chinese have formed a different 
form of social integration.

By taking Monterey Park and Flushing as an 
example, Min Zhou and Mingang Lin（2004）
pointed out that compared with traditional 
Chinatown, new immigrant Chinese commu-
nities had larger geographical area, more di-
verse membership and ethnic composition. 
In short, new immigrant communities were 
multi-ethnic, open and globalized. Huping 
Ling（2007:29）found that St. Louis had a 
“Fluid, time-sharing” geographically border-
less community of new overseas Chinese. 
Huijing Zhang（2016:19）stated that new im-
migrant Chinese communities in Japan had 
undergone an evolution from “job-housing 
space to social space”, and that new immi-
grants lived in a deterritorialized ethnic com-
munity（Huijing Zhang, 2017）. Despite the 
geographical differences, above findings im-
ply a commonality. That is, although the new 
immigrant Chinese community reflects cer-
tain ethnic characteristics externally, it is ac-
tually merged into the mainstream society 
due to the diversification of member nation-
alities and the ambiguity brought about by 
deterritorialization. It has not become an iso-
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lated “ethnic town”.
Based on their on-the-spot confirmation of 

new immigrant Chinese communities, the 
above-mentioned scholars have each focused 
on building an analytical framework that can 
explain the corresponding form. Min Zhou 
and Mingang Lin（2004）condensed the in-
teractive relationship between financial capi-
tal, human capital, and social capital as an in-
tegrated concept of “ethnic capital”. After 
comparing the differences in ethnic capital 
between the new and old Chinese immigrant 
communities, they pointed out that the pre-
requisite for the formation and development 
of new immigrant Chinese communities was 
new immigrants’ rich financial resources and 
human capital. Instead of relying on tradi-
tional Chinatown, these characteristics en-
abled new immigrants to obtain social capital 
for their own survival and development 
through the operation of financial capital and 
human capital. Huijing Zhang（2016:20-25）
also focused on social capital. Through the 
construction of an analytical perspective of 
“node and social capital interaction”, she be-
lieved that traditional Japanese Chinatown 
could no longer meet the requirements of 
“high liquidity, high level, and high creativity” 
new immigrants. New immigrant Chinese 
community was formed because new immi-
grants used Chinese associations and “culture 
festivals” as nodes to extend their personal 
networks and accumulate social capital. In 
addition, there are theories of “cultural com-
munity” and “cultural symbolic community” 
from the perspective of cultural identity. 
Huping Ling（2007）defined a “cultural com-
munity” as a community that had no geo-
graphic boundaries and was based on the cul-
tural  identity of  an ethnic group. The 
formation mechanism of this kind of new im-

migrant Chinese community is that its mem-
bers have been integrated into the main-
stream society both socially and economically 
while still maintaining a high degree of at-
tachment to Chinese culture. It is noticeable 
that the prerequisite for applying “cultural 
community” theory is new immigrants in the 
community already possess upper-middle 
class socioeconomic status. For new immi-
grant communities with different internal 
strata, the explanatory power of “cultural 
community theory” may be insufficient. 
Based on this, Huijing Zhang（2017:1）put 
forward the theory of “cultural symbolic com-
munity” that can respond to “the adaptation 
and development needs of new immigrants 
from all strata at different levels”. The theory 
believed that when new immigrants “need to 
gradually adapt to a non-immigrant country 
which lacks immigration policy”, a cultural 
symbolic community that used “cultural iden-
tity as a link and symbolic signs as a carrier” 
was formed by the interweaving and bonding 
of networks of members in various strata

（Huijing Zhang, 2017:4）. As a place where 
new immigrants can seek relief when they 
encounter difficulties, the essential function 
of cultural symbolic communities is to help 
ethnic group members eventually adapt to lo-
cal life. Therefore, to some extent, the emer-
gence of cultural symbolic community and 
cultural community corresponds to the spiri-
tual needs of new immigrants at different 
stages of survival and development in foreign 
state.

In summary, the internal analytical logic of 
existing research is what characteristics the 
new immigrants have in order to survive and 
develop in foreign societies, and how their ac-
tions unfold. Under such a perspective of ex-
ploring inward, internal structure character-
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istics, network extending methods, and 
spiritual needs of new immigrants are regard-
ed as important factors that have spawned the 
new immigrant Chinese community.

2.2 New ideas for the analysis
Whether the focus is on social capital or 

cultural identity, there is a common problem 
in the analytical framework of the aforemen-
tioned studies: discussions from the perspec-
tive of foreign society are missing. In other 
words, existing studies just regard host coun-
try’ s social environment as a background of 
the formation of new immigrant Chinese 
communities, rather than an element that 
consti tutes  the analytical  framework. 
However, the survival and development of 
new immigrants is undoubtedly wrapped in 
the political, economic, cultural and other 
formal or informal rules of the host society. 
The institutional system of a foreign society is 
likely to participate in the process of shaping 
new immigrants’ integration as an influenc-
ing factor. Therefore, on the basis of existing 
literature, how to incorporate institutional 
factors into the construction of analytical 
framework is the new idea which this paper 
intends to explore.

After clarifying that the analytical frame-
work should cover institutional factors and 
individual initiative, the concept of “social 
support”, which has been fully discussed in 
sociology, has raised author’ s attention. 
Social support was first applied to the study of 
social etiology, which generally refers to the 
help received by individuals from others in 
society（Raschke, 1977）. In terms of types, 
the mainstream view is to divide social sup-
port into formal and informal support net-
works. Formal support is institutional assis-
tance provided by state and society, while the 

source of informal support consists of “rela-
tionships such as family, relatives, friends, 
and colleagues”（Xiaoguang Fan, 2012:95）. 
The introduction of the concept of social sup-
port in immigration research can be traced 
back to the 1990s. Since then, social support 
has been used to discuss the psychological 
pressure, aging, educational resources and 
educational expectations of immigrants（Vega 
et al., 1991; Feng Wen, 2017; Min Zhou & Jun 
Wang, 2019）. But generally, the concept has 
not been widely applied in the field of immi-
gration studies.

The existing research on new immigrant 
Chinese communities did not directly apply 
the concept of social support in the analysis, 
but the research results showed the feasibility 
to follow up from the perspective of social 
support. As illustrated above, personal rela-
tionship is one of the factors that give birth to 
the new immigrant Chinese community, and 
it also assists new immigrants to obtain re-
sources for survival and development. The 
aim-oriented use of personal relationships by 
new immigrants actually embodies a process 
of obtaining social support through informal 
networks. Meanwhile, state and society which 
provide formal support are precisely the insti-
tutional factors that existing studies have ne-
glected and this paper intends to include 
when constructing the analytical framework. 
Hence in order to assess the applicability of 
formal support to the issue, and to establish a 
corresponding analytical framework based on 
Ikebukuro situation, it is necessary to con-
duct specific discussions in conjunction with 
the institutional environment faced by over-
seas Chinese in Japan.
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3. Research design

3.1 �Analytical framework: the structure of 
social support

After reviewing the existing literature and 
focusing on Japanese society, this study finds 
that institutional factors have a real impact 
on the survival and development of overseas 
Chinese in Japan. In the early post-war peri-
od, the icy diplomatic relations between 
China and Japan caused early overseas 
Chinese to suffer much social exclusion. This 
is mainly manifested in Japanese government’
s strict control over Chinese immigrants’ resi-
dence and naturalization applications. During 
this period, most early overseas Chinese still 
lived in traditional Chinatown, relying on kin-
ship, geo-relations and other strong ties to 
survive and develop. However, between 1970 
and 1980, with Japanese government continu-
ously revising its immigration policies to 
speed up internationalization process, the in-
stitutional environment faced by overseas 
Chinese has undergone multiple changes. In 
1989, the “Immigration Control and Refugee 
Recognition Act” newly revised by Japanese 
government increased the type of employ-
ment visas from 7 to 14. In 1999, Japanese 
government raised the minimum residence 
time for investor visas from 6 months to 1 
year, and the maximum residence time for 
skilled worker visas from 1 year to 3 years. At 
the beginning of this century, Japanese gov-
ernment has successively promulgated poli-
cies on the introduction of talents. Under the 
premise that many social benefits in Japan 
are only accessible to immigrants with long-
term residence（more than 3 months）per-
mit, changes in residence and naturalization 
policies also mean that new immigrants are 
more likely to benefit from institutional guar-

antees. For example, all immigrants with 
long-term residence permit can enjoy the 
same medical benefits as Japanese nationals 
as long as they join the National Health 
Insurance.

Based on above discussions, this paper 
eventually determines to use “the structure of 
social support” as the analytical framework, 
and explores the formation mechanism of 
Ikebukuro Chinatown by analyzing the sup-
por t  network of  Chinese operators  in 
Ikebukuro. This study still adopts the classifi-
cation standard of “formalization” equaling 
“institutionalization” for the structure of so-
cial support. After combining characteristics 
of immigration studies with the reality of 
Japan, this paper defines government and 
communities as the sources of providing for-
mal support for new immigrants in Japan, 
and treats Chinese associations and personal 
relationships（kinship, geo-relations, aca-
demic and professional relationships, etc.）as 
providers of informal support. The contents 
of social support provided by aforementioned 
entities includes material assistance（provid-
ing currency and other tangible objects）, be-
havioral assistance（sharing tasks through 
manual labor）, intimate interaction（such as 
listening）, and guidance（such as providing 
information）, feedback（to individual emo-
tions, etc.）, positive social interaction（feeling 
entertained and relaxed）（Barrera, 1983）.

3.2 Research data and analytical methods
This research collects data through Nanjing 

University’ s 2019 International Scientific 
Research and Training Program. The prelimi-
nary field research lasted 13 days. Program 
members visited Ikebukuro and attended lec-
t u r e s  h e l d  b y  To k y o  M e t r o p o l i t a n 
Government, the University of Tokyo, the 
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Overseas Chinese Association in Japan, the 
Duan Press, the Nanjing University Alumni 
Association in Japan and other institutions to 
learn about Ikebukuro environment. Then, 
based on the information collected, the re-
search subjects were identified as 25 Chinese 
business operators in Ikebukuro, who were 
semi-structured interviewed from five dimen-
sions: nationality, work status, marriage and 
family, daily life, and social interactions. At 
the same time, the program received first-
hand off icial materials such as “Tokyo 
Guidelines for the Promotion of Intercultural 
cohesion” and “Foreigners Population by 
Nationality and Region in Japan” provided by 
Tokyo Metropolitan Government.

I t  s h o u l d  b e  n o t e d  t h a t  t h e  u s e  o f 
semi-structured interviews and the determi-
nation of subject numbers have both under-
gone the considerations of research signifi-
cance and research difficulty. According to 
Tokyo Metropolitan Government’ s latest 
data,  the number of  Chinese l iving in 
Toshima where Ikebukuro is located has 
reached 12,955 by the end of January, 2019. So 
from the perspective of operability, compared 
with quantitatively surveying all Chinese in 
entire Toshima area, the sample size of 
Chinese business operators in Ikebukuro is 
relatively small. Qualitative research methods 
can be used to reduce the research difficulty 
and dig deeper into individual experiences. 
Meanwhile, compared with only studying a 
Chinese association, the study on Ikebukuro 
can be extended. After using judgmental sam-
pling and snowball sampling method to de-
fine the research subjects, the information 
obtained has been able to reflect the prob-
lems. The interview recording has been sort-
ed out and its verbatim draft contains more 
than 350,000 words.

In the follow-up data analysis stage, this pa-
per uses qualitative research software 
MAXQDA to analyze the interview manu-
scripts based on the topic framework. 
According to the analytical framework and 
content of the interview, two main categories 
“formal support” and “informal support” are 
formed. The basic information of research 
objects is shown in the following table:

Case 
No. Gender

Time 
of 
entry

Age
（till 
2019）

Business 
industry

1 Male 1983 56 Language school

2 Male 1987 56 Volunteer 
association

3 Female 1990 54 Real estate

4 Male 1991 61 Newspapers and 
publishing

5 Male 1994 50 Investment
6 Female 1997 53 Real estate
7 Female 2001 38 Restaurant

8 Female 2002 About 
36 Massage shop

9 Male 2002 30-40 Restaurant
10 Male 2002 33 Hairdressing
11 Male 2004 42 Restaurant
12 Male 2005 46 Restaurant
13 Male 2006 43 Restaurant
14 Male 2006 34 E-commerce
15 Male 2007 26 Restaurant
16 Male 2008 34 Restaurant

17 Male 2008 24 Pharmaceutical 
Company

18 Male 2009 29 Real estate
19 Male 2009 34 Martial arts

20 Male 2010 29 Communications 
company

21 Female 2011 42 Beauty shop
22 Female 2012 44 Restaurant
23 Male 2012 40-45 Restaurant
24 Male 2013 32 Restaurant

25 Male 2015 37 Bed and 
Breakfast
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4. Research findings

4.1 �Initial support structure: the prefer-
ence for informal networks

In order to highlight the diachronic evolu-
tion of support networks in the survival and 
development process of new immigrants in 
Ikebukuro, networks associated with immi-
gration from the time the movement does not 
occur to the time it just occurs are defined as 
the initial structure of social support for new 
immigrants.

Materials show that the formation and im-
plementation of new immigrants’ intention to 
immigrate to Japan are closely related to the 
support provided by personal relationships in 
informal networks. In terms of the strength 
of support, many new immigrants who origi-
nally came to Japan for the purpose of study-
ing stated that whether their family can afford 
the expenses was an important influencing 
factor when determining which country to 
study. According to interviewee Mr. W（Case 
14）, “At that time, the idea of studying in Japan 
was very popular in China. In my circle of 
friends, many of them wanted to study in the 
English-speaking countries, such as the United 
States, the United Kingdom, Canada... I took tui-
tion fees into consideration and eventually de-
cided to go to Japan.” Mr. S（Case 18）, who 
came to Japan after graduating from high 
school, also mentioned that “when graduating 
from high school, it was common for students 
to study abroad. The cost of living in Japan is not 
as much as that of Europe and the United States, 
and yet Japan is a relatively developed country. 
So I came to Japan to study.” In terms of the 
form of support, intimate interactions and 
guidance provided by personal relationships 
also become a dragging force to attract indi-
viduals to Japan. Mr. G（Case 20）, who cur-

rently runs a telecommunications corpora-
tion in Ikebukuro, said that he chose Japan 
because compared to other countries, his old-
er sister was studying in Japan and “here can 
have some care”. If siblings can support each 
other in a foreign country, “parents will be 
happier too.” Mr. Z（Case 13）had a close rela-
tionship with Mr. B who was “working in the 
same kitchen in a restaurant” in China. After 
Mr. B quitted his job to run a restaurant in 
Japan, the considerable income he received 
gave Mr. Z the idea of opening a restaurant 
abroad. Mr. Z had a good salary in China at 
that time. He was a chef with “a salary of 8,100 
yuan a month and the head of a hundred peo-
ple”, but he couldn’ t save money to open a 
shop. Because “one part of the money was 
spent on feeding family, and another part was 
on socializing”, his savings were “basically 
gone.” The reality of “it was difficult to open a 
restaurant as a chef in China ” eventually 
prompted Mr. Z to ask for help from Mr. B, 
then he was invited to Ikebukuro with a 
skilled worker visa as a chef. It can be seen 
that financial assistance and spiritual comfort 
from relatives, the provision of information 
and support from fellow townsmen, etc., 
have profoundly shaped individual’ s mobility 
choices.

When cross-border movement just occurs, 
the limited sources of support induced by 
“unfamiliar place of life” make new immi-
grants either seek help from their contacts in 
the China, or turn to local Chinese associa-
tions when encountering difficulty. In the 
case of relying on personal relationships, the 
specific content of social support received by 
new immigrants is mostly manifested in the 
supply of basic survival resources and spiritu-
al support. When Mr. Y（Case 24）and Mr. S

（Case 18）first came to Japan, they found 
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houses both through their personal networks. 
Ms. W（Case 21）also gradually adapted to 
foreign life through interactions with friends:

When I first came to Japan, I found a Chinese 
dormitory... It was introduced by a friend...I 
have known this brother（friend）for more 
than ten years, a former friend at work in China.

（Case 24, restaurant operator）
When I first got here, I thought I was lucky. I 

was studying in a language school in Fukuoka, I 
had a fellow townsman from Dalian there, and 
the house was already rented. I just need to 
move in and share the fees.（Case 18, real es-
tate operator）

When I first came, I was greeted by friends. It 
wasn’ t that I was dragging luggage alone or that 
I was unfamiliar with people. Because there are 
friends here, it’ s okay just to slow down and 
adapt gradually.（Case 21, beauty shop opera-
tor）

At the same time, the Chinese associations, 
which acts as a glue between the individual 
and the mainstream society, is also an option-
al source of support, especially when new im-
migrants have no personal relationships to 
rely on. Chinese associations, such as fellow 
townsmen associations and alumni associa-
tions, possess a “middle” position between 
the public and the government, functioning 
as a “buffer zone” for new immigrants to 
adapt to Japanese society. Compared with 
personal relationships, Chinese associations 
that can communicate with the mainstream 
society are more able to give new immigrants 
guidance of knowing relevant policies. When 
new immigrants who have just left their home 
country face adjustment difficulties due to 
language barriers and insufficient under-
standing, Chinese associations can provide 

services and organize activities to help new 
immigrants better connect with the local so-
ciety.

When I first came to Japan, I wanted to en-
trust someone to help, so I found the Chinese 
Volunteer Association in Japan. At that time, my 
wife was pregnant, I needed an interpreter to 
help us do the check-up. I needed an interpreter 
next to me when we had the baby.（Case 25, 
B&B operator）

I didn’ t know the law and regulations of 
Japan at the beginning, but later I heard Lawyer 
X say something about Japan...We are fellow 
townsmen…The association often want to do 
something beneficial, like holding real estate 
lectures. Lawyer X gave a lecture on law.（Case 6, 
real estate operator）

However, only a few interviewees include 
Chinese associations as a source of informal 
support. Most interviewees still obtained sup-
port through personal relationships when 
they first arrived in Japan. It can also be seen 
that the strong ties such as kinship and 
geo-relations used by early overseas Chinese 
are reflected in new immigrants’ structure of 
social support in the early stage of integra-
tion. However, compared with early overseas 
Chinese who are still struggling to survive at 
this stage, the degree of formalization of new 
immigrants’ support structure has increased 
significantly. At this time, formal support of 
Japanese society is exerting influence on im-
migrants’ lives thoroughly from top to bottom 
through intermediate associations such as 
municipalities and communities, and then 
expands horizontally to various aspects of life 
that need to be guaranteed, such as education 
and medical care.

In daily life, Japan’ s formal support for for-
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eigners is manifested in language assistance 
and social welfare. Interviews show that new 
immigrants with relatively weak Japanese lan-
guage skills and their children will receive 
free Japanese classes provided by local gov-
ernments. Government will also provide suf-
ficient and necessary social security such as 
education, medical care and disaster preven-
tion, so that new immigrants who have ob-
tained a long-term residence permit can en-
joy the same kinds of support as Japanese 
nationals.

I have never attended a formal Japanese lan-
guage school, just two classes a week in univer-
sity. The voluntary classes provided by govern-
ment is one class a week.（Case 4, newspaper 
and publishing practitioner）

When we first came here, because the child 
was not good at Japanese, there were two 
Chinese speakers in our community accompa-
nying him to school, two hours a day. That is, I 
will walk you to school for two hours today, and 
another two hours tomorrow. If you have any-
thing to communicate with the teacher,（they 
will）at least accompany you for about two 
months to three months. There is also a special-
ized school in each community for you to learn 
Japanese. For example, at nine o’ clock every 
day, I can give you one hour of tuition, and I will 
give you Japanese tutoring for free.（Case 11, 
restaurant operator）

If your kids don’ t go to private school, all the 
way to high school, it won’ t cost you a cent. 
One is education, the other is medical treat-
ment... When the child is ill, he goes to the hos-
pital for examination. After the examination, 
the hospital prescribes medicine for him, and 
we do not spend any money... I pay only 30% 
when I go to the hospital... So everyone is equal.

（Case 9, restaurant operator）

In summary, from the time when cross-bor-
der movement does not occur to the time it 
just occurs, new immigrants rely more on in-
formal support to survive the life transition 
from home country to host country. The anxi-
ety of “unfamiliarity” aroused by foreign envi-
ronment is relieved by the intimacy and 
warmth generated from personal relation-
ships and Chinese associations. Although 
during this period formal support from 
Japanese government has begun to radiate its 
influence, the impact on individuals has not 
yet been fully revealed because language 
learning takes time and welfare benefits peo-
ple in certain situations. The initial support 
structure of new immigrants presents the 
characteristics of mainly relying on personal 
relationships, supplemented by Chinese asso-
ciations and formal support.

4.2 �Source expansion and strength recon-
struction: the stabilization of diversi-
fied support structure

As the time of studying or working increas-
es, new immigrants gradually build new per-
sonal relationships at schools, companies and 
other places. These relationships, such as ac-
ademic relationship and business relation-
ship, are formed and becoming more stable 
due to frequent interactions in a specific 
space, and then constitute new sources of in-
formal support network for new immigrants 
when needed. Different from the initial sup-
port structure in which private relations are 
still confined to Chinese circles and are most-
ly used to solve basic survival problems, 
during this period the ethnic composition of 
relationships tends to be diversified, and the 
informal support provided corresponds to the 
higher development needs of new immi-
grants. In economic life, this is mainly mani-
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fested in providing funds and information 
during the start-up and operation of business.

Our Japanese friend, he lent me the money... 
To register a company, you must have a deposit 
of 10 million Japanese yen. At that time, you 
transferred in and you could withdraw after the 
company being registered. It means that I didn’
t really borrow the money. The contractor just 
lent it to us for registration.（Case 4, newspa-
per and publishing practitioner）

Friends in Japan are basically classmates. 
That is, classmates in the language school, many 
students were from China. There were Chinese, 
Vietnamese, and American...（Starting up a 
company）Because I had some contacts in 
Japan, like classmates.（Case 5, investment 
company operator）

Mr. Z opens an izakaya next to me...Although 
they are all restaurants, the way they purchase 
goods is completely different...Now the infor-
mation resource is your own wealth. In fact, you 
can really get other people’ s information at that 
time. Like me and Mr. Z, we exchange informa-
tion.（Case 9, restaurant operator）

As the network of personal relationships 
expands, the role Chinese associations play in 
informal support network of new immigrants 
is becoming weaker and weaker.  Studies have 
demonstrated that in Japan, new immigrants’ 
sense of organizational identity towards 
Chinese associations is weakening（Huiling 
Zhu, 2003）.  Ikebukuro Chinese operators 
studied in this paper show similar character-
istics. Only 7 of the 25 interviewees said they 
would regularly participate in Chinese associ-
ation activities to meet their compatriots and 
relax. Busywork and lack of leisure time are 
the objective reasons why most interviewees 
do not participate.

I don’ t have time to attend（townsmen asso-
ciations）. Because I run a store, the catering 
industry is like this, and there is little time for 
rest.（Case 7, restaurant operator）

I don’ t think the（townsmen association）is 
formal... and I think life in Japan is quite stress-
ful…the monthly living expenses are fixed, so 
you can’ t stop. When you are at a Tokyo subway 
station, you will feel that everyone is trotting 
and can’ t rest.（Case 18, real estate operator）

I know some people in the（townsmen asso-
ciation）, but I may not participate in their ac-
tivities. All I can see the post in their Moments is 
eating, singing, chatting and so on. The pace of 
life in Japan is very fast, and people who have 
that time are rare.（Case 24, restaurant opera-
tor）

In terms of subjective willingness, many in-
terviewees hold the view that Chinese associ-
ations have limited functions. Mr. D（Case 
10）believes that participating in Chinese as-
sociations is not a necessary way to expand 
personal networks. Individuals will only “do 
that kind of thing if they are too lonely”. If “they 
have buddies to play with” and “have their own 
social circle”, then “there is no need to expand 
the network”. From a practical point of view, 
Mr. Y（Case 24）points out that joining an or-
ganization cannot effectively alleviate con-
flicts of interest caused by competition when 
the business industry is homogeneous. 
Because “the business association to some ex-
tent is a community of interests. If there are 
common interests, everyone will participate”. If 
it “does not provide great benefits for others”, it 
is difficult to gain recognition. Mr. Z（Case 2）, 
who runs a Chinese association and thus 
knows behind-the-scenes stories, directly 
states that there are power games behind 
some associations and such associations are 
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losing touch with real life. “How to found asso-
ciations, there are two ways, at least two. One is 
that associations have a certain background, 
that is, the official political background. The 
other is purely non-governmental... These with 
official backgrounds, they want to make profits. 
These associations have a common problem...is 
that they are not grounded.”

Moreover, in this period, new immigrants 
have been able to improve their Japanese 
through independent learning or official as-
sistance. They do not necessarily need 
Chinese associations as an intermediary to 
communicate with the mainstream society. In 
fact, under the circumstances that Japanese 
society has relatively sufficient formal sup-
port to offer foreigners, new Chinese immi-
grants can easily obtain various types of assis-
t a n c e  f r o m  o f f i c i a l  s o u r c e s.  M a n y 
interviewees say that as long as they comply 
with relevant regulations and meet the quali-
fication standards, they are indiscriminately 
treated in the process of obtaining formal 
support.

It’ s easy for us to do things in Japan now. It’ s 
really simple. Without complication. It’ s just, 
you reach its standard, and the standard is not 
particularly high, you can usually reach it. You 
only need to apply, all are very simple, including 
a series of procedures such as business fire pro-
tection and so on.（Case 9, restaurant opera-
tor）

Japan is relatively equal in this respect. It won’
t be different if you are a foreigner or whatever, 
it’ s all the same, as long as you have enough 
materials. Japanese institutions and public utili-
ties treat you equally.（Case 11, restaurant op-
erator）

Specifically in Tokyo, where Ikebukuro is 

located, the local government has been ac-
tively pursuing a policy of “multicultural co-
existence” in recent years, aiming to enable 
all foreigners display their talents in a safe 
and comfortable environment. As a result, 
when encountering problems, interviewees 
either directly seek help from local adminis-
trative department or rely on their expanding 
personal relationships to solve difficulties, 
and the role of Chinese associations in sup-
port network has declined.

If we encounter any difficulties, we usually 
discuss with friends if the problem can be 
solved by ourselves... After settling down, we 
will turn to local government, neighbors, dis-
trict government, or the embassy if we need 
help. It can be said that you can get things done 
smoothly here, otherwise there would not be 
such many Chinese, more and more. When I 
came here, there was only 200,000 Chinese, and 
now it’ s millions. So this number, this change 
indicates that the overall environment and the 
institutional environment here are relatively 
good.（Case 4, newspaper and publishing 
practitioner）

From the above discussion, it can be seen 
that the sources of social support available to 
new immigrants have expanded in total 
amount, and the strength of different sources 
in informal support network has been recon-
structed. Government, community and per-
sonal relationships are preferred choices for 
new immigrants to obtain social support. The 
strength of Chinese associations in support 
network is weakening. The multi-level sup-
port system revealed in initial support struc-
ture has now stabilized. Compared with the 
support structure of early overseas Chinese 
who highly relied on informal networks, 
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multi-level support system marks the forma-
tion of new immigrants’ survival and develop-
ment strategy which is distinguished from 
traditional integration methods.

4.3 �Diversified support structure and the 
shaping of “Ikebukuro Chinatown”

Sociologist Claude S. Fischer（1976）point-
ed out that the continuous improvement of 
social welfare and other institutional systems 
in the modernization process will inevitably 
shift support structure from being “overly de-
pendent on interpersonal networks to a more 
diverse support system that includes formal 
support”（Xiaoguang Fan, 2012: 95）. The di-
versified support structure of new immigrants 
in Japan fits the prediction of this shift, and 
the formation of “Ikebukuro Chinatown” is 
connected to this shift.

The over-reliance of early overseas Chinese 
on informal support networks gives birth to 
traditional Chinatown. Kinship and geo-rela-
tions are the ties that hold traditional 
Chinatown together from inside. With these 
social relationships, resources for early over-
seas Chinese to survive and develop are gen-
erated and then distributed through Chinese 
associations such as townsmen associations

（ M i n  Z h o u  &  M i n g a n g  L i n,  2 0 0 4 ）. 
Considering the possible social exclusion one 
may face in a foreign land, the certainty that 
traditional Chinatown can provide social sup-
port makes early overseas Chinese willingly 
carry out all activities in this specific area. As 
t h e  i n t e r n a l  c o h e s i o n  o f  t r a d i t i o n a l 
Chinatown gets stronger over time, the com-
munity also gradually isolates itself from 
mainstream society.（Min Zhou & Mingang 
Lin, 2004）.

When all citizens including immigrants can 
equally access resources from social institu-

tions, obtaining social support only from in-
formal networks has become a history.  
Diversified support structure then affects the 
integration choice of new Chinese immi-
grants. “Ikebukuro Chinatown” is the example 
of new immigrant Chinese community 
shaped by this choice.

Unlike the informal network that brings 
early overseas Chinese together from a scat-
tered state to a specific place（traditional 
Chinatown）, geographic location is the objec-
tive yet crucial reason why new immigrants 
come to Ikebukuro. Yamashita（2003）point-
ed out that in Ikebukuro, one could find a 
concentration of Japanese schools, rent house 
at low prices, and be given many job opportu-
nities. The interviews correspondingly shows 
that Ikebukuro’ s prosperity and convenient 
transportation are the main factors that at-
tract interviewees.

There are 23 districts in Tokyo. Then there are 
6 core areas among these 23 districts, known as 
the most prosperous places. Shinjuku being the 
first, and then there are Shibuya, Ikebukuro, 
Ginza, Ueno, and the sixth is Roppongi. These 
are the most prosperous areas in Tokyo. So, 
there is a phrase called “the heart of Tokyo” , 
right? In terms of “the heart of Tokyo” , there 
are six in Tokyo, Japan. Therefore, Ikebukuro is 
one of the most prosperous places in Japan.

（Case 19, martial arts hall operator）
Later, I chose Toshima（Ikebukuro）because 

of the publication and convenient transporta-
tion. （Case 4, newspaper and publishing 
practitioner）

Ikebukuro is a nice place...After all, a million 
people come to take transportation here every 
day.（Case 9, restaurant operator）

But Ikebukuro’ s geographical advantage 
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only gives new immigrants the opportunity to 
gather together in a specific place. What en-
ables this gathering to maintain for a long 
time is new immigrants’ same need for infor-
mal support network, just like early overseas 
Chinese. After initial gathering, the growing 
Chinese circle in Ikebukuro, which can pro-
vide business opportunities and mutual assis-
tance among compatriots, makes new immi-
grants who have come here willing to stay, 
and attracts more to come.

It is relatively cheap to rent office buildings in 
Ikebukuro. Secondly, it has convenient trans-
portation and is close to everywhere. Meanwhile 
there are many Chinese shops nearby, so there 
are more opportunities to do business with 
Chinese.（Case 17, operator of a pharmaceuti-
cal company）

I have been in Ikebukuro since I was in Japan. 
I never left Ikebukuro... The school I once stud-
ied in is in Ikebukuro, so I am familiar with the 
surroundings. Besides, there are many Chinese 
here, and it is convenient to do what I want, so 
why should I leave... After all, here you can eat, 
drink and have fun. There are more and more 
Chinese shops, so the Chinese are more than 
willing to gather here.（Case 10, operator of 
hairdressing shop）
（In Ikebukuro）There are many Chinese 

here, so they help each other and sometimes 
take care mutually. After all, we are a small 
group in a foreign country. There is no union 
formed, but a small group will emerge sponta-
neously. It is said that “relatives faraway are not 
as helpful as neighbors nearby” , so there are 
many friends here.（Case 11, restaurant oper-
ator）

I came to Japan in 1991 and moved to 
Ikebukuro in 2005. 15 years have passed by now. 
I witness the changes at the North Exit of 

Ikebukuro. In the past, there were very few 
Chinese shops, but now, it is said that the num-
ber has reached 600. We have the custom indus-
try, the cultural industry, instructions on driving 
license tests in Chinese, as well as kindergar-
tens, Chinese schools, and banks, almost all 
trades and professions.（Case 4, newspaper 
and publishing practitioner）

It can be seen that, similar to the traditional 
Chinatown, the formation of “Ikebukuro 
Chinatown” also includes the gradual in-
crease of immigrant population in a specific 
place. However, the gathering of new immi-
grants in Ikebukuro has not been transformed 
into a “Chinatown-like” community which is 
isolated from the outside world. New immi-
grants’ low degree of recognition and partici-
pation in Chinese associations is the influenc-
ing factor. In traditional Chinatown, Chinese 
associations were the main sources from 
which early overseas Chinese can obtain re-
sources for survival and development. The 
close relationship between individuals and 
associations later became a kind of communi-
ty structure, restricting and fixing members 
in this place（Min Zhou & Mingang Lin, 
2004）. However, to new immigrants in 
Ikebukuro whose personal relationships are 
not limited to Chinese circle and are assisted 
by the system, the sources of support they 
can choose are more diverse, and Chinese as-
sociations are not a must. In 2008, there was a 
Chinese Association Committee in Ikebukuro 
that aimed to establish “Tokyo Chinatown”. 
Members of this association tried to unite 
Chinese operators in Ikebukuro and promote 
the collaboration among new overseas 
Chinese（Yamashita Kiyomi, 2011）. Although 
this attempt eventually ended in failure under 
the influence of many factors, the failure did 
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not affect the survival and development of 
new immigrants in foreign societies because 
of the diversified support structure.

Thus, in physical form, the location advan-
tage of Ikebukuro and the attraction of 
Chinese circle make new immigrants gather 
together geographically. In terms of internal 
cohesion, Ikebukuro Chinatown is relatively 
loose compared to traditional Chinatown. 
This is in part because to new immigrants, 
the Chinese circle in Ikebukuro is only one of 
the ways in which they extend personal net-
works, and the reduced reliance on Chinese 
associations also indicates the fade of a way 
to be bonded. Hence like other new immi-
grant Chinese communities that have been 
discovered elsewhere, Ikebukuro Chinatown 
has a gathering of Chinese but no clear com-
munity boundaries, and the ethnic composi-
tion is diverse. Although it has merged into 
the mainstream society, it is known as “New 
Chinatown” publicly.

（Ikebukuro）In fact, it is already a Chinatown, 
subconsciously. Everything you need is here, 
right? Even the Chinese snacks. （Case 14, 
E-commerce operator）

The North Exit of Ikebukuro is the gathering 
place for Chinese. Snacks, restaurants, and en-
tertainment facilities such as karaoke are almost 
all concentrated in this area. The North Exit is 
already an unspoken Chinese gathering place.

（Case 18, real estate operator）
Ikebukuro is pretty good, not only Chinese, 

but also foreigners come here more often... The 
gathering of Chinese contributes to its prosperi-
ty. Ikebukuro is like Kowloon...Even if the 
Chinatown is not officially established, everyone 
assumes that this is the place where Chinese 
live.（Case 24, restaurant operator）

5. Conclusion and discussion

Using the “structure of social support” as a 
theoretical framework, this paper analyzes 
the formation of a new immigrant Chinese 
community in Ikebukuro, which is a fol-
low-up attempt based on existing research. 
First of all, there are not many cultural facili-
ties in Ikebukuro that maintain ethnic life. So 
the “cultural community” theory（Huping 
Ling, 2007）and the “cultural symbolic com-
munity” theory（Huijing Zhang, 2017）, which 
both emphasize the reason why new immi-
grants gather together is because of their 
needs for cultural identity, are not applicable 
to the Ikebukuro case. Second, theories focus-
ing on social capital, like “ethnic capital”（Min 
Zhou & Mingang Lin, 2004）and “nodes and 
social capital interaction”（Huijing Zhang, 
2016）, just exactly describe the diverse ways 
in which new immigrants extend their per-
sonal networks. Besides, since existing stud-
ies all discussed foreign social environment 
in research backgrounds, the impacts of insti-
tutional environment on the survival and de-
velopment of new immigrants do exists. 
Based on this, after clarifying the formal sup-
port received by new and early overseas 
Chinese in Japan is indeed different, this arti-
cle incorporates formal support as a constitu-
ent element of the analytical framework, and 
discusses the formation mechanism of 
Ikebukuro Chinatown.

The results show that the “structure of so-
cial support” has an explanatory power on 
Ikebukuro case. As a form of new immigrants’ 
integration under the background of global-
ization, “Ikebukuro Chinatown” reveals the 
possible impact of diversified support struc-
ture on the formation and development of 
new immigrant Chinese communities. In 
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consideration of social and economic factors, 
such as cheap rent prices and convenient 
transportation, the first Chinese immigrants 
to Ikebukuro gathered together in this geo-
graphically advantageous land. The Chinese 
circle formed later became the dragging force 
to attract more new immigrants to Ikebukuro. 
The number of new Chinese immigrants 
gathered here was thus increasing over time. 
From the perspective  of  demography, 
Ikebukuro already has the conditions for 
forming a new immigrant Chinese communi-
ty in terms of reginal population. New immi-
grants’ reliance on informal support network 
such as kinship and geo-relations, just like 
early overseas Chinese, become the possible 
means to maintain this form of gathering. But 
unlike early overseas Chinese who have suf-
fered much social exclusion and have to “get 
together for warmth”, new immigrants in 
Ikebukuro now live in a more diverse and 
equal social environment. New immigrants 
can easily obtain various kinds of formal sup-
port from the ever-improving official system. 
At the same time, their personal relationships 
extend beyond the boundaries of ethnicity 
and community. Compared with early over-
seas Chinese who were embedded in tradi-
tional Chinatown through associations, the 
diversified support structure enables new im-
migrants no longer treat Chinese associations 
as a necessary source to obtain resources for 
survival and development. The unitary sup-
port structure that only relies on informal 
networks has become history. Therefore, in 
the context of diversified support structure, 
the integration of  new immigrants  in 
Ikebukuro is agglomerated in physical space, 
but loose in internal cohesion. A new immi-
grant Chinese community-” Ikebukuro 
Chinatown” -finally came into being. The de-

territorial nature of Ikebukuro Chinatown is 
consistent with existing studies on the open-
ness of new immigrant Chinese communities.

Meanwhile, based on empirical materials, 
this article explores and discovers the dia-
chronic changes in the support structure of 
Ikebukuro’ s new immigrants, responding to 
and supplementing relevant discussions in 
existing studies. First of all, in terms of for-
mal support, some scholars pointed out that 
political regulations and cultural policies of a 
host country had significantly affected how 
new overseas Chinese adapted to mainstream 
society（Bing Wang & Xiao Liang, 2003）. In 
this paper, as the openness of Japanese insti-
tutional environment to immigrants is in-
creasing, it is easier for new immigrants to 
obtain resources for survival and develop-
ment from social institutions. For example, 
new immigrants can break through language 
barriers and accelerate their adaptation to lo-
cal life with the help of Tokyo Metropolitan 
Government, which provides free Japanese 
learning classes. Secondly, in terms of infor-
mal support, new immigrants’ frequent use of 
non-traditional personal relationships in the 
later stages of their survival and develop-
ment, such as academic and professional re-
lationships, are consistent with existing stud-
ies that new immigrants have higher human 
and social capital（Min Zhou & Mingang Lin, 
2004; Huijing Zhang, 2016）. However, the 
characteristic of using Chinese associations 
as an important intermediary for extending 
networks（Huijing Zhang, 2016）is not re-
flected in the interpersonal interactions of 
Chinese operators in Ikebukuro. On the con-
trary, interviewees’ recognition and participa-
tion in Chinese associations is weakening

（Huiling Zhu, 2003）. This may because this 
article restricts the research object to busi-
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ness operators, so samples of other occupa-
tional identity need to be included for further 
discussion.

In general, the “structure of social support” 
analytical framework proposed by this paper, 
enriches both the perspective to analyze for-
mation of new immigrant Chinese communi-
ty, and the application of the “social support” 
concept in immigration studies. Meanwhile, 
the field survey conducted by this paper in 
Ikebukuro, Tokyo, Japan, also provided first-
hand materials for current domestic studies 
on Chinese immigrants in Japan. Whether 
this analytical framework can be applied gen-
erally needs follow-up studies to correct and 
discuss.
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