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Byzantine princess Theophano, who was herself related to Emperor John Tzimiskes. Otto III
was well acquainted with Greek culture and had as tutor John Philagathos (of Rossano), who,
moved by ambition, was appointed pope over Gregory V, the legitimate pope and a cousin of
Otto III (he, too, was a disciple of Philagathos). Saint Neilos, who came to Rome from his seat
at Serperi, near Gaeta, asked that Philagathos, who had been imprisoned and was horribly
mutilated, be delivered to him, but Otto III and Gregory V refused his request. (See Agostino
Chiesa Alciator, Le pape au nez coupé: Jean XVI entre deux empires, de Rossano à Liège
(930–1013) [2006].)

This review, however cursory, lets us understand the fundamental role Neilos had in con-
temporary historical events, aswell as themediating role that holymonks often played in their
society. Saint Neilos acted like other Italo-Greek saints before and after him: throughout the
Byzantine Empire it was very common for them to move away from their monasteries and
their hermitages to defend the flocks of faithful entrusted to them against both external and
internal enemies, even at the cost of conflict with secular or ecclesiastical powers.

Thisbios truly represents themost beautiful example of historical Italo-Greek hagiography:
thus, the present edition, despite some inaccuracies, will allow a modern, international audi-
ence to gain a more in-depth understanding of that work and of its holy protagonist.

Gioacchino Strano, University of Calabria
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This is amost welcome book. Zachary Chitwood uses the notion of “Byzantine legal culture”
as “a shorthand way of collectively referring to different aspects of the interaction between
Byzantine law and society” (7). It is conveniently vague enough to enable him to go into a great
number of sources and subjects, while indicating his focus on the social history of Byzantine
law. In this legal culture, Chitwood distinguishes three strands: the Roman political legacy,
Orthodox Christianity, andHellenic culture. The study covers the years 867–1056, the almost
two centuries of the Macedonian dynasty, which Chitwood loosely terms the Middle Byzan-
tine period, and describes the gradual transformation of Justinian’s mainly Latin legacy to-
wards a Hellenic, less secular legal culture; Chitwood even goes as far as speaking of “The
End of Secular Law in Byzantium?” (184–92). Chitwood illustrates his argument with many
examples, which make for an attractive and often convincing story. There is much to applaud,
and this book provides a substantial contribution to the social history of Byzantine law in the
period indicated in his title; Chitwood provides an interesting context for the Byzantine legal
sources it discusses. A special bonus is the English translation of “the so-called Novella con-
stitutio, which announced the creation of the new position of nomophylax didaskalos along
with the founding of a law school in the capital,” printed as an appendix at 193–203 and dis-
cussed at 168–73. (The present reviewer is mildly surprised by the prominent title. Novella
constitutio is a generic indication of imperial legislation: every imperial constitutio is novella
as opposed to the existing legislation.) The qualification “so-called” probably bears on the
fact that it is a draft, not the actual constitution, which has not been transmitted. Since No-
vella constitutio is not the genuine title, why not devise a more eloquent one?

One of the characteristics of Byzantine legal language is the presence of Latin words in an
otherwise Greek environment. In the chapter on “Legal Education,” Chitwood discusses
among other things the difficulties raised by this Latin legal terminology for theGreek-speaking
population. As a first example, at 157, Chitwood presents a fragment from the Paraphrasis
Institutionum of Theophilos, 1.18. It contains in a few lines no less than six Latin technical
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terms, which are not easy to avoid in a translation. Instead of Murison’s translation, which
accompanies the latest edition, he gives his own, in which “granted freedom” is not entirely
correct (J. H. A. Lokin, R. Meijering, B. H. Stolte, and N. van der Wal, eds., Theophili ante-
cessoris Paraphrasis Institutionum, trans. A. F. Murison [2010]); if you want to avoid tech-
nical terms, it is clearer than Murison’s “emancipated,” but why not use “released from pa-
ternal power”?Moreover, it is curious to add to the enumeration of the technical terms a note
only pointing out that legitimoi is “a Hellenized form of legitimi.” Similarly Hellenized, in
other words, Latin roots provided with Greek endings, are also the other terms emancipatus
(acc. plur.!), testamentarion (acc. sing.), adgnaton (acc. sing.), adgnastica (nom. plur.), and
emancipationi (dat. sing.; the nominative would have been emancipation, not -io). From
Chitwood’s point of view it would have been worth noting that these Latin terms apparently
have been able to maintain themselves in the manuscript tradition of Theophilos’s Paraphrasis—
an introduction to the law!—until at least the eleventh century.

At 158, Chitwood gives an example of how the Byzantines overcame the difficulty of
“making sense of the Codex.” The Basilica (c. 900) contain Greek summaries of the original,
mostly Latin text of Justinian’s codification. These summaries were often difficult to under-
stand without having recourse to the Latin originals, an additional barrier being the often
complicated Latin of Justinian’s Codex (534). In the sixth century, the antecessor Thalelaios
had taught the Code by providing a kata podas translation into Greek, as well as a Greek
commentary on the substance of the text.When theBasilicawere compiled using summaries,
Thalelaios’s teaching proved a useful tool for understanding that summarywithout having to
turn to Justinian’s Latin text. Most Basilica manuscripts contain so-called old scholia in
which these antecessorial texts were copied in the margins in order to clarify the summaries.
Chitwood argues that this was the way in which the Byzantines tried to circumnavigate the
necessity for the reader to consult the Latin originals, who in such a case would be sufficiently
informed by Thalelaios. The passage chosen to illustrate this procedure (Bas. 29.5.31, a sum-
mary of CJust. 5.14.1, with a scholion containing both Thalelaios’s kata podas translation
and his interpretation) is a good example, but Chitwood’s translation suggests that he has
not fully understood the legal substance of the text and of Thalelaios’s commentary. A full
explanation would far surpass the scope of this review, and I hope to offer it elsewhere, but
it does bring me to a final observation.

Legal sources are not the easiest texts to use for nonlawyers. My observations on the two
texts discussed on 157–59 do not diminish my positive appreciation of Chitwood’s book,
which I consider to be a successful integration of social and legal history. The boundaries be-
tween social and legal history are fading away, but both specialties still have to learn a lot
from each other.

Bernard H. Stolte, University of Groningen

Joshua Davies, Visions and Ruins: Cultural Memory and the Untimely Middle Ages. (Man-
chester Medieval Literature and Culture.) Manchester: Manchester University Press, 2018.
Pp. ix, 224; 20 black-and-white figures and 1 map. £75. ISBN: 978-1-5261-2593-4.
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In spite of its title, Joshua Davies’s new book, Visions and Ruins: Cultural Memory and the
Untimely Middle Ages, is a timely contribution to current debates about the relevance of the
Middle Ages to contemporary political discourse. It is a thoughtful and meditative rumina-
tion on the various ways that the idea of medievalism functions within modernity, ranging
from the dark underbelly of right-wing nationalism, which co-opts the medieval as a singular
site of originary ethnicity, to the hopeful, almost utopian work of contemporary artists, who
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