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A B S T R A C T

As part of the UN Sustainable Development Goals, all countries have agreed to “make cities and human set-
tlements inclusive, safe, resilient and sustainable”. We argue that there is a critical need for large-scale com-
parative city policy data that, when linked with outcome data, could be used to identify where policies are
working and where they could be improved. In an assessment of the landscape of existing city policy data, based
on a comprehensive scoping review, we find that existing databases are insufficient for the purposes of com-
parative analysis. We then describe what an “ideal” city policy database would look like, where it could be
housed, and how it could be developed. Such a database could be a key tool for achieving SDG 11, the urban
Sustainable Development Goal.

1. Introduction

In 2015, all 193 United Nations (UN) member states unanimously
adopted the Sustainable Development Goals (SDGs), a comprehensive
set of 17 goals and 169 targets aimed at reducing poverty and advan-
cing health and well-being for all (UN, 2015). While the SDGs built on
many of the core commitments established by the Millennium Devel-
opment Goals, which preceded them, they also expanded their scope to
other critical areas, including urban planning and development. SDG
11, “Make cities and human settlements inclusive, safe, resilient and
sustainable,” calls on countries to improve inclusive access to safe
housing, transportation, and green space, among many other targets.

With over half of the world's population residing in cities, SDG 11
represents a key opportunity to improve the daily living conditions of
billions of people (UN Department of Economic and Social Affairs,
2014). As with other SDGs, however, realizing the potential of SDG 11
requires identifying and implementing effective approaches to achieve
its targets. The formal SDG monitoring process focuses primarily on
tracking changes in outcomes. SDG indicator 11.1.1, for instance, will
track the “proportion of urban population living in slums, informal
settlements or inadequate housing” between 2015 and 2030. Yet while
improved outcomes are the ultimate goal, understanding the policy
levers that lead to change—and monitoring their global adoption—is
essential for accelerating progress. For example, at the city level, what

works to increase access to safe, adequate, and affordable housing?
Quantitative, globally comparative city-level policy data would fa-

cilitate efforts to answer such questions. While case studies of in-
dividual cities and comparative policy research synthesizing lessons
provide valuable information (see, e.g., Brakarz & Jaitman, 2013;
Gonzalez-Navarro & Quintana-Domeque, 2016; Nijman, 2008;
Tibaijuka, 2005), globally comparative policy indicators offer several
unique strengths. First, when urban leaders can easily observe ap-
proaches among other cities of similar size and resources to solving
common urban problems, they can better understand what policies are
feasible within their own cities. Second, with both quantitative data on
city policies and data on individual or household outcomes, researchers
could rigorously analyze policy impact, enabling urban leaders and
other stakeholders to make decisions guided by robust evidence about
which policy approaches are most effective. Finally, in areas of city
policy where there is already strong evidence about what works,
quantitative policy data would provide a tool for quickly identifying
gaps in both policies and their implementation.

The New Urban Agenda (NUA), adopted at a UN Conference on
Housing and Sustainable Urban Development in 2016, represents a
shared vision of the international community for cities' sustainable
development, and builds on SDG 11. It underlines the strong connec-
tions between good urbanization and job creation, livelihood oppor-
tunities, and improved quality of life, which should ideally be included
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in every urban policy and strategy (Habitat 3, 2018). The NUA stresses
the importance for various stakeholders to improve coordination of
their urban and rural development strategies to achieve sustainable
urbanization. It further states that there is no one single solution to
ensuring sustainable urbanization; it calls for commitments from the
decision-makers - national and local governments, to rethinking the
way the urban spaces are planned, built and managed. The NUA sets
out a series of principles including the importance of international co-
operation for cities' development efforts, sharing best practices, po-
licies, and programs (Habitat 3, 2018). The NUA does not, however,
provide either a policy roadmap for action or a data or policy mon-
itoring system—a fact that further underscores the necessity of creating
a global city policy database to accelerate the achievement of SDG 11.

At the national level, the WORLD Policy Analysis Center and others
have developed globally comparative policy data in a range of areas
affecting health, equity, and economic well-being. These databases
have enabled efforts to illustrate what policy choices have been feasible
across national contexts (Heymann & Earle, 2009; Heymann, Raub, &
Earle, 2011; Heymann, Raub, & Earle, 2013; Heymann, Rho, Schmitt, &
Earle, 2009); to monitor governments' compliance with international
human rights treaties, the MDGs, and the SDGs (Heymann, McNeill, &
Raub, 2014; Heymann, McNeill, & Raub, 2015); and to rigorously
analyze the impacts of a wide range of social policies on health out-
comes across countries in different income groups (Daku, Raub, &
Heymann, 2012; Hajizadeh, Heymann, Strumpf, Harper, & Nandi,
2015; Nandi et al., 2016; Ponce et al., 2017). Yet, to accelerate change
at the municipal level, the same type of globally comparative, in-depth
data is needed for city-level policies in such key areas as housing,
transportation, and sanitation.

In this paper, we argue that city-level policy data is needed in order
to evaluate progress toward achieving SDG 11. We assess the avail-
ability of comparative, city-level policy data in regional and global
databases, focusing on key policy areas relevant to the urban SDG
targets. To describe the landscape of existing city policy data and
identify any significant gaps, this paper provides the first comprehen-
sive scoping review of the relevant academic and grey literature. Such
reviews are typically conducted when an area of interest “is complex or
has not been reviewed comprehensively before” (Arksey & O'Malley,
2005).

In order to maximize the benefits to researchers, planners, and
policymakers, we sought to identify city policy databases that compiled
primary policy data and covered multiple countries and SDG 11 targets,
in addition to being regularly updated, available online, related to a
range of topics, and searchable by topic. Our review was guided by the
following two questions: first, do any such city policy databases exist?
Second, if so, does one such database or do several in combination
provide the data needed for comparative policy analyses that enable

assessments of progress toward SDG 11?
This paper begins by making the case for why a city policy database

will be essential for assessing progress toward the urban Sustainable
Development Goal. We then suggest five key attributes that such a
database would need to enable comparative analysis. We detail our
approach to conducting a comprehensive scoping review for existing
databases. The paper concludes with a discussion of data gaps and how
these can be addressed.

2. Background

2.1. Using comparative policy data for assessing progress in cities

City governments are increasingly using data to inform policy-
making. Recent research has called attention to some of the ways in
which cities may use indicator data, whether from their own cities,
from similar cities, or from “model” cities (Lim, Kim, & Maglio, 2018).
However, we argue that in order to obtain a broader picture of which
policies work, and in which contexts, we need large-scale city policy
data that can be linked with outcomes. The main objective of a com-
parative city policy database is to enable policymakers to learn from
others and design evidence-based policies. Fig. 1, below, outlines the
process through which a desired outcome or objective is translated into
an actionable policy or law.

In the initial stage, policymakers set an agenda and identify the
desired outcomes of a policy. In the case of the SDGs, an international
organization, the UN, has established particular goals that nations must
strive to achieve. The New Urban Agenda also sets several standards by
which municipal governments must abide. Once a policy goal is iden-
tified, policymakers enter the policy formulation stage and consider
options for the policy's design. The capacity to adopt and effectively
implement a policy must be considered at this stage. Once a policy is
designed and then adopted, the means by which it may be implemented
can be identified. An evaluation of the policy's effects on related out-
come variables can shed light on the policy's effectiveness and inform
further discussion and refinements. Comparative policy analysis can
play a large role in the agenda setting and policy formulation stages,
allowing local governments to see what works and what does not across
differing contexts.

2.2. Current SDG monitoring efforts

In an effort to capture countries' progress toward achieving the
SDGs, the UN has compiled a Global SDG Indicators Database. The
development of this database is ongoing, and its data are updated
regularly. However, the data are available only at the country/area
level, not the city level. Moreover, the number of indicators represented

Fig. 1. Role of comparative policy analysis in evidence-based policymaking.
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in the database is limited. For example, the portion of the database
related to SDG 11 lacks indicators on providing access to an accessible
transport system, ensuring inclusive and sustainable urbanization,
protecting cultural and natural heritage, providing access to green and
public spaces, creating links between urban and rural areas, and sup-
porting less developed countries. Moreover, this database contains
outcome data rather than policies. Additionally, in a lot of cases data
and metadata for measuring the progress toward achieving the SDGs is
missing.

The World Bank has developed another SDG monitoring system,
through the World Development Indicators. This system allows users to
explore all the targets and selected indicators, as well as compare two
economies side-by-side for a number of indicators. Again, however,
only country-level data are provided. Finally, like the UN monitoring
system, the World Bank approach contains only outcome data, rather
than information on policies and legislation.

While these efforts represent an important start, the limited avail-
ability of policy data in general, and absence of city-level policy data in
particular, will impede progress toward identifying what works best
and monitoring the adoption of effective approaches to realizing the
urban SDG. A number of social policies central to the fulfillment of SDG
11 are legislated at the city level. For example, the details of housing
policy, transportation policy, and sanitation policy are often decided
and implemented by municipalities. Consequently, the availability of
city-level policy data is critical for monitoring progress toward SDG 11,
and would provide an essential complement to national policy data in
broader efforts to realize the SDGs.

2.3. Features of a city policy database

A comprehensive, publicly accessible database on city policies
would enable diverse stakeholders to adopt, analyze, or read various
pieces of legislation and policies in comparative context, and provide an
action-oriented resource to supplement the formal SDG monitoring
process focused primarily on national-level outcomes. However, the
details of this database's construction matter for its utility as a com-
parative tool and data source for rigorous analysis. We began our
scoping review by specifying important attributes to ensure open access
and multidisciplinary use. We specifically prioritized five attributes that
would be essential in a city database: it should (1) cover multiple policy
areas, (2) provide primary sources, (3) be regularly updated, (4) have
broad geographic scope, and (5) be searchable by topic.

First, a city database adequate to fully address the SDGs should
include measures of the full range of relevant policies. A broad scope
would expand on current urban databases focused on single areas,
capturing the full range of topics needed to meet all the needs of the
SDGs.

The second attribute addresses the issues of data quality. Primary
sources are necessary in a comprehensive database to fact-check, ensure
accuracy, and use as a basis for comparison. We define primary sources
as original legislation, bills, policies, and similar documents. The
International Labour Organization's NATLEX database is an example of
a public and comprehensive database that provides access to original
legislation on labor (International Labour Organization, 2017). We
sought similar sources on urban policy. These primary sources are
created by governments and may include policies as well as reports or
actions. A city database could embed these primary source documents
as attachments or provide direct links to electronically accessible
sources. Primary sources increase the accountability of databases and
mitigate potential differences in policy interpretation.

Third, the city policy database should contain consistently updated
information. Databases that are recently and regularly updated will be
critical for advancing the SDGs. Furthermore, regular updates will en-
sure effective monitoring and evaluation of the policy efforts. Policies
change over time, sometimes over short periods, as political leaders and
national priorities shift. We suggest an annual or bi-annual (if resources

are constrained) update to capture shifts in political leadership or city
priorities, which affect legislation. A database with frequent updates
better incentivizes city action and, when linked to outcomes, accel-
erates learning.

The fourth aspect of our model city policy database is a global
geographic scope, which is necessary for comparing the effects of po-
licies across contexts. Since we argue that such database will help
achieve SDGs, it should by definition cover all countries or as many as
possible. Moreover, an ideal database would include multiple cities
within one country but maintain the ability to compare and standardize
against cities around the world. This attribute would allow stakeholders
to assess city-level policies both nationally and globally.
Comprehensive city databases sometimes exist for single countries, but
a compilation of cities across multiple countries would better facilitate
progress toward SDG 11. For example, the Integrated City Sustainability
Database is a nation-wide dataset of U.S. municipal governments' sus-
tainability programs and policies, which can serve as a valuable re-
source for researchers investigating local environmental and energy
sustainability. However, given that this database is national, it does not
allow for global comparison and analysis. A global city policy database
would encourage broader discussion among local government officials
as well as researchers and members of intergovernmental and civil
society organizations.

Finally, our model database would enable users to search by topic.
This attribute complements the first one: the coverage of multiple to-
pics. While searchability is a design feature of a database and not a
methodological aspect, its importance lies in enhancing usability. The
ideal database should be easy to use, if stakeholders are unable to
search and make full use of a city database, its primary goal of dis-
semination will be undermined.

3. Methods

To ensure the discovery of any and all relevant databases, we con-
ducted a comprehensive scoping review. We followed Arksey and
O'Malley's (2005) description of scoping review methods in order to
assess the relevance of databases that were uncovered. Scoping reviews
aim to rapidly gather and map existing information on a particular
topic. They are often useful for areas where comprehensive reviews
have not been previously undertaken (Arksey & O'Malley, 2005), in that
they can contribute broad overviews of the state of existing research.

Based on our research questions, we identified sources that would
enable our search to be as comprehensive as possible: academic data-
bases, civil society organization websites, and Google search. We began
with a search of academic literature related to city policies. For this, we
consulted the following platforms: ProQuest, EbscoHost, JSTOR, Sage,
and Google Scholar. Queries relied on a series of keywords using
Boolean strings, giving priority to primary sources related to city-level
policies. The keyword searches included the terms: “cities,” “city-level,”
“urban,” “urban-level,” “regional,” “provincial,” “municipal,” “muni-
cipal-level,” “legislation,” “law,” “policies,” “ordinance,” and “decree.”
These were combined with terms restricting the searches to articles
referencing databases (such as “database,” “data,” “lex,” and “re-
pository”). Searches were first carried out in English and then re-con-
ducted in Spanish, French, German, and Russian, using translations of
the keywords. We sought to keep the review as broad as possible, and
thus did not set search constraints by date or database format (Excel
spreadsheet, website, or so forth).

In addition to the queries described above, we carried out topic-
driven searches of the academic literature. Based on previous research,
we selected policy areas that are interdisciplinary, generally regulated
at the city level, and related to infrastructure or services. Additionally,
these policy areas would have an impact on the SDGs and the overall
goal of alleviating poverty. The keywords included in these specific
queries were “early childhood development/education,” “water,” and
“housing.”
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We eliminated results that were: (1) not based on city-level policies
or (2) not globally comparative. For example, we excluded the UN-
HABITAT Urban Data website because its data, while focused on out-
comes, do not refer to city legislation or policy. Broadly, our concern is
with city-level policies and not with international groups that enact
special initiatives at the regional or city level.

4. Results

We identified 23 eligible databases that met our initial criteria. Of
these databases, we assessed whether each met our full eligibility cri-
teria of a comparable and global city policy database. Ineligible data-
bases included outcomes-focused or single-country policy databases.
After this review, 11 databases met our eligibility criteria. We then
explored each database in more detail to determine whether they met at
least one of the five desired attributes. Seven city databases cover
public policies, in multiple countries, and meet at least one key attri-
bute. These seven databases contain information on a wide range of
social policies, include geographic ranges from 36 to 242 countries and
territories, and were updated this year (Table 1).

In Table 2, we matched each database with the 10 targets from SDG
11. If information could be found for at least one country or source in
the database, the SDG 11 target was noted. Targets 11.1 and 11.2 focus
on adequate and affordable housing and transport, especially for vul-
nerable populations, and all databases cover some aspect of these in-
dicators. Target 11.3 is based on inclusive urban planning; this theme is
found in all seven databases as well. Target 11.4 protects cultural and
natural heritage, which is addressed in the majority of the databases.
Target 11.5, related to the reduction of deaths and economic losses
caused by disasters, thematically appears in four of the final databases.
Target 11.6 focuses on air quality and waste management and is found
in all but one database. Target 11.7, access to green public spaces, is
similarly found in all databases except one. Targets 11.A, 11.B, and
11.C relate to positive economic growth through regional planning,
climate and disaster adaptation strategies, and financial assistance in
resilient building, respectively. All seven databases have some aspect of
the last three targets. Overall, all SDG 11 targets are well represented in
many of our final databases. UrbanLex, the Cities Alliance Knowledge
Centre, and the United Cities and Local Governments E-library contain
policies and/or legislation on all SDG 11 targets.

In Table 3, we provide information related to our second research
question: whether the data allow for comparative policy analysis. We
group databases into three categories: (A) contains the most relevant
policy information and enables multiple comparisons, (B) contains re-
levant policy information and enables some comparisons, and (C)
contains some relevant policy information and enables limited com-
parisons. Attribute 1, “Covers multiple policy areas,” is selected if the
database covers more than one topic area. Attribute 2, “Provides pri-
mary sources,” is selected only for databases that refer to city-level
legislation or other primary source documents. Attribute 3, “Regularly
updated,” describes databases that have been updated in 2016 or later.
Attribute 4, “Broad geographic scope,” is selected if databases contain
relevant information for multiple cities in more than one country. At-
tribute 5, “Searchable by topic,” refers to those that contain a topical
search capability.

The first category (Group A) contains UrbanLex, the city policy
database that has all five attributes: covering multiple policy areas,
providing primary sources, regularly updated, broad geographic scope,
and searchable by topic. UrbanLex covers topics ranging from urban
planning to finance, contains original legislation, is consistently up-
dated, encompasses 72 countries, and is fully searchable by topic.
Additionally, it contains legislation from 2018, suggesting regular and
timely updates by database administrators. However, the process of
updating UrbanLex is not clearly described on the site, so more widely
available information is needed regarding the methods and consistency
of updates. Another limitation of UrbanLex is that policies cover aTa
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limited number of cities and legislation. In summary, we believe that
UrbanLex is relevant for comparative policy analysis because it de-
monstrates all five attributes, but opportunities remain for further de-
velopment.

The second group (Group B) includes relevant data sources that
enable some comparisons and generally cover three or four attributes.
The specific sources in Group B are: the Open Government Partnership,
ICLEI Local Governments for Sustainability, and the Cities Alliance
Knowledge Centre. All cover multiple policy areas and are regularly
updated. The Open Government Partnership is globally focused and
searchable by topic, but it lacks direct links to primary sources. The
Local Governments for Sustainability database has a broad geographic
scope but lacks primary source links and search by topic options. The
Cities Alliance Knowledge Centre can be searched by topic but lacks
broader geographic scope and direct links to primary sources. Group B
databases have many desirable comparative policy attributes, but could
be strengthened with primary source links.

The third group (Group C) contains databases and data sources with
some relevant policy data, which allow for limited comparisons, typi-
cally based on two or three attributes. These promising databases
contain important policy information but could be further expanded.
The three data sources in this group all cover multiple policy areas.
They are: Connective Cities, OECD Thematic Work on Cities, and the
United Cities and Local Governments (UCLG) E-library. Connective
Cities is regularly updated and searchable by topic but lacks primary
source links, broader geographic scope, and the ability to analyze data
directly from publications or a data library. Though regularly updated,
the OECD Thematic Work on Cities is not searchable by topic and lacks
primary source links and broad geographic scope. The OECD database
provides rankings and comparisons of specific cities, demonstrating
potential for more global applications. The UCLG database has a broad
geographic scope and topic search functionality but lacks primary
source links and regular updates. Group C databases contain some
elements of comparable global city policy databases but lack key at-
tributes, leaving open opportunities for enhancement.

Overall, each of the seven data sources identified through our
comprehensive scoping review of academic sources and grey literature
has unique strengths and limitations. In this section, we have high-
lighted the attributes relevant to policy analysis and decision-making.
Our review highlights a significant gap, in that only one of the sources
fully encompasses the attributes needed for comparative analysis. All of
the identified databases would benefit from increased methodological
transparency, larger geographic and policy coverage.

5. Discussion

With this review, we aimed to identify city policy databases that
cover multiple policy areas, provide access to primary sources, are
regularly updated, have a broad geographic scope, and are searchable
by topic. This scoping review found seven city policy databases that
meet at least two of these criteria and cover multiple SDG 11 targets.
The one database that meets all the criteria covers only a limited range
of topics relevant to the SDGs for a limited range of cities and countries.
This finding reinforces other researchers' previous assertions regarding
the lack of sufficient data to accelerate action (Klopp & Petretta, 2017,
p. 96).

Given time constraints, we limited our search to city policy data-
bases and did not include information about city budgets. We recognize
that policy data will not on its own lead to policy change; however, we
believe that having these data available would be a critical first step
toward identifying actionable policies that can significantly contribute
to progress toward the SDGs.

A database with primary city-level policy data, containing in-
formation on a large number of countries and data on multiple targets,
would be critical for developing the knowledge base needed to reach
the urban SDG targets. Such a database will not only provide an

important foundation for achieving SDG 11, but will also enable the
further creation and improvement of urban sustainable development
policies. Comparative local policy data is necessary to understand what
action steps are available to cities (in contrast to national level options),
provide examples to decision makers of steps taken by other cities, and
enable monitoring of spread of effective policies as well as gap areas
where cities are not taking.

The seven databases from our search results are not sufficient to
address current policy and indicator measurement needs, particularly
with regard to SDG 11, the urban Sustainable Development Goal. They
lack several important features. First, several databases do not allow for
large-scale comparisons across cities. Only three out of seven cover all
SDG 11 targets, while the rest cover them only partially. Even these
three do not cover all SDG-relevant topics for the majority of cities.

As our findings indicate, there is no database in existence that would
allow for comprehensive comparative city policy analysis with a global
scope. In some cases, policies contained in existing databases are
country-level rather than city-specific. Even the database with the most
relevant policy information, UrbanLex, has the downside of covering a
limited number of cities, thus prohibiting an exhaustive analysis.
Further, current monitoring efforts by UN bodies such as UN Habitat do
provide some useful resources in terms of outcomes data, but a com-
prehensive repository of city policies is lacking. While existing data are
insufficient to meet the need, they can provide an invaluable founda-
tion for building one or more global city policy databases that have a
broad geographic scope, cover a range of topics, and provide access to
primary sources, in addition to being regularly updated, easily available
online, and searchable by topic. The city policy database we envision
would build on existing databases by documenting existing policies in a
vast cross-section of the cities of the world.

Planners and policymakers may wish to think about methods of
capturing data in a systematic way across cities, to allow for compar-
ison. This database should be open access, allowing multiple stake-
holders and the public to engage in the policy process.

An ideal comparative city policy database would enhance each step
of the policy formulation, implementation, and evaluation phases. The
use of comparative city policy database is shown in Fig. 2. During the
agenda setting and policy formulation, city policymakers could utilize
the database to search for existing and relevant policies from other
cities similar in demographics, size, or goals. As a policy is implemented
and monitored, stakeholders could use the database to determine ap-
propriate indicators to report outputs, make contact with similar cities,
compare outcomes with other cities, and monitor progress toward the
policy goals. Finally, city policymakers could assess the regulatory
quality and output in the final stage by contributing their lessons, im-
provements, and quantifiable achievements. As an example, a city in-
terested in developing environmental protection policies could begin a
search on the comparative policy database, identify comparable policy
scope, adapt language and objectives, connect with an experienced city,
develop measurable indicators for outcomes, track their progress,
iterate on the policies, and report long-term outcomes. This proposed
database would be comprehensive but we anticipate gaps in policy
knowledge, which could be ameliorated by having city policy stake-
holders outreach to similar cities in jointly developing new policies.
Alternatively, a pioneering city with a new policy could document their
policymaking steps, share iterations of legislation, and act as a policy
mentor.

Despite the current movement toward individual “smart cities,”
there appears to be a lack of investment in the creation of repositories
that would capture information across cities, thus allowing for learning
across contexts. Building such a database would require financial in-
vestments by governments and incentives for cities to participate.
Municipalities could contribute in-kind resources such as staff per-
sonnel time to upload and update policies, website server hosting, or
publicity surrounding the repository. Metadata on each policy con-
tribution should state the upload date, policy passage date,
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contributor's name, affiliations, file type, and similar information.
Given its predominant role in monitoring progress toward the SDGs,

the UN would be the most appropriate entity to house a comparative
city policy database. The city policy database we envision would be
well suited for inclusion alongside an existing database such as the UN
SDG Global Indicators Database. As noted, however, most existing data
related to SDG 11 are country- rather than city-level. The existing re-
porting structure could be strengthened by engaging national govern-
ments to solicit local laws and policies from all major cities.
Policymakers from around the world should convene to determine how
best to obtain municipal policies and legislation. By combining city
policies with data on outcomes, other policymakers can learn valuable
lessons that will inform local policy debates. UN agencies such as UN-
Habitat would also be strong bases for the database. The New Urban
Agenda has consistently emphasized the importance of UN-Habitat as a
focal point on sustainable urbanization in collaboration with other
United Nations system entities. The NUA calls for UN-Habitat to
strengthen its normative knowledge and provide tools to all govern-
mental levels in designing, planning, and managing sustainable urban
development (Habitat 3, 2018).

While the UN is the most appropriate institution to house the pro-
posed city policy database, we also emphasize the need for city-level
action and support. However, it's critical that the process for developing
the database engage and be informed by city policymakers. We would
encourage coalitions of cities and localities to envision the scope, scale,
and practicality of a comparative database. A call to action from
mayoral coalitions like the C40 Cities and United Cities and Local
Governments (UCLG) would spur action toward a database. This in-
itiation could coincide with a global meeting such as the biennial C40
Mayors Summit, C40 workshops, or UCLG World Summit.

How analysts approach the database and how decision makers use
the findings will depend on their objectives and local contexts.

One may wish, for example, to analyze the role of city health sys-
tems in post-conflict areas. In this case, it will be important for the
database to contain a sufficient number of post-conflict cities to serve as
a comparison group. Examining the full range of challenges cities face
from informal settlements in low income countries to pollution in ra-
pidly industrializing settings to high crime rates etc., we can see the
importance of the database including a large number of cities from all
regions and countries. In order to conduct rigorous analyses, multi-level
modelling methods will be crucial and these require a sufficient sample
size of comparator cities.

In an effort to sketch out a sample data application and illustrate
how such a city policy database could be used, we provide one example

related to educational policies. Imagine that decision-makers in a
lower-income country are formulating policies with the objective to
improve secondary school completion rates of female students. The next
step would be to search for policies related to gender and education,
with a particular emphasis on cities with similar budgets or similar
along other social and economic dimensions that the policymakers find
relevant. Data on policies and practices in other cities will provide
examples of possible approaches. Where data on a sufficient number of
cities and length of time is available linking policies and outcomes, this
data may also provide strong evidence on which policies/practices are
most/least effective and under what conditions. This could fill critical
information gaps city level decision makers currently face.

Limitations of this study include the fact that, while we attempted to
be comprehensive, a relevant database may have gone undetected if the
query failed to use search engine optimization, or if the search terms
included were ill-defined. Databases may exist on single topics that are
often addressed by city policies (such as transportation), but these may
not necessarily have appeared in our search if other topics were not
addressed. This paper does not explore issues related to power dy-
namics, including access to policies and policymaking, the capacity for
enforcement, knowledge circulation, funder priorities, or the compre-
hensibility of a policy database to the general public.

6. Conclusion

Amid tremendous urban growth in recent decades, urban sustain-
able development has become a priority for many countries across the
globe. In this paper, we argue that in order to achieve the urban
Sustainable Development Goal 11, there is a need not only for city-level
outcome data, but for policy data as well. Ideally, a comparative city
policy database would be similar to existing databases with country-
level policies. Such a database would be regularly updated and avail-
able online, have a broad geographic scope, cover a range of topics, be
searchable by topic, provide access to primary sources, and cover the
SDG 11 targets. This would allow researchers, planners, and policy-
makers to see which cities might provide lessons and ideas regarding
“best practices” for other cities.

Based on the findings from our scoping review, it appears that there
is a significant gap in policy data that would allow us to compare cities
and understand which policies are working and which policies need to
be improved across SDG 11. We argue that more work is needed to
create such a database, either by an organization such as the United
Nations or by a civil society organization, or potentially, both. Only
with the systematic compilation of data that allows us to learn what

Fig. 2. Use of comparative city policy database.
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policies are most effective at scale can we accelerate progress toward
the SDG goals so that cities may truly provide opportunities for all.
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