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A major effect of the Economic 
Recovery Act of 1981 is the creation 
of an entirely new system for cost 
recovery of an investment in assets — 
the accelerated cost recovery system 
(ACRS). The new system provides for 
accelerated methods for computing 
the recovery allowances as well as for 
shorter recovery periods. The purpose 
of this article is to examine the new 
system as to its effect on one aspect 
of business investment decisions in 
real property. Specifically, the paper 
examines the initial choice between 
the ACRS and straight-line deprecia­
tion as allowed by the new law.
The Accelerated Cost 
Recovery System (ACRS)

The Act replaces the concept of 
depreciation based on the useful life 

of an asset with a system which 
employs standard recovery percent­
ages. The percentages reflect accel­
erated methods of cost recovery over 
pre-determined periods that have no 
necessary relationship with the useful 
life of assets. ACRS also permits the 
recovery of salvage value. The 1981 
Act provides for the recovery of the 
cost of depreciable personal property, 
generally over a 3-year, 5-year, or 
15-year recovery period, depending 
upon the type of property.

ACRS Write-Off of Real 
Property

Real property has been assigned a 
15-year recovery period by the new 
Act. The cost recovery percentages 
allowed during this period under ACRS 
are presented as follows:

Recovery Cost Recovery
Year: Percentage:

1 12
2 10
3 9
4 8
5 7
6 6
7 6
8 6
9 6

10 5
11 5
12 5
13 5
14 5
15 5

Some Advantages of ACRS
The new system will produce 

dramatically more favorable tax 
benefits than previous depreciation 
methods. For example, assume a 
$1,000,000 investment in real property 
that would have a depreciable life of 
40 years prior to the new law. Double 
declining balance depreciation would 
produce a depreciation charge the first 
year of $50,000, yielding a tax savings 
of $20,000 to an investor who is sub­
ject to a 50% marginal tax rate and the 
20% minimum tax on the excess of ac­
celerated depreciation over straight- 
line. The same investment under the 
provisions of ACRS provides a 
depreciation deduction and tax benefit 
the first year of $116,667 and $49,333, 
respectively. This amounts to more 
than doubling the tax benefit with 
ACRS in spite of higher preference in­
come and a lower depreciation rate 
(175% versus 200%).

In general, investors in real proper­
ty will find the ACRS to produce 
favorable tax effects. However, certain 
circumstances would indicate that a 
property holder should consider the 
optional straight-line depreciation alter­
native to the ACRS. Previous ac­
celerated methods are no longer an 
option.

Residential Real Property
Under previous law, when real prop­

erty is sold, gain is taxed at ordinary 
rates only to the extent that ac­
celerated depreciation exceeds 
straight-line depreciation. There is no 
ordinary income recapture upon sale 
when straight-line depreciation is 
elected. This treatment is unchanged
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under the 1981 Act for residential real 
property. Generally, owners of residen­
tial real property will find, as before, 
that the advantages of accelerated 
(ACRS) write-off will outweigh its 
potential disadvantages relative to the 
alternative straight-line method. A 
comparative analysis is presented in 
Table I for a hypothetical investment 
of $1,000,000 in a residential building. 
The tax effects depicted assume the 
potential sale of the building at the end 
of the various years shown. Only for in­
vestments in which a sale is contem­
plated within five years should the 
straight-line alternative be considered. 
Thus, as a general rule, accelerated 
cost recovery will continue to offer 
more beneficial tax effects for owner­
ship and investment in residential real 
property.
Nonresidential Real Property

Under the 1981 Act, no longer will 
gain subject to recapture as ordinary 
income be limited to the excess of ac­
celerated over straight-line depre­
ciation for nonresidential real property. 
Instead, with ACRS all prior deductions 
will be treated as ordinary income 
upon sale. Electing straight-line 
depreciation would insure no recapture 
and all gain on the sale would be 
capital gain.

An owner or investor in nonresiden­
tial real property should consider the 
relative merits of ACRS (accelerated 
deductions) versus straight-line 
depreciation (avoiding recapture) in 
choosing a cost recovery system when 
the possibility of selling the property 
exists. Table II shows the relative ad­
vantages for a $1,000,000 investment 
and subsequent sale at various stages 
of the asset’s life.

The calculations demonstrate that 
for a taxpayer in a 50% marginal tax 
bracket whose time value of money is 
18%, straight-line depreciation would 
be the preferable alternative if sale is 
contemplated within 17 years. The 
relevant “holding period” will vary with 
modifications of the basic assumptions 
concerning appropriate tax rates, dis­
count rates, and sale price of the 
asset..

Other Considerations
When the comparisons in Table 2 

are repeated with the assumption that 
the taxpayer is not in the alternative 
minimum tax situation, the choice of 
ACRS becomes advantageous when 
sale is made after only twelve years 
rather than eighteen for investments in 
non-residential property. In fact, for in­
vestments in residential property, the 
choice of ACRS provides a relative tax 
advantage for any year of recovery. 
Thus, for investors who have other in­
come which can be used to reduce the 
amount of income subject to the alter­
native minimum tax, the straight-line 
method would be advantageous in 
fewer situations.
Conclusions

The analysis summary indicates that 
the ACRS will yield favorable tax con­
sequences for many owners and in­
vestors in real property. However, 
electing the alternative straight-line 
method may produce more beneficial 
tax effects for real estate which may be 
subject to sale, particularly in the case 
of non-residential real property.Ω
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