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Several electrocardiogram (ECG) indexes are used to identify cardiac 
abnormalities in rats. However, there are few studies about the 
reliability of this tool. The aim of this study was to verify the reliability 
of a computerized electrocardiography (Heart Ware System) adapted 
for rats. The ECG was registered under intramuscular anesthesia 
(Zoletil®, 25mg/kg body weight) in the supine position, using four 
inserted electrodes in the subcutaneous layer of the animals’ paws 
(n=11). Three records per day were performed in an interval of fifteen 
minutes in three distinct days. Six standard leads were obtained (I, II, 
III, aVR, aVL and aVF) and the  following indexes were analyzed: 
duration of P wave; duration of QRS complex; PR interval; RR interval; 
QT interval and corrected QT (QTc) interval. Each individual ECG 
indexes were obtained from the average of three (P; QRS; PR) or ten 
(RR; QT; QTc) manual measures performed by the same observer. The 
repeatability in the same day and reproducibility in distinct days were 
verified by changes in the mean of the raw indexes (Anova with 
Tukey’s post-test, p< 0.05) and by the typical error expressed as the 
coefficient of variation (CV) of the LOG transformed indexes. For P, 
PR, QT and QTc indexes measured in the first day we found significant 
difference in the mean. All indexes showed a CV minor than 10% 
(except P, CV=11.9%). We conclude that the electrocardiography used 
in the described conditions has good reliability when conducted by 
trained professionals. 
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