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Abstract: The purpose of this study was to examine the benefits associated with complementary and alternative medicine 

(CAM) treatments from the patients’ perspective using a whole systems research approach as a guiding framework.  

We conducted five focus groups of six to eight participants each, with users of CAM recruited through experienced CAM 

providers and clinics. Eligible participants were aged 21 or older, had used CAM in the last 12 months, and believed the 

treatment to be beneficial. The focus group discussions were digitally recorded, transcribed, and analyzed through a quali-

tative content analysis. Responses were inductively coded for common themes, and then placed into broader conceptual 

categories reflecting the CAM outcome domains suggested by Verhoef and colleagues. Participants described physical 

health benefits including symptom relief and improved function, and positive psychological benefits such as improved 

coping and resilience. Social health benefits that arose from the positive aspects of the patient-practitioner relationship 

were also reported, including support and advocacy. In addition, participants identified empowerment, increased hope and 

spiritual growth as results of receiving CAM treatments. A new behavioral health outcome domain emerged as partici-

pants reported that CAM use had fostered behavioral changes such as increased exercise, smoking cessation and improv-

ing their diets. 

These patient-reported benefits of CAM treatment are consistent with the outcome model proposed by Verhoef and col-

leagues, and extend this model by identifying a new outcome domain—behavioral health outcome. The findings provide 

insight and direction for the development of outcome and process measures to evaluate CAM treatment effects. 

INTRODUCTION 

 As interest in and use of complementary and alternative 
medicine continues to rise, so does the need to identify and 
understand the full range of treatment effects. Indeed, it has 
been noted that evaluating the effectiveness of CAM neces-
sarily relies on the choice and range of outcomes evaluated 
[1]. Moreover, conceptual clarification of the factors that 
give rise to these effects is considered essential to ensure that 
the outcomes being evaluated are those that matter most to 
CAM users [2]. To this end, researchers have suggested tak-
ing a whole systems research perspective to view the multi-
plicity of CAM outcomes and their potentially synergistic 
interactions with contextual and personal factors [3-5]. This 
framework includes a consideration of specific or symptom-
focused effects, as well as other non-specific effects that fall 
within the boundaries of psychological, social, and spiritual 
benefits [4]. Although comprehensive, it is unknown if these 
outcome domains reflect the full range of experiences of 
CAM users because the categories were derived from survey 
responses by CAM researchers and practitioners. The pur-
pose of the current study was, therefore, to explore the do-
mains of benefits and outcomes associated with CAM 
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treatments from the patients’ perspective using a whole sys-
tems research approach as a guiding framework. 

Conceptualizing CAM Outcomes 

 A focus on evidence-based practice in recent years has 
prompted discussion about how CAM outcomes should be 
conceptualized and evaluated. Although the importance of 
including an assessment of the patient’s subjective experi-
ence of CAM therapies to identify key outcome criteria has 
emerged from this discussion, there remains some debate 
regarding the range of effects that should be considered [2, 
4]. Moreover, the diversity of CAM outcomes that can be 
considered treatment “effects” has led researchers to suggest 
that a holistic perspective is necessary to fully understand, 
distinguish, and measure the benefits of CAM interventions 
[1, 4].  

 Long [2] suggests that understanding the source of CAM 
effects is key to both identifying what constitutes an effect 
and to distinguishing certain outcomes from each other. He 
suggests that there are three basic types of effects: effects 
that arise from the philosophy of health and healing, effects 
that arise from the patient-practitioner relationship, and ef-
fects that are brought about by specific techniques used by 
the CAM practitioner to enhance the healing process [2]. The 
first type of effect is intertwined with the meaning of health 
as it relates to CAM, including such concepts as self-care, 
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holistic health beliefs, and a systems or biopsychosocial ap-
proach to healing and health. The second type of effect is 
most often described as “non-specific” and involves con-
cepts such as hope, trust, empathy, and encouragement that 
may hasten healing processes by supporting the patients’ 
belief that healing is possible. Finally, the third type of effect 
involves the tools and techniques that are unique to individ-
ual CAM modalities, including acupuncture needling tech-
niques, specific homeopathic remedies, and body manipula-
tion techniques. Long [2] suggests that such distinctions are 
necessary to not only identify CAM treatment effects but 
also to evaluate the “full” effects, which include outcomes 
related to each of these sources. 

A Whole Systems Approach to CAM Outcomes 

 Moving from a focus on the source of CAM outcomes, 
other researchers have developed a preliminary framework 
for categorizing the nature of CAM effects that highlights 
their interaction. Based on a whole systems research ap-
proach [3, 6], Verhoef and colleagues [4] propose four CAM 
outcome domains that give rise to a sense of holistic well-
ness. Physical outcomes relate to dimensions of physical 
well-being and include biological markers, physical func-
tioning, and symptoms such as pain and fatigue. Psychologi-
cal outcomes include those related to mental and emotional 
well-being, including mood, motivation, and perceptions 
related to health and healing such as control, resilience, and 
expectations. Social support, relationship factors, health-care 
utilization, and daily role functioning are examples of social 
outcomes related to CAM treatments. Finally, benefits such 
as empowerment, hope, and relaxation are conceptualized as 
spiritual outcomes associated with CAM.  

 Rather than being discrete domains, these outcomes are 
viewed as interacting synergistically with each other and 
with the contextual and personal factors that are integral to 
the process of healing. Consistent with Long’s [2] model, the 
whole systems model presents aspects of the patient-provider 
relationship as key factors that can affect treatment out-
comes. Moreover, it includes a holistic outcomes category 
that encompasses the four main outcome categories and as-
sesses this often overlooked outcome of CAM care [1]. Be-
cause a whole systems approach includes both the specific 
and non-specific effects of CAM treatment, it provides a 
potentially valuable framework for understanding and opti-
mizing the full effects of CAM treatments. 

The Present Study 

 Despite the apparent utility of the whole systems model, 
it is still unclear whether the model reflects the full range of 
outcomes that CAM patients perceived as benefits from 
treatment. The domains were derived from the survey re-
sponses of practitioners and researchers regarding their ob-
servations of CAM outcomes. It has, however, been sug-
gested that the best way to capture the range of ways in 
which CAM benefits its users is through experience-based 
evidence obtained directly from those users [2]. 

 One way of obtaining this type of evidence is by using 
focus groups. Indeed, several studies have employed focus 
groups as a means to better understand the motivations for 
using CAM [7-12], but there are relatively few studies that 
have examined the perceived benefits of CAM from the pa-

tient’s perspective. Among those that have, the focus was on 
outcomes regarding a single CAM therapy [13, 14], a limited 
set of CAM outcomes [15], or satisfaction with CAM care 
[16]. Thus, there is a need to explore the full range of bene-
fits perceived by CAM patients and, further, to examine if 
these perceived benefits are captured by the domains sug-
gested by current models of CAM outcomes.  

 The purpose of this study was, therefore, to address this 
gap by using a focus group methodology to examine the 
benefits associated with CAM treatments from the patients’ 
perspective using a whole systems research approach as a 
guiding framework. Because focus groups provide a dy-
namic forum from which new and unexpected themes may 
emerge from the natural flow of conversation [17], we felt 
that this methodology would be particularly relevant for ex-
amining and possibly expanding the outcomes from a whole 
systems research perspective.  

MATERIALS AND METHODOLOGY 

 To identify benefits and outcomes experienced by CAM 
consumers, we conducted five focus groups in two geo-
graphic locations (North Carolina and Massachusetts). Each 
focus group consisted of between 6 and 8 participants, with a 
total of 36 focus group participants. We recruited partici-
pants with the assistance of about 30 CAM practitioners and 
integrative care clinics, all of which were identified as expe-
rienced providers by knowledgeable informants. These pro-
viders included practitioners of a wide range of CAM serv-
ices representing the five types of CAM services defined by 
the National Center for Complementary and Alternative 
Medicine (NCCAM); these include whole medical systems, 
energy therapies, manipulative and body based therapies, 
mind-body therapies, and biologically based therapies. Pro-
viders who agreed to help with recruitment were asked to 
post flyers and fact sheets about the study in their offices. 
These materials included a toll-free number for interested 
persons to call to determine whether they qualified for the 
study.  

 Individuals were eligible for this study if they were 21 
years of age or older; received treatments by one or more 
complementary or alternative therapy practitioners for a 
health problem in the last year; found their treatments to be 
beneficial; and felt comfortable and willing to discuss their 
experiences in a group. We assigned eligible individuals to 
groups in each location to obtain as much variation as possi-
ble in age, gender, and the type of CAM therapies used.  

 Prior to beginning each focus group discussion, partici-
pants signed consent forms and completed a short question-
naire covering variables related to sociodemographic charac-
teristics, general health status, and service utilization. Once 
these forms were completed, an experienced moderator con-
ducted the focus groups, while a co-moderator took notes. 
To aid in the analysis and to capture the words of partici-
pants, each focus group session was digitally recorded. Each 
focus group discussion lasted approximately 2 hours. Par-
ticipants received a $40 honorarium to cover their time and 
any incidental expenses.  

 We transcribed the digital recordings, entered the tran-
scriptions into QSR NVivo [18], a qualitative data analysis 
software program, and used the categories from the focus 
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group interview guide to code the data. We then generated 
reports based on these codes.  

 Together with moderator and co-moderator summaries 
that were prepared after each group, two research analysts 
conducted an independent review of the reports and used 
qualitative content analysis [19] to identify common themes 
and outcomes reported by the focus group participants. We 
inductively coded the responses for common themes and 
then placed them into broader conceptual categories that 
reflected the CAM outcome domains suggested by Verhoef 
and colleagues [4]. We also examined the data to identify 
any additional domains that may have emerged and that were 
not included in the whole systems outcome model. Finally, 
we identified participant quotations to illustrate the outcomes 
that emerged during the analysis. 
 

Table 1. Characteristics of Focus Group Participants  

Characteristic Number Percent 

Age 

25–34 5 13.9 

35–44 7 19.4 

45–54 9 25.0 

55–64 10 27.8 

65 or older 5 13.9 

Gender 

Female 30 83.3 

Health status 

Excellent 3 8.3 

Very good 13 36.1 

Good 15 41.7 

Fair/poor 5 13.9 

Race 

White 33 91.7 

Education 

High school graduate or GED 1 2.8 

Some college or technical school 4 11.1 

College graduate 10 27.8 

Post graduate or professional degree 21 58.3 

Marital status 

Married 26 72.2 

Divorced 6 16.7 

Never married 4 11.1 

Income 

$45,000 or less 12 36.4 

$45,000–$70,000 8 24.2 

$70,001 or greater 13 39.4 

RESULTS 

 The characteristics of participants are shown in Table 1. 
Among the 36 participants across the 5 focus groups, the 
majority (n = 33) described their race as white/Caucasian. 
The majority of participants were female (n = 30) and mar-
ried (n = 26); more than half (n = 21) were under 55 years 
old. Overall, participants in the focus groups were well edu-
cated with more than half (n = 21) having a postgraduate 
education or professional degrees. The participants’ annual 
incomes varied: of those who provided this information, 12 
had incomes of $45,000 or less, 8 had incomes of $45,000–
$70,000, and 13 reported annual incomes greater than 
$70,000.  

General Health Status and CAM Utilization Background 

 Overall, a majority (n = 31) of the participants considered 
themselves to be in good, very good, or excellent health. 
Even so, they reported having a wide variety of health prob-
lems, including hypertension, gastrointestinal problems, vi-
sion problems, and arthritis and other pain-related issues for 
which they first visited a CAM practitioner. Others men-
tioned seeking CAM for general wellness or interest in learn-
ing self-regulation and self-help techniques. Table 2 provides 
a list of specific health problems prompting first time usage 
of CAM practitioners.  
 

Table 2. Reasons for First Visit to a CAM Provider 

Reason Number 

Depression, anxiety, stress, post-traumatic stress disorder 11 

Arthritis and joint stiffness 6 

Miscellaneous health problems not diagnosed or resolved  

by conventional practitioners 
3 

Knee pain, injuries, replacement 3 

Gynecological problems (menstrual, infertility or pelvic  

problems) 
3 

General aches and pains 2 

Headaches 2 

Head injuries (depressed skull fracture or post-concussive 

syndrome) 
2 

Vision problems 1 

Stomach or gastrointestinal problems 1 

Sinus problem 1 

Prostate infection/prostatitis 1 

Chronic cough 1 

Bladder control 1 

High blood pressure 1 

Smoking 1 

Gait issues 1 

Post-surgical recovery 1 
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 Participants in these groups were experienced CAM us-
ers. Most (n = 26) reported that their first visit to a CAM 
provider occurred over 2 years before the study and reported 
that they had used multiple types of CAM therapy. About 
half of the participants (n = 17) had used between 4 and 6 
different therapies, and one reported trying 21 total therapies 
over many years. Acupuncture (n = 24) was the most com-
mon therapy ever used by participants, followed by chiro-
practic (n = 14), Reiki (n = 13), yoga (n = 12), and craniosac-
ral and massage therapies (n = 11 each). Table 3 is a full list 
of the CAM therapies used by these participants.  

 

Table 3. Complementary and Alternative Medicine Thera-

pies Used by Participants 

CAM Therapy Number 

Acupuncture 24 

Chiropractic 14 

Reiki 13 

Yoga 12 

Craniosacral therapy 11 

Massage therapy 11 

Tai Chi 8 

Energy healing 6 

Homeopathy 6 

Herbs and supplements 5 

Feldenkrais Method 3 

Ton Ren 3 

Alexander Technique 2 

Cranioelectrical stimulation 1 

Naturopathy 1 

 

 Almost all (n = 35) reported having medical insurance; 
however, only 12 participants indicated that their insurance 
covered CAM services. Of these, only 1 indicated that insur-
ance covers all of the types of CAM used. Close to half 
(n = 14) of the participants reported spending over $1,000 
out of pocket to see CAM practitioners in the year prior to 
the study. 

Physical Health  

 We asked participants to discuss the type of physical 
problems that caused them to seek treatment from a CAM 
provider. While the type of physical conditions mentioned 
varied, participants often mentioned that they had sought 
help from CAM providers for problems or conditions when 
conventional medical treatments had been unsuccessful. The 
problems were similar to those reported in the demographic 
survey (see Table 2). A majority said that they used CAM 
for pain-related problems such as back pain, arthritis, dental  
 

pain while waiting for dental treatment, residual pain from a 
car accident, migraines, or other chronic headaches. These 
included acute, recurrent, and chronic pain. Many also said 
they saw a CAM practitioner for medical conditions such as 
upper respiratory infections, reflux, hypertension, side ef-
fects of conventional cancer treatments, tendonitis, or auto-
immune conditions like Sjögren’s syndrome. Some sought 
treatment to improve restricted function resulting from mus-
culoskeletal or neurological conditions such as Parkinson’s 
disease, vertigo, or the effects of a stroke. Table 4 provides 
examples of participants’ comments by the type of provider 
and physical condition for which they saw these providers.  

 When asked what type of benefit they received from the 
therapies used, several said that they received some type of 
improvement in their condition, such as decreased pain, de-
creased markers of inflammation, increased flexibility, in-
creased energy, better sleep, and increased mobility. CAM 
helped one participant “to be able to walk from one place to 
another and not feel a constant pain. That is what it has 
helped me. I feel physically stronger and I can do more.” 
Another remarked that “I started seeing him [acupuncturist] 
and I got more energy, but also he really helped me with my 
very severe menstrual cramps. My period got much more 
comfortable, lighter and such. It is much, much easier now. 
Even though I came in for a specific thing [lack of motiva-
tion] his idea was that he wanted to treat me and not a symp-
tom.” 

 Although some participants agreed that the degree of 
symptom relief received from CAM therapies depends on the 
symptom being treated, almost all reported receiving some 
type of relief from the symptoms for which they visited a 
CAM practitioner. Some received temporary relief of their 
symptoms as a result of CAM use, which was sometimes 
referred to as “short-term relief.” One focus group member 
commented that “I keep going back because my back is al-
ways cranky I would say and the middle of my back hurts 
and my shoulders hurt. I can exist without it [craniosacral 
therapy] but I know that I can go and get relief.” Another 
explained that “every time he [chiropractor] does an adjust-
ment it gets the bones in my back in line. I don’t hurt until 
they go out of place again in two hours to two days. It seems 
like now, almost three years later, that it [relief] is getting a 
little longer and for that I am grateful.” A few indicated that 
CAM helped to avert surgery, and some attributed their ex-
pedited recovery to CAM use. As one participant described, 
“I did have a herniated disc in my lower back and the Alex-
ander technique [practitioner] taught me how to move, how 
to stand and so forth so I wouldn’t reinjure myself continu-
ously as it healed.”  

 When asked about whether any of their conditions had 
been resolved by CAM use, most agreed that a physical 
health condition or problem was cured or resolved through 
CAM treatment. Patients described the benefits that the re-
ceived from CAM in various ways: 

 I had acid reflux and I was on medication for ten years 
for that and through this diet program I was on we figured 
out what was going on and I haven’t taken medication for 
that in over a year now. I haven’t had any episodes. When I 
see her it is for different things she doesn’t treat me for that 
any more and I get lasting results [when I see her].  
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Table 4. Participants’ Comments on Type of Physical Problems and CAM Treatment Sought 

CAM Treatment Physical Problem Participant Comments 

Acupuncture Pain 
“[The acupuncturist helped me] to be able to walk from one place to another and not feel a constant pain. 

That is what it has helped me. I feel physically stronger and I can do more.” 

Acupuncture Migraine 
“I suffered from terrible migraines for a long time . . . but [I had] one treatment from my acupuncturist [and] 

I haven’t had a headache since then and that was over six months ago.” 

Acupuncture 
Fatigue and  

menstrual pain 

“I started seeing him [acupuncturist] and I got more energy, but also he really helped me with my very severe 

menstrual cramps. My period got much more comfortable, lighter and such. It is much, much easier now. 

Even though I came in for a specific thing [lack of motivation] his idea was that he wanted to treat me and 

not a symptom.” 

Acupuncture Ganglion cyst 

“I had a ganglion cyst on my wrist and a big visible lump there and through acupuncture my body reab-

sorbed it and it has never returned and it took two months of office visits every other week to reduce it but 

once it was reduced it has never come back.”  

Acupuncture Tendonitis/pain 
“I had tendonitis in my knees years back. . . . I didn’t want to be in the circle of taking drugs. . . . I went to an 

acupuncturist and [after] two treatments and I never had that pain in my knees again.” 

Acupuncture 

Autoimmune  

system disorder; 

Reynaud’s disease 

“I, myself, am having trouble with an autoimmune system and that creates very dry eyes and dry mouth and 

everything is dry. Since I started acupuncture this has tremendously improved together with a prescription of 

eye drops. Also my Reynaud’s problems also associated with that have improved.” 

Acupuncture Pain 
“I also had hip replacement and I [had] three bone breaks and that is where acupuncture really comes in the 

way of helping to heal.” 

Acupuncture Sinus infection 

“[I had a] sinus problem for years especially in the winter with head that felt like three times as heavy. Even 

then I was trying Sudafed or nose sprays and maybe the heaviness symptom went away but never the mucus 

and fluid off. So I decided to go to an acupuncturist . . . she puts in some needles. Within 20 minutes on the 

table the mucus was gone.”  

Acupuncture 
Effects of a  

stroke 

“Then I had another stroke. My acupuncturist . . . he thought I needed a treatment every day. . . . For the first 

8 days I had a treatment every day. I was paralyzed 80% on that stroke. The only thing I have residually now 

is sometimes I limp a little bit if I am tired or sit too long. Basically everything else in terms of other functions 

is as good as it ever was. Acupuncture has done big things for me.” 

Acupuncture 

Parkinson’s  

disease; high  

blood pressure 

“[As] a last resort I went to an acupuncturist. The very second time she saw me she said have you ever been 

diagnosed with Parkinson’s and I said no. I had it confirmed at Duke that indeed I do have Parkinson’s and 

now I continue to see her [acupuncturist] weekly and I have gotten really better. I have gotten relief from 

stiffness, pain and rigidity. She also treats me for high blood pressure.” 

“Alexander  

Technique” 

Herniated disc;  

pain 

“I did have a herniated disc in my lower back and the Alexander Technique [practitioner] taught me how to 

move, how to stand and so forth so I wouldn’t reinjure myself continuously as it healed.” 

“Alexander  

Technique” 
Pain 

“Alexander Technique has that you take about 8 or 10 lessons and you learn different things that help relieve 

pain. The problem, for me, was that it really eases pain temporarily and then I have to go back and do some 

more of it.”  

“Alexander  

Technique” 
Sciatica 

“I went and did Alexander Technique and that is what made the difference. [It] has helped my numbness to 

eventually go away.”  

Chiropractic 

Musculoskeletal 

problems and  

back pain 

“[Every] time he [chiropractor] does an adjustment it gets the bones in my back in line. I don’t hurt until they 

go out of place again in two hours to two days. It seems like now, almost three years later, that it [relief] is 

getting a little longer and for that I am grateful.” 

Chiropractic Pain 

“[I] totaled my car and I suffered a broken rib and hurt back and sacral torsion. I could hardly move and the 

chiropractor using the thumper system was able, over a period of many weeks, to get me back to where I felt 

like I was in my own body again.” 

Chiropractic Muscle spasms “I have had severe muscle spasms and after [I saw] the chiropractor, within a few hours I was back to work.” 

Chiropractic 
Myofascial  

pain 

“I had chronic myofascial pain and I did chiropractic, physical therapy and massage therapy and all of this 

helped somewhat but not completely.” 

Chiropractic Pain “I have whiplash and I went to my chiropractor and it helped so much to relieve the pain.” 
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(Table 4) contd…. 

CAM Treatment Physical Problem Participant Comments 

Craniosacral therapy Pain 
“I keep going back because my back is always cranky I would say and the middle of my back hurts and my 

shoulders hurt. I can exist without it [craniosacral therapy] but I know that I can go and get relief.” 

Craniosacral therapy 

Headache and other 

pain related symp-

toms 

“I went to see this craniosacral practitioner because I had headaches, my back and shoulders hurt and I had 

a really tight and painful stomach. . . . [The] treatment [provided] an immediate relief but [it was] also like a 

compounded thing. Right after each treatment I feel, and still feel, totally amazing.” 

Craniosacral therapy Spinal stenosis 

“Though the therapy hasn’t and it won’t cure the spinal stenosis, it has helped. I, too, used to have a lot of 

pain but now it [is painful] only when I think about it. The cranio therapy is helping and it has just made me 

calmer.” 

Massage therapy Pain 
“I started with a massage therapist and he started doing energy work which cured the pain from my torn 

muscles.” 

Massage therapy and 

yoga 

Back and shoulder 

pain 

“I used the massage therapy and yoga . . . I had back pain in my upper shoulder. So for that I have a friend of 

mine who is a massage therapist . . . I started going to her because she said that she could help me. She also 

suggested going to yoga and stuff and it helped the pain go away.” 

Multiple therapies not 

specified 
Acid reflux 

“I had acid reflux and I was on medication for ten years for that and through this diet program I was on we 

figured out what was going on and I haven’t taken medication for that in over a year now. I haven’t had any 

episodes. When I see her it is for different things she doesn’t treat me for that anymore and I get lasting re-

sults [when I see her].” 

Reiki 
Cancer and effects 

of chemotherapy 

“[I tried] a number of things like Reiki which I have no idea how it works . . . it put me in a frame of mind so I 

could heal. It was definitely a part of my healing process but it didn’t cure the cancer.” 

Tai Chi and yoga Arthritis pain 

“I have both arthritis and an inflammatory illness . . . it affects your shoulders and your hips. My range of 

motion was almost nothing. I couldn’t comb my hair and could barely stand up. I started doing my Tai Chi 

and yoga . . . I realized that when I did do it, then [the pain] felt better for a few hours after.”  

Tai Chi and yoga Knee pain 

“I had unbelievable pain in my knee and then as I began to come to my own senses I did go to my doctor who 

sent me to a rheumatologist and I and still take Naprosyn for this pain. But I turned also to massage and that 

did help and in the fall I began taking Tai Chi and I last year added Polarity yoga.” 

Self care: homeo-

pathic remedy 
Vertigo 

“Another one was vertigo…one morning I woke up with it and I called this doctor. . . . He [my husband] got 

three little medicines [from the doctor] with directions take them every 15 minutes or so. Within four hours I 

was on my feet and it was over.”  

Self care: homeo-

pathic remedy and 

Ton Ren 

Dental pain 

“I had tooth troubles this past year, before I could get to see my dentist I was in quite a bit of pain. So instead 

of getting a prescription for a pain killer I used homeopath Miasm which I was able to look up because of my 

own system. Then when the Miasm stopped working I switched to Ton Ren . . . and I was able to knock out the 

pain for about probably four hours.” 

 

 I suffered from terrible migraines for a long time . . . but 
[I had] one treatment from my acupuncturist [and] I haven’t 
had a headache since then and that was over six months ago. 

 I went to see this craniosacral practitioner because I had 
headaches, my back and shoulders hurt and I had a really 
tight and painful stomach. . . . the treatment [provided] an 
immediate relief but [it was] also like a compounded thing. 
Right after each treatment I feel, and still feel, totally amaz-
ing. 

 Interestingly, across all the groups, participants felt that 
even when they were not totally cured by their CAM ther-
apy, the out-of-pocket costs were worthwhile. As one par-
ticipant put it, 

 I know alternative therapies can be expensive but you get 
healed or learn how to deal with whatever it is on your own 
and you are not continually saying I need a new prescrip-
tion. Even if you need to be reevaluated it is not something 

that is going to cost you [a lot], even if you have to pay for 
the visit to your naturopath or your massage therapist, they 
give you the tools to heal yourself. 

Psychological and Emotional Health  

 While most of the group discussions focused on physical 
health benefits, many participants also shared how CAM 
therapies positively affected their psychological and emo-
tional well-being. Several participants noted that they were 
dealing with issues of depression, stress, anxiety, or other 
emotional problems. As with the physical health problems, 
participants reported seeing a range of CAM providers to 
help them cope with these conditions or from whom they 
received psychological benefits as a result of the CAM ther-
apy, regardless of the presenting problem. 

 These benefits included a decrease in symptoms of de-
pression, anxiety, and stress. Almost all participants reported 
that CAM treatments had a positive effect on their emotional 



Perceived Benefits of CAM The Open Complementary Medicine Journal, 2009, Volume 1    41 

well-being. They also reported being generally able to func-
tion more effectively as a result of CAM use. One participant 
explained that “when I have seen my acupuncturist I feel 
stronger and more alert. I feel like I have less stress and I 
am a much more calm, centered person and I think that is 
one of the reasons I don’t get sick.” Another perceived that 
CAM treatment had caused an overall improvement in well-
being: “I think this [CAM therapy] has helped me hugely 
decrease stress and generally feel better.” The general sen-
timent of the participants is summarized in the words of one 
of the group member, who stated that “I find I feel a combi-
nation of energy and I am much less anxious [as a result of 
the CAM therapy]. I worry much less the rest of the day and 
my mood is much better. I feel happier and more willing to 
do things.” Participants also discussed the connection be-
tween how they felt psychologically and their ability to im-
prove physically. As one said, “I don’t think we can stress 
enough how the CAM doctor and all the practitioners realize 
that your mental state is what allows the body to heal.” 

 Many group members also spoke about receiving positive 
psychological benefits such as increased resilience, happi-
ness, and hopefulness. One participant commented that “I 
feel more resilient over my outlook overall. I feel like I am 
much better able to deal with whatever arises for me and just 
really feel like a more balanced, sane person.” Another 
averred that “it [CAM therapy] has changed my person 
110%. Before I was in it I was an angry northerner and 
close minded and hating life. I found alternative therapies 
and I am balanced, centered and happy.” Moreover, a few 
participants commented that the CAM therapy provided a 
way to regain a sense of control over their lives, with one 
expressing that “I was looking for support during chemo and 
it really helped me a lot then in that I can definitely say it 
helped my whole sense of well being and [helped me] gain a 
sense of taking control especially during that watch and wait 
time.” 

 For some, these psychological benefits resulted from the 
resolution of long-standing physical problems and had an 
impact on their families as well as themselves:  

 It has affected the household as well. I am not as nega-
tive and my daughter said “Mom all you talked about was 
the pain and the worry and whatever went along with it.” 
She said I don’t talk about it anymore and my husband said 
he knew I was getting well when he started getting into trou-
ble. I am not concentrating on my health problem and I am 
able to garden and babysit the neighbor kids and do lots of 
things that I had no energy or interest in two years ago. 

 Only a few people spoke about the degree of symptom 
relief relative to the psychological benefits of CAM use. 
Those who did agreed that the CAM practitioner either 
helped them to recognize a stressor or gave them tools and 
techniques, such as deep breathing and yoga, to deal with 
stress or to maintain a positive mental state.  

Social Health  

 Social health is another outcome domain that participants 
spoke about in some detail. Many talked about how the 
CAM practitioner becomes a caring member of their social 
network, one who “knows about your family, asks about 
your kids” and “sends personal greetings on holidays.” The 

two components of social health that participants spoke most 
about were beneficial relationships with practitioners and 
increased access to other resources—in other words, a thera-
peutic relationship and care coordination.  

 Therapeutic Relationship. Despite the fact that most par-
ticipants stressed that they believed the positive results they 
had experienced from CAM therapies are a function of the 
specific techniques used, they also spoke about the relation-
ship they have with the practitioners as a benefit of CAM 
use. Their comments indicate that participants believe these 
relationships enhance their physical and psychological health 
outcomes. Almost all participants who talked about this rela-
tionship agreed that their CAM provider spends time listen-
ing to them and talking to them to get to know them as peo-
ple. As one participant articulated, “I certainly look forward 
to my visits to her so we can talk because I am not currently 
in talk therapy but talking with her satisfies that need. She 
knows me and I am free to express my feelings around her.” 
That same sentiment is conveyed by another participant: 
“[My therapist] said we will talk about it [my symptoms] 
again next week and every week she starts out by finding out 
how my week went, how I felt from the treatment I had gotten 
the week before and just my general well being.” While sev-
eral participants were quick to point out that doctors provide 
this same approach if they have time or that not all CAM 
practitioners relate to their clients in this way, many valued 
the personal interest and caring shown by CAM practitio-
ners.  

 Whereas a few participants conveyed that they were 
partners in their care with their doctors, some participants 
expressed that their relationship with their CAM practitio-
ners was a partnership that offered a form of support not 
typically found with conventional medical providers. As one 
participant put it,  

 For the most part the alternative therapists gives [sic] 
you more time, gives you love, gives you validation, and I 
think it is an exchange of energy and [in] a whole different 
way we are in sort of a partnership with the therapist as op-
posed as to the “I am the doctor” and I am in charge and 
you do what I say to do. 

 Participants in one of the groups talked more specifically 
about what CAM practitioners do that helps to improve their 
mental state. They felt that their practitioners built trust, took 
time to hear what they were saying about their symptoms, 
created an atmosphere in which participants did not feel 
alone, and provided validation that the problem or condition 
was real. In the words of one participant, “Because some-
body [the practitioner] was there with me touching me, be-
ing reassuring my anxiety level from like a 10 went to down 
to like a 2 and I would definitely attribute that to two things 
the Reiki itself which is relaxing but also to her caring pres-
ence.”  

 Care Coordination. Participants valued care coordination 
that was provided by their CAM practitioners. A few spoke 
about having a provider who served as a resource in select-
ing conventional medical providers as well as other CAM 
providers. Some of these participants were patients of inte-
grative medical practices (i.e., practices that use both pri-
mary care doctors and CAM providers); others were patients 
of doctors who had also been trained in specific CAM thera-
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pies such as homeopathy. Some had switched to primary 
care doctors who were CAM practitioners or worked col-
laboratively with CAM practitioners to have the best of both 
worlds with regards to health care. One of these participants 
explained that “My family practitioner is an MD and holistic 
doctor and he has a whole list of people like acupunctur-
ist[s] and chiropractors and he recommends midwives when 
you are in his care.” Another described their CAM practitio-
ner as a care coordinator: “My practitioner is a wonderful 
resource for other things like if you need a good orthopedist 
or good dentist or she recommended an acupuncturist.” 

 In other cases, participants reported that their CAM pro-
viders recognize when clients need to see a medical provider 
and direct them to seek further conventional medical care or 
second opinions. One person spoke specifically about how 
an acupuncturist recommended that it might be best to see a 
neurologist; the neurologist diagnosed the problem as Park-
inson’s disease. The words of another person convey how 
some participants experienced at least some degree of care 
coordination by CAM practitioner:  

 I had an ankle that would flare up and swell and it got 
increasingly worse and more frequent and they [the doctor] 
thought I had gout and [the acupuncturist] said “you go to 
that rheumatologist and find out and let me know. I don’t 
think it is gout.” It was not gout but it was a compensation 
for the way I walk because of the condition that I have. Or-
thotics and acupuncture have helped. 

 A few described that sometimes there is communication 
but not coordination between their conventional medical 
providers and CAM practitioners. In one instance, a partici-
pant discussed how her CAM therapies appeared to be re-
ducing her dependence on oral diabetes medications. Her 
medical provider and CAM therapists agreed to discuss her 
case. In this case, the focus group participant indicated that 
the medications were less expensive than the CAM therapy, 
so the CAM therapy was discontinued.  

 Although many had the opinion that their CAM providers 
did not coordinate their care with conventional medical pro-
viders, a few indicated that they wished there was more of 
that type of coordination, and a small number discussed how 
their medical providers supported and encouraged their use 
of CAM, even though they did not coordinate with the CAM 
therapists. One participant illustrated this by describing how 
“he [the rheumatologist] said I should continue it [CAM 
use] until such time that it is not benefiting me any more and 
then come back to him. He said the only thing he could do 
was prescribe the medication.” 

Spiritual Health 

 Participants also spoke about changes in their philosophy 
of healing and spiritual health as additional benefits of CAM 
use. For many of them, spirituality appeared to be related to 
a sense of hope, trust, or a connection to a higher power that 
might hasten healing processes. Several also expressed that 
they gained a sense of empowerment and a feeling of being 
in control as another benefit. Many talked about this sense of 
empowerment in terms of being able to overcome feelings of 
helplessness to take charge and do something to help im-
prove their conditions.  

 Even though they expressed a belief that personal deter-
mination is important in the healing process, many also ex-
pressed that CAM practitioners often provided a needed 
sense of hope that their conditions or situations would im-
prove and that the CAM providers had caring attitudes to-
ward their clients’ overall care. The sentiments of these par-
ticipants were conveyed by one who said that “hope is one of 
the biggest things that they encourage in you and gives you a 
sense of hope no matter what the outcome is in terms of 
physical terms. Maybe they give you the hope to be healed or 
maybe it is not going to happen but then there is the hope of 
[a] less painful or less traumatic time.” Another expressed 
that  

 The treater [CAM practitioner] gives you some hope and 
you find that sometimes there is an immediate response and 
it doesn’t last very long but at least it is out there and there 
is a possibility [of improvement]. I think there is a mystery 
there. In some way [it’s] spiritual and you use the word mind 
and body here. I think we have a lot of that in the whole 
[CAM] business. 

 A few participants spoke about how their CAM practitio-
ners believed in the power of the universe and the power of 
nature and the effect that that belief had on the way they 
viewed their own health conditions or problems. The under-
lying theme of this type of power can be summarized by a 
participant for whom 

 It [CAM] slowed me down long enough to think about it 
and it made me realize, I must be here in this exact situation 
for some reason. I may never get the answer to why I have 
diabetes when I have none of the risk factors but I am here. I 
am treating it and there are options for me and, for me, it 
has really been important I have learned to accept that I am 
here where I am at this point because of some kind of plan. 

 Throughout all of the discussions, participants conveyed 
that they felt a sense of empowerment as a result of CAM 
therapy. Several individuals talked about recognizing their 
own inner strength, feeling they have some amount of con-
trol over their health outcomes, being empowered to take 
charge of their conditions, and believing in their own abili-
ties to cope with their conditions as a result of their relation-
ships with and the encouragement they received from their 
CAM providers:  

 They give resources and they plan with you and they 
make you feel like you are not just being told to take this pill 
three times a day and call me in a week if you are not feeling 
better or if you try this and you can’t do it and you are not 
willing to do it then you are never going to get better.  

 So it was definitely like the empowerment factor that like 
there was homework to do in between sessions that you 
could do to help yourself. That is part of what I like about 
complementary approaches too, a lot of them, not all of 
them, you’re in charge and taking care of yourself. 

 There is a whole system of balancing and this has given 
me a sense of empowerment. It has alleviated a lot of fears 
for the future because of being crippled or being in a wheel-
chair or worse. 

 For some, CAM use brought about more than the specific 
effects of treatment and served to catalyze changes in their 
philosophy of healing: 
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 It isn’t so much for me a symptom and treatment as much 
as it has been a very different way of life and looking at my 
body and my health and having alternative methods to sup-
port that. To think not about so much the cause and affect 
[sic] symptoms but to think more about my overall wellness. 
It is more about bringing the whole system into balance and 
that is a real…not so much cause/effect these symptoms. 
Anyway this idea of coming back into balance and shifting 
my thinking about my body and what wellness is and what 
balance is. That, in itself I think, is very healing. 

Impact on Health-related Behaviors  

 In each group, people also talked about a benefit of CAM 
not specifically mentioned in the four outcome domains of 
the Verhoef [4] model; they discussed the positive effects 
that using CAM therapies had on their health-related behav-
iors. Participants spoke about focusing on their overall health 
more closely and being motivated to take better care of 
themselves as a result of their CAM use. Several individuals 
also discussed the lifestyle changes they had made to help 
prevent more serious illnesses; these changes included stop-
ping smoking, decreasing alcohol consumption, increasing 
exercise, and changing their diets.  

 Many said they improved their poor eating habits be-
cause CAM use helped them to make better food choices or 
to pay closer attention to their diet. This theme is illustrated 
in the following comment by a group member: “I don’t know 
if this directly came from the yoga people or Tai Chi but the 
more I do it the more I feel better about myself and the more 
I choose to eat a better diet and stay away from the sugar 
and the meats and fats.” Several participants also stated that 
they had begun exercising more as a result of their CAM 
experience. For example, one participant commented that, as 
a result of her yoga and Tai Chi classes, “I am now taking 
the classes at home and doing aerobic exercise which I 
didn’t do for health before.” A few individuals said that they 
had stopped smoking and had reduced their alcohol intake as 
a result of receiving complementary and alternative therapy.  

 Most of those who experienced health-related benefits 
felt that they were supported in these lifestyle changes by 
their CAM providers through receiving CAM treatments, 
learning self-help techniques from the therapist, or being 
monitored and encouraged by their CAM practitioners. One 
participant claimed that “because of the [CAM] therapy I 
have been able to get into healthy habits . . . I had gained a 
lot of weight after taking some antidepressant medications 
and I have been able to get my weight back [down by] about 
15 pounds and it is not directly related but I think it is the 
self confidence to do better and take more control of my 
diet.” Another commented that acupuncture treatments 
“helped to reduce sugar cravings.” A few also viewed their 
CAM providers as role models whose healthy behaviors they 
wanted to emulate: “In yoga class when I can only get my 
hand on my knee and they have theirs on the floor I look at 
them as a role model and say wow look at the level of flexi-
bility or control they have. It is kind of nice to have them 
leading the class and being proficient at it and you can say I 
can do that and achieve that.” Another said, “Yeah both the 
Tai Chi teachers are vegetarians and they are long and lean. 
You respect that and that is a role model.” Others stated that 
their CAM practitioners used techniques to eliminate crav-

ings or provided other support: “The allopathic physician 
says quit smoking or drink less, lose weight . . . but my acu-
puncturist or my massage therapist will support me through 
it.” Another example is found in this comment: “I quit smok-
ing cigarettes and I attribute that to my massage therapist 
and he is the one who does Reiki.”  

 The general theme expressed by those who felt that CAM 
therapy impacted their health was reflected by the comment 
that “it seems that when you feel good you want to do things 
that feel good. I think you are [also] more aware of things 
that don’t feel good [as a result of CAM use].” This state-
ment suggests that CAM users experience increased body 
awareness as well as heightened motivation for health behav-
ior change. A more in-depth analysis of the role of CAM 
providers in health behavior change is explored in a separate 
study.1 

DISCUSSION 

 This study provides insight into the experience of satis-
fied CAM users who derive a range of benefits from CAM 
therapies. Consistent with the preliminary model of outcome 
domains suggested by Verhoef and colleagues [4], we found 
that most benefits described by the focus group participants 
were captured by the physical, psychological, social health, 
and spiritual outcomes included within this whole systems 
framework. The physical benefits include resolution or im-
provement in presenting problems and nonspecific benefits 
such as improved sleep, energy, mood, and concentration or 
focus. The reported psychological benefits include both re-
lief from mental health problems, such as depression and 
anxiety, and positive psychological benefits, such as resil-
ience, hope, and empowerment. Participants also reported 
social health benefits (i.e., increased social networks and 
social capital as CAM providers become a source of support 
and caring), and providers connected CAM users to a range 
of resources. Many of these CAM users felt enriched by their 
exposure to a different view of health and well-being and, in 
some cases, a sense of spirituality. 

 An additional outcome domain that emerged from the 
responses was the impact of CAM on health behaviors. Sev-
eral focus group participants mentioned how they had made 
lifestyle changes as a result of their experience with CAM, 
noting that such changes may have resulted from feeling 
better because of the treatments themselves and/or because 
of the encouragement and support they received from the 
CAM practitioners. Embedded within these accounts of im-
proved diets and physical activity levels is the notion that 
such changes were concomitant with psychological changes 
in control perceptions, self esteem, and confidence. From a 
whole systems perspective, the intertwining of these differ-
ent benefit domains is expected because the outcome do-
mains are viewed as being synergistically linked to each 
other. Our analysis of the possible outcome domains of 
CAM use underscores this synergy because many of the rep-
resentative quotations for one domain encompass elements 
that can be classified within other domains. Given this inter-

                                                
1 In a separate study we examined the possible mechanisms involved in the health 

behaviour change facilitated by CAM treatment. The paper reporting these findings is 
currently under review. 

Williams-Piehota P, Sirois FM, Bann C, Isenberg K, Walsh EG. Agents of change: 

What role do CAM providers play in health behavior change? Soc Sci Med (submitted). 
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connectedness, our findings highlight the importance of in-
cluding a behavioral domain as one of the key areas of im-
provement that may result from CAM treatment. 

 The model of CAM outcomes proposed by Verhoef and 
colleagues [4] also considers the role of contextual factors 
such as the importance of the patient-practitioner relation-
ship in CAM treatment. According to Long [2], the CAM 
practitioner is a potential source of influence that can have a 
direct effect on treatment outcomes through the quality of 
the relationship with the patient. Although we did not spe-
cifically analyze the focus group responses for the role of 
patient-practitioner factors, their presence is clearly reflected 
in the CAM users’ narratives. In addition to receiving social 
health benefits, such as social support and advocacy, CAM 
users reported experiencing other benefits that arose from the 
therapeutic relationship with their practitioners. These in-
cluded patient-centered care, emotional support and encour-
agement, care coordination or referrals to other useful re-
sources.  

 In addition to the patient-practitioner relationship, there 
was some evidence for the other sources of CAM outcomes 
suggested by Long [2]. Several participants mention how 
specific CAM techniques facilitated their healing processes 
and led to both improvements in their symptoms and their 
knowledge of how to continue to care for themselves. Simi-
larly, some participants specifically made reference to the 
different perspective on health and healing that evolved 
through their experiences with CAM, and how this holistic 
philosophy changed how they viewed themselves and their 
lifestyle. The findings of this qualitative analysis should be 
considered within the context of several limitations. Despite 
our efforts to recruit a diverse group of CAM users, the 
groups were primarily white, female, and well educated. 
While we reached out to a broad array of CAM providers to 
assist in recruiting subjects and did succeed in recruiting 
individuals who had experience with a wide range of CAM 
therapies, the sample of CAM users recruited was far from 
being all inclusive. In particular, we are missing traditional 
therapies used by ethnically diverse populations. Finally, we 
purposely recruited individuals who felt that they had bene-
fited from CAM to keep with our objective of identifying 
domains of benefit derived from CAM use. We might have 
obtained different responses and insights had we simply re-
cruited individuals who use or had used CAM therapies and 
heard about all aspects of their experiences. 

 Despite these limitations, it has been suggested that 
qualitative analysis is appropriate for extending rather than 
testing theories [20]. Accordingly, the proposed extension of 
the outcome domains to include behavioral outcomes that is 
suggested by our findings is more important than the gener-
alizability of our findings, which remain to be verified.  

CONCLUSIONS 

 These findings provide insight and direction for CAM 
outcomes measure development and for identifying existing 
scales appropriate for use in CAM outcomes research. Based 
on these findings, we developed and piloted measures for 
some of these domains, reported elsewhere [21]. These in-
clude measures of the patient-provider relationship, which 

may be used as quality measures or as predictors of healing.2 
In addition, several concepts emerged in the focus groups 
that may warrant further investigation. These included in-
creasing body awareness (i.e., the ability to notice and mod-
ify one’s physical and behavioral response to stress). Further, 
participants described experiencing relaxation as a result of 
CAM therapy and, in some cases, learning to become more 
relaxed on their own. Some participants reported an expan-
sion in their social network that went beyond their relation-
ships with the CAM practitioners or receipt of care coordina-
tion. These CAM clients appeared to have a sense of group 
membership or a new identity associated with their CAM 
use. How this occurs and what role it plays in the lives of 
CAM users or in outcomes of treatments are other possible 
areas of investigation. 
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