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This paper draws on Self-Directed Learning (SDL) theory (Knowles, 1975) to conceptualize learning for value co-creation as a

consumer-centric process. It presents a two-stage empirical investigation of consumer learning that distinguishes consumers in terms

of their learning orientation and characterizes their learning strategies.
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EXTENDED ABSTRACT
It is widely acknowledged in contemporary marketing litera-

ture that consumers play an active role in the creation of their own 
value (Vargo and Lusch, 2008; Grönroos, 2011) and often need to 
acquire new knowledge and skills to develop capabilities and re-
sources to draw upon during value-creating activities (Payne et al., 
2008). Prior research has evaluated the effectiveness of firms’ ef-
forts to educate customers (Dellande et al. 2004; Zhao et al. 2008), 
but there is little research that adopts a consumer-centric perspective 
and recognizes them to be in control of their own learning. Theories 
of Self-Directed Learning (SDL) (Knowles, 1975) are suggested to 
offer useful frameworks for conceptualizing consumer learning for 
value creation and, indeed, for understanding learning as a resource 
integration activity in its own right (Hibbert et al., 2012). SDL as-
sumes that individuals identify their own learning needs, formulate 
goals, obtain resources, implement and regulate learning strategies 
and evaluate outcomes, although it acknowledges that other parties 
may support learning in various ways (Knowles, 1975; Merriam et 
al., 2007; Garrison, 1997). It also emphasizes the context-specific 
nature of learning (Tough, 1971). SDL has been applied in an array 
of contexts (e.g., distance learning, healthcare) but there is, as yet, 
no empirical research that examines consumers’ learning for value 
creation as a SDL process. The purpose of this research is to explore 
consumer learning processes in a context of consumer value creation, 
examining the learning motives and strategies that characterize indi-
viduals’ efforts to acquire new knowledge and skills. The findings 
will offer insights to firms and other parties that seek to support con-
sumer learning. Below we outline a two-stage empirical study that 
sought to distinguish consumers in terms of their learning orientation 
and to characterize their learning strategies, present the findings and 
briefly set out the conclusions of this exploratory study. 

METHOD
A mixed method study was conducted with members of an on-

line Do-It-Yourself (DIY) community. In the first stage of the re-
search 248 participants completed an online survey measuring mo-
tivational aspects of goals (performance and learning), self-efficacy 
(confidence in their learning) and their emotional reaction (positive 
and negative) towards learning DIY knowledge and skills. Scales 
were adapted from existing measures used in the SDL literature 
(e.g. Dweck, 1986; Valle et al., 2003; Bandura, 1997) and responses 
measured on a 7-point Likert scale. The second stage involved 26 
in-depth interviews with a purposive sample of survey respondents. 

RESULTS: STAGE 1
Exploratory Factor Analysis grouped the items into the ex-

pected constructs. All multi-item scales demonstrated reliability with 
Cronbach Alpha values ranging from .748 to .961. A non-hierarchi-
cal k-means cluster analysis using the mean values for each construct 
as seed points was conducted to examine whether there were distinct 
groups of consumers in terms of their DIY learning orientations. A 
three cluster solution best grouped the data differentiating between 
surface learners (SL), emotional learners (EL) and assertive learn-
ers (AL) (Table 1). 

ANOVA combined with Scheffe post-hoc tests revealed sig-
nificant differences between these groups. Assertive Learners (AL) 

scored the highest in terms of being motivated by learning and per-
formance goals, and their positive emotional response to learning, 
followed by Emotional Learners (EL), with Surface Learners (SL) 
scoring the lowest across these constructs.  EL experience more frus-
tration and a stronger negative emotional response to learning than 
the other two groups, while AL have more confidence in their learn-
ing of DIY skills than EL and SL. 

RESULTS: STAGE 2
Thematic analysis of in-depth telephone interviews drawn from 

survey respondents of each group revealed that learning in a DIY 
context follows a dynamic process and that there was considerable 
interaction between elements of the learning process. Unlike other 
SDL contexts (e.g. distance learning) in which individuals often 
learn for the gratification of developing their knowledge, consumers 
in the three groups who engage in DIY are motivated predominantly 
by performance goals. Learning goals are developed in response to 
performance goals as consumers assess their own abilities and rec-
ognize deficiencies in their own resources that impact on their ability 
to undertake tasks inherent to their project. 

The domain specific knowledge and the acquisition and use 
of available learning resources (e.g. advice from service providers, 
social networks, technology) contribute to achieving learning goals 
and shape and support the learning process. Consumer value is re-
alized through the acquisition of resources that help the customer 
to participate in learning environments to achieve their performance 
goals. Consumers use these resources to develop learning strategies 
and to set learning goals before embarking on the project. This is 
aided before participation by assessing the skills required to com-
plete the task, or during participation in response to a (un)foreseen 
learning requirement. AL show an intrinsic interest in learning DIY, 
using their confidence and overall experience of the DIY environ-
ment to set, monitor, adapt and evaluate challenging performance 
and importantly to them, learning goals. In doing so they draw on 
relevant and available resources to supplement their own knowledge, 
skills and experience. Similarly EL participate not only for perfor-
mance reasons, but also to learn new skills. They too set, monitor, 
adapt and evaluate their learning, importantly using resources to help 
support their high emotional (positive and negative) involvement in 
the learning process. SL on the other hand prefer to plan and utilize 
resources to help with their learning goals by reproducing, rehearsing 
and memorizing learning content made available to them (see also 
Bandura, 1977). For SL performance goals (e.g. financial) are the 
key motivation for participation.

CONCLUSION
This research complements the body of literature that has exam-

ined firms’ efforts to educate consumers (Dellande et al., 2004; Zhao 
et al., 2008) by adopting a consumer-centric perspective on learn-
ing for co-creation. The findings reveal key differences in groups of 
learners both in their motivations for participation and in their acqui-
sition of resources to support their learning process. Further work is 
required that examines the additional learning processes of consum-
ers as they seek to develop their resources in learning environments 
to create value. This can aid service providers in developing sup-
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port and environments that can help facilitate this learning process 
through value co-creation activities.
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