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Introduction 
The Master Grazer Educational Program is the result of 
funding provided by the Kentucky Agricultural Develop-
ment Board to educate producers on better utilization of 
grazing lands to improve livestock production and the prof-
itability of the State. County agriculture and natural 
resource agents, extension specialists, industry contacts and 
producers work together to make this program a success. 
The Master Grazer Educational Program began in 2006 as 
evening lecture sessions taking place in local extension 
offices. In 2008, the program grew with the addition of a 
field session that showcased a farm with successful grazing 
practices, a farm with underdeveloped grazing practices, 
and a final session for participants to develop their own 
grazing system. In 2010, the program was modified into the 
Applied Master Grazer Program. This program placed more 
emphasis on the importance of the county agriculture. The 
agents decided which topics would be covered and admin-
istered many areas of the program. The program now 
consists of a minimum of two evening field sessions in 
which a farm is showcased for a particular topic, as well as 
one impact session in which participants can interact and 
contribute to a producer forum. For the purpose of this arti-
cle, reporting will be focused on the last two years of the 
Master Grazer Program. The past few years, events such as 
Grazing Schools, the Advanced Grazing Schools, and Pas-
ture Walks have been held to discuss timely topics of 
forage and livestock management. Also, the Master Grazer 
Program has a newsletter, website, and DVD series. 

Grazing Schools 
The Kentucky Grazing School is a two day event that in-
cludes lecture series, demonstrations and hands-on 
exercises to better pasture and livestock management. The 
purpose of this program is to couple forage management 
with animal production to help producers increase the effi-
ciency and profitability of farms. Topics such as forage 
management, variety selection, establishment, livestock 
nutrition, weed control, fertilization, watering systems, ro-
tational grazing, and fencing are discussed. Grazing 
Schools are held in the spring and the fall, and attract pro-
ducers, industry professionals, and public service profess-
ionals from county and government agencies from many 
different counties and even other states. When surveyed, all 
participants indicated that they planned to make changes to 
their farms or  to promote  new practices to  improve their  

 
grazing systems and increase production and profitability 
as a result of attending the program. After attending the 
Grazing School, many producers expressed an interest in 
attending the Advanced Grazing School as well.  

The Advanced Kentucky Grazing School is a one-day 
course meant for those who have participated in a previous 
grazing program, and is used as a refresher course to go 
more in depth on important forage and animal topics. The 
first Advanced Grazing School was first held on July 10, 
2012. Participants representing 4 states and over 30 Ken-
tucky counties attended this event. Many surveyed 
participants indicated their intentions to make changes to 
their current forage and livestock operation as a result of 
the program. Common changes include improvements to 
water systems, use of summer annuals, stockpiling forages 
for winter feed, seeding novel endophyte infected tall fes-
cue varieties, and improved techniques for weed control. 
Gathering at events such as the Advanced Grazing Schools 
have helped the development of networks of producers, 
industry professionals and the public sector to share knowl-
edge of improved farm management through efficient 
grazing techniques. 

Grazing Networks 
Grazing Networks consist of producers who focus on feed-
ing their livestock mainly through grazing. Through Pasture 
Walks, the Grazing Network provides a way for these pro-
ducers to get together and discuss timely management 
practices to better utilize pastures for animal production. 
Pasture Walks take place at a host farm, where the farmer 
highlights timely forage and livestock management issues 
and an extension specialist provides a basic lecture and fa-
cilitates discussion. Active Grazing Networks include the 
Eden Shale Grazing Network, Northern Kentucky Grazing 
Network, Western Kentucky Grazing Network, and the 
Kentucky River Grazing Network. These networks can gain 
access to other resources and research articles through the 
Grazing News newsletter and the Master Grazer website. 

Resources 
Grazing News is issued monthly during the grazing season 
(February to November) and is distributed either electroni-
cally or physically by mail to all Kentucky county 
agriculture extension agents, producers, and others who 
have requested the newsletter. Contents include articles on  
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Figure 1. Kentucky counties impacted by the Master Grazer Educational Program, 2010-2012. 

timely forage and livestock management topics. This can 
include articles on fertility, seeding, renovation, establish-
ment, extending the grazing season, forage species and 
varieties, forage related disorders, weed control and grazing 
systems. 

The Master Grazer website was designed and created in 
2012.  This site contains archives of all newsletter articles, 
the PDF form of the current newsletter, a sign-up to receive 
the newsletter electronically, informational video clips, 
upcoming events and programs, reports and accomplish-
ments, links to other useful websites, and important 
contacts. The Master Grazer website can be found at 
www2.ca.uky.edu/grazer

In addition to the newsletter and website, the Master 
Grazer Program has recently completed a DVD series to 
provide another source of outreach. The Master Grazer 
DVD series was completed in 2012 and distributed to all 
county agriculture and natural resource extension agents. 
The DVD series included topics that were covered in Graz-
ing Schools and provides a way for extension agents to 
have recorded versions of the Grazing Schools. 

.  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Overall impacts 

Through multiple events and resources of outreach, the 
Master Grazer Educational Program has impacted many 
producers, industry professionals, and many acres of forage 
and livestock. In 2010 alone, 77 Kentucky counties and 6 
other states were impacted and increased production and 
profitability. The main impacts of grazing practices through 
the Kentucky Grazing Schools and the Applied Master 
Grazer Program include: extending the grazing season and 
reducing stored feed needs, soil improvement and pasture 
renovation, increased forage utilization, increased pest 
management, and switching to rotational grazing from con-
tinuous grazing with permanent or temporary fencing. 
These changes, in 2010, estimated an economic impact of 
1.94 million dollars (US).  

The program continues to grow each year, reaching out 
to more and more counties within the state, as well as other 
surrounding states. The counties in Kentucky impacted by 
the Master Grazer Educational Program from 2010 to 2012 
are highlighted in Figure 1.  
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