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introduction of an additional
module, and therefore cover
in greater detail the
difference between these two
business processes.

A different benefit
regarding the process of
creating a rubric also needs
to be mentioned. As noted
above, the rubrics that were
created involved a team of
four instructors. Jointly,
through the creation of the
rubrics, the committee
determined what topics
should be addressed in a
particular course.
Consequently, the syllabus
for an ethics course was
restructured to include a
topic that was originally not
included. This resulted in a
course that more completely
achieved the goal of the
department. Also as noted
above, linkage of various
disciplines is strengthened
by a judicious use of
rubrics.

The creation of rubrics is
not a difficult process,
although it is somewhat
time consuming. A
particular challenge that
needs to be addressed is
regarding the time resource
required to use it within a
class. This issue needs to be
addressed through a
comprehension of the
underlying perspective that
drives the rubric process,
and the outcome(s) expected
of that process. Two
different principles may be
followed; 1) the rubric is
being used to assess the
progress towards meeting
the goals/mission of the
program, and therefore only
needs to be conducted on a
represented sample of the
student body (addressing
political as well as internal
needs), 2) the rubric is being
used as an adjunct to other

assessment instruments
within the class (in addition
to the assessing of non-
content knowledge of the
students), and therefore
every student should be
measured.

Obviously, the first
position is less time
intensive. Supporting the
findings of Gerretson and
Golson (Gerretson & Golson,
2004), an additional hour
each week for each class
that was utilizing the rubric
would be more than
satisfactory to accomplish
the task if the first position
is adopted by a particular
program or course, and it is
likely that in the most
“streamlined” of
implementation an
additional hour for the
entirety of the course may
be attainable. However, time
demands quickly escalate
when each student is being
assessed. For example,
when using the teamwork
rubric for a graduate class,
it took an additional eight
hours of work to assess a
class of thirty-seven
students for one
assignment. If each of the
rubrics were uniformly
applied to each student in
this graduate class, the time
demand would easily exceed
forty hours for additional
grading. 

The time demands for
the undergraduate class
were substantial. For each
student-submitted paper,
that student received at
least two, and frequently
three separate assessments.
Specifically, the primary
assessment focused on the
assigned paper – that is, did
the student address the
issues that were required by
the assignment. The second
assessment focused on the

writing rubric, while the
third assessment focused on
the analytical and decision
rubric. The technology
rubric assessed the entire
semester, and also
addressed the team
presentation (that is, the
use of the computer
projector or other
technology that might have
been used during the
presentation). The ethics
rubric focused on one
specific paper. The
teamwork rubric was used
once, and the oral
presentation rubric was
used twice during this
course, because there was
one small individual
presentation by each
student during the
semester, in addition to
substantial and joint
presentation scheduled for
this class.

In total, the writing
rubric was used eight times,
while the analytical and
decision rubric was used six
times (the writing rubric use
began in the third week of
the class, while the
analytical and decision
rubric began in the fifth
week of the class. The sums
of the strengths and
weaknesses of each student
were tallied and factored
into the final grade of the
individual students. In
addition, a summary report
of the entire class was
generated in order to
determine the cohort’s
strengths and areas for
improvement, and what
modifications to the class
structure and teaching
would be necessary to
improve performance of the
class. Fortunately, the class
was reasonably sized in
order to accomplish this
work.
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A New Generation of
Corporate Codes of Ethics

Michael K. Braswell, Charles M. Foster, and Stephen L. Poe

In the early part of this
decade, the business
community in the United
States was rocked by a
series of corporate scandals.
Companies such as Enron,
Phar-Mor, Cendant, Tyco,
Waste Management,
Adelphia, Sunbeam, and
Worldcom regularly made
headlines as a result of
accounting scams and other
financial misdeeds. This
wave of corporate impro-
priety triggered new calls for
reform, with many empha-
sizing the need to protect

investors through more
effective promotion and
regulation of business ethics
in the corporate
environment.

Congress was quick to
respond, and President G.
W. Bush soon signed the
Sarbanes-Oxley Act of 2002
(SOX), which set forth a
number of initiatives
designed to help stem the
tide of corporate fraud,
including the establishment
of standards for a corporate
code of ethics for senior
financial officers. Shortly
thereafter, the Securities
Exchange Commission
(SEC) issued final rules
implementing many of the
provisions of SOX, and
amplified the scope and
coverage of these standards
by extending the corporate
code to include the
company’s principal
executive officer. At about
the same time, in response
to the perceived need for
regulatory action, the major
stock exchanges also
proposed rules requiring
their members to adopt and
disclose corporate codes and
take other actions to deter
the occurrence of future
scandals.

A common factor in each
of these reform initiatives is
the emphasis on the use of
a code of ethics to
implement change in
America’s corporate culture.

The purpose of this article is
to briefly outline the
provisions of these
initiatives that pertain to
adoption of corporate codes
and the resulting
approaches many firms
have taken when drafting or
revising their codes in light
of these initiatives. It then
offers a commentary on the
positive and negative
consequences of these
approaches and discusses
additional steps that
companies might take when
drafting and implementing
corporate codes of ethics.

Development and Use
of Corporate Codes of
Ethics

Over the past two
decades, many public
companies have voluntarily
developed and implemented
codes of ethics that can be
defined as specialized codes
of behavior and standards
for professional conduct for
managers and employees.
Typically, these codes state
the companies’ core values
and provide guidelines for
such matters as employee
relations, relationships with
customers and suppliers,
conflicts of interest,
confidential information,
and other topics (Myers,
2003). Companies adopt
such codes for many
reasons, i.e., to encourage
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good behavior by employees,
to prevent behavior that
might lead to legal liability,
and to foster goodwill for the
company with clients,
investors, the business and
regulatory community, and
the public. Companies may
also adopt such codes as
part of their efforts to
establish a program to
detect and prevent
violations of law—such a
compliance program may
reduce the penalties that a
company would otherwise
face if found liable as a
result of its employees’
criminal actions (Rafalko,
1994).

For more than forty
years, corporate codes have
also found great favor with
legislators and regulators
seeking to promote ethical
standards within the
corporate culture. Adoption
of corporate codes have
been included as part of the
legislative solution in the
wake of a series of business
scandals occurring each
decade since the 1960’s
(Harvard Law Review,
2003).1 Also, as noted
above, Congress determined
in 1991 that corporate
codes would be an
important part of any
compliance program that
companies wished to adopt
to serve as a mitigating
factor under the Federal
Sentencing Guidelines for
Organizations.

Ultimately, however, as
demonstrated by the
corporate scandals of 2001
and 2002, the mere
adoption of a corporate code
of ethics has not usually
been enough by itself to
prevent corporate
malfeasance. Nevertheless,
it was in light of these
scandals that Congress

passed SOX and the SEC
and the national stock
exchanges adopted their
rules regarding the use and
disclosure of corporate
codes of ethics by public
companies.

Overview of
Regulatory Responses
Relating to Corporate
Codes

Despite their widespread
adoption and use by
business corporations prior
to the scandals of 2001 and
2002, corporate codes of
ethics apparently did little
to stop the outbreak of
improprieties that resulted
in these scandals. In an
attempt to make codes more
effective at regulating the
ethical conduct of public
companies, Congress
enacted Section 406 of SOX
(Newberg, 2005).2

In Section 406, Congress
instructed the SEC to enact
rules requiring public
companies to disclose
whether they have adopted
a code of ethics for senior
financial officers or, if they
have not adopted such a
code, to explain why not. In
addition, Congress directed
the SEC to require public
companies to immediately
disclose any changes in or
waivers to the code for
senior financial officers. Six
months later, the SEC
implemented Section 406 by
issuing a series of rules,
which expanded the
coverage of the Section 406
code requirements in two
ways. First, the SEC rules
directed that the company’s
code of ethics apply to the
company’s principal
executive officer, as well as
the senior financial officers
of the firm. Second, the

rules expanded the code of
ethics requirement to
include standards designed
to deter wrongdoing and to
promote (1) honest and
ethical conduct, including
the ethical handling of
actual or apparent conflicts
of interest; (2) full, fair,
accurate, timely, and
understandable disclosure
in reports and documents
that a company files with
the SEC and in other public
communications; (3)
compliance with applicable
governmental laws, rules
and regulations; and (4) the
prompt internal reporting to
appropriate personnel of
code violations, and (5)
accountability for adherence
to the code.3

In 2003, the year
following the enactment of
SOX, the New York Stock
Exchange (NYSE), the
American Stock Exchange
(AMEX), and the NASDAQ
Stock Market (NASDAQ) all
revised their respective
listing rules to require
public companies to adopt
and publicly disclose
corporate codes.4 Although
all three exchanges
broadened the scope of
corporate codes by requiring
that they apply to all
directors, officers, and
employees, the NYSE
standards went much
farther. For example, the
NYSE standards required
that any waivers of the code
for the benefit of senior
officers or directors be
granted only by the board of
directors or a board
committee with any such
waivers being promptly
disclosed to shareholders.
Also, these standards
imposed certain content
requirements: each
company’s code cover
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the course design to more
fully address this important
issue. Part of the need for
an adjustment in course
design was observed during
the team presentations,
however, part of the insight
for the need to adjust the
course occurred from an
analysis of the summary
report for the analytic and
decision rubric. The three
items noted on the analytic
and decision rubric
receiving the lowest
cumulative scores included
“student provides
contingency plans(s) as
appropriate,” “student
demonstrates knowledge of
a variety of implementation
tools/methodologies,” and
“student creates a
monitoring process for
implementation and post
implementation.”

Since a reason for using
the rubrics in these classes
is to help assess the broad
program goals, and to help
the individual students
improve their mastery of
necessary skills for
professional work, it is
interesting to gain a
perspective on how the
students assess the use of
rubrics. Following are some
comments from the
undergraduate students
regarding their perceptions
of the analytic and decision
rubric:

• Showed a different view

• Good models of effective
decision making

• Models provide
orientation in the future

• Pointed out areas of
your work to be
improved on

• I don’t think the scales
provided enough range
to accurately assess the
work

• Gave me ideas of what to
include in my paper and
what points to hit on
when writing it

• Didn’t understand it

• Indifferent

• It let me know where I
stand and what I needed
to do to change

• Didn’t effect my work

It is also interesting to note,
that the undergraduate
students were asked to
evaluate the usefulness of
five rubrics—writing, oral,
teamwork, analytic and
ethics. These students
found the oral rubric to be
of the greatest use (5.8 on a
9 point scale), while the
analytic rubric was of the
least value. However, even
though the analytic rubric
was rated as the least
useful, it still received an
assessment of being
moderately useful (4.6 on a
9 point scale). The analytic
and decision rubric’s
average score was driven by
a low 1st quartile rating of 2,
while the oral rubric’s 1st

quartile rating was 4.5.
Because of the anonymous
nature of how the data was
collected, it is not known if
low assessment-rating
scores by the students were
driven by students whose
skills in analysis were
already strong, or whether
the low assessment rating
scores by the students were

drive by individuals who
were annoyed by the entire
assessment process. It is
interesting to observe that
students who rated one
rubric poorly, also tended to
rate the other rubrics
poorly. This may suggest
that these students did not
perceive any value of the
process. 

Discussion
Several observations

may be noted. A rubric not
only serves as a tool for
assessing what knowledge
and skills have been
acquired by students, and
whether the goals of the
program are being achieved,
the rubric also serves as a
“crib-sheet” for the
instructor of what must be
discussed in the course, and
whether the instructor has
adequately addressed the
issues that were intended to
be covered. As a “crib
sheet,” the rubric is
reflected against the
syllabus for the course, and
the weekly progress of the
students is monitored to be
certain that the various
elements of the rubric are
addressed in the
appropriate modules of the
course, and to assess
whether the material has
been adequately taught. In
the example noted above for
the undergraduate class, it
became apparent after the
student presentations that
the students did not fully
grasp the significant
difference between creating
a strategy, and developing
the plans for implementing
a strategy. The realization of
this situation allowed the
instructor to focus time on
this distinction with the
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• Made a good case and
had the facts to back it
up.

• Focused on
problems/challenges but
did not give strong
options.

• Did OK.

• Nice layout, developed
problems clearly,
conveyed efficiently,
developed nice practical
solutions.

• Very thorough
presentation. More
concepts could have been
used to help the
audience visualize the
issues and solutions
better.

• Clear cut and dry
information. Didn’t
provide information
relevant to the matter at
hand.

• I figured that teams 1 &
2 gave the same sort of
presentation—not very
in-depth, but
understanding enough to
relate the problems in
which the companies
were addressing.

• Presented several
possible plans for future
but spent too much time
describing current
products.

• Most reasonable
recommendations, well
structured presentations,
good problem analysis.

• Presented more problems
and solutions to those
problems. Also they used
a SWOT analysis.

• Well organized but not
informational enough.

• Good presentation, but
pictures were missing.

• Great presentation and
great information.

Team 3 1st Place

• The best due to
answering all aspects of
presentation

• Team 3 did a terrific job
in analyzing the MP3
industry and made great
points with their charts.

• Made the most
compelling case because
of the in-depth research
and the attention to
detail.

• Analyzed the market
successfully and
identified proper
challenges and options.

• Nice presentation, well
thought out and good
PowerPoint work.

• Lots of relevant
information, but a lot of it
was repetitive, slides a
little congested.

• This team went into
depth of analyzing and
exploring the case. In
addition to that, this
team was able to use
many of the concepts
discussed in class
throughout the semester
and apply them to this
case.

• Very in depth, a lot of
information, gave
problems and solutions,

seemed like they put a
lot of thought into it.

• Gave the best
presentation, was very
well organized and
informational which is
why they were the best
team.

• Had the most in depth
ideas on strategic plans
& used the most analytic
tools like SWOT, PESTEL,
Group mapping.

• Used 3 tools and
presented strong cases
about problems.

• Great information and
presentation—wow.

• Good presentation but a
little too long.

• Did a thorough
presentation. Used
different analytical tools.

It was apparent to the
instructor that during the
presentations by the three
groups, the class did not
adequately address
implementation issues. The
students had learned how to
create strategies in this
course, but they did not
appear to have learned the
issues that occur in
attempting to implement
those strategies.
Fortunately, the existence of
the rubric allowed for a
quick intervention during
the class to address some of
the issues that are faced
when attempting to
implement a strategy. The
awareness of the class
deficiency in addressing
implementation issues, also
resulted in a correction to
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conflicts of interest,
corporate opportunities,
confidentiality, fair dealing,
protection and proper use of
company assets, compliance
with laws, rules and
regulations (including
insider trading laws), and
the reporting of any illegal
or unethical behavior.
Finally, NYSE-listed
companies were required to
include certain code
enforcement procedures,
such as a means for
employees to report
potential conflicts to the
company, and safeguards to
ensure that employees knew
that the company would not
allow retaliation for reports
made in good faith. As the
NYSE initiative contained
much more detailed
guidance than the SOX
provisions or the SEC rules
for the drafting of codes, it
has been especially
influential among both
listed and non-listed
companies that have
adopted or updated codes
following the passage of
SOX (Rogers, 2002).5

A New Generation of
Corporate Codes of
Ethics

In light of the increased
emphasis on corporate
codes of ethics resulting
from the enactment of SOX,
the SEC rules, and the
revised listing standards of
the national stock
exchanges, a number of
suggestions have been
offered to guide corporations
desiring to adopt and/or
update codes to satisfy both
the letter and the spirit of
these regulatory initiatives.
As public companies
incorporate these

suggestions into their codes,
a new generation of
corporate codes is taking
effect. Most of these
suggestions can be
summarized and grouped
into the following areas.

First, SOX and the SEC
rules require company codes
to address honest and
ethical conduct, including
the ethical handling of
actual or apparent conflicts
of interest. In order to meet
this goal, employees need to
know the company’s
definition of an “actual or
apparent conflict of
interest,” so not only should
these terms be defined, but
examples of conflict-creating
transactions and activities
should be provided
(Boudreaux & Steiner,
2005). To expedite the
“handling” of such conflicts,
the code should set forth
procedures for the reporting
of potential conflicts, the
reviewing of such reports to
determine whether a conflict
actually exists, and the
recommendation of any
action the employee and/or
the company should take if
a conflict is found to exist
(Pittman & Navran, 2003).
In order to strengthen the
company’s commitment to
guard against such
conflicts, the code should
both define and emphasize
the importance that the
company places on values
that are relevant to this
area, such as “fairness,
integrity, and loyalty”
(Pittman & Navran, 2003).

Codes following the
requirements listed in the
NYSE listing standards also
should address related
situations that may give rise
to a conflict of interest. For
example, the code should

define the term “corporate
opportunities,” provide
examples of same, and
prohibit employees from
taking such opportunities
for themselves without the
express consent of the
company. Also, “confidential
information” should be
defined and employees
should be directed to keep
such information private,
whether they have received
it from the company or its
customers, except when
disclosure is legally required
or allowed by the company
(Boudreaux & Steiner,
2005). Codes should also
impose a duty of fair dealing
on the company’s
employees, stressing the
importance of dealing fairly
with the company’s
stakeholders and refraining
from unfair-dealing
practices. Finally, the code
should require employees to
protect company assets and
use them only for legitimate
business purposes unless
express consent from the
company has been obtained.

The second requirement
a company must satisfy
when adopting a code
pursuant to SOX and SEC
rules is to provide for full,
fair, accurate, timely, and
understandable disclosure
in reports and documents
that a company files with
the SEC and in other public
communications. To achieve
this goal, the code should
state the importance the
company places on values
that lead to such disclosure,
such as honesty and
fairness, and the company’s
commitment to comply with
all laws, rules, and
regulations regarding the
provision of such disclosure
to the SEC and the public
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(Myers, 2003; Pittman &
Navran, 2003). The code
must also provide standards
for accurate and timely
disclosure of any changes in
or waivers to the code’s
provisions. To comply with
the SEC rules, the code
should provide for the
immediate disclose of any
amendment to or waiver of
the code’s provisions for
senior officers, either on
Form 8-K or the company’s
website (Mayer, Brown,
Rowe, & Maw, 2003). To
comply with the NYSE
listing requirements, the
code must also stipulate
that any such waiver for
senior management may be
made only by the board and
then must be promptly
communicated to the
shareholders (NYSE Listed
Company Manual, 2003).

Third, a code adopted by
a company pursuant to
Section 406 must require
compliance with applicable
governmental laws, rules
and regulations. To provide
meaningful guidance to
employees, the code might
provide examples of laws
and regulations that are
most likely to create ethical
problems in the conduct of
the company’s particular
business (Boudreaux &
Steiner, 2005; Barker,
2004). For example, as
noted by the NYSE listing
standards, the code should
remind employees to comply
with laws that forbid insider
trading, a practice that is
both unlawful and
unethical. Some codes have
gone even further, urging
employees “to seek the
higher standard—the spirit
or intent of the law rather
than simply the letter”
(Pittman & Navran, 2003;
Myers, 2003).

Fourth, companies
updating their code
following the enactment of
SOX must include provi-
sions requiring the prompt
internal reporting to
appropriate personnel of
code violations. In order to
create a work environment
that facilitates this objec-
tive, one commentator has
noted that “two organi-
zational actions” are needed
(Pittman & Navran, 2003).
The first such action is to
provide protections from
retribution or retaliation for
employees who make such
reports in good faith
(Boudreaux & Steiner,
2005). For example, the
code might provide
procedures that facilitate
the reporting of violations,
such as a confidential
hotline (Barker, 2004;
Boudreaux & Steiner, 2005).
The second organizational
action is to provide assur-
ances to employees that any
such reports will be taken
seriously. To this end, the
code might underscore the
company’s commitment to
thoroughly investigating
claims made in any such
reports (Boudreaux &
Steiner, 2005; Breeden,
2004; Pittman & Navran,
2003), and designate an
ethics compliance officer or
special ombudsman to
investigate these claims
(Myers, 2003; Barker,
2004). The code should also
remind employees of the
important role such reports
play in the furtherance of
the company’s ethical
objectives.

Fifth, to satisfy the
regulatory requirements
adopted by the SEC and the
national exchanges, the
code must include
provisions that ensure

accountability for adherence
to the code. To accomplish
this goal, the scope of the
code’s coverage should be
broadened to apply to all
employees, as required by
the listing standards, and
not just to the company’s
senior officers, as required
by Section 406 and SEC
rules (Myers, 2003;
Breeden, 2004). The code
should also include
procedures for the efficient
handling of code violation
reports, and enforcement
provisions such as
penalties, sanctions, and
other disciplinary action for
code violations (Rockness &
Rockness, 2005; Breeden,
2004; Boudreaux & Steiner,
2005).6 Rather than include
“predetermined conse-
quences” such as specific
sanctions for specific
violations, some advise that
the code should provide a
range of disciplinary
actions, allowing
management some
discretion to determine
accountability based on the
individual facts of the
particular violation (Pittman
& Navran, 2003). Finally,
employees need to be aware
that code violators will be
promptly and consistently
disciplined (Boudreaux &
Steiner, 2005), so the
company may wish to
publicize code violations and
any resulting disciplinary
consequences to its
employees on a periodic
basis (Pittman & Navran,
2003).
 
A Critique of the
Renewed Emphasis on
Corporate Codes of
Ethics

What has been the effect
of SOX, SEC rules, and the
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revised listing standards on
corporate codes of ethics?
From the foregoing
discussion, it is evident that
neither Congress nor the
SEC intended to dictate the
provisions of a code—or
even require that a firm
adopt one—but they did
provide an incentive for
public companies to adopt
written codes and required
the disclosure of same to the
investing public. As such,
companies have been free to
adopt the type of code they
desire provided that the
basic regulatory guidelines
are followed, although
companies listed on the
NYSE must address the
content areas indicated by
the NYSE standards.
Though the evidence seems
far from conclusive, and
some studies have found
that written codes of ethics
may have a positive effect on
ethical behavior (McKinney
& Moore, 2008, and studies
cited therein), these
regulations have not created
a strong incentive for
companies to adopt rigorous
codes (Harvard Law Review,
2003). In fact, the changes
in code content that have
been made in response to
SOX appear to have been
relatively modest, although
it has been argued that the
disclosure requirement for
waivers, amendments, and
the codes themselves, will
lead to greater transparency
(Newberg, 2005).

Although few doubt that
the renewed emphasis on
business ethics in the
corporate environment is a
good thing, debate exists as
to whether corporate codes
of ethics—even after SOX
and the SEC rules—are an
effective means of improving

corporate behavior.7 Some
maintain that such codes
are merely cynical exercises
companies engage in to
generate public goodwill and
to merit leniency under the
compliance program
requirements of the Federal
Sentencing Guidelines
rather than true attempts to
place meaningful checks on
corporate improprieties
(Harvard Law Review, 2003:
2126; Bainbridge, 2003;
Digh, 1998). Others argue,
similarly, that without
mandated content
provisions, companies have
few incentives to implement
rigorous codes (Harvard
Law Review, 2003: 2126-28;
Bainbridge, 2003). The
drawback to a strong code,
so this argument goes, is
that strict, detailed
provisions in a code are
much more likely to produce
reports of code violations.
Once the violation is
reported, it must be acted
upon or a waiver occurs.
Since both reports and
waivers must be
immediately disclosed to the
public under SOX and the
SEC rules, they could lead
to civil or criminal liability
for the company following
disclosure. Alternatively,
such reports could send
troublesome signals to the
marketplace that would
scare investors and cripple
the company’s stock price.
Accordingly, companies
have much greater incentive
to avoid attempts at true
reform and instead adopt
codes with broad, vague
provisions that satisfy the
public relations need to
have a code but are much
less likely to subject the
company to liability (Mori,
2007; Newberg, 2005).

Unfortunately, a broad,
vague code is not likely to be
an effective deterrent to
corporate malfeasance.

Critics who question the
effectiveness of corporate
codes also can point to the
fact that the companies
involved in the major
corporate scandals of 2001
and 2002 all had corporate
codes of ethics. Although
Enron, for example, had a
code of ethics, it was largely
ignored by senior officers of
the company and as a result
was ineffective in deterring
the conduct that led to the
downfall of that company
(Smith, Dickerson, &
Koontz, 2002). In fact,
following the Enron scandal,
a report prepared by the
Special Investigative
Committee of the Board of
Directors of Enron
Corporation listed
numerous instances
involving the failure of
Enron’s senior officers to
comply with Enron’s code
regarding their conflicts of
interests, the failure of
Enron’s management and
board to provide sufficient
oversight of those conflicts,
and the failure of Enron to
disclose these conflicts in its
public filings (Powers et al.,
2002).

Reforming the
Corporate Culture 

In order to effectively
change the corporate
culture and introduce a
more ethically-aware
environment, a code of
ethics is an important start,
but nearly all commentators
recommend that the
company go beyond the
code and implement an
effective ethics and
compliance program
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(Rockness & Rockness,
2005; Turknett & Turknett,
2002; Pittman & Navran,
2003). Legislative and
regulatory authorities might
also better serve the public
interest by seeking a more
holistic approach to
reforming corporate culture
(Rockness & Rockness,
2005: 48-49). Now that
attention has been paid to
corporate codes of ethics
and disclosure require-
ments, both business firms
and regulatory authorities
should consider more far-
reaching initiatives for the
creation and implementa-
tion of broad ethics and
compliance programs. Such
programs, for example,
might include the following
elements.

First, such programs
should strive to meet the
requirements of an effective
ethics and compliance
program under the Federal
Sentencing Guidelines for
Organizations of the U.S.
Sentencing Commission. For
example, the program
should be designed to
facilitate compliance by the
company with the values
and standards of its internal
code of ethics and with
governmental regulations
that pertain to the
company’s business
(Rafalko, 1994). Following
the guidelines outlined
below, the company should
begin by establishing
detailed ethics and
compliance standards and
procedures. As no “one size
fits all,” these standards and
procedures must be tailored
to the individual firm and
clearly stated in the
company’s policies (Turknett
& Turknett, 2002;
Boudreaux & Steiner, 2005).
In addition, the program

should provide directives to
ensure that proper care is
taken when substantial
discretionary authority is
delegated to employees, that
standards and procedures
are effectively communi-
cated to all employees and
agents, that the program’s
procedures and results are
properly monitored and
audited, that discipline of
employee violations is
consistently enforced, and
that responses to wrong-
doing are prompt and any
program deficiencies are
timely remedied (Pittman &
Navran, 2003).

Second, for the program
to succeed it is critical that
it be fully and openly
supported by the firm’s chief
executive and its senior
management. As “the tone is
set at the top,” the
company’s senior manage-
ment should regularly and
publicly demonstrate their
commitment to the
company’s code, thus
sending strong signals
about its importance to the
rest of the company
(Boudreaux & Steiner, 2005;
Breeden, 2004; Barker,
2004). The directors and
senior officers should
continually emphasize and
remind employees of their
support of the basic “core”
values and behavioral
standards that the company
has adopted to govern the
ethical behavior of its
employees (Boudreaux &
Steiner, 2005).8 Also, once
designed, senior manage-
ment must commit to the
program by ensuring that
the officers designated to
manage the program are
given the necessary
authority, resources, and
access to the firm’s top
executives to successfully

implement the program’s
standards and objectives
(Finder & Warnecke, 2005).

Third, the program must
be designed to allow
employees to take owner-
ship of the company’s
ethical initiatives
(McNamara, 2008). To foster
this sense of ownership, and
to ensure that the program’s
values and standards are as
relevant and credible as
possible, the firm’s senior
management should seek
input from as many
departments and employee
groups as possible when
drafting the program’s
objectives and standards
(Myers, 2003; Barker, 2004;
Boudreaux & Steiner, 2005).
To ensure accountability
and responsibility, the
program should include
appropriate measures to
enhance employee
compliance with its
standards and objectives
(Rockness & Rockness,
2005). For example, the
company should require
employees to pledge their
commitment to the
company’s ethical program
by signing a form
acknowledging they have
read and understood the
code and agree to comply
with its provisions. The
company should then put
real teeth in the code by
providing in their employee
agreements that violation of
the code will constitute
“good cause” for dismissal—
for all employees (Myers,
2003).

Fourth, as neither the
code nor the other
supporting materials used
by the company for its
ethics and compliance
program can accomplish
their purpose unless they
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• Analysis

• Motivation brochures and
publications

• Announcements (to
customers, suppliers,
colleagues, and the
general public)

• Training/education
documents including
specifications, SOPs, and
other policies

• Human Resource
documents (i.e.,
Performance Reviews,
written warnings, letters
of recommendations, etc.)

• Résumés

Each form of written
communication is distinct.
Each form of written
communication requires
sensitivity to the audience
and its needs, the
appropriate and industry-
accepted format for the
information that is conveyed,
and in some cases, an
understanding of any legal
implications. 

The Modality of Writing
was used in the strategy
course. As an example
regarding the use of the
writing rubric, in addition to
the normal case analysis
writing, the writing
assignment for the case
study of “Merck and the
Recall of Vioxx” (Thompson,
2004) in Crafting and
Executing Strategy: The
Quest for Competitive
Advantage required the
students to draft a notice
that would be written by a
typical Marketing Executive
to the external community
regarding the recall of Vioxx.
The purpose of this

particular writing
assignment was to assess
the student’s ability to write
a notice regarding a
potentially disastrous
corporate issue (injury or
potential death to an
individual, a situation that
might cause significant
market share loss, major
legal challenges, brand
destruction, or similar
problem), that explained the
situation to the public, was
truthful and informative,
helped the customer to
understand the issue and
its ramifications, and
attempted to contain the
serious situation and not
destroy the company. For a
different case study,
“Smithfields Food’s Vertical
Integration Strategy”
(Hosmer, 2004) in Crafting
and Executing Strategy: The
Quest for Competitive
Advantage, along with the
necessary case analysis, the
students were required to
write an internal email
message regarding a
particular aspect of the case
that addressed the issue at
hand, without becoming
fodder for potential plaintiff
lawyers in the event of a
lawsuit by residents
surrounding the North
Carolina facilities. After the
student’s work was
submitted, the various
writings were copied on
transparencies, and the
entire class assessed
grammatical errors, context
issues, style of writing, and
any unique element that
was particular to that
specific assignment (such as
the Vioxx and Smithfield
case requirements).

The result of this course
structure was to quickly
move the total class writing
(within a two week period of

time) from an exercise of
expedience as demonstrated
by the student’s writing (as
perceived by the instructor
to be to write the
assignment as quickly as
possible, and be done with
it), to one where the writing
was crisper, less error-filled, 
and addressed the issue(s)
at hand. From a measure-
ment perspective for the
writing rubric, the
performance improved 50
percent at the third week of
rubric use, and that
performance level remained
essentially stable
throughout the rest of the
semester. The final result for
the semester showed that
the aspect of writing with
which the students had the
greatest difficulty was being
certain that the “topic was
clearly stated and
developed,” while the areas
they had the greatest
strengths included “writing
format is appropriate,”
“audience is properly
identified and addressed,”
and “information collected
from appropriate sources.”
Due to the nature of the
assignments, less attention
was focused on “citing
information appropriately,”
and “citing using the
appropriate format.” While
the students generally did
not appreciate the ongoing
use of the writing rubric
each week, the quality of the
written material improved,
and the rubric became an
element in the student’s
individual grade.

Although the above
discussion focused on the
writing rubric, it is
worthwhile to explain the
analytic rubric in greater
depth. The analytic and
decision rubric is presented
in Table 1.
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are comprehensible,
companies should make
sure that these materials
are understandable and
accessible to all employees,
free of buzzwords and
legalese (Barker, 2004). The
company should offer
periodic training and testing
programs to ensure
comprehension and to make
sure the objectives of the
code are clearly understood
so they can be effectively
implemented (Myers, 2003;
Boudreaux & Steiner, 2005). 

Fifth, for the program to
positively influence
employee behavior, the
company should strive to
create an open work
environment in which
employees feel free to
discuss ethical issues and
dilemmas. To facilitate such
discussion, the program
must make clear that the
code’s purpose is merely to
serve as a general guide to
employee behavior on the
job, rather than a manual
addressing every
conceivable ethical situation
(Boudreaux & Steiner,
2005). In cases not
specifically addressed by the
code, employees should be
encouraged to talk to
supervisors, managers or
other appropriate personnel
when in doubt about the
best course of action in a
particular situation and/or
be trained to use the values
and general principles
stated in the code to guide
their decision-making
(Barker, 2004; Pittman &
Navran, 2003). In order to
facilitate an atmosphere of
trust and open communica-
tion so that such a dialogue
might take place, the
program should allow for
anonymous or confidential

consultations and/or
reporting by employees that
could be utilized without
fear of retaliation (Finder &
Warnecke, 2005).

Sixth, to keep current
and reflect changes in the
company and its business
practices, the program
should provide a
mechanism for periodic
monitoring and updating of
its contents and procedures,
and both the program and
its effectiveness at
preventing, detecting, and
responding to unethical
conduct should be reviewed
from time to time and
amended when necessary
(Boudreaux & Steiner, 2005;
Pittman & Navran, 2003).
For example, some
companies have placed an
expiration date in their
code, which requires the
board to review and update
the code on a regular basis
(Pittman & Navran, 2003).
Of course, under SOX and
the SEC rules, any such
amendments to the code, as
they apply to the firm’s
senior officers, must be
promptly disclosed to the
SEC and to the company’s
shareholders.

In addition to helping a
company achieve its ethical
objectives, a firm’s adoption
of a broad ethics and
compliance program can
serve other benefits. For
example, studies have
shown that such a
demonstrated commitment
to ethical values and
objectives can lead to
favorable business financial
performance (Verschoor,
1998).9 Also, as noted
above, such a program may
be considered as a
mitigating factor to be
considered under the

Federal Sentencing
Guidelines in determining
whether to initiate
enforcement actions against
companies and how to
assess penalties. In sum,
comprehensive guidelines
for such programs should
be adopted by the
companies themselves
and/or promulgated by
appropriate legislative and
regulatory authorities so
that these firms might have
a better opportunity to
achieve true reform.

Conclusion
In the aftermath of the

wave of corporate scandals
that rocked American
business in 2001 and 2002,
Congress, the SEC, and the
national stock exchanges all
enacted reform initiatives
that included the imple-
mentation of corporate
codes of ethics as a way of
instituting change in
America’s corporate culture.
Although these initiatives
were well-intended, they
have been criticized as being
too general and for creating
incentives for companies to
adopt less than rigorous
codes. In the years since
2002, research also has
shown that these reforms
have not been successful so
far in stemming the tide of
corporate wrongdoing,
although misconduct has
been reduced significantly at
firms with strong ethical
cultures (Ethics Resource
Center 2007). As a result, it
is apparent that in the
future regulatory
authorities, as well as the
companies themselves,
must consider more far-
reaching measures to bring
about the change in
corporate culture that is
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necessary to achieve true
reform.

A comprehensive,
management-backed ethics
and compliance program
has been shown to be a step
in that direction. Spe-
cifically, firms should
develop and implement a
comprehensive ethics
program that (i) facilitates
compliance with both the
firm’s code of ethics and
applicable governmental
regulations, (ii) has the full
and open support of the
firm’s chief executive and its
senior management, (iii)
ensures accountability and
responsibility by including
appropriate measures to
enhance employee
compliance, (iv) offers
periodic training and testing
programs to ensure
employee comprehension,(v)
creates an open work
environment in which
ethical issues and dilemmas
can be freely discussed, and
(vi) provides a mechanism
for periodic monitoring and
updating of the effectiveness
of the program’s contents
and procedures. In this way,
companies may develop and
maintain a strong ethical
culture that will protect
investors and the general
public through more
effective promotion and
regulation of business ethics
in the corporate
environment. 

Notes
1.  For a discussion of the

history of the federal
government’s attempts
to legislate ethical
conduct on the part of
corporations, see
Rockness & Rockness
(2005).

2.  For a general discussion
of the provisions of
Section 406 and the
SEC rules issued
pursuant thereto, which
remain in effect today,
see Rogers (2002), Fried,
Frank, Harris, Shriver,
& Jacobson, LLP (2003),
and Mayer, Brown,
Rowe, & Maw (2003).

3. Although these rules
provided general
guidelines and objectives
for the drafting of a
code, the SEC decided
that decisions as to
specific code provisions,
compliance procedures,
and disciplinary
measures for ethical
breaches were best left
to the judgment and
discretion of the
individual company. The
SEC did, however, urge
public firms to utilize
broad, comprehensive
code provisions in order
to satisfy the
requirements of the new
rules (Mayer, Brown,
Rowe, & Maw, 2003).

4. NYSE Listed Company
Manual, Section
303A.10 (2003); AMEX
Company Guide, Section
807 (2003); NASDAQ
Manual Section 4350(n)
(2006).

5. It appears than in some
instances non-listed
companies have also
adopted and disclosed
codes of ethics pursuant
to these standards even
though they were not
required to do so (Mori,
2007). In fact, even 

privately held
businesses and
charitable organiza-
tions … are finding
that certain aspects
of [SOX] can benefit
their overall opera-
tions and are cherry-
picking those parts
that will do them the
most good (Savich,
2006),

including code of ethics
provisions.

6. Alternatively, the code
might use an audit-
based compliance
system, which uses
periodic “audits” of
employees to ensure
accountability to the
code (Lere & Gaumnitz,
2007; Myers, 2003).

7. Many studies have
examined the
relationship between the
development and
implementation of a
company’s code of ethics
and the ethical behavior
of its employees. For a
discussion and critique
of some of these studies,
see McKinney & Moore
(2008), Ethics Resource
Center (2007), and Long
& Driscoll (2008).
Although some have
concluded that such
codes have been effective
in leading to more
ethical employee
behavior, others have
not found a conclusive
correlation (Newberg
2005; Lere & Gaumnitz
2007).
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After review, a pilot
assessment was needed,
and one specific course
piloted the implementation,
because all rubrics
(excluding detailed quantita-
tive analysis) could be
conducted in this course.
The specific course was a
strategy course taught at
the junior level, and the
structure of the course
allowed for adequate
assessment of writing, oral
presentation, use of
technology, analytic and
decision-making, ethics,
and teamwork.

Implementation
The pilot began with the

rubrics being explained to
the students at the
beginning of the semester.
In addition to reviewing the
syllabus for the course, each
student was also given a
copy of each of the rubrics
that were to be used in the
course, and each element of
the various rubrics was
addressed during the first
class. The use of the rubrics
was also reinforced
throughout the semester.
The first rubric to be used,
and the rubric that received
the most attention due to
the structure of the course,
was the writing rubric (this
particular course had been
identified as a writing
intensive course for the
management program). For
the first six weeks of class,
student writing was
reviewed in class (names of
the students omitted to
protect the innocent), and
the students, as a whole,
would review the writing for
professionalism, compe-
tence, grammar, style, and
content. 

The issue of style needs
further explanation. As the
course was designed, the
writing assignments were
not merely limited to the
standard case-analysis
student-paper submission,
but also included writing
that addressed a wide
variety of styles that are
required in the business
community. In addition to
the writing rubric, a
modality of writing
document was created that
determined the different
types of writing that an
executive might be required
to create. Included in the
modality of writing
document was writing of
resumes, emails, product
recalls, standard operating
procedures, executive
briefings, and detailed
business analysis docu-
ments. In all, a total of 13
different types of writing
were identified, and seven
types were assessed in the
course.

The “Modality of Writing”
document follows:

Clear, concise, and
compelling writing is
required for effective
communication in a
professional capacity.
Effective communication is
necessary in order to 

• Convey data,
information,
understanding, and
wisdom

• Request data,
information,
understanding, and
wisdom

• Educate,

• Serve as an historical
reference,

• Call to action,

• Sway opinions,

• Alert to dangers or
changing situations,

• Amuse,

• Converse and align with
colleagues, suppliers,
customers, and a vast
array of stakeholders.

In order to be considered
competent, business
professionals must master a
variety of writing
modalities—for personal as
well as professional reasons.
When a specific form of
writing requires citation,
adherence to a recognized
style of citation (MLA) is
expected. Ineffective or
inappropriate communication
will limit the career success
of any professional, while
simultaneously limiting
effectiveness regarding the
pursuit of their professional
duties and responsibilities.

The modalities of writing to
be mastered in both an
electronic and paper format
include

• Email

• Business correspondence

• Executive briefings

• Presentations

• Reports 

• Research papers

• Legal briefs
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clarify for the student the
expectations beyond content
knowledge that must be
mastered, and rubrics serve
as an adjunct to the
syllabus regarding topics
that need to be addressed.
As will be noted later in this
article, the rubrics address
individual aspects of a
particular topic, and the
detail that is explicated
ranges from nine items for
the written rubric, to 15
items for the analytic and
decision rubric. Bolton
(2006) wrote about the first
aspect in “Rubrics and
Adult Learners Andragogy
and Assessment,” while
Stenzel (2005) noted the
second aspect in “Assess-
ment in Undergraduate
Counselor Education: A
Contract with Clients.”

Another benefit in using
rubrics is to understand
how the process of teaching
is performed. Analysis of the
results of rubrics helps to
determine deficiencies in a
particular course or
program, and allows for
corrective action. Gerretson
and Golson discussed this
benefit in “Introducing and
Evaluating Course-
Embedded Assessment in
General Education”
(Gerretson & Golson, 2004).
An example discussed later
in this article also
illustrated this point.

Additionally, rubrics
may be used as an adjunct
to the grades of the
individual students, as well
as being used as a tool to
assess the program itself.
Using rubrics in addition to
specific comments on
student-submitted papers
provides an overall
perspective for the student
on the strengths and
deficiencies of their work.

Initial Work Before
Implementation

The process of
implementing the business
rubrics at Utica College
began with the formation of
a committee of tenured and
tenure-track faculty who
were supported by a core
faculty member of the
College in the Health
Sciences (and also who
functions as the site mentor
in assessment). With
guidance from the site
expert, an outside resource
from East Tennessee
University presented to the
Business and Economics
Department the rubrics that
are used at East Tennessee
University, and explained
East Tennessee University’s
process of creating and
implementing those rubrics.
This portion of the process
was critical in enhancing
the speed of creation and
implementation of the
proposed business rubrics
at the Business and
Economics Department at
Utica College. While the
faculty was fully capable of
creating rubrics without this
assistance, it is highly likely
that the process would have
taken significantly longer.

Interestingly, the
process still took one year
from initial conversation to
the beginning of imple-
mentation. The department
team of four members
convened on a bi-weekly
basis to review the Mission
and Goals of the
Department, to determine
what rubrics were necessary
to be created, to review
material from East
Tennessee University, and
to generate rubrics that
would achieve the purpose
of guidance and assessment

that was desired as easily as
possible. Matrices were
developed to determine
where the rubrics would be
used, and most importantly,
where in the student’s
future career the skills that
were being assessed by the
rubric would actually be
needed.

As may be typical in an
academic setting, long
discussions ensued over
word choices, elements to be
assessed, assessment
methodology, linkages
across the various course
offerings, the proper place
and time to perform the
analysis, and external
resources that might be
utilized to enhance the
assessment process. As an
example of the detail
addressed, one month of
discussion revolved around
the particular writing
standard that should be
used regarding proper
citation of sources.

As previously noted,
seven rubrics were created
for the undergraduate
program (writing, oral
presentation, ethics,
technology, teamwork,
analytic and decision
making, and quantitative
skills). Six rubrics were
created for the graduate
program (analytic and
decision making, writing,
ethics, technology,
quantitative, and team-
work). The individual
rubrics contained multiple
elements. An example of one
specific rubric is discussed
later in this article.

After the committee
completed the first draft, the
completed rubrics were
presented to the Depart-
ment’s faculty for approval.
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8. As Rockness & Rockness
conclude, 

[t]he responsibility
for ensuring an
ethical culture must
rest not only with
the CEO but also
with an independent
Board of Directors.
The Board must be
responsible for the
values and ethics
they seek in officers
of the corporation to
ensure a culture that
supports, nurtures,
fosters, and attracts
individuals of high
personal integrity.
The Board must
provide the oversight
necessary to ensure
that ethical behavior
is noticed and
rewarded. Similarly,
the culture must
encourage the
departure of those
who violate the
ethical principles
regardless of their
other contributions
to the organization
(2005: 49).

9. See also Verschoor
(2005) and studies cited
therein.
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Implementation of Rubrics in an Upper-
Level Undergraduate Strategy Class

Herbert Rau
Measurement, analysis,

and feedback are necessary
for improvement. In
business one of the most
hackneyed expressions is
“you get what you measure.”
Measurement and feedback
are also critically important
from an academic per-
spective, and it has received
increased attention with the
2006 Spelling’s Commission
report, “The Future of
Higher Education” (Brint,
2008; Hamilton & Banta,
2008).

The Business and
Economics Department at
Utica College shares the
concern of assessing all
aspects of the student’s
academic experience. While
each course follows
standard protocol for
teaching at the post-
secondary level—qualified
instructors, college-level
materials (texts and other
resources), peer-reviewed
syllabi and teaching, exams,
and papers—assessing
whether the goals and
mission of the College are

being achieved needs to be
assessed in a different
manner. Consequently, the
department has instituted
rubrics as a tool to enhance
the assessment process.

Rubrics may have
several levels of use. An
important purpose for using
rubrics is to assess whether
the mission and goals of the
College—and the School—
are being achieved. These
goals extend beyond course
content knowledge. To
accomplish this purpose
and align with the mission
and goals of the College,
seven rubrics were created
in the Business and
Economics Department and
include

• Writing
• Oral presentations
• Technology
• Analytic and Decision

Making
• Quantitative Skills
• Teamwork
• Ethics

While the use of rubrics
measures whether these
areas have been satis-
factorily addressed across
the curriculum and inform
whether the goals and
mission of the College are
being achieved, analysis of
rubrics assists in linking
various disciplines of the
College together. At Utica
College, the overall

structure of offerings
encompasses an integrated
perspective of the
humanities. Therefore,
humanities courses, in
conjunction with the topic
specific courses taught by
the Business and
Economics Department,
become the structure for the
final degree. An example
clarifies this statement.
Since public speaking is a
core discipline of the College
(and this discipline is taught
by a separate School), being
able to link the presentation
skills of students in
business courses with their
core courses from the
Communication and Social
Sciences Department helps
to identify specific strengths
and weaknesses that the
composite student body
might have, and
consequently allow for
modifications in the courses
(if necessary) that are
currently taught by the
Communications and Social
Sciences Department. To
use contemporary business
parlance, an internal
customer-supplier
relationship is maintained
across disciplines. The
result of the teaching by the
Communications and Social
Sciences Department is an
input into the courses later
taught by the Business and
Economics Department. 

Rubrics also help to
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