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This year marks the 40th anniversary of the Alma-Ata 
Declaration, adopted at the International Conference on 
Primary Health Care in 1978. The Declaration focused on 
health as ‘a state of complete physical, mental and social 
well-being and not merely the absence of disease or 
infirmity’ and recommended a cross-sectoral approach to 
promote health (1,2). It highlighted the inequality of health 
statuses between countries as unacceptable and noted how 
health for all was a human right. A key element was that of 
Primary Health Care (PHC) and how it should be 
incorporated in national health systems to achieve 
universal health care for all (1). Currently, universal health 
coverage is on the agenda through the Sustainable 
Development Goals (SDGs), where the aim is to ensure 
healthy lives and promote well-being for all (3).  

Building upon Sri Lanka’s policies of free access to 
government provided health care services since the 1930s, 
the country signed the Alma-Ata Declaration in 1978 (2). 
Sri Lanka’s health system has served as a role model for 
successful implementation of PHC for a number of years 
(4). Specifically, it has used community-based health 
services supported by the PHC system (5). For instance, 
Sri Lanka improved rural health centres by staffing them 

with competent midwives, thereby bringing health services 
closer to rural families and reducing the need for beds in 
urban referral hospitals (4). The significant focus on PHC 
has had a profound effect on health in the country, 
especially in regards to maternal and child health, 
immunization and control of major infectious diseases  (2). 
Regardless of economic fluctuations, Sri Lanka has 
managed to maintain a satisfactory level of health (6). Life 
expectancy at birth has continuously risen and is currently 
75 years (72 years for men and 78 years for women), 
which is considerably higher than the WHO regional 
average of 67 years (7). Furthermore, under-five mortality 
and maternal mortality has decreased significantly over the 
years (7).  

The question is however, whether it is possible to keep this 
position as a PHC role model among low- and middle-
income countries. Sri Lanka has one of the fastest aging 
populations in South Asia. It is estimated that the 
population over 60 will double within the next 25 years 
(8). This brings additional health requirements of elderly 
people in a system with limited social security (6) as well 
as decreasing family support. Such changes in the 
demographic composition also brings an epidemiological 
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transition. Over the past decades, the relative importance 
of communicable, maternal and perinatal diseases have 
decreased and today more than 75% of deaths in Sri Lanka 
are caused by non-communicable diseases (NCDs) (9). 
Also, causes of injuries have changed with an increasing 
importance of traffic related injuries (7). 

This epidemiological transition requires a significant 
transformation of the PHC system in Sri Lanka with 
updated health policies and services to ensure an adequate 
response to the new demands. A recent World Bank 
assessment concluded that there was no evidence yet that 
Sri Lanka is performing well in terms of managing NCDs, 
nor that the health system, as it is currently configured, is 
well positioned to do so. The rapid epidemiological 
transition further calls for educating a greater number of 
health professionals in established as well as new fields of 
professions. The current capacity at the training 
institutions may not be equipped to fulfil future demands. 
This will influence a key component of the health care 
system building blocks - the human resources - and are 
likely to affect the greatest on the rural population (10).  

Expenditure on health as a share of gross domestic product 
(GDP) has decreased in Sri Lanka in recent years where 
spending on health has grown slower than the overall 
economy and currently stand at approximately 3% of GDP 
(11). The Government spending on health has remained at 
around 8% of the budget for the past 10 years (11). Around 
the year 2006, Sri Lanka had the lowest dependency rate, 
which provided a window of opportunity for a favourable 
impact on the economy. However, Central Bank of Sri 
Lanka data clearly shows that Sri Lanka has not used the 
demographic dividend effectively (12). This missed 
opportunity will be an additional burden to the health care 
system. With the increasing pressure from the 
demographic and epidemiological transitions in Sri Lanka, 
it is questionable if government expenditure on health can 
be maintained at 8% without affecting universal access to 
health care.   

Sri Lanka has a moderate incidence of catastrophic 
expenditure, with around 5% of the population spending 
more than 10% of their entire budget on health. However, 
high out-of-pocket expenditure (almost 40% of current 
health expenditure) (2) and high utilization of the private 
sector, even among low income groups, means that in spite 
of access to free state health care the actual cost of some 
drugs, investigations and surgeries may place a significant 
burden on households (13). 

The ongoing epidemiological transition may without 
investments and health reforms result in patients, who in 

even greater numbers, bypass lower-level government 
health facilities, if not equipped to deal with the specific 
requirements of NCDs. Also, going forward without an 
intensification of government health care reforms the role 
of the private health care sector is likely to grow further. 
The private sector already plays an important role in Sri 
Lanka and make up approximately 55% of total spending 
of healthcare, especially in the context of outpatient 
curative care  (14).  According to estimations made by 
PricewaterhouseCoopers (PWC) out of pocket expenditure 
make up 86% of private expenditure on healthcare with the 
remainder relatively evenly split between private and 
employer insurance. A further move towards private care 
may place pressure on the households in terms of out-of-
pocket payments. In addition to the growing private 
clinical services, the private pharmaceutic and diagnostic 
sectors are growing 14-17% per year (14). Clearly, the 
private sector offers a growing and needed service. 
However, the universal access have to be addressed 
politically to ensure an equilibrium in services and to not 
undermine access to health care for already marginalized 
urban, remote-rural and estate communities. 

The need to invest in effective preventive strategies for 
NCDs is of paramount importance to reduce the financial 
burden on private households and government budgets. 
The current PHC system will need to incorporate such 
efficient preventive approaches to remain relevant. In 
addition to the range of important cardio-metabolic 
disease, mental health challenges will also have to see 
further investments to reduce not only individual suffering 
but also the tremendous burden on the society. In sum, to 
achieve the SDG targets for health and the aim of ‘leaving 
no one behind’, the PHC services of Sri Lanka will need to 
develop further in order to address the changing needs of 
the population.  
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