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My experience with my 
teachers at Howard di­
rectly influenced my ap­
proach to study at the 
Ph.D. level.

'Thank You Howard 
For the Experience'
By James A. Bayton

In 1896, a young man named George L. 
Bayton left his home in rural Virginia to 
enroll in what was then known as 

Howard University’s Preparatory Depart­
ment. In those days the nation’s educational 
system, especially in rural Virginia, did 
little to prepare Black youth to undertake 
college level education. In order to cope 
with this problem, Howard University es­
tablished its Preparatory Department 
where young Black men and women could 
prepare themselves for entry into college. 
George Bayton, my father, took advantage 
of this opportunity and later went on to

graduate from Howard’s Medical School in 
1906. He then settled in Philadelphia where 
he practiced medicine.

As a youngster, I grew up in a Howard 
University-oriented home. A large picture 
of the campus of the early 1900s occupied a 
prominent position in our home. Many of 
our family friends were Howard alumni; the 
family regularly participated in Howard 
events. It follows then, upon completion of 
high school, the only college I considered 
attending was Howard.

Let me sketch some of the broader 
aspects of my college experiences at 
Howard: A sense of high quality in the
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courses and teachers; the special apprecia­
tion of being in contact with or in proximity 
to truly outstanding Black individuals; op­
portunities to hear lectures or speeches 
that brought insight into the problems of 
Black people throughout the world; 
participation as an usher in the Sunday 
Chapel services and the experience of 
listening to a variety of enriching thoughts 
and the music of a glorious choir; serving as 
treasurer of the student council, member of 
two championship basketball teams and 
being an active participant in the campus 
social scene.

A critical thing that happened to me very

early at Howard was my encounter with the 
psychology department. In the fall of my 
second year, I signed up for an introductory 
course in psychology taught by a dynamic 
young teacher named Alonzo Davis (later 
head of psychology at Tuskegee). This so 
stimulated my interest in the field that I 
took additional courses with the three other 
teachers in the department — Francis 
Sumner, Max Meenes and Frederick Watts.

At the time there was something about 
the approach of the psychology department 
that I really did not fully grasp or under­
stand. I do now. The approach of the 
department was to provide the students

with the opportunity to become aware of 
psychology in all its various manifestations; 
Those teachers introduced undergraduate 
students to basic experimental psychology, 
courses in learning, social psychology, sta­
tistics, applied psychology, abnormal psy­
chology, the psychology of religion and 
psychology through literature. What the 
program offered was a broad perspective on 
the areas of concerns with which psychol­
ogy grappled.

After receiving my B.S. degree in psy­
chology, I continued at Howard and ob­
tained my M.S. degree. The department’s 
program at the M.S. level was an intensive
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I felt quite comfortable 
with the atmosphere at 
Howard.

continuation of the broad approach of the 
undergraduate curriculum, which was de­
signed to prepare students to continue on to 
the Ph.D. degree in psychology even though 
at that time Howard did not offer the Ph.D. 
degree in the field. For example, at that 
time (the mid-1980s) candidates for a Ph.D. 
had to pass, among other things, examina­
tions in French and German. The M.S. 
program in psychology at Howard required 
students to take a course in Readings in 
French Psychology and a course in Read­
ings in German Psychology, both taught by 
Sumner and Meens. So those of us who 
went to other institutions to earn the Ph.D. 
were already prepared to tackle these 
language examinations.

My next stop, the next year, was Colum­
bia University where I began work on my 
Ph.D. By this time I had committed myself 
to a career as a psychologist. What did “a 
career as a psychologist” mean to a Black 
individual in 1936? The prospect was to 
become a teacher of psychology in a Black 
college. That was an attractive prospect to 
me because I was increasingly developing 
interest in the substantive matter that 
psychology dealt with; the academic life, as 
I had seen it at Howard, appealed to me.

With my career goal set and with my 
expectation that I would spend the rest of 
my life teaching in a Black college or 
colleges set as well, my experiences with 
my teachers at Howard directly influenced 
my approach to study at the Ph.D. level. I 
have already noted that the psychology 
program at Howard, both on the B.S. and 
M.S. levels, was broad-based. That pro­
gram exposed students to every basic 
aspect of psychology in terms of concepts, 
applications and methods. As I looked 
forward to becoming a teacher of psychol­
ogy, I just naturally assumed that it was my 
responsibility to prepare myself so that I 
could emulate the teachers at Howard who 
had served as models for me.
The Right Model

Today there is the widespread view that

Black students in psychology should con­
centrate on what to me seems a very 
restricted notion of the field. That was not 
the model with which I “grew up.” My 
model led me to take advantage of the 
opportunities represented in Ph.D. level 
study to expose myself to the basic con­
cepts, applications and method of the field- 
at-large.

A case in point: In my Howard program, I 
had learned about something called “psy­
chophysics,” that branch of psychology that 
studies the effect of physical processes 
upon a person’s mental processes. The very 
name can be awe-inspiring. When I got to 
the Ph.D. level I felt that I had to “learn” 
psychophysics. As a prospective teacher, I 
felt it was incumbent upon me to move 
beyond the “learn about” stage. I further 
assumed that if psychophysics was impor­
tant in psychology it was my responsibility 
to prepare myself so that I could be 
competent to transfer this knowledge to my 
future students. At that stage in my life, it 
never occurred to me that someone, some 
day, might say: “Why on earth should Black 
psychology students bother with some­
thing like psychophysics?”

This broad-based type of approach, 
brought about by my natural interest and 
my assumed responsibility to my future 
students, made my Ph.D. study and re­
search a period of excitement.

The sudden death of my father at the end 
of my year at Columbia made it necessary 
for me to transfer to the University of 
Pennsylvania, from which I subsequently 
received my Ph.D.

My first teaching job was at Virginia 
State College (now university). When I 
went to Virginia State in 1939 I learned 
something that I had not realized before. At 
that time, psychology in Black colleges 
usually consisted of only a few applicable 
courses in departments of education — 
courses such as Educational Psychology, 
Child Psychology, Adolescent Psychology 
and Tests and Measurements—all required

for teacher certification. Given the broad 
background I started with at Howard and 
continued at the Ph.D. level, I enlarged the 
scope of the offerings in psychology. This 
move was met with positive student re­
sponse. I subsequently had similar experi­
ences at Southern University and at Mor­
gan State College (now university), where I 
was the only psychologist on the faculty 
teaching the required courses for teacher 
certification and the courses in the broad­
ened curriculum.

In the summer of 1943,1 received a letter 
that changed the direction of my profes­
sional life.

One of the outstanding names a student 
of psychology encountered in my student 
days, perhaps even today, was Rensis 
Likert, of the Likert-type scales for meas­
uring attitudes. There were two rather 
unusual things about that letter. First, it 
asked if I would be interested in coming to 
Washington to discuss the possibility of a 
position as a psychologist in a research 
program headed by Likert. Second, it came 
from the Bureau of Agricultural Economics 
of the U.S. Department of Agriculture. 
Hence my query: What on earth did psy­
chologists do in the U.S. Department of 
Agriculture — a branch of the federal 
government that was concerned with crops 
and livestock?

My immediate guess was that Likert had 
come across my name through my pub­
lished work in psychological journals. I 
accepted the invitation to work with him in 
the Division of Program Surveys of Bureau 
of Agricultural Economics. This division 
was responsible for conducting psychologi­
cal surveys on farmer attitudes toward 
government agricultural policies and pro­
grams. It was a new area for psychology — 
the application of psychological concepts 
and methods to the study of problems in 
policy development and program evaluation 
in an agency of the federal government.

I was given the title of “project director” 
and was responsible for developing, direct­
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ing and reporting major research projects.
As it turned out, this strange new area of 

psychological research was not so strange 
after all. It drew upon concepts and meth­
ods in social psychology, attitude research 
clinical psychology, experimental psychol­
ogy (perception, memory, learning), statis­
tics and research design that I learned at 
Howard.

In 1945, I went back to teaching (at 
Southern and Morgan State) until I was 
appointed to the faculty at Howard in 1947.1 
was “back home.”

At Howard, a broad-based curriculum 
was already in place. There were a large 
number of psychology majors and sizeable 
groups of graduate students. And unlike the 
situation at other Black colleges, research 
by teachers was emphasized and expected. 
I felt quite comfortable with the atmosphere 
at Howard.

Meanwhile, Likert had gone to the Uni­
versity of Michigan where he established 
the Institute for Social Research. I was 
invited back to the Department of Agri­
culture by the new administrator of the 
division of Program Surveys to assist in a 
research project. This led to an arrange­
ment that lasted for several years.

During my second affiliation with the 
Department of Agriculture, something that 
illustrates my theme of obtaining a broad- 
based undergraduate and graduate educa­
tion occurred. Remember “psycho­
physics?” It came into play when the 
chairman of the Florida Citrus Commission 
presented this problem: Processed (can­
ned, frozen) natural-flavor orange juice can 
vary from very tart or sour to very sweet. 
What sourness-sweetness level is most 
preferred by consumers? I spotted this 
immediately as a problem that is based in 
the concepts and methods of psycho­
physics. This problem and its obvious 
application to other food products led me to 
establish, in the Department of Agri­
culture, a Food Preference Research Labo­
ratory. I also developed procedures for

large-scale food preference research proj­
ects (actually, large-scale psychophysical 
experiments). In appreciation of my work, 
the Department of Agriculture gave me a 
Superior Achievement Award.

My involvement in psychology as it 
applied to research on problems of policy 
and program evaluation brought me to the 
attention of individuals in the corporate 
world. Arnold King, president of National 
Analysts, Inc., a private research firm, 
offered me the position of vice president 
and director of research with his firm. 
Because I had no desire to leave perma­
nently my teaching post at Howard, I took 
leave of absence to develop the company’s 
research program. (National Analysts, Inc., 
is now a subsidiary of Booz, Allen and 
Hamilton).

Later, I was associated with Alfred Politz 
of New York, from 1962 to 1966, and the 
Chilton Company, a Philadelphia-based 
publisher of industrial magazines.

Beyond the Classroom

This recital of my experiences in the 
Department of Agriculture and the Na­
tional Analysts, and Alfred Politz and 
Chilton seems to be a far cry from what I 
said was my commitment and expectation 
when I left Howard with the B.S. and M.S. 
degrees. My goal then was simply to spend 
my life as a teacher of psychology in a Black 
college, or colleges. Up to now, I just more 
or less mentioned the fact that I have taught 
at Virginia State, Southern, Morgan State 
and Howard. Also, I have cited projects I 
have done for government agencies and 
corporate enterprises. What about matters 
of special concern to Black people? Con­
sider the following activities that I have 
been involved in over the years:
■  Serving as an expert witness in school 
desegregation cases, and a job discrimina­
tion case for the NAACP and the NAACP 
Legal Defense Fund. Key cases here in­
volved the desegregation of the Arlington, 
Alexandria and Roanoke school systems

after the period in Virginia known as 
“massive resistance.”
■  Conducting nationwide sessions in the 
desegregation of what was the most segre­
gated activity in government — the federal 
and state agricultural extension system that 
involved every one of the approximately 
3000 counties in the United States.
■  Evaluating programs established by 
New York City, Atlanta and Washington, 
D.C., in their efforts to cope with inner-city 
problems. Examples of the programs evalu­
ated are civilian police complaint review 
boards, summer youth programs, com­
munity relations commissions and civil 
rights commissions.

The most rewarding aspect of these 47 
years as a psychologist, though, is the 
record number of students I can say I 
“touched.”

I love teaching and working with stu­
dents, especially during 40 years at 
Howard. The opening of the Ph.D. program 
in psychology several years ago added a new 
dimension to my teaching and my academ­
ically-based research.

This, then, is the story about the impact 
Howard University had on me. As I look 
back, I am constantly amazed at the numer­
ous unanticipated paths that opened for me 
— paths that are characterized by a variety 
of activities. Today, as I approach my 
students, I am sharply conscious of the 
demand upon me to prepare them so that 
they will be equipped to take advantage of 
the unknown prospects that lie ahead. The 
details of these prospects cannot be antici­
pated. The only preparation is a broad- 
based one.

I am indebted to Howard for starting me 
on a direction that has been personally 
rewarding and productive. □

The above was excerpted from a presentation at 
the College of Liberal A rts’ Honors Day 
Convocation.
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