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NCCU School of Law Weekly
Carol Stanley
Editor
cstanlevraiwpo.nccu.edu

PLEASE TYPE ALL
WEEKLY NEWS ITEMS
AND SUBMIT BY 12:00
NOON FRIDAY
AFTERNOON BEFORE
MONDAY AFTERNOON
PRESS TIME.

E-MAIL WEEKLY
ENTRIES ARE
WELCOMED.

UNC SCHOOL OF LAW
CAMPUS BOX 3380
CHAPEL HILL, NC

IMMIGRATION LAW
SYMPOSIUM:

WORK, MIGRATION
& IDENTITY:

"WE WANTED WORKERS,
BUT HUMANS CAME"

SATURDAY
JANUARY 26, 2002
8:00 A.M. - 8:00 P.M.

PHONE:(919) 962-4402
FAX: (919) 962-4713

TAMESHA L. KEEL
SYMPOSIUM EDITOR

E-mail: NCILJ@UNC.EDU

The North Carolina Journal of

International Law and

Commercial Regulation

STUDENT
ORGANIZATIONS

There is a MANDATORY
MEETING for the Presidents
and Treasurers of all Student
Organizations on
Wednesday, January 2 3 rd at
6:15 p.m. in the basement
outside of the SBA office.
The agenda will include
budgets and requesting
money for the spring
semester. Presidents and
Treasurers who cannot
attend should see Keisha
Wright as soon as possible.

LAW JOURNAL NEWS

The Law Journal will have a
MANDATORY meeting for
ALL staff on Wednesday,
January 23,2002 at 6:15 p.m.
in Room 206. Pizza and/or
sub sandwiches will be
served. Anyone seeking to
be excused from the meeting
must submit their excuse in
writing to Renee Hughes by
Tuesday, January 2 2nd at
6:30 p.m.

TO ALL STUDENTS:

There will be a
PARAPHERNALIA SALE
Wednesday, January 2 3rd

Thursday, January 2 4th, and
Friday, January 2 5 th from
10:00 a.m. until 1:00 p.m. in
the back foyer
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