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Introduction
	 Twenty years have passed since the first 
CNEHA bibliography (Starbuck 1986), which 
included nearly all historical archaeology liter-
ature published within the area served by 
CNEHA up through the fall of 1987. The orig-
inal CNEHA bibliography consisted of 1,884 
citations, reflecting at least 60 years of research 
in the 7 provinces, 13 states, and the District of 
Columbia that are represented by CNEHA. In 
1987 it may have appeared that traditional 
publishing would decline and be replaced by 
the “gray literature” of cultural resource man-
agement, but that has not occurred. Today arti-
cles pertaining to historical archaeology in the 
Northeast appear most frequently in the jour-
nals Northeast Historical Archaeology, Historical 
Archaeology, IA, The Journal of the Society for 
Industrial Archeology, Archaeology of Eastern 
North America, North American Archaeologist 
and Journal of Middle Atlantic Archaeology, as 
well as in the magazines Archaeology, National 
Geographic, Expedition, Smithsonian and 
American Archaeology. Also, the journals pub-
lished by state and provincial archaeological 
societies now contain nearly as many articles 
about historical archaeology as they do about 
aspects of prehistory. At the same time, there 
has been a veritable explosion of books on his-
torical archaeology topics, especially by such 
university presses as University Press of 
Florida, University Press of Virginia, 
University of Tennessee Press, Cambridge 
University Press, University Press of New 
England, and others. The result is that this new 
bibliography contains 2,087 citations per-
taining to the Northeast. The current state of 
publications in our field appears very healthy 
indeed.
	 It may be said that there has been a “gener-
ational change” in who is doing the pub-
lishing. The earlier, 1986 bibliography was 
filled with entries by Ivor Noël Hume, James 
Deetz, John Cotter, Bert Salwen, Karlis 
Karklins, Ed Lenik, Olive Jones and others, 

many of whom are either retired or no longer 
with us. Now, of the older generation, only 
Ivor Noël Hume continues to publish vast 
numbers of books and articles, seemingly inde-
fatigable in his ability to inform and fascinate 
us. But 20 years ago, and continuing today, the 
“baby boomers” and succeeding age sets have 
been prodigious in their publishing efforts. 
The “faces,” the research topics, and even the 
institutions that conduct research continue to 
change, but some very good work has been the 
result.
	 The contents and format of this “new” bib-
liography mirror the 1986 bibliography as 
closely as possible. Entries include published 
articles, books, master’s theses and doctoral 
dissertations, but they do not include book 
reviews, most newsletter items (although there 
are some exceptions), CRM reports, on-line 
reports, or most of the other ephemera of our 
field. (A notable exception is the “Telling Time” 
posters prepared for CNEHA by George Miller 
and his colleagues at URS Corporation. These 
have been included because it appears that 
these will be around in quantity for a long time 
to come!) It was also necessary to exclude 
some submissions because they did not pertain 
to the region served by CNEHA, and others 
because they are still “In Press,” and it was 
unclear as to when they would actually be 
published. There is no duplication between the 
earlier bibliography and this one, but a small 
number of pre-1986 entries that were missed in 
the earlier bibliography have been included 
here.
	 There are no doubt some omissions, incon-
sistencies and downright errors in this bibliog-
raphy, in spite of very good intentions. Many 
individuals submitted copy for inclusion that 
contained contradictory or missing informa-
tion (such as volume and page numbers), there 
was a certain “looseness” in indicating the cor-
rect sequence of “senior” vs. “junior” authors, 
and it has not been possible in some cases to 
locate and verify the accuracy of every citation. 
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And while we all depend on bibliographies as 
a guide to further research, it has been dis-
tressing at times to find that a host of pub-
lished citations (at the ends of articles and 
books) are loaded with errors. That, too, did 
not make it easy to assemble this bibliography. 
Some articles published in state and local jour-
nals may also be missing, even though many 
of these were carefully combed through.
	 What did make this task easier, though, 
was the assistance of dozens of CNEHA mem-
bers who sent in entries for inclusion. I have 
tried to faithfully incorporate all of your 
entries, except for the occasional book review, 
newsletter entry, or CRM report. Perhaps these 
will some day be included in bibliographies 
elsewhere. I would especially like to thank 
Ellen Blaubergs for submitting a great many 
entries about archaeology in Ontario, David 
Poirier who submitted many entries for 
Connecticut, Paul Huey and Charles Fisher 
who submitted many entries for New York 
State, Monique Elie who provided many 
entries for Quebec, and Mary Beaudry who 
provided entries for many of her students and 
colleagues. Mary and Ellen also spent a very 
substantial amount of time proofreading and 
then adding to the nearly-completed bibliog-
raphy.
	 As with the 1986 bibliography, at the end 
of many of the entries there is a letter abbrevia-
tion in brackets to indicate the pertinent state 
or province. The abbreviations are as follows:

NL	 Newfoundland and Labrador
ON	 Ontario
QC	 Quebec
NB	 New Brunswick
PEI	 Prince Edward Island
NS	 Nova Scotia
ME	 Maine
NH	 New Hampshire
VT	 Vermont
MA	 Massachusetts
CT	 Connecticut
RI	 Rhode Island
NY	 New York
PA	 Pennsylvania
NJ	 New Jersey
DEL	 Delaware
VA	 Virginia
WV	 West Virginia
MD	 Maryland

DC	 District of Columbia
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