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School counselors need multiple resources to assist
today’s students in developing to their fullest potential.
This development might often be measured outwardly
by academic success; however, psychological and emo-
tional well-being of students is a large part of this suc-
cess. The construct of hope is defined as a bidimension-
al characteristic consisting of an agency component
(willpower to move toward one’s goals) and a path-
ways component (ability to develop multiple routes to
one’s goals) and has been linked to academic success,
athletic performance, psychological adjustment, and
physical health in students (Snyder et al., 1991).
Helping school counselors to enhance individual
strengths through the promotion of characteristics such
as hope may result in multiple benefits for students
and their school environments at large. Studies involv-
ing hope and its correlates are discussed and sugges-
tions for appropriate and feasible interventions in this
area are given.

S
chool counselors are uniquely positioned to help
students define, work toward, and reach their
goals in many life arenas. Although identifying

and preventing problems that hinder youth’s success
is important, balancing these efforts with a deeper
examination of “what works” for students can ulti-
mately reveal individual goals that matter to these
students, strategies that can be used to pursue those
goals, and the motivation that can keep them on
track (Galassi & Akos, 2007). Indeed, using
approaches designed to identify and enhance
strengths can assist students in achieving to their
fullest potential. Hope is conceptualized as a process
of goal pursuit involving the generation of multiple
routes toward a chosen goal and maintenance of
motivational levels needed to make progress along
these routes (Snyder et al., 1991). This article details
C. R. Snyder’s hope theory and research, giving spe-
cial emphasis to the role that school counselors can
play in enhancing students’ hope and, in turn, the
promotion of personal and social well-being, career
development, and academic achievement (American
School Counselor Association [ASCA], 2005). 

In thinking about helping students to become
more hopeful, it is important to note that that this
process involves teaching a set of skills that build on
what children do naturally: think about the future.
With this strength-based guidance from school
counselors, children can learn how to describe
important goals that are clear, specific, and add
something to their lives. 

HOPE THEORY

Over the past 20 years, Snyder and his colleagues
have developed a theory and associated measures of
hope that have received much attention both within
and outside the field of psychology (Edwards, Rand,
Lopez, & Snyder, 2006). In his seminal book, The
Psychology of Hope, Snyder (1994) described his the-
ory and early research efforts to understand and
measure hope. He described hope in primarily cog-
nitive terms, though the theory evolved to include
emotions as well (Snyder, 2000b). 

According to Snyder and colleagues (1991, p.
287), hope is defined as “a positive motivational
state that is based on an interactively derived sense of
successful (a) agency (goal-directed energy) and (b)
pathways (planning to meet goals).” This model
involves three interrelated components—goals,
agency, and pathways (Snyder, Ilardi, Michael, &
Cheavens, 2000). Pathways and agency thinking are
positively related, additive, and reciprocal, but nei-
ther component alone defines hope, nor are they
synonymous.

Goals are the anchor of hope theory, as they are
the targets of mental action sequences (Snyder et al.,
2000). Individuals’ goals must fall somewhere in the
middle of a probability of an attainment continuum
going from goals that are absolutely certain of being
achieved to those that are untenable (Edwards et al.,
2006). To reach goals, people must perceive that
they are capable of imagining one or more routes, or
pathways, to their goals. Snyder (1994) described
pathways thinking, the second component of hope,
as the mental capacity necessary to reach goals.
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When barriers to desired goals emerge, as they
inevitably do, the mental flexibility of pathways
thinking allows people to navigate those obstacles
and find alternate routes. For example, if a child is
learning to play soccer, it might be difficult for him
or her to find time to practice. Pathways thoughts
could be those that encourage the child to prioritize
after-school activities, schedule specific practice
times with friends, and create a personal system of
rewards in order to increase soccer practice time.

Agency is the third component of hope, and it
refers to the motivation that propels individuals to
initiate and sustain movement toward their goals
(Snyder, 1994). People with agency, also known as
willpower, are able to remain determined and utilize
their mental energy to move around obstacles and
stay focused on achieving their goals. For children
trying to play soccer better, agency thoughts would
be those reminders they tell themselves to persist
with practicing, focus on improvements, and keep
working toward their goal of playing soccer. 

It is important for school counselors to take cul-
tural context into account, as well, in developing
appropriate interventions for students of all back-
grounds. In thinking about strengths such as hope
as they apply to a diverse population, it is important
to be aware of differences in time orientation, value
systems, and feasibility of personal choice (Pedrotti,
2007). For example, the hope process with its future
orientation may not fit as well for cultural groups
that do not ascribe to this orientation to time, such
as Eastern cultures. In addition, people from cul-
tures that are more collectivist in nature (e.g., Asian,
Latino) may feel that group goals, as opposed to
individual goals, are more pertinent. Finally, sources
of agency and motivation may not come from per-
sonal stores but may be rooted in familial responsi-
bility, or filial piety (Pedrotti). The hope model may
still be used with individuals from these cultures, but
at times modifications must be made to ensure rele-
vance and respect for differences. School counselors
must be aware of these potential differences in order
to appropriately integrate and acknowledge the
unique cultural contexts of all students.

Hope and Its Relationship to Positive Constructs
and Outcomes
Snyder and colleagues’ (1991) concept of hope has
been studied in many contexts, and several positive
correlates to this construct have been found in
youth. Many of these constructs are directly related
to goals that school counselors may have in devel-
oping certain types of strengths in their students.
Enhancement of hope within students can assist
with development in areas of personal/social, aca-
demic, and career development (ASCA, 2005). 

Hope and personal/social contexts. It is not

surprising to find that hope is related to many other
positive constructs within the realm of personal and
social life. Magaletta and Oliver (1999) examined
relationships between hope and both self-efficacy
and optimism and found positive and statistically
significant relationships between these pairs. In addi-
tion, hope has been linked with self-esteem (Snyder
et al., 1997), self-worth (Curry, Snyder, Cook,
Ruby, & Rehm, 1997), beliefs about the ability to
accomplish goals (Snyder, Sympson, Michael, &
Cheavens, 2000), and life satisfaction (Chang,
1998). Studies also have shown that low hope is pre-
dictive of depression (Kwon, 2000), and higher
hope has been found to be related to lower levels of
depression in children (Snyder et al., 1997). Hope is
termed “a psychological strength” by Valle, Hueb-
ner, and Suldo (2006) and was found in their study
of adolescents to function as a moderator or buffer
between difficult experiences in life and well-being. 

Finally, Barnum, Snyder, Rapoff, Mani, and
Thompson (1998) found that adolescent burn sur-
vivors with higher hope related to caregivers more
positively and also engaged in fewer activities that
undermined recovery. Although links between these
various constructs and hope are strong, it is impor-
tant to note that hope, optimism, and self-efficacy
are uniquely predictive of outcomes and are thus dis-
tinct constructs (Magaletta & Oliver, 1999). The
above constructs are much-desired qualities and can
promote social and psychological wellness in all stu-
dents (Miller, Gilman, & Martens, 2008). Fostering
these types of personal traits can have carry-over ef-
fects into academic and future work domains as well. 

Hope and academic performance. Hope has
been linked to academic benefits in several studies.
Anderson (1988) found that IQ scores were signifi-
cantly and positively linked to hope, and Snyder and
colleagues (Snyder, 2002; Snyder et al., 1991;
Snyder et al., 1997) have studied the relationship
between grade point average and hope and found
similar results. Hope also has been linked to self-effi-
cacy (Magaletta & Oliver, 1999) and scholastic
competence (Onwuegbuzie, 1999), as well as prob-
lem-solving (McDermott et al., 2000). Finally, other
studies have found that “hope in the future” (as
measured by answers to questions regarding the
importance of attending college, the likelihood of
having a good job by age 30, and the likelihood of
having a “dismal” future) is inversely linked to
dropout rates in adolescents (Worrell & Hale, 2001,
p. 378). 

Hope and career-building skills. Positive traits
such as hope, self-efficacy, problem-solving, and
optimism also may assist students in developing
good skills in vocational development. Diemer and
Bluestein (2007) studied the “vocational hope” (p.
98) of adolescents in urban settings and found that
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this construct was related to positive vocational
identity development. These researchers showed
links in the ability to persist toward vocational goals
despite various obstacles that may occur. Other stud-
ies (e.g., Super, 1980) have shown that a future-ori-
ented identity is positively correlated toward a ben-
eficial vocational identity as well, and thus Snyder’s
(2002) hope model may be particularly beneficial in
this work. Diemer and Bluestein suggested that
interventions designed to enhance vocational hope
may assist in managing both external and internal
threats to the career development goals of urban
adolescents. These practical implications may be
extended to include any school-aged child or ado-
lescent dealing with obstacles in this area.  

The previously discussed studies show that hope is
related to many positive constructs and outcomes;
thus it follows that cultivating and enhancing hope
in youth may improve current and future function-
ing. Miller and colleagues (2008) state that “educa-
tional facilities are ideal settings for providing inter-
ventions and prevention programs that promote
hope and optimism” (p. 6) due to the large amount
of time that students spend in this venue. Thus
school counselors are uniquely equipped to help stu-
dents build these types of resources and to offer pro-
gramming to address these topics with both students
and parents. 

Assessment of Hope
One of the issues that has plagued research in the
areas of wellness and health promotion is the incor-
rect belief that assessment of positive characteristics,
such as hope, well-being, and optimism, is impossi-
ble due to their amorphous nature (Snyder &
Lopez, 2007). There are, in fact, many methods of
measurement of these types of constructs. Snyder
and colleagues (1991) developed the Adult Hope
Scale, a 12-item self-report measure that asks ques-
tions related to goal processes. Answers range on a
4-point Likert scale from definitely false to definite-
ly true. Psychometrics have been established for this
measure (Snyder et al., 1991) and it has been used
in hundreds of studies to better understand hope in
adults. This measure was then adapted by Snyder
and colleagues (1997) to forms that could be used
for school-aged children (the Children’s Hope Scale
[CHS]). Snyder, Feldman, Shorey, and Rand (2002)
stated that in addition to measuring global hope, it
is also important to measure domain-specific hope.
Some studies have found that while global hope may
be high for students, hope in the specific domain of
academics may be lacking (Snyder et al., 2002).
Thus, measurement across several levels may be
appropriate, and the Domain Specific Hope Scale
may be useful for this assessment (Sympson, 1999). 

The CHS (Snyder et al., 1997) is a six-item self-

report scale that asks questions about how children
think and feel about their goals and the steps they
take to reach them. Answers on this scale range from
none of the time to all of the time on a 6-point Likert
scale. Three of the six items (items 2, 4, and 6) can
be summed to form a Pathways subscale (e.g., “I can
think of many ways to get the things in life that are
most important to me”) and the other three (items
1, 3, and 5) sum to form an Agency subscale (e.g.,
“I think I am doing pretty well”). A copy of the scale
is included in Appendix A. The CHS was developed
for use with children ages 7 to 16, and support for
reliability and validity, as well as factor structure, has
been established in many different populations of
youth (Lopez, Snyder, & Pedrotti, 2003).

Despite mean-level analyses of race and gender
(Snyder et al., 1997; Valle, Huebner, & Suldo,
2004), further basic information is needed to under-
stand hope in other non-European American popu-
lations. Support has been found for a hierarchical
representation of the CHS with two underlying fac-
tors (pathways and agency) within Mexican
American youth (Edwards, Ong, & Lopez, 2007).
CHS scores were found to be positively correlated
with measures of positive affect, life satisfaction, sup-
port from family and friends, and optimism, and
additional analyses provided evidence supporting
convergent validity and measurement invariance
across gender. In addition, recent investigations of
hope in African American youth have provided sup-
port for the reliability and validity of the CHS with
this population (Valle et al.). More information is
needed regarding conceptual equivalence of the
construct of hope across cultures.

The CHS is a well-researched assessment tool that
has been used in numerous studies and settings to
understand hope in youth (Edwards et al., 2006).
School counselors may consider using the CHS in
order to chart individual student progress, conduct
research about hope and other outcomes in schools,
and provide evidence-based support for related
interventions that target hope and/or well-being
(ASCA, 2005). In addition, once a level of hope has
been established for a student or group of youth,
school counselors can monitor this level as they
teach children about the strategies described in the
hope model itself. 

Increasing Hope in Youth
Individual strategies. School counselors may con-
sider integrating hope concepts into their individual
planning work with students (ASCA, 2005).
According to Snyder et al. (2002), the first step in
engaging youth about hope concepts is to help them
identify a set of goals that span various life domains.
School counselors can utilize values, interests, and
skills/abilities inventories to stimulate this list of
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goals, and students should be encouraged to priori-
tize the goals in terms of importance to them. Those
goals that are unambiguous and have distinct end-
points will be best for students to work toward, and
markers can be created to help students evaluate
their progress toward goals.

Once counselors have helped students identify
and rank their goals, they can work with youth to
develop agency and pathways thoughts (Snyder et
al., 2002). Developing agency about goals involves
examining the nature of the goals and deciding if
they are meaningful and challenging enough to sus-
tain the student’s energy and motivation to pursue
them. Additionally, students can be taught to moni-
tor negative self-talk that may be discouraging, and
rather focus on learning positive self-statements such
as “I can do this” and “I’m a capable person”
(Snyder et al., p. 305). Keeping a personal diary of
ongoing self-talk can be a useful tool for monitoring
self-statements (Lopez, Rose, Robinson, Marques,
& Pais Reibero, in press).

Finally, developing pathways thoughts helps stu-
dents to find routes around obstacles that emerge as
they work toward their goals (Snyder et al., 2002).
One aspect of enhancing pathways thinking is to
develop subgoals that can be approached in a logi-
cal, step-by-step sequence (Lopez et al., in press).
For example, for a student whose goal is to under-
stand fractions for his math class, a school counselor
can help him to identify ways (e.g., finding a peer
tutor, completing extra worksheets) to work toward
this goal even as obstacles come in the way. 

Group techniques. Several promising programs
have been developed to enhance hope among chil-
dren and adolescents, many of which can be utilized
or adapted for incorporation into the guidance cur-
riculum (ASCA, 2005). One of the first interven-
tions developed to increase hope in children
involved learning about hope theory and discussing
stories about high-hope children (McDermott,
Callahan, Gingerich, Hastings, & Gariglietti, 1997).
This program involved eight weekly sessions with
first- through sixth-grade students at an ethnically
diverse elementary school. During each week of this
program, students spent 30 minutes discussing hope
and goal-setting and hearing stories about high-
hope children. Through hearing and discussing
these stories each week for 30 minutes, children had
the opportunity to identify goals in the lives of pro-
tagonists as well as to apply the hope concepts to
their own lives. Children’s hope was assessed with
the CHS before and after the 8-week session, and
results demonstrated modest improvement on both
self-report and teacher ratings of students’ hope.
McDermott and colleagues concluded that an 8-
week session was not sufficient time to instill high
hope, but they considered their results promising

(Lopez et al., 2004). 
The Making Hope Happen program (MHH;

Pedrotti, Lopez, & Krieshok, 2000) is another
school-based intervention developed to enhance
hope in students through didactic teaching and
group work. MHH was first piloted at the junior
high level. The MHH program consisted of five 45-
minute sessions with groups of 8 to 10 junior high
students, each lead by two graduate students. After
beginning with a simple explanation of the hope
model developed by Snyder and colleagues (1991),
the MHH program was designed to move through
various exercises and interactions geared at helping
students to use the hope model in their own lives. 

Week 1 began with an introduction of the model,
using various posters and cartoons to outline the
main tenets of pathways, agency, and obstacles. In
addition, narratives that featured high-hope protag-
onists were introduced during this session to help
students to identify high-hope strategies and state-
ments. Group discussions were facilitated to outline
these points for all students. At the end of this first
session, students were paired into “Hope Buddy”
partnerships to be kept throughout the 5 weeks.
These pairs were chosen by the researchers after
reviewing the students’ individual hope scores, and
they paired high-hope children with lower-hope
children so as to facilitate modeling. Finally, students
were asked to devise a personal goal during this ses-
sion that could be pursued throughout the 5 weeks
of the MHH program. These goals could be small
or large and did not have to be achieved by the 5th
week of the program; the only restriction placed on
students was that the goals had to be positive (i.e.,
adding something to one’s life) as opposed to nega-
tive (i.e., stopping a bad behavior or habit). If stu-
dents devised more negative goals (e.g., “I want to
stop fighting with my sister”), group leaders helped
them to rework them into more positive phrasing
(e.g., “I want to get along better with my sister”). 

In week 2, the points made during the first session
were revisited through the use of new narratives, and
the concept of “G-POWER” was introduced. Each
of the letters in this word stand for a particular com-
ponent of the hope model: G = goals; P = pathways;
O = obstacles; W = willpower; E = evaluate your process;
R = rethink and try again (Pedrotti et al., 2000).
Students were trained to use this acronym to help
them to remember the different steps to the hope
model. Week 3 followed up on this concept and the
“Hope Game” was introduced. This board game
was devised to reinforce the additive properties of
agency and pathways and to emphasize that both are
needed to facilitate goal achievement. As always after
each of these sessions, hope buddies met and dis-
cussed progress made on goals throughout the week. 

In week 4, students were given more individual
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work in addition to group work, and the concept of
hope talk was introduced during this session.
Students were asked to change unhopeful sentences
(e.g., “I will never be good at math”) into more
hopeful sentences (e.g., “Math is not my best sub-
ject, but I can use these strategies to succeed”). In
addition, statements from historical (e.g., Martin
Luther King, Jr.) and local figures (e.g., a college
basketball coach) were evaluated by the students for
their level of hopefulness. Finally, in this week stu-
dents began to write their personal hope story,
which described their chosen goal and the progress
made toward it during the 5 weeks. Lastly, in week
5, students read their completed hope stories to the
group. Snacks and beverages were provided on this
day to promote a celebration of the completion of
progress on these goals, and students were asked to
offer positive feedback and future steps to each other
about their goal processes. 

Prior to the beginning of the MHH program, all
students were given the Children’s Hope Scale
(Snyder et al., 1997). At this time, a control group
also was identified and these students were adminis-
tered the measure as well. Upon completion of the
program all students were again administered the
CHS and increases in hope scores were found to be
significantly larger in the group of students who par-
ticipated in the MHH program, as compared to the
control group. These results were maintained 6
weeks post-programming (Pedrotti et al., 2000),
suggesting that students continued to utilize the
tenets learned in the program.

After the Making Hope Happen program was
established at the junior high level, expansion to the
elementary school level occurred. Making Hope
Happen for Kids (MHHK; Edwards & Lopez,
2000) was developed to enhance hope in fourth-
grade students. This five-session program involved
activities and lessons designed to help students
understand hope and apply the construct to their
lives. The program was conducted in several class-
rooms with groups of 7 to 10 students each led by
two graduate student co-facilitators. 

The first week of MHHK involved learning about
the hope model and acting out the parts of the
model with laminated props (Edwards & Lopez,
2000). Students pretended to be goals, obstacles,
pathways, and agency using the props (e.g., a stop
sign for an obstacle, an arrow for pathways and
willpower) in a brief psychodrama depicting mean-
ingful goal pursuits. In the second week, children
were introduced to a story that described a young
girl navigating obstacles as she worked toward the
goal of learning lines for her school play. During the
third week, children played a different version of the
Hope Game designed for this age group. Children
worked in teams to identify obstacles, pathways, and

agency thoughts to accomplish a shared goal. In the
fourth week, children designed hope cartoons,
emphasizing hopeful language. Finally, during the
last week of the program, children developed hope
stories detailing the goals on which they had been
working, and then they shared their stories with one
another in a final celebration. 

Evaluation of the MHHK program was conduct-
ed at the end of the first and second years in two dif-
ferent schools. The CHS (Snyder et al., 1997) was
administered before and after delivery of the inter-
vention with all children. While the evaluation of
this program did not include a control group, com-
parisons of means at pretest and posttest demon-
strated significant gains in hope scores in the fourth-
grade students. Thus, hope was enhanced in these
young children (Lopez et al., 2004). 

In addition, the Making Hope Happen High
School (MHH-HS) program was developed specifi-
cally for use with freshmen in an urban high school
(Bouwkamp & Lopez, 2001). The MHH-HS pro-
gram, which is quite similar to the original MHH
program, consists of five 70-minute sessions with
groups of 20-plus students, each led by two trained
facilitators. As in the other versions of the program,
pretest measures were completed and week 1 pro-
gramming began with an introduction of hope the-
ory and its many applications, using various posters
and stories (with adolescent high-hope protagonists)
to describe how goal thinking combines with path-
ways and agency. The “Hope Camera Project” also
was introduced during the first week with the fol-
lowing instructions:

The “Hope Camera Project” is a creative
group effort spanning all five sessions of the
program. You will be divided up into groups
of ten, and each group will receive a dispos-
able camera. Your instructions are to use the
camera and take pictures of people, places, or
things that represent HOPE to you. Then you
will use these images to create a final HOPE
project (of your own design) to share with the
class at our fifth session. 

In weeks 2, 3, and 4, additional hope stories were
used to emphasize the components of hope theory
and engage participants in the daily applications of
hope. Progress on the hope camera projects was dis-
cussed. Completion of personal hope stories (see the
description in the junior high version of MHH)
reinforced that individuals can pursue important
goals without much help from others, and the team
project helped to introduce hope as a social phe-
nomenon. 

Week 5 took on a celebratory tone with snacks,
beverages, and music. Groups shared their hope
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camera projects, which included collages,
PowerPoint presentations, a musical number, and
one video (which was created by participants who
lost their disposable camera and borrowed a video
camera to complete the project). The group ended
with each participant discussing future plans using
hopeful language. Upon completion of the program
all students completed the posttest measures and it
was found that low-hope students achieved signifi-
cant gains in hope (Bouwkamp & Lopez, 2001).

Future Directions for Nurturing Hope in Schools
As much of children and adolescents’ time is spent
in the school environment, “educational facilities are
ideal settings for providing interventions and pre-
vention programs that promote hope” (Miller et al.,
2008, p. 6). There are several future directions that
may be beneficial to pursue in facilitating enhance-
ment of hope within the school environment.
School counselors may have a unique vantage point
within the school environment to contemplate how
to improve hope within students, teachers, staff, and
administrators, as well as to note if there are signs of
loss of hope or burnout on the part of these person-
nel (Snyder et al., 2002). Indeed, facilitating sys-
temic change (ASCA, 2005) is an aspect of school
counselors’ work that can help to make broader
changes in the environments in which youth exist,
and it may serve to increase hope on a larger scale.
School counselors can share information with other
school professionals about hope and how to evaluate
and increase their own hope within work and per-
sonal contexts. Discussions or workshops with
school personnel about the general school climate
can lead to the generation of specific strategies for
facilitating a hopeful environment. 

To this end, changes must often be facilitated at
the macro level, and recognition of an overarching
goal of health and wellness promotion is valuable
from an administration perspective (Miller et al.,
2008). Encouragement of both physical and mental
health in a school’s personnel, and as a goal for its
students, can create a climate that values overall
wellness in this way. One way to do this is by maxi-
mizing mentally healthful characteristics such as
hope, as this construct is beneficial on its own and
has so many other positive correlates. Miller and col-
leagues offer several suggestions along these lines,
including incorporating hope and optimism pro-
grams within the curriculum, the use of structured
activities outside the curriculum, and applying infor-
mation from sport and exercise psychology to use
within the school context. These researchers state
that taking this three-pronged approach that incor-
porates both psychological and physical health can
facilitate overall wellness in students (Miller et al.). 

It is also important that school counselors receive

support to pursue endeavors that address positive
constructs and prevention tactics as opposed to only
supporting intervention tactics (Galassi & Akos,
2007). Although it is essential to provide resources
for students who are already dealing with problems,
primary prevention programs that incorporate all
students can be extremely beneficial at promoting
positive constructs such as hope at a macro level
(Snyder & Lopez, 2007). Meta-analyses have shown
that universal primary prevention techniques (i.e.,
those aimed at an entire community or context)
involving programs for children and adolescents
have been largely effective (Durlak & Wells, 1997),
and thus this is an important area to pursue.

The development of programs that create an envi-
ronment that facilitates respect for diversity is anoth-
er essential area of future development (Snyder &
Lopez, 2007). It is important to recognize that dif-
ferences may exist between individuals of different
races and ethnicities in terms of how they view the
relevance of hope in their lives, as well as in the types
of pathways they create and the sources from which
they derive agency. At present, more research is
needed in this area, but school counselors can work
to develop their own multicultural competence by
being aware of their own biases and making sure to
gain knowledge and skills in working with individu-
als from all backgrounds (American Psychological
Association, 2002). 

Finally, several resources exist to help school pro-
fessionals to learn more about Snyder’s hope model
and to develop ideas for its application in school and
therapeutic contexts. For an academic book on the-
ory and research about hope across various domains,
Snyder’s (2000a) Handbook of Hope is a critical
resource. Other books that provide strategies and
examples for how to instill hope in clients and stu-
dents include Hope for the Journey: Helping Children
Through Good Times and Bad (Cook, McDermott,
Rapoff, & Snyder, 1997), Making Hope Happen: A
Workbook for Turning Possibilities into Realities
(McDermott & Snyder, 1999), and The Great Big
Book of Hope (McDermott & Snyder, 2000). It is
hoped that through these means school counselors
may have the resources they need to assist students
and student personnel in enhancing their personal
hope. ❚
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APP ENDIX A
Goals Scale

Directions: Read each item carefully. Using the scale shown below, please select the number that best
describes you and put that number in the blank provided. 

1 2 3 4 5 6
None of A little of Some of A lot of Most of All of 
the time the time the time the time the time the time

_____ 1. I think I am doing pretty well.

_____ 2. I can think of many ways to get the things in life that are most important to me.

_____ 3. I am doing just as well as other kids my age.

_____ 4. When I have a problem, I can come up with lots of ways to solve it.

_____ 5. I think the things I have done in the past will help me in the future.

_____ 6. Even when others want to quit, I know that I can find ways to solve the problem.
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