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Summary 

There has been no large-scale study looking at the proportion of 
social work students in the UK who achieve the professional 

qualification, although there is some evidence that different groups 

experience different rates of progression. This article examines 

progression rates among students studying for the DipSW in 

England and analyses the factors that influence whether students 
achieve an award on time (defined as achieving an award without 

being referred, deferred, failing or withdrawing). The results show 

that male students, students from a black and minority ethnic 

group, and stu- dents with a self-reported disability have poorer 
progression rates. However, contrary to the picture in higher 

education as a whole, older students and students with previously 

lower levels of educational attainment do not have poorer 

progression rates. Social work education has important lessons to 
share with higher-education colleagues in terms of working with an 

increasingly diverse student group. However, work is needed to 

identify students at greater risk of non-progression than others and 

to develop more effective student support strategies. 

Keywords: professional training, minority ethnic groups, gender, 

disability, social work, progression rates, higher education 

Introduction 

The recruitment and retention of social workers in the United 

Kingdom (UK) has attracted increased policy attention, most The 
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recruitment and retention of social workers in the UK has attracted 

increased policy attention, most clearly indicated in the decision to 

make social work a degree-level qualification (Department of 
Health, 2001). This coincides with a wider government target of 

increasing entry to higher education, partic- ularly among under-

represented groups (Secretary of State for Education and Skills, 

2003). Arguably, social work was one of the earliest professions to 
engage with issues of discrimination (Ahmad, 1990; Statham, 

1994; Dominelli, 2002). Indeed, these concerns, which were subject 

to ridicule from some quar- ters in the 1980s, have now entered the 

political mainstream (McLaughlin, 2005). In this context, examining 
how theoretical commitments to combat dis- crimination are 

reflected in the demographic characteristics of people complet- ing 

social work programmes provides information on how the profession 

both addresses the issue of workforce diversity and raises questions 
about the role of social work education in contributing to this 

process. Perhaps surprisingly, this has been an under-researched 

area within social work education until now. However, with the 

formal investigation into public sector fitness standards (Disability 

Rights Commission, 2006), it is likely to become increasingly 
important. Furthermore, the establishment of the Commission for 

Equality and Human Rights (CEHR) (2006 Equality Act) suggests 

that there will be more strategic and overarching attempts to tackle 

different types of inequality in the future. 

This article presents secondary analysis of data provided by the 

General Social Care Council (GSCC) on three cohorts of students 

registering in England for the Diploma in Social Work (DipSW) in 

1995–96, 1996–97 and 1997–98 to explore factors associated with 
its completion. The DipSW formed the basic professional qualifying 

award for social work in the UK from 1989 until the introduction of 

the new degree-level qualification in 2003. 

 

Background 

Social work, and the widening participation agenda 

Indicators that different students have differing experiences of 

social work education have been clear for some time. For example, 

students with disabilities face barriers in accessing and completing 

social work programmes (Baron et al., 1996; Crawshaw, 2002; 
Wray et al., 2005). Practice placements may pose particular 

challenges. While many disabled students report positive 

experiences, others say that some placement staff show limited 

awareness and fear being made to feel a ‘burden’ or that their 
employment prospects will be jeopardized if they disclose a 
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disability (Wray et al., 2005). This may explain why only one in ten 

social work students declares a disability (Central Council for 

Education and Training in Social Work, 2001; General Social Care 
Council, 2002, 2003, 2004a), whereas, among the working-age 

population, almost twice as many people consider themselves to be 

disabled (Smith and Twomey, 2002). This has led to the assertion 

that ‘disability issues have remained a poor relation among all the 
equalities of social work training’ (Oliver, 2004, p. 10). It is possible 

that changes to the way that the GSCC asks students to report 

whether they have a disability may capture students’ difficulties 

more accurately but this has only taken effect from 2006 and its 
impact on reporting rates has yet to be monitored. 

Improving the under-representation of older students in higher 

education is an important part of the government’s widening 

participation strategy and commitment to life-long learning 
(Secretary of State for Education and Skills, 2003). What has 

caused particular concern is that mature students (defined as those 

aged twenty-five and over at the beginning of a course of study) 

have poorer progression rates than their counterparts aged 

eighteen to twenty-five, with almost twice as many full-time mature 
students (15.4 per cent) not continuing in higher education after 

their first year compared with young entrants (7.8 per cent) (Higher 

Education Statistics Authority, 2004). By contrast, over two-thirds 

of social work students are aged twenty-five to forty-four (Central 
Council for Education and Training in Social Work, 2001; General 

Social Care Council, 2002, 2003, 2004a) in comparison with around 

a fifth of students accepted for higher education as a whole 

(Moriarty and Murray, 2005). Furthermore, the introduction of the 
DipSW was seen as a way of removing unnecessary barriers to 

higher education among mature applicants (Green Lister, 2003). 

Widening participation strategies also aim to address the variations 

in the proportion of students from different ethnic groups. While 

Asian–Indian, black African and Chinese people are relatively over-
represented in higher education in comparison with their numbers 

within the working-age population as a whole, black Caribbean 

people are under-represented (Department for Education and Skills, 

2004). Furthermore, it is not enough simply to consider 
participation rates without also considering different students’ 

experiences in higher education and their progression rates. Connor 

and colleagues (2004) have shown that while people from black and 

minority ethnic groups are more likely than white people to 
progress to higher education in England, they are, on aver- age, 

less likely to do as well in degree performance and face greater 

problems finding employment (Connor et al., 2004). With black1 

students comprising between 10 and 15 per cent of new enrolments 
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each year (Central Council for Education and Training in Social 

Work, 2001; General Social Care Council, 2002, 2003, 2004a), 

social work represents one of the few subjects in which there are 
substantial proportions of black students (Department for Education 

and Skills, 2004). However, there are comparatively few social work 

students from Asian–Indian, Asian–Pakistani and Asian–Bangladeshi 

backgrounds (Moriarty and Murray, 2005). With some exceptions 
(Aymer and Bryan, 1996; Cropper, 2000), there has been very little 

UK research looking at the experiences of social work students from 

black and minority ethnic groups. However, evidence from the USA 

suggests that a supportive culture within the institution, relevant 
curicula and the presence of faculty staff who are themselves from 

a minority ethnic background are positive factors in attracting and 

retaining social work students from minority ethnic groups (Aranda, 

2001; Bowie et al., 2005). 

The position of male social work students is perhaps more complex. 

While always in a minority (Christie, 2001), their numbers have 

declined from around a third to a fifth during the past twenty years 

(Lyons et al., 1995; Perry and Cree, 2003). Furthermore, 

proportionally fewer men achieve an award in comparison with 
women (Cree, 2001). At the same time, both men and women 

students are aware that it is men who are the more likely to achieve 

promotion upon entering paid employment (Taylor, 1994; Cree, 

1996). 

Regrettably, very little research has looked at how social work 

supports students from less privileged socio-economic backgrounds 

or those whose sexuality means that they may experience 

discrimination. Shaw (1985) suggested that social work was a 
‘closed profession’ to applicants from lower socio-economic 

backgrounds. However, the decline in the proportion of students 

from routine and semi-routine economic backgrounds within higher 

education (Galindo- Rueda et al., 2004) means that social work may 

be attracting a broader representation of students from different 
socio-economic backgrounds than many subjects. This may be the 

result of people working in social care support roles embarking on 

professional training (Moriarty and Murray, BJSW Advance Access 

doi:10.1093/bjsw/bch325). 

While there has been some research on the experiences of lesbian, 

gay, bisexual and transgendered (LGBT) social work students 

(Trotter and Gilchrist, 1996; Burgess et al., 1997), this has not 

explored whether sexuality affects progression. 

Lastly, previous educational attainment is important to consider 

when analysing progression rates because research suggests that 

lower levels of previous educational attainment are associated with 
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higher rates of non-continuation in higher education (Smith and 

Naylor, 2001; Davies and Elias, 2003). Social work is one of the 

subjects attracting fewest undergraduate students with high levels 
of previous educational attainment (Leslie, 2002, 2003), albeit this 

picture fails to take into account the fact that around a quarter of 

social work students undertake postgraduate routes (Central 

Council for Education and Training in Social Work, 2001; General 
Social Care Council, 2002, 2003, 2004a). 

Progression rates 

The chances that a student will complete a course of study in higher 

education are affected by different factors. 

Factors attributable to the higher education institution (HEI) at 
which the student is studying range from teaching and assessment 

methods, course structure, numbers and types of students to 

relationships and levels of staff and student contact. The expansion 

of higher education has led to a larger and more diverse student 
population without commensurate increases in staffing or resources 

(Manthorpe and Stanley, 2002). Where HEIs are offering vocational 

courses, there are further potential influences on progression rates. 

As well as providing the theoretical components of the programme, 
arrangements have to be made for students to develop their 

practice skills. This depends on sufficient numbers of good-quality 

practice placements and of practice teachers; shortages exist both 

in social work education and other professional training courses, 

such as nursing and occupational therapy (Craik and Turner, 2005; 
Hutchings et al., 2005). This was one of the reasons why the 

establishment of the Practice Learning Taskforce was seen as an 

important part of introducing the new degree (Department of 

Health, 2003a). 

Students themselves may experience a number of challenges. 

These include concerns about the course, worries about their future 

career, depending upon levels of graduate unemployment, 

difficulties in adjusting to student life and personal relationship 
problems (Grant, 2002). In addition, the question of how debt 

affects participation in higher education has dominated debates 

(Callender and Jackson, 2005). As social work students tend to be 

older than the average undergraduate, the change from 
maintenance grants to student loans was one explanation for the 

decline in newly qualifying social workers in the late 1990s (Wallis-

Jones and Lyons, 2003) and a major spur to the introduction of 

bursaries for the new degree (Department of Health, 2003b). 

The introduction of the new degree and concerns about a shortage 
of social workers highlighted the timeliness of a study examining 
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progression rates among social work students. In 2005, the General 

Social Care Council (GSCC) commissioned the Social Care 

Workforce Research Unit at King’s College London to analyse 
progression rates among DipSW students. As they would not be 

including any variables within the data-set that would permit 

identification of individuals, it was not necessary to seek ethical 

approval. However, in order to maintain anonymity among 
individual HEIs, this article is based on aggregated data. 

Methods 

Data 

The data comprised a complete set of three national cohorts of full-

time students registering for a DipSW in England from 1995 to 
1998. The variables comprised background details on 10,891 

students (gender, age at time of registration, whether they had a 

self-reported disability, ethnicity, previous educational attainment at 

time of registration, and the type of financial support received). 

Ethnicity and self-reported disability (which included sensory 
impairments, men- tal health difficulties, dyslexia and other ‘hidden 

disabilities’) were recoded into dichotomous variables because some 

categories contained insufficient numbers of students to permit 

valid statistical analyses. We were also given information on the 
date on which they began the programme, their end result in terms 

of achieving an award or not achieving an award and whether they 

had been required to repeat a piece of course work or practice 

placement (referred) or whether there had been any delays due to 
illness, maternity leave and so on (deferred). 

Researchers are rarely in a privileged position, as we were, of 

having access to data on a complete population. In addition, the 

quality of the data set was extremely high in that there were very 
few missing values. At 8 per cent, the only variable with a relatively 

high missing value was self-reported disability. This finding is by no 

means unique; studies have consistently highlighted that people 

may be reluctant to disclose a disability for fear of potentially 

negative consequences, or are unclear about what counts as a 
disability (McLean, 2003; Wray et al., 2005). Thus, while we might 

have taken these missing values as meaning that the students had 

a disability, this was not an interpretation that could be robustly 

defended. 

Theoretical relationships between different variables 

Our analyses were guided by theories highlighting the multiplicity of 

factors influencing progression rates, which have been outlined in 

the first part of this article. These suggested that students from a 
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minority ethnic group, students with disabilities, men, older 

students and students with lower levels of previous educational 

attainment were likely to have lower progression rates. Financial 
support might be another reason for withdrawal. The data set with 

which we were provided enabled consideration of all these factors. 

However, the GSCC does not collect information on students’ 

sexuality or socio-economic status so we were unable to consider 
whether these made a difference. 

It proved difficult to take account of the factors relating to the HEI 

providing the programme. Although we were able to link individual 

students to the HEI at which they studied, there were insufficient 
numbers of students spread across too many HEIs to include 

progression rates at individual HEIs in the analyses. The data set 

provided no means of grouping different HEIs together in terms of 

the ratios of teaching staff to students and so on. However, we 
knew that older universities tended to have fewer non-traditional 

students than post- 1992 universities (Higher Education Statistics 

Authority, 2004). Thus, it might be expected that this might make a 

difference to progression rates. We derived a variable grouping HEIs 

into pre-1992 universities, post-1992 universities and colleges of 
further and higher education. In addition, in the 1990s, reductions 

in the number of applicants for social work and the introduction of 

new employment-based routes to a qualification meant that some 

HEIs and employers banded together to form a single consortium. 
These generally consisted of arrangements whereby a university 

and local college of further and higher education pooled resources, 

offering a single programme. We included an additional category to 

cover these programmes, referred to in the tables and text as 
consortia. This is not an entirely satisfactory way of recording such 

arrangements but, as the results will show, it reflected some of the 

differences that existed, most usually in cohort size, when 

compared with other programmes. We also wondered whether 

universities based in large metropolitan areas and conurbations 
would attract different types of student from those found in less 

urban areas, where higher proportions of local students might be 

expected. We divided the HEIs into metropolitan (situated in 

Greater London and metropolitan/unitary authorities) and non-
metropolitan (situated in county and borough councils) using the 

listing of local authorities of the time. As will be apparent, both HEI-

type and metropolitan versus non-metropolitan HEI groupings are in 

themselves rather crude and are no more than rough proxies 
indicating areas in which HEIs might theoretically be expected to 

differ. 

We also considered whether students at greater risk of non-

completion would find it easier or more difficult to achieve an award 
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if they were enrolled on programmes in which they were 

represented in greater numbers. In order to examine this, we 

derived new variables from the data set recording the proportions of 
students from a black and minority ethnic group, students with any 

self-reported disability and male students. The divisions were based 

on overall distributions so that each category had a reasonably 

equal proportion of students in comparison to the other categories. 

The size of social work programmes varies considerably, ranging 

from as few as fifteen students to as many as 120 per cohort 

(General Social Care Council, 2004b). In order to see whether this 

impacted upon progression rates, we divided them into small (fewer 
than twenty-five students), medium (twenty-six to forty-nine) and 

large (more than fifty) programmes. 

Analyses 

We measured variations in progression rates by examining the 

proportions of students completing the DipSW within the expected 
time, passing at a later date after deferring or having being referred 

and not achieving an award because they failed or chose to 

withdraw altogether. 

Initial descriptive analyses showed that the proportion of students 
never completing (due to failing or withdrawing) did not vary as 

much as the proportion of those who passed within expected time 

(i.e. those who passed without being referred or deferred). To 

identify which background variables had significant effect on 

students’ progression, we used conditional forward logistic 
regression models to predict the probability of achieving an award 

within the expected time. Using logistic regression does not make 

any assumptions about the distribution of the independent variables 

(e.g. whether they are interval data or whether they are normally 
distributed). Importantly, where an event is likely to be attributable 

to several factors, as with this sort of data, logistic regression 

distinguishes the effects of each factor after controlling for all the 

other risk factors. The results of the analysis are presented in the 
form of odds ratio (OR). For each variable in the model, one of the 

categories is taken as a reference group. For example, in the case 

of gender, the odds of women achieving an award on time are 

compared with the odds of men—the reference category—achieving 
an award on time. If the odds ratio for women is greater than 1, 

then it shows that women are more likely to pass on time than 

men; where it is less, it is men who are more likely to pass on time. 

The significance level (p-value) shows whether these differences are 

statistically significant—it indicates how likely it is that these results 
have occurred by chance. The p-value represents the probability of 

obtaining the results given the null hypothesis—in this case, the 
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null hypothesis that the b-coefficient is equal to 0, suggesting that 

there is no statistical relationship between the independent 

(completing or not completing the DipSW on time) and the 
dependent variables (age, gender and so on). In other words, if the 

p-value is smaller than 0.005, it means that there is less than a 0.5 

per cent chance that an observed statistical relationship (the 

inverse of the null hypothesis) is due to error. 

We also had to consider whether different variables were, in fact, 

measuring the same thing. For example, when we examined the 

inter-correlations between variables, we found a significant 

correlation between financial support and the type of programme. 
This was because, before the new degree, postgraduate students 

were eligible for a means-tested bursary but non-graduate and 

under- graduate students relied on maintenance grants, loans or 

secondment. For this reason, financial support was omitted from the 
final models, as it was highly correlated with type of programme. 

In the same way, HEI type was highly correlated with course 

composition. These correlations suggested that HEI factors and 

course composition have some hierarchical effects so the models 

were performed repeatedly for each type of HEI to take them into 
account. 

Finally, in this article, we have excluded part-time students because 

we needed to develop a separate analysis for this group. These 

results are to be reported elsewhere (for details contact the 
authors). 

Results 

Descriptive results 

Table 1 presents the distribution of the results for students following 

full-time DipSW programmes. Overall, 74 per cent of all full-time 
students completed their programmes within the expected time. 

Fourteen per cent completed later, after having deferred or being 

referred, and 12 per cent did not achieve an award, because they 

either failed or withdrew from the programme. Although Table 1 

shows that men, students with a self-reported disability, students 
from a black and minority ethnic group and students with less 

financial support were less likely to pass on time and that students 

from pre-1992 universities and postgradu- ate students were more 

likely to complete on time, these results can be deceptive, as one 
variable may appear to affect the outcome, whereas the effect may 

be due to another confounding effect. This is what we shall go on to 

explore. 
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**** Table 1 around here **** 

The need to take account of the interrelationship between different 

factors influencing progression rates is strikingly demonstrated in 
Tables 2 and 3. Corre- lation analyses showed that student 

characteristics, course composition and type of programme offered 

varied widely in relation to the type of HEI. For example, almost a 

third of students attending pre-1992 universities were younger than 
twenty-five years, compared with around a seventh at other HEIs. 

Post-1992 uni- versities and consortia HEIs had the highest mean 

cohort size of fifty-three and sixty-two students, respectively. This 

compares with thirty-four and thirty-seven within pre-1992 HEIs 
and colleges of further and higher education. 

 

**** Table 2 around here **** 

There were also differences between students undertaking different 

routes to a DipSW. Table 3 shows that the proportion of students 

with reported disability is slightly higher and the proportion of 

younger students was highest among undergraduates in comparison 
with the corresponding proportions among under and 

postgraduates. As mentioned earlier, financial support was highly 

associated with route type. The majority of postgraduate students 

received bursaries; non- graduates and undergraduates relied more 
upon maintenance grants from local authorities, for which the 

postgraduates were not eligible. The Department of Health 

stipulated that part of the Training Support Programme grant 

should be used to help unqualified staff acquire a professional 
qualification (Department of Health, 2002). Seconded students were 

usually on non-graduate programmes, reflecting employers’ 

interests in minimizing the time spent in training. Non- graduate 

programmes were also likely to contain larger cohorts of students. 

**** Table 3 around here **** 

Analytical results 

Table 4 presents the results of a logistic regression model testing 

the association between predictive variables and probability of 
passing on time for all full- time students (see ‘Methods’ for 

interpretation of Table 4). The results confirm both the descriptive 

findings and the literature that men, students from black and 

minority ethnic groups, and students with a disability were less 
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likely to pass on time. However, in contrast to the literature, age 

and previous educational attainment did not make a difference. It 

should be noted that the recording of educational attainment data 
does not differentiate between levels of attainment in the way that, 

for example, the UCAS tariff score distinguishes between those 

achieving top grade A ‘A’ levels and those with grade ‘E’s. It is 

possible that a more tightly calibrated system would allow 
differences between those with differing levels of achievement to 

become more apparent. An alternative explanation is that social 

work has developed a repertoire of teaching methods capable of 

dealing successfully with students with diverse levels of previous 
educational attainment. 

Undergraduates were least likely to complete social work courses on 

time. Cohort size and cohort composition in terms of gender and 

ethnicity did not affect the likelihood of passing on time but the 
proportion of students with a self-reported disability did. 

 

**** Table 4 around here **** 

Table 2 showed that students’ profiles vary considerably across 

different HEIs. It was thus important to identify which factors were 
significantly associated with the probability of passing on time while 

controlling for this. We therefore undertook a set of logistic 

regression models for students attending each HEI type. 

Table 5 presents the results of the four logistic regression models. 
Programme route was not included as a predictor variable for higher 

education and further education colleges because, at the time, they 

only offered non-graduate routes. The Omnibus tests and Hosmer–

Lemeshow goodness-of-fit statistics showed that the four models 
provided a reasonably good fit for the data. However, the models 

only explained 8–13 per cent of the variance in the probability of 

passing on time in different HEI types (see footnotes for details of 

numbers and statistics for each model). This was unsurprising, 

given the potential number of factors that might have influenced 
progression about which we had no information. Notwithstanding 

this limitation, the analyses provided further information on which 

of the predictor variables have a significant association with the 

probability of passing on time in different types of HEI. 

**** Table 5 around here *** 

The results confirm that, across all types of HEI and regardless of 

other characteristics, students’ ethnicity and self-reported disability 

all have significant effects on students’ chances of achieving an 
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award on time. In all types of HEI, students from black and minority 

ethnic groups had the lowest odds ratio (0.39– 0.54) of passing on 

time, followed by students with a self-reported disability (0.55–
0.65). However, with the exception of ethnicity and self-reported 

disability, the analyses show that, of all the remaining factors 

presented in Table 4 as significantly affecting students’ chances of 

passing on time, the importance of each factor varies between 
different types of HEI. Each is considered in turn. 

Undergraduates were significantly less likely to pass on time when 

compared with non-graduate students in both post-1992 

universities and consortia (OR = 0.55 and 0.60, respectively). The 
different length of their programmes (three or four years as 

opposed to two years) needs recognizing. Postgraduates attending 

programmes run by consortia had significantly higher chances of 

passing on time when compared with the same reference group (OR 
= 1.95). These students also undertook their programmes over two 

years. 

Age similarly seemed to exert a different effect in different types of 

HEI. Only in pre-1992 universities did younger students have a 

greater chance of passing on time than older students. In post-1992 
universities and consortia, there were no significant differences 

between them. By contrast, older students were almost twice as 

likely (OR = 1.93) to pass on time in FE/HE colleges. 

In contrast to higher education generally, students’ levels of 
previous attainment were significantly associated with the 

probability of passing on time only among students attending 

higher/further education colleges and, even here, the level of 

significance was only moderate. 

With the exception of pre-1992 universities, students’ gender made 

a significant difference to their chances of passing within the 

expected time. Otherwise, in post-1992 universities, higher/further 

colleges and in consortia, men were always less likely than women 

to pass on time. 

Men, students from black and minority ethnic groups and students 

with a disability are minorities on most social work programmes. As 

Table 2 showed, the extent to which students with these 

characteristics were distributed across different types of HEI varied. 
Feelings of isolation may contribute to poorer progression (Connor 

et al., 2004), so it was important to consider what happened in 

HEIs in which there were fewer or more students with a particular 

characteristic. 

Differences in the proportion of men on a programme produced 
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inconsistent results. In post-1992 universities and higher/further 

colleges, where more than a quarter of the group were men, then 

students were significantly less likely to pass on time. By contrast, 
where the number of men in a cohort ranged from just over a fifth 

to a quarter (i.e. where men were slightly over-represented in 

terms of their overall numbers among the student social work 

population as a whole), there was a positive effect on students’ 
chances of passing on time, especially within colleges of higher and 

further education. 

The analyses also suggested that where black and minority students 

were over and under-represented in comparison with their 
proportion within the student social work population (i.e. 10–15 per 

cent), the effect on overall progression rates differed. In pre-1992 

universities and consortia, students on programmes in which 25–40 

per cent of the students were from a black and minority ethnic 
group, stood a greater chance of passing on time than those 

attending programmes in which fewer than 10 per cent were from a 

black and minority ethnic group (OR = 2.62 and 1.47, respectively). 

By contrast, in post- 1992 universities, this effect was reversed, 

with programmes in which black and minority ethnic groups were 
under-represented doing better (OR = 0.61). This is intriguing, as, 

on the whole, black and minority ethnic students are more likely to 

attend post-1992 universities and are generally under-represented 

in pre-1992 universities (Connor et al., 2004). It seems probable 
that something is happening at programme, rather than HEI, level, 

which these data were unable to capture. For example, some social 

work programmes in pre-1992 universities may have developed 

very effective mentorship for students from a black and minority 
ethnic group or have more black staff as positive role models. 

The proportion of students with a self-reported disability in the 

group was significantly associated with the probability of passing on 

time in post-1992 universities and consortia. Students on 

programmes in which 7–12 per cent of students had a self-reported 
disability were more likely to pass on time. However, their chances 

of passing on time were reduced if the proportion of students with a 

self-reported disability was greater. Although the data available do 

not show why this difference exists, possible explanations are that 
HEIs with higher pro- portions of students with disabilities face 

greater difficulty in arranging suitable practice placements or that 

staff (or students) have less time pro rata to assist individuals with 

potentially higher support needs. 

Whether students were part of a small, medium or large intake 

made no difference except in pre-1992 universities. Students on 

courses comprising fifty or more students were three-and-a-half 

times more likely to pass on time when compared with those 
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attending courses of fewer than twenty-five students. This may be 

because, at the time, fewer than 5 per cent of pre-1992 universities 

ran courses with more than fifty students. It was striking that, 
among the 120 students in this category, 95 per cent had no self-

reported disability, and 91 per cent were white. However, we lacked 

any supplementary information to set cohort size into context; it is 

possible that larger social work programmes in pre-1992 
universities are better resourced. 

Students attending pre-1992 universities and higher/further 

colleges in non- metropolitan areas were significantly more likely to 

pass on time than their counterparts in metropolitan areas. 
However, this relationship was not significant among students 

attending post-1992 universities or consortia. It is possible that pre-

1992 universities and higher/further colleges in more rural areas 

may be the only HEI negotiating practice placements, with less 
likelihood that students will need to defer because of problems in 

arranging a placement. 

 

Discussion 

For the first time, it is possible to make public statistical analyses of 
national progression rates among social work students in England. 

Until now, although research has revealed the contrasting 

experiences of different groups of students, this mainly rested upon 

small-scale studies with no means of determining their 

generalizability. These results provide some important messages for 
social work education. On a positive note, the great majority of 

social work students go on to achieve an award. Attrition rates are 

low in comparison with subjects such as nursing (National Audit 

Office, 2001) and teaching (Smithers and Robinson, 2001), in which 
around a fifth of students leave before completing their training. In 

addition, many social work students are from non-traditional 

backgrounds in terms of participation in higher education, yet the 

majority achieve an award within the expected time. In contrast to 
higher education as a whole, being in an older age group and 

having lower levels of previous educational attainment do not 

broadly reduce students’ chances of achieving an award. 

At the same time, it is important to consider the effects of non-
progression upon individuals themselves and upon recruitment to 

the profession as a whole. The results suggest that men, people 

from black and minority ethnic groups, and people with disabilities 

all have lower progression rates. This highlights the need for 

research. This should also consider the position of LGBT students, 
and the effects of socio-economic status because differences 



Hussein et al. (2008) 16 

sometimes attributed to, for example, ethnicity are often the effects 

of disparities in socio- economic status (Nazroo, 1998; Connor et 

al., 2004). 

The results of this research are particularly timely in the context of 

the new social work degree qualification. The pattern whereby 

undergraduate students have lower progression rates might 

continue if social work attracts a wider range of students without 
substantial experience of social care employment, or indeed of any 

employment. The change to a degree-level qualification met with 

widespread support among social work educators who were 

concerned about UK social work’s lack of comparability with training 
programmes in the EU (Lyons, 2002) and welcomed the additional 

teaching and practice time. How- ever, educators and policy makers 

also need to be alert to the potential impact on progression rates of 

these changes. 

In addition to factors that might be ascribed to the type of social 

work programme, the results suggest that factors unique to an HEI 

impact upon progression rates. Enhancing support for diverse 

students requires consideration of disability, gender and ethnicity by 

all HEIs, but the differences revealed between HEIs suggest that a 
range of tailored strategies is likely to be useful. This highlights the 

need for developments that strengthen individual HEIs and 

programmes. Although the evaluation of the new degree in England 

funded by the Department of Health (Manthorpe et al., 2005) will 
inform this area, more data on a broader range of programmes are 

clearly required. 

Together, these results highlight the need for further debate among 

social work educators, policy makers, researchers and students 
themselves on under- standing why students face difficulties in 

completing a programme within the expected time and how to 

support them effectively. Such discussions are likely to be furthered 

by the Disability Rights Commission’s investigation of social work, 

nursing and teaching experiences (Disability Rights Commission, 
2006). It is hard to underestimate the importance of such work. 

Developments such as the 2000 Race Relations (Amendment) Act 

(chapter 34), the Equality Standard for Local Government 

(Employers’ Organisation for Local Government/ Disability Rights 
Commission/Equal Opportunities Commission/Commission for Racial 

Equality, 2005) and the NHS Plan (Secretary of State for Health, 

2000) emphasize that equalities and diversities strategies within the 

workforce are central to the delivery of public services that are fair 
to, and meet the needs of, the communities they serve. While social 

work is felt to have made progress in becoming a more diverse 

workforce (Beresford and Croft, 2004), the starting point for 

improvements must be at the level of social work education. This 
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research represents one step in highlighting some of the barriers to 

developing a more diverse profession; the challenge is to improve 

our understanding of how these barriers may be overcome. 

Note 

1. Published data do not distinguish between black African, black 

Caribbean and other black students. 
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Tables: 

Table 1: Distribution of full time students according to different HEI and students’ 

characteristics by end results 

Background characteristics End Result 

Total   Passed on time Passed later 

Non 

completion 

Course composition Factors     

Registration Cohort         

95-96 74.6% 14.4% 11.0% 3,852 

96-97 74.6% 13.3% 12.1% 3,585 

97-98 71.6% 14.6% 13.8% 3,454 

Programme type         

Non Graduate 73.3% 14.1% 12.6% 6,388 

Post Graduate 78.5% 12.9% 8.6% 2,794 

Under Graduate 67.1% 16.0% 17.0% 1,709 

Cohort Size         

Less than 25 77.5% 11.6% 10.9% 1,349 

25 to 49 73.4% 14.6% 12.0% 5,953 

50 or more 72.6% 14.2% 13.2% 3,589 

Proportion in group with disability         

< 7 % 75.5% 12.3% 12.1% 2,473 

[7 %- 12 %[ 75.8% 12.7% 11.5% 6,101 

12% or more 66.1% 19.5% 14.4% 2,317 

Proportion BME in group         

< 10 % 77.4% 11.2% 11.4% 3,220 

[10 %- 25%[ 74.6% 14.4% 11.0% 4,233 

[25 %- 40%[ 68.8% 18.4% 12.8% 1,414 
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Background characteristics End Result 

Total   Passed on time Passed later 

Non 

completion 

40% or more 69.0% 15.1% 15.9% 2,024 

Proportion male in group         

< 22% 74.4% 13.0% 12.6% 2,222 

[22 %- 25%[ 73.6% 14.0% 12.4% 5,520 

25% or more 73.2% 15.1% 11.7% 3,149 

HEI Factors     

Type of HEI         

Pre 1992 78.0% 13.3% 8.7% 2,626 

Post 1992 71.8% 14.1% 14.1% 3,599 

HE/FE College 72.4% 15.2% 12.4% 1,381 

Consortia 72.8% 14.2% 13.0% 3,285 

Type of area         

Metropolitan 70.2% 16.2% 13.6% 5,499 

Non-metropolitan  77.1% 12.0% 10.9% 5,392 

Students’ Factors     

Gender         

Male 69.2% 14.7% 16.0% 2,712 

Female 75.1% 13.8% 11.0% 8,167 

Age         

<25 75.3% 13.0% 11.7% 2,054 

25-34 74.1% 14.1% 11.8% 5,126 

35 + 72.2% 14.7% 13.1% 3711 

Reported disability         

None 75.8% 13.0% 11.2% 8,995 
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Background characteristics End Result 

Total   Passed on time Passed later 

Non 

completion 

Any 63.0% 19.3% 17.8% 996 

Ethnicity         

White 77.0% 12.6% 10.5% 8,551 

BME 61.4% 19.7% 18.8% 2,246 

Financial support         

Mandatory/discretionary grant 70.4% 15.1% 14.4% 6,035 

Secondment/sponsorship 82.0% 11.7% 6.3% 1,138 

Bursary 77.8% 12.4% 9.7% 2,854 

Other 72.6% 15.0% 12.4% 749 

Education         

O' level/ NVQ2/ NCL 75.0% 13.4% 11.6% 1,349 

NVQ3/ NVQ4/ 'A' level 73.0% 13.8% 13.1% 3,402 

Diploma 74.9% 13.3% 11.8% 2,508 

Degree 73.1% 14.9% 12.0% 3,485 

All full time students 73.7% 14.1% 12.3% 10,891 
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Table 2 Variations in some characteristics according to type of HEI 

Characteristics 

Type of HEI 

Pre 1992 Post 1992 HE/FE College Consortia 

% Students younger than 25  29.4% 15.5% 11.9% 17% 

% BME students* 13.5% 31.1% 20.8% 14.8% 

% Students  

already possessing a  degree 33.1% 30.6% 34.7% 31.7% 

Mean cohort size 33.6 52.7 36.7 61.2 

Type of programmes offered NG/PG/UG NG/PG/UG NG NG/PG/UG 

% of HEIs in metropolitan areas 33.3% 58.8% 33.7% 62.1% 

Total number of HEIs 22 22 15 20 

Total number of full time students 2626 3599 1381 3285 

* Black and Minority Ethnic group 

 

Table 3 Variations in some characteristics according to type of programme 

Characteristics 

Type of HEI 

Non Graduates Post Graduates Under Graduates 

% Students younger than 25  11.7% 25.3% 35.0% 

% Students with reported disability 9.5% 7.4% 10.6% 

% Students with Degrees 31.1% 34.8% 30.7% 

Mean cohort size 56.0 33.4 45.9 

Major financial support 

Mandatory/ 

Discretionary Grant 

68% 

Secondment 15% 

Bursary 85.5% 

Mandatory/ 

Discretionary 

Grant 89% 

Total number of full time students 6388 2794 1709 
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Table 4: Results of logistic regression model testing probability of passing on time 

among all full time students
i
 

Independent variables sig Adj Odds Ratio 95% CI  

Lower Upper 

Non-metropolitan area vs. 

metropolitan 

** 1.37 1.24 1.50 

Cohort (ref. 95-96) *    

96-97 NS - - - 

97-98 ** 0.84 0.75 0.95 

Programme type (ref NG) **    

Post graduates ** 1.27 1.13 1.43 

Under graduates ** 0.80 0.70 0.91 

Cohort size (ref <25) NS    

25-49 -    

50+ -    

% With disability in group (ref. 

<7%) 

**    

[7%-12%[ ** 1.21 1.07 1.37 

12% or more ** 0.69 0.60 0.79 

% BME students in group (ref. 

<10%) 

NS    

[10%-25%[ -    

[25%-40%[ -    

40% or more -    

% Male in group (ref. <22%) NS    

[22%-25 %[ -    

25% or more -    

Female vs. Male ** 1.34 1.20 1.49 

Age (ref. <25 years) *    
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Independent variables sig Adj Odds Ratio 95% CI  

Lower Upper 

25-34 NS 1.05 0.92 1.20 

35 years or more NS 0.91 0.79 1.05 

Any disability (vs. none) ** 0.59 0.51 0.69 

BME (vs. white) ** 0.50 0.45 0.56 

Education (ref. ‘O’ level/ NVQ2/ 

NCL) 

NS    

NVQ3 or 4/ ‘A’ level -    

Diploma -    

Degree -    

Constant ** 2.54   

NS: Not Significant, *: Significant on p-value<0.05, **: Significant on p-value<0.005 
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Table 5: Results of logistic regression models testing significant associations with probability of passing on time among full time students according 

to type of HEI 

Independent variables HEI Type  

Pre 1992
ii
 Post 1992

iii
 HE/FE College

iv
 Consortia

v
 

sig Adj 

Odds 

Ratio 

95% CI  sig Adj 

Odds 

Ratio 

95% CI sig Adj 

Odds 

Ratio 

95% CI sig Adj 

Odds 

Ratio 

95% CI 

Lower Upper Lower Upper Lower Upper Lower Upper 

Non-metropolitan areas 

vs. metropolitan  

** 1.70 1.29 2.25 NS    ** 4.34 2.67 7.07 NS    

Cohort (ref. 95-96) NS    NS    NS    *    

96-97 -    -    -    NS 1.21 0.99 1.49 

97-98 -    -    -    NS 0.90 0.73 1.10 

Programme type (ref 

NG) 

NS    **    NI    **    

Post graduates -    NS 0.79 0.60 1.05 -    ** 1.95 1.45 2.61 

Under graduates -    ** 0.55 0.43 0.69 -    ** 0.60 0.45 0.78 

Cohort size (ref <25) *    NS    NS    NS    

25-49 NS 0.89 0.67 1.16 -    -    -    

50+ ** 3.61 1.52 8.59 -    -    -    
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Independent variables HEI Type  

Pre 1992
ii
 Post 1992

iii
 HE/FE College

iv
 Consortia

v
 

sig Adj 

Odds 

Ratio 

95% CI  sig Adj 

Odds 

Ratio 

95% CI sig Adj 

Odds 

Ratio 

95% CI sig Adj 

Odds 

Ratio 

95% CI 

Lower Upper Lower Upper Lower Upper Lower Upper 

% With disability in 

group (ref. <7%) 

NS    **    NS    **    

[7%-12%[ -    NS 1.43 0.98 2.10 -    ** 1.46 1.17 1.82 

12% or more -    * 0.65 0.43 0.99 -    NS 0.86 0.64 1.17 

% BME students in 

group (ref. <10%) 

**    *    **    *    

[10%-25%[ NS 0.99 0.76 1.29 * 0.65 0.48 0.89 NS 0.78 0.51 1.18 NS 1.24 1.00 1.55 

[25%-40%[ ** 2.62 1.56 4.39 * 0.61 0.42 0.89 NS 1.26 0.70 2.28 * 1.47 1.07 2.02 

40% or more NS 0.68 0.41 1.13 * 0.70 0.50 0.99 ** 9.17 3.52 23.88 NS 1.56 1.00 2.44 

% Male in group (ref. 

<22%) 

NS    *    **    NS    

[22%-25 %[ -    NS 0.93 0.69 1.27 ** 5.26 2.90 9.54 -    

25% or more -    * 0.75 0.57 0.98 NS 1.31 0.72 2.37 -    
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Independent variables HEI Type  

Pre 1992
ii
 Post 1992

iii
 HE/FE College

iv
 Consortia

v
 

sig Adj 

Odds 

Ratio 

95% CI  sig Adj 

Odds 

Ratio 

95% CI sig Adj 

Odds 

Ratio 

95% CI sig Adj 

Odds 

Ratio 

95% CI 

Lower Upper Lower Upper Lower Upper Lower Upper 

Female vs. Male NS    * 1.24 1.04 1.49 * 1.38 1.02 1.89 ** 1.40 1.16 1.70 

Age (ref. <25 years) **    NS    *    NS    

25-34 ** 0.60 0.47 0.78 -    ** 1.93 1.26 2.94 -    

35 years or more ** 0.47 0.35 0.62 -    NS 1.38 0.91 2.11 -    

Any disability (vs. none) ** 0.55 0.39 0.76 ** 0.56 0.44 0.70 * 0.61 0.40 0.92 ** 0.65 0.50 0.85 

BME (vs. white) ** 0.39 0.30 0.52 ** 0.54 0.44 0.65 ** 0.47 0.33 0.66 ** 0.50 0.38 0.62 

Education (ref. ‘O’ 

level/ NVQ2/ NCL) 

NS    NS    *    NS    

NVQ3 or 4/ ‘A’ level -    -    NS 0.72 0.44 1.16 -    

Diploma -    -    NS 1.01 0.59 1.71 -    

Degree -    -    * 0.60 0.37 0.96 -    

Constant ** 5.08   ** 5.28   * 0.23   ** 1.68   

NS: Not Significant, *: Significant on p-value<0.05, **: Significant on p-value<0.005, NI: not included. 



Hussein et al. (2008) 31 

 

                                   

i 9789 cases included in analysis. Nagelkerke R2= 0.066. Omnibus Test: Chi-

square=448.695, p-value=0.000. Hosmer and lemeshow test; Chi-square=23.01, 

p-value=0.003 

 

ii 2450 cases included in analysis. Nagelkerke R2= 0.115. Omnibus Test: Chi-

square= 188.202, p-value= 0.000. Hosmer and lemeshow test; Chi-

square=12.25, p-value=0.114 

iii 3176 cases included in analysis. Nagelkerke R2= 0.083. Omnibus Test: Chi-

square=187.536, p-value=0.000. Hosmer and lemeshow test; Chi-square=14.57, 

p-value=0.068 

 

iv 1211 cases included in analysis. Nagelkerke R2= 0.134. Omnibus Test: Chi-

square=116.7, p-value=0.000. Hosmer and lemeshow test; Chi-square=16.58, p-

value=0.036 

v 3950 cases included in analysis. Nagelkerke R2= 0.075. Omnibus Test: Chi-

square=156.8, p-value=0.000. Hosmer and lemeshow test; Chi-square=13.127, 

p-value=0.108 


