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ABSTRACT 

 

Psoriasis is a chronic disease where treatments are often needed throughout life. The quality 
of life of patients is often affected and comorbidities are common. The overall aim of this 
thesis was to study treatment regimes, assessments and comorbidity in psoriasis patients 
with the intention of finding treatment strategies that work in daily practice and improves 
patients’ quality of life.     
 
In Paper I, bacterial and fungal cultures were studied from intertriginous areas in psoriasis 
patients with and without topical steroid treatment and from healthy controls. The results 
show that untreated psoriatic patients were colonised by Staphylococcus aureus significantly 
more often than the control group but infection seemed to be unlikely. Candida was not found 
in any of the groups. We propose that intertriginous psoriasis could be treated with topical 
steroids alone. 
In Paper II, the effectiveness, quality of life and side-effects were compared between the 
treatments with methotrexate and ciclosporin. The mean PASI change from baseline at 12 
weeks was 58% in the methotrexate group and 72% in the ciclosporin group, showing 
ciclosporin to be more effective than methotrexate. The improvement of the VAS score was 
also higher in the ciclosporin group.  
In Paper III, the sub-analysis of the assessment tools used in the second study showed that 
the VAS correlated with the PASI and the DLQI, except at the baseline visit for the PASI. We 
suggest that the VAS could be used to assess disease activity and quality of life for psoriasis 
patients in everyday clinical practice.  
In Paper IV, the experience and risk of dental caries and periodontal disease were assessed 
in psoriasis patients and controls, and similar profiles were observed in the two groups. 
 
Conclusion: Intertriginous psoriasis can be treated with topical steroids alone. Ciclosporin is 
more effective than methotrexate from a short-term perspective, although methotrexate also 
gives a satisfactory effect and is safer from a long-time perspective. The VAS method for 
assessing disease activity and quality of life in psoriasis can be recommended. In psoriasis 
patients, no overall increased risk for dental caries and periodontal disease was 
demonstrated.  
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