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1. Introduction

Patient participation is increasingly recognized as a key
component in healthcare. Patients’ experiences and knowledge
are considered as complementary and equal in importance to
professionals’ knowledge [1], both in individual care contexts and
in healthcare organization [2,3]. Direct patient participation
methods have been proven to lead to patient-centeredness and
better care [4], but developing and implementing such methods is
often a complex matter [5,6]. The use of the co-design
methodology could offer a solution for designing and implement-
ing these complex interventions. “Experience-Based Co-Design” is
a specific form of co-design in healthcare. “Experience-based”
refers to how patients feel about the used healthcare services and
how well they serve their needs. “Co-design” indicates that both
patients and healthcare professionals act as designers of the
healthcare services. Also, it can be seen as an implementation
strategy as it has the potential to counter reluctance within
healthcare teams [7]. Overall, EBCD is a rigorous participatory
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approach that enables both staff and patients to (re)design services
together by sharing experiences, identifying priorities, implement-
ing and evaluating improvements in care and service provision [8].

2. Background of EBCD

EBCD has already been used in several countries, in at least 57
projects, and in a variety of settings [9]. It originates from design
science and draws on the idea that products and services could be
improved by involving the end-user in their design. By combining
insights from design science, organizational learning and patient
engagement, Bate and Robert [10] transferred this user-centered
approach into the healthcare context. Using a range of qualitative
methods, the approach seeks to capture and understand how
people actually experience a process or service in healthcare. Key
moments that shape a person’s overall experiences (“touch
points”) are identified. Patients and hospital staff then jointly
set priorities and seek solutions. A full version of EBCD includes
eight stages: (1) gathering hospital staff experiences through
clinical observations, (2) filmed in-depth narrative- based inter-
views with patients or families, (3) editing the interviews in a 30-
min trigger film, (4) staff feedback event to review themes from
staff interviews to identify priorities for improving services, (5)
patient feedback event to view the edited film and to identify
enting patient participation in hospital services: A discussion paper,
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priorities for improving services, (6) joint event bringing staff,
patients or families together to share their experiences of a service
and identify their shared priorities for improvement, prompted by
an edited 30-min trigger film (7) co-design groups of staff, patients
or families working on implementing improvements relating to
identified priorities, and (8) an evaluation/celebration event [11].
Recently, accelerated versions of EBCD have been designed and
tested using video interviews from a national database [12], but
the innovative elements of remained the same: patients’ active
involvement throughout the entire improvement process, includ-
ing implementation.

3. Methods

We describe three studies to illustrate the fit between co-design
and implementing complex healthcare interventions; each study
used co-design to (re)design and evaluate a patient participation
intervention introduced by the researchers. Applicability of the
interventions, based on theoretical knowledge, needed to be
discussed with those who would benefit from them or might be
harmed by them. Therefore, patients and hospital staff were
involved by use of interviews and group meetings. Two important
considerations in the evaluation of interventions were desirability
and feasibility. Although the three studies used co-design, they
varied in terms of scope, length and complexity.

The first study aimed to design and implement the “experts by
experience intervention”, which involved trained patients in the
delivery and evaluation of hospital services [13,14]. Experts by
experience were systematically involved to support their peers
and provide feedback to hospital staff about the care and its
organization. The intervention took place in three settings of a
large university hospital in Belgium. In each setting, a full co-
design trajectory was performed. Experts by experience were,
together with other patients and healthcare staff, involved in the
co-design process. Adaptation were made to the original EBCD-
version. First, participants were informed about the co-design
trajectory by means of a video message. Second, discharged
patients (>1year) were also included to provide a broader
perspective on healthcare by including patients who had already
processed their physical and mental problems. Third, researchers
provided literature-based knowledge during the process to
equally combine experiential knowledge, practical knowledge
and scientific knowledge. Lastly, staff interviews were filmed to
treat patients and hospital staff equally. The two latter
adaptations are grounded in the responsive evaluation and the
empowerment evaluation methodology which served as a
framework in our study [15,16]. Reflecting on our approach, the
embedding of co-design in the two well-established evaluation
frameworks increased mutual understanding and facilitated an
open dialogue among stakeholders. To ensure full participation of
the experts by experience it was necessary to conduct an
extensive co-design trajectory where all aspects of the interven-
tion and its implementation were discussed together (e.g. goals of
their engagement, tasks and roles, practical organization,
dissemination of the project). However, our approach was costly
and time consuming as 43 individual filmed interviews, nine
group meetings and nine co-design groups were organized
together with four researchers and three moderators.

The second study aimed to develop and implement the Tell-us
Cards in eight settings in six hospitals. The Tell-us Card is a tool,
which facilitates communication between nurses and patients by
inviting patients to write on the Tell-us Card what is important for
them concerning hospital discharge. The card offers the possibility
to identify patients’ preferences and needs to be acted upon by
nurses [17–20]. Admitted patients and nurses were selected in
each setting to participate in the co-design trajectory to tailor the
Please cite this article in press as: E.M. Castro, et al., Co-design for implem
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tool for the local context. Due to the practical nature of the Tell-us
cards, the co-design process was comprehensively shortened.
Film-editing in the third stage was replaced by using audio
fragments from the interviews of both nurses and patients. The
sixth, seventh and eighth stage were held together. In our opinion,
the co-design approached was supportive in tailoring the
intervention and creating acceptance on the ward. However, a
more substantial and comprehensive explanation of the interven-
tion to prepare the stakeholders would have been useful. The
duration of the shortened trajectory was sufficient.

The third study used the co-design trajectory to design and
implement bedside handovers on nursing wards. Bedside hand-
over is a process where the shift-to-shift report between nurses is
delivered at the patient’s bedside to improve the patient’s
involvement [21]. The goal was to use bedside handovers [17–
19] as new standard in fourteen services in eight hospitals.
Admitted patients and nurses were involved to fine-tune the
intervention. To reduce length and intensity of the co-design
process, adaptations were made to the classic EBCD-trajectory.
First, all respondents received an information brochure in
combination with verbal explanation. Second, patients were
selected on availability (i.e. present on the ward). Third, instead
of using an edited film, written quotes from patients were used in
the third stage of the co-design trajectory. As the intervention was
quite straight-forward, the sixth and seventh stage were merged.
Finally, the celebration event was not organized but comprised of a
gift in the final session. The adaptions were made from a
perspective of cost-effectiveness. Looking back to our co-design
trajectories, our approach enabled us to tailor the intervention for
both patients and nurses, without overusing the available time
resources. Moreover, the interactions with patients were valuable
to overcome barriers that were initially reported by nurses. As
such, we consider co-design as an appropriate implementation
strategy. However, we experienced one difficulty: by using written
quotes from patients instead of videos, nurses were confronted
with patients’ opinions quite late in the trajectory.

Based on observations, recordings and field notes of the 25 co-
design trajectories in 15 general and university hospitals in
Flanders, two research teams analyzed and triangulated their
observations using the five phases of Atkins and Murphy’s model of
reflection: awareness, describing the situation, analysis of feeling
and knowledge, assessment of the relevance of knowledge,
identifying and learning. Experienced barriers and enablers were
described, analyzed, and translated into nine points of action and
recommendations [22].

4. Points of action and recommendations

4.1. Preparation of co-design

Sufficient preparation to ensure patients and staff feel
comfortable with the method is highly recommended. Both
patients and hospital staff should be prepared for the interviews.
Being interviewed is usually a new and exciting experience,
especially if interviews are (video-/audio)-recorded. For some
participants, this method can even be slightly frightening and
prevent patients from speaking freely. To create trust and put
participants at ease, we suggest providing patients with a detailed
explanation of the trajectory and the purpose of the interviews,
not solely on paper but also on film/in person. Preparations
and planning are important, but so is ‘letting things go’, as not
everything is controllable. For example, some patients abandoned
the project and continuing to pursue these patients is
not recommended as it contravenes the principle of patient
self-determination, which should be respected in all co-design
trajectories.
enting patient participation in hospital services: A discussion paper,
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4.2. Recruitment of patients and hospital staff

Patients as well as hospital staff should be purposefully
recruited. Patients had difficulties extrapolating their individual
experiences because of their health condition (e.g. still processing
a traumatic experience). Therefore, patients with a less recent
hospital experience were also included. In terms of patient
recruitment, the three studies showed that it was desirable to
collaborate with a head nurse or physician to facilitate initial
contact with participants, although the risk of selection bias
increased [23]. To support acceptance and successful implemen-
tation of an intervention a multidisciplinary sample of hospital
staff should be recruited. An open but critical mindset and
willingness to collaborate in this empowering participatory
trajectory are essential for both hospital staff and patients.
Furthermore, to assess the intervention, hospital staff should feel
free to give constructive feedback.

4.3. Practical support

The effect of contextual factors such as practical arrangements
should not be underestimatedSome examples to take into
consideration are reachability, accessibility of the location, name
badges so that participants can be addressed personally, catering
so that participants feel welcome, a little present to thank the
participants, etc. It was useful to have an additional person onsite
to help patients with these logistic arrangements (e.g. transport),
to support all stakeholders during several activities (e.g. giving
additional explanation in smaller groups) and to assist the
moderator by safeguarding the research process (e.g. making field
notes based on observations). This type of support services and
practical assistance are necessary to allow the moderator to focus
on enabling interaction and effective group discussions.

4.4. Group cohesion

An important task of the moderator is to facilitate group
cohesion by taking group dynamics into account. Group dynamics
refers to a system of behaviors and psychological processes
occurring within or between (a) social group(s) [24]. Facilitation of
group cohesion can be challenging as it might be hampered by
inequalities associated with traditional roles of patients and
healthcare professionals, in which patients mainly rely on
healthcare professionals’ knowledge and where healthcare pro-
fessionals tend to use a rather paternalistic approach. This
approach was sometimes observed in the first part of a joint
meeting: the group of patients sat on one side of the table and the
group of professionals on the other side of the table. Patients barely
spoke. Next, the moderator showed the filmed interviews. To
facilitate group cohesion professionals and patients were asked to
reflect on their activity in small mixed groups. During the second
part of the meeting, the two “subgroups” spontaneously took
mixed seating positions at the table, resulting in an open
discussion of the various experiences. Apparently, the combination
of showing the edited films and the reflection exercise in mixed
subgroups was very valuable to achieve connectivity.

4.5. Combination of methods and tools

In an attempt to overcome the lack of (participatory) ideation
tools provided in EBCD [25], we used specific, mostly qualitative,
research methods in combination with creativity-oriented meth-
ods to organize the meetings. Amongst others, rating scales,
imaginary cases and other focus group techniques such as written
citations and video quotes were used [26,27] next to several
interactional materials such as notepapers and feedback on
Please cite this article in press as: E.M. Castro, et al., Co-design for implem
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presentations. The combination of these methods and tools proved
appropriate and in line with the aim of the meeting and its
participants, provided guidance, interaction, variety, and trust-
worthiness in an informal atmosphere.

4.6. Ensuring mutual respect

All participants need to experience that their point of view is
taken seriously. Ensuring mutual respect, avoiding unnecessary
jargon and safeguarding an equal distribution of patients and staff
are indispensable. We suggest avoiding meeting with more
professionals than patients or vice versa. Including more patients
than professionals may lead to the assumption that the patient's
voice is not be as powerful as the professional’s. The moderator
should create a safe environment, in which an open, respectful and
authentic dialogue between participants with differing perspec-
tives can take place. This can be achieved by interviewers adopting
an open attitude themselves, having participants introduce
themselves informally, using humor, and specific methods such
as Metaplan, in which participants first write down ideas on slips
of paper before they are discussed in group. Only those who are
willing to provide extra explanation, do so.

4.7. Common ground

Searching for common ground should be one of the key
objectives of a co-design trajectory. This is achieved by first
exploring the experiences of patients and healthcare professionals
in separate groups, followed by an integration in a joint group. This
process allows participants to first differentiate, share basic
assumptions and subsequently move towards integration, aiming
to determine the common denominator. It can be supported by
identifying, mapping and comparing the differences rather than
ignoring them [28,29]. Again, the use of ideation tools is
indispensable.

4.8. Avoiding participant drop-out

Drop-out and short hospital stay causing discontinuous
involvement of participants might disrupt equality and perhaps
empowerment [15]. Three ways to achieve continuous involve-
ment are to include discharged patients, reward them for their
contribution, and capturing the interviews of patients as well as
those of hospital staff, in videos, recordings or written quotes. By
showing these to the participants, they gain insight into each
other’s perspective, which provides a solid basis for further
exchange of ideas. Including the quotes from hospital staff is not
part of the original version of EBCD. The statements could be
confrontational for patients, who still need the support and care of
the staff during their hospital stay. However, in our experience,
professionals who are willing to participate in a co-design
trajectory refrain from disrespectful or offensive statements.

4.9. Knowledge convergence

Aiming to effectively co-design interventions, all voices should
be heard: those of healthcare professionals and their practical
knowledge, of patients and their experiential knowledge and of
researchers and their theoretical knowledge (i.e. by a preceding
literature review). Following the empowerment theory, this
combination of different types of knowledge will lead to more
sustainable and accepted interventions in practice [15]. The EBCD
method upholds this principle through the use of group meetings,
in which different types of knowledge converge. However, in our
experience the frequency of knowledge convergence (i.e. the
duration and comprehensiveness of the co-design trajectory)
enting patient participation in hospital services: A discussion paper,
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should be determined by the complexity and concreteness of the
proposed intervention. For example, the first study (i.e. the
involvement of experts by experience) was more complex (more
interacting components [30]) than the second (i.e. Bedside Shift
Reporting) and third study (i.e. Tell-us Cards). Therefore, in the first
study we conducted the full EBCD trajectory but in the second and
third study, researchers felt this would not have an added value. As
such, in light of a balance between costs and benefits, we suggest
adjusting the number of meetings to prevent unnecessary
overshooting.

5. Conclusion

We reported the value of co-design in studies on implementing
complex patient participation interventions, and provided insights
from a researcher’s perspective.

Two conclusions can be drawn from our findings. First, although
the effects and process of co-design have been reported frequently
[31,32], practical advice on how and when to use it remains limited.
We are convinced that co-design can be helpful as a participatory
research method in healthcare thanks to its combination of several
research methods and the systematic convergence of stakeholder
perspectives. We found co-design to facilitate group dynamics
resulting in constructive collaboration. Furthermore, we retrieved
one of the foundations of EBCD (user involvement in product
improvement) and included the innovative aspects of EBCD such as
the dynamic sequence of several meetings, in varied forms, using
several methods, all enhancing a perpetual motion of evaluating
and (re-)designing an intervention.

Second, we consider co-design a useful tool for designing,
evaluating and implementing complex patient participation-
related interventions. We found the practical step-by-step
approach of co-design, in which the perspectives of patients and
healthcare professionals are brought together, to be a critical factor
in overcoming reluctance in practice and designing methods
tailored to patients and healthcare practitioners. We consider it
necessary to adapt the approach to the proposed intervention,
using either an extended or accelerated trajectory, depending on
the scope of the intervention. A balance between costs and benefits
should be taken into account when planning co-design.

Overall, co-design can be considered as the future method for
quality improvement, research, intervention development and
implementation. In this reflective paper, we suggest nine
recommendations for further use, grounded in the essentials of
empowerment and placed within a societal responsible framework
of costs and benefits.
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