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Abstract 
 

The current study sought to test the effective-
ness of a workshop for post-graduate clinical 
psychology students to develop their ability to 
work with lesbian, gay and bisexual (LGB) cli-
ents in an appropriate manner. Seven female 
participants completed the workshop and all 
assessments. The study incorporated a pre-
test-post-test design, with assessments taking 
place before the workshop and one month 
after. Assessment was conducted primarily 
through a number of questionnaires assessing 
attitude, behavioural intention, cultural com-
petence and knowledge in relation to LGB 
people. Short answer responses to a scenario 
depicting an interaction between a heterosex-
ual clinical psychologist and a gay male client 
were also analysed. Significant changes were 
found in behavioural intention (p = .017), cul-
tural competence (p = .001) and knowledge 
(p < .001). Qualitative analysis of scenario 
responses identified a number of instances 
where learning of workshop material was ap-
parent, although this was not reflected in a 
quantitative analysis. The workshop produced 
some promising results, but may require 
modification in future applications to improve 
its impact. 

 
Keywords: psychological practice, heteronormativ-
ity, lesbians, gay men, bisexual people 

 
Introduction 

 
Western societies function through various 
social norms that represent assumptions about 
particular forms of category membership. One 
such norm is heterosexuality. The social norm 
of heterosexuality (or ‘heteronormativity’) pre-

sumes or attributes a heterosexual identity to 
all members of society, and furthermore, it 
presumes that heterosexual is the ‘normal’ 
sexuality from which all others deviate 
(Johnson, 2002; Simoni & Walters, 2001).  
Such presumptions can often result in lesbian, 
gay and bisexual (LGB) people (amongst oth-
ers) experiencing marginalisation and disad-
vantage in their everyday lives. One specific 
example of this occurs when same-sex at-
tracted people access professional services 
(e.g., psychological services) that are not suf-
ficiently attuned to their needs (Herek, 1995; 
Stevens, 1995). A practitioner’s presumption 
of a client’s heterosexual identity may result in 
failure to adequately understand how norma-
tive assumptions contribute to the client’s 
marginalisation, and thus prevent them from 
receiving optimal service. The current study 
therefore aimed to design, implement and 
assess a workshop for clinical psychology stu-
dents that examined the impact of heteronor-
mativity on psychological practice, to assist 
participants to provide more appropriate and 
inclusive psychological services to same-sex 
attracted clients. 
 
Same-sex attracted clients may experience 
therapy as oppressive because 1) they have 
experienced prejudice and discrimination 
throughout their life and are therefore under-
standably wary or fearful of discrimination 
from the practitioner, 2) the practitioner is 
unaware of social norms that may contribute 
to cultural or experiential differences that im-
pact upon psychological service provision, 3) 
the practitioner has low confidence in their 
ability to provide psychological services to LGB 
individuals in a culturally sensitive manner, or 
even 4) the practitioner is prejudiced against 
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same-sex attracted individuals and this im-
pacts upon their practice. All such cases have 
the potential to severely limit the development 
of rapport between practitioner and client and 
thus may limit the effectiveness of psychologi-
cal services. 
 
Practitioners demonstrate competence in 
working with particular client groups through 
their awareness, knowledge, and ability to 
employ cultural sensitivity (Israel & Selvidge, 
2003). Cultural competence must be ad-
dressed at all levels of service provision, from 
relevant governing legislation and institutional 
policy to administration and the approaches of 
individual practitioners. For practitioners, per-
haps the most useful method of developing 
and furthering their cultural competence is to 
undertake training (Yutrzenka, 1995). The 
Australian Psychological Society (APS) has 
identified that practitioners must be able to 
work with LGB clients (amongst others) in a 
culturally competent manner (APS, 2000). The 
APS ethical guidelines for working with LGB 
clients recommend that practitioners under-
take professional development and training on 
issues relevant to service provision to same-
sex attracted individuals, and that university 
clinical psychology courses include material on 
providing culturally competent psychological 
services to same-sex attracted people. How-
ever, such material is not mandated for course 
accreditation (Australian Psychology Accredita-
tion Council, 2005), and the extensive material 
(much of it mandatory) competing for inclu-
sion within the limited space of clinical courses 
may preclude cultural competence training. 
Thus, many Australian psychology students 
may complete their undergraduate and post-
graduate education without exposure to LGB-
related issues, and may feel unprepared to 
work with these client populations. 
 
Hence, there is a need for training programs 
for clinical psychology students that address 
the provision of culturally competent psycho-
logical services to same-sex attracted clients. 
Although some training packages addressing 
prejudice towards same-sex attracted indi-
viduals do exist (e.g., BlockOut, Miller & Ma-

hatmi, 1994; Not Round Here, Miller & Ma-
hatmi, 2000; Creating Safe Space for GLBTQ 
Youth, Girl’s Best Friend Foundation & Advo-
cates for Youth, 2005), the following summary 
suggests they are not necessarily suitable for 
the specific purpose of training clinical psy-
chology students. 
 
Existing programs may be ill-suited to clinical 
training for several reasons. First, programs 
such as BlockOut and Not Round Here (Miller 
& Mahatmi, 1994; 2000) often tend to focus 
on overt prejudice, which may not be particu-
larly useful for clinical psychology students. 
Research suggests that students aspiring to 
enter a helping profession typically hold pro-
gressive rather than prejudiced views against 
same-sex attracted people (Peel, 2002; 
though this may not always be the case for 
students in general; see Hinrichs & 
Rosenberg, 2002; Medley, 2005; Ellis, Kitz-
inger & Wilkinson, 2002). This is not to deny 
the existence of prejudice amongst psychology 
students (and psychologists), nor should it be 
presumed that students and practitioners with 
LGB-positive attitudes do not engage in heter-
onormative practices (Ellis et al., 2002; Tolley 
& Ranzijn, 2006). It is, however, important to 
recognise that most students will not demon-
strate overt bias against same-sex attracted 
people. Thus a primary focus upon prejudice 
and homophobia may be perceived as accusa-
tory and interfere with students’ ability to en-
gage with and learn from presented material. 
 
Secondly, existing programs take an individu-
alised focus to addressing prejudice. That is, 
they focus on the impact of direct actions by 
heterosexual individuals towards same-sex 
attracted people, and are thus aimed at help-
ing dominant group members ‘change their 
attitudes’ by ‘learning about the other’. This 
implies that anti-LGB prejudice is only enacted 
by ‘bad homophobic people’ and ignores the 
effect that living in a heteronormative society 
has on the lived experience of same-sex at-
tracted people (Peel, 2002). It may be benefi-
cial to instead focus on how heteronormativity 
functions to produce both privilege and disad-
vantage (i.e., unearned benefits that accrue to 
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heterosexual people through living in a heter-
onormative society but which are unavailable 
to same-sex attracted people), and how this 
may shape the experiences same-sex at-
tracted clients bring to therapy. 
 
Thirdly, existing programs do not focus on the 
specialised needs and concerns of practitio-
ners working with LGB clients. Although some 
material will be relevant across disciplines, 
these programs do not offer clinical students 
any practical strategies for working with LGB 
clients or an opportunity to develop confi-
dence in doing so. Thus, a program specifi-
cally designed for clinical psychology students 
would be more clinically relevant and directly 
address participants’ concerns. 
 
Finally, existing packages are often time inten-
sive. For example, the BlockOut training pro-
gram (Miller & Mahatmi, 1994) is delivered 
over a three-day weekend. Such time commit-
ments may be unfeasible given the consider-
able workload of clinical psychology students, 
who may benefit from a shorter training pack-
age. 
 
Extensive reviews of relevant literature, con-
sultations with professionals in the field, and 
evaluations of existing programs underpin the 
design of the current workshop, which focused 
on the (often hidden or obscure) functions of 
heteronormativity and the multiple ways in 
which insufficient awareness of heteronorma-
tivity will impact upon psychological practice, 
regardless of the sexuality of the practitioner. 
Furthermore, and with an understanding of 
heteronormativity as the broader framework in 
which psychological practice typically occurs, it 
is also important to examine the specific ways 
in which it is enacted. 
 
Following Braun (2000), it may be suggested 
that heteronormativity takes places through 
the enactment of heterosexism (a term that 
incorporates the concept of normativity along 
with an understanding of discrimination based 
on sexual orientation). As Braun suggests, 
heterosexism can be understood to function 
through both commission and omission. The 

latter refers to “the lack of disagreement with, 
or challenge to, heterosexist talk” (p. 136, 
original emphasis), such as a failure to chal-
lenge others’ or one’s own heterosexism. 
Braun defines the former as “the explicit ar-
ticulation of heterosexist assumptions” (p. 
134, original emphasis), such as assumptions 
regarding the gender of someone’s partner. As 
this distinction suggests, that which is left un-
said can be just as damaging as that which is 
explicitly voiced. Such an approach that em-
phasises the often mundane ways in which 
heterosexism occurs may assist students to 
better understand the relevance of an ap-
proach to psychological practice that priori-
tises an awareness of heteronormativity in 
various forms (Peel, 2001). 
 
Whilst the literature is relatively quiet on the 
design and process of sexuality-based cultural 
competence training (Van de Ven, 1995), a 
number of components are considered impor-
tant (Peel, 2002; Phillips & Fischer, 1998), and 
have been incorporated into the workshop 
design. These include: 
 
• identification of stereotypes and as-

sumptions that participants may have 
regarding same-sex attracted individu-
als, and challenging these; 

• experiential activities that help partici-
pants to understand the everyday ex-
periences of same-sex attracted indi-
viduals, and through this; 

• encouraging empathy; 
• exposure to same-sex attracted people, 

either in person or through media such 
videos and documentaries; 

• recognition of privilege accrued to het-
erosexual people but denied to same-
sex attracted people through hetero-
normativity, and; 

• identification of practical strategies to 
help challenge heterosexism and heter-
onormativity and provide a more cul-
turally competent service to same-sex 
attracted clients. 

 
The workshop was designed to incorporate all 
of the above points, through both theoretical 
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components and exercises, and included in-
formation specifically relevant and useful to 
clinical psychologists and students. Discussion 
accompanied all components and exercises to 
help participants draw out relevant points in 
each section. Components included the use of 
terminology, assumptions and stereotypes, 
the impact of social norms, the effects of het-
eronormativity, practical suggestions and use-
ful referrals. 
 
A scenario exercise was developed to open 
the workshop. The scenario depicted an inter-
action between a heterosexual practitioner 
and a gay male client in a therapeutic con-
text, and included a number of occasions 
where the practitioner’s innocent but naïve 
dialogue potentially impacted negatively upon 
the client. Accompanying questions allowed 
participants the opportunity to discuss how 
this may be experienced as oppressive and 
alternative ways to approach the situation. 
Thus the scenario encouraged participants to 
consider how social norms surrounding sexu-
ality promote certain stereotypes and as-
sumptions, which may influence psychological 
practice and impact upon same-sex attracted 
clients. 
 
The second exercise, the Heterosexuality 
Questionnaire (Rochlin, 1992), provided an 
example of how heteronormativity functions 
by reversing questions that are commonly 
asked of LGB individuals to instead question 
those who identify as heterosexual. This dem-
onstrated how social norms around sexuality 
construct such questions as natural and legiti-
mate and illustrated the effect such questions 
may have on same-sex attracted clients. For 
example, responding to “When and how did 
you first decide that you were a heterosex-
ual?” required participants to justify their 
sexuality, which highlights for participants 
how same-sex attracted people may find this 
confronting and how heterosexuality does not 
usually require justification. 
 
Despite psychology’s commitment to support 
of LGB issues, heteronormativity remains pre-
sent within the discipline and the way ideas 

and information are communicated in psycho-
logical circles (Barker, 2007; Clark & Serovich, 
1997; Hogben & Waterman, 1997; Myerson, 
Crawley, Anstey, Kessler, & Okopny, 2007; 
Simoni, 1996). Journal articles and textbooks 
provide central routes for dissemination of 
psychological knowledge, and the heteronor-
mativity within these texts is thus conveyed 
to psychology students. The Textbook exer-
cise required participants to search through 
prominent psychological textbooks to locate 
depictions of heterosexual and same-sex at-
traction within psychology textbooks, exam-
ine how they are represented within this con-
text, and discuss in relation to heteronorma-
tivity. 
 
The Stepping Out exercise (Ollis, Watson, 
Mitchell & Rosenthal, 2000) provided an ex-
periential understanding of how social norms 
surrounding sexuality may impact upon the 
everyday lives of same-sex attracted people, 
and how these may differ from the lives of 
heterosexual people. This was achieved 
through matched scenarios that were identi-
cal except for the sexuality of the individual 
depicted. Participants responded to questions 
(e.g., “Can you kiss or hold hands with your 
partner in a public place, such a Rundle 
Mall?”) from the perspective of the depicted 
individual and differences in responses were 
used to demonstrate how heteronormativity 
impacts upon the daily lives of same-sex at-
tracted people. 
 
Participants also viewed 24 minutes of Out in 
the Bush, a video depicting young people 
talking articulately about their experiences of 
growing up same-sex attracted in rural Aus-
tralia. This allowed participants to hear first-
hand the impact of anti-LGB prejudice on 
these people’s lives. Viewing was followed 
with discussion of issues raised by the video. 
 
The workshop was also supplemented by two 
articles to be read independently. The APS 
Guidelines for psychological practice with les-
bian, gay and bisexual clients (2000) was 
provided before the workshop to ensure that 
participants were aware of the basic ethical 
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requirement when working with same-sex 
attracted clients. A second reading (Hegarty, 
Pratto, & Lemieux, 2004) was provided after 
the workshop to further demonstrate how 
heteronormativity may operate in everyday 
interactions. 
 
Traditionally, the effectiveness of sexual iden-
tity-based cultural competence programs has 
been operationalised as participants’ attitude 
change towards same-sex attracted people, 
assessed through questionnaires (Herek, 
1984). However, as previously discussed, 
postgraduate clinical psychology students 
may largely hold positive attitudes towards 
same-sex attracted people (especially those 
who self-select to attend a workshop on 
working with same-sex attracted clients). 
Thus the program in a sense may be 
‘preaching to the converted’ (Peel, 2002). 
Consequently, results assessed in this matter 
may be subject to ceiling effects with little 
room for positive change.  
 
Also, as attitudes are seen to be relatively 
stable, a single session workshop may not 
significantly alter attitudes. As such, attitude 
change may not be useful in assessing the 
efficacy of the workshop. Of greater rele-
vance would be changes in participants’ ap-
proach to interacting with same-sex attracted 
people, and their ability to do so in an appro-
priate manner. Hence, the assessment of be-
haviour (or more precisely, intentions for fu-
ture behaviour) and cultural competence 
(operationalised in this study as self-rated 
skills and awareness of stereotypes and dis-
crimination) as dependent variables would 
provide more useful information. Attitude 
may still be important, however, as the utility 
of the workshop may not generalise to popu-
lations that hold less positive attitudes to-
wards same-sex attracted people. 
 
Participants may perceive some social pres-
sure to respond in ways that reflect positive 
attitudes or actions towards same-sex at-
tracted people (as prejudice is inconsistent 
with psychological practice). They may also 
consider it socially desirable to be confident 

and willing to provide such services. Demand 
effects may also occur, as the workshop is 
explicit in its aim of improving participants’ 
confidence and comfort in working with same
-sex attracted clients. Thus dependent vari-
ables that are less susceptible to social desir-
ability and demand effects, such as knowl-
edge, would also provide valuable informa-
tion. 
 
Thus it was predicted that implementation of 
the workshop would impact upon participants 
such that follow-up behavioural intention, 
cultural competence and knowledge scores 
would be higher than the corresponding 
baseline scores, and that these changes will 
manifest in the improved ability of partici-
pants to recognise heteronormativity in clini-
cal practice and its impact upon clients, and 
subsequently change their evaluation of the 
psychologist/client interaction. Follow-up sce-
nario response scores would thus be signifi-
cantly higher than baseline scores. 

Method 

Participants 
 

Three workshops were conducted, later work-
shops being added to increase the sample 
size, as workshop attendance was quite low 
(group sizes ranged from two to three partici-
pants). A total of eight female postgraduate 
clinical psychology students range in age from 
23-53 years (M_=_31.63, SD_=_11.49) par-
ticipated voluntarily. Seven participants com-
pleted the follow-up assessment, and the re-
sults are presented for these participants only. 

 

Design 
 
The study employed a pre-test/post-test de-
sign. Baseline assessments were completed 
during the week before the workshop, except 
for scenario responses, which were completed 
as the first exercise of the workshop. Follow-
up assessment occurred one month following 
the workshop. The dependent variables were 
attitude, behavioural intention, cultural com-
petence, and knowledge in relation to same-
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sex attraction and responses to the workshop 
scenario questions. 
 

Measures 
 
Attitude was assessed through an adapted 
version of the Index of Attitudes Towards Ho-
mosexuals (IATH; Hudson & Rickets, 1980), a 
25-item self-rated standardised measure of 
attitude towards same-sex attracted people. 
The IATH demonstrated high internal reliabil-
ity within this study (Cronbach’s α_=_.95). 
Participants responded to statements such as 
“I would feel comfortable working closely with 
a lesbian”, and “I would feel uncomfortable 
knowing that my son’s teacher was a gay 
man” on a 7-point Likert scale. Responses 
were averaged for a total score ranging from 
1-7, with higher scores reflecting more posi-
tive attitudes. 
 
Behavioural intention was assessed through 
an adapted version of the Homophobic Behav-
ior of Students Scale (HBSS; Van de Ven, 
Bornholt & Bailey, 1996), a 10-item self-rated 
standardised measure of willingness to inter-
act with same-sex attracted individuals. The 
HBSS demonstrated high internal reliability 
(α_=_.87) within this study. Participants re-
sponded to statements such as “I would speak 
individually, in class, with a lesbian, gay or 
bisexual person about same-sex attraction 
issues” on a 7-point Likert scale. Responses 
were averaged for a total score ranging from 
1-7, with higher scores reflecting greater will-
ingness. Seven additional items were gener-
ated to assess participants’ approach to work-
ing with same-sex attracted clients in a thera-
peutic context, for example, “I am looking 
forward to providing psychological services to 
same-sex attracted people”. The internal reli-
ability of these added questions was also high 
(α_=_.85). 
 
Cultural competence was assessed through 
the Sexual Orientation Counselor Competency 
Scale (SOCCS; Bidell, 2003) a 29-item self-
rated standardised measure comprised of 
three subscales: Awareness, Skills and Knowl-
edge. The SOCCS demonstrated high internal 

reliability overall (α_=_.82). The 10-item 
Awareness subscale assessed participants’ 
approach to working with same-sex attracted 
clients, including an awareness of assumptions 
and stereotypes and how they may impact 
upon same-sex attracted clients (e.g., “It 
would be best if my clients viewed a hetero-
sexual lifestyle as ideal” – reverse scored), 
Internal reliability of this subscale was poor 
(α_=_.45), though this may merely reflect low 
variance among the very high scores. The 12-
item Skills subscale (α_=_.88) assessed par-
ticipants’ perception of their own skills and 
their training in providing services to same-sex 
attracted clients (e.g., “I feel confident to as-
sess the mental health needs of a person who 
is LGB in a therapeutic setting”). The 7-item 
Knowledge subscale (α = .66) assessed un-
derstanding of specific issues and difficulties 
that same-sex attracted people may face, par-
ticularly in accessing psychological services 
(e.g., “Heterosexist and prejudicial concepts 
have permeated the mental health profes-
sions”). Participants responded on a 7-point 
Likert-type scale (1 = not at all true, 7 = to-
tally true), with responses averaged so that 
subscale and total scores range from 1-7, with 
higher scores reflecting greater competence. 
 
The Knowledge about Homosexuality Ques-
tionnaire (KAHQ; Harris, Nightengale & Owen, 
1995) is a 16-item standardised measure of 
factual knowledge. It assessed participants’ 
acceptance of (incorrect) stereotypes of same-
sex attracted people (e.g., “A majority of 
same-sex attracted people were seduced in 
adolescence by a person of the same sex, 
usually several years older”) and knowledge of 
LGB culture and other information related to 
non-heterosexuality (e.g., “’Coming out’ is a 
term that lesbian, gay and bisexual people use 
for publicly acknowledging their same-sex at-
traction”). Ten added items reflected knowl-
edge of rights and legal protections of same-
sex attracted people within Australia (“e.g., In 
South Australia, the same-sex partner of a 
deceased person can legally be denied access 
to their funeral”). Participants responded to 
items with ‘true’, ‘false’ or ‘unsure’ according 
to their own knowledge, with correct re-
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sponses scored as one and other responses 
scored as zero. The range of possible total 
scores was thus 0-26. 
All above measures were adapted through 
changes to terminology to ensure that they 
were respectful of same-sex attracted people. 
This was done particularly in relation to the 
term ‘homosexual’, a label that has been criti-
cised and rejected by many within LGB com-
munities (Kitzinger, 1987), and recognised as 
problematic by the American Psychological 
Association (2001). The term ‘homosexual’ 
was replaced with ‘gay man’, or when it is 
used more generally, with ‘same-sex at-
tracted’. 
 
The opening scenario of the workshop was 
developed both as a learning tool and as an 
opportunity for participants to demonstrate 
(measurable) awareness of issues relevant to 
culturally competent practice with LGB clients. 
The depicted interaction between practitioner 
and client was divided into three parts inter-
spersed with short-answer questions assessing 
participants’ ability to recognise examples of 
heteronormativity (e.g., “Why might the psy-
chologist have assumed that [the client] was 
heterosexual?”), identify the expression of 
stereotypes and assumptions (“What stereo-
types(s) does the psychologist appear to be 
drawing upon?”), and articulate how and why 
these might impact upon the client (“How 
might this exchange have influenced the ses-
sion?”). Participants responded to eight short-
answer question and two items based on a 1-
7 Likert scale. The internal reliability of sce-
nario responses was acceptable (α_=_.64). 
Each relevant point for short-answer re-
sponses were scored as one, the maximum 
score for each item being the highest number 
of points that could be reasonably made for 
that item, with a possible range of 0-50. Two 
raters independently scored short-answer re-
sponses, with discrepancies resolved through 
negotiation. The text of short-answer re-
sponses was also analysed to identify concep-
tual changes that may not necessarily have 
been reflected in numerical coding. 
 

 

Procedure 
 
Potential participants were notified of the 
workshop through leaflets and emails, and 
interested parties were provided with an intro-
duction letter, consent form, and question-
naire measures to be completed and returned 
prior to the workshop. Once participants re-
turned baseline questionnaires, they received 
a copy of the APS Guidelines for psychological 
practice with lesbian, gay and bisexual clients 
(2000) as an introductory reading. Participants 
attended the 3-hour workshop, the first activ-
ity being the aforementioned scenario from 
which ability related responses were taken. 
Upon conclusion of the workshop, participants 
were provided with an article of further read-
ing (Hegarty et al., 2004) to supplement train-
ing. Follow-up assessment was conducted by 
mail one month after the workshop. 

Results 

The descriptive and inferential statistics for all 
dependent variables are presented in Table_1, 
and demonstrate positive change in some of 
the measures. Behavioural intention (HBSS) 
scores were moderately high at baseline and 
in the high range at follow-up, and this in-
crease was significant (p = .017) improve-
ment. Scores for the additional therapy spe-
cific behavioural items were initially slightly 
lower than for the overall measure, however 
the significant (p = .016) improvement for 
these items was somewhat more pronounced. 
Thus, participants were generally willing to 
work and interact with LGB people and clients, 
and this willingness increased following the 
workshop. 

Similar results occurred for self-rated cultural 
competence as measured by the SOCCS. The 
moderate scores at baseline increased signifi-
cantly (p = .001) to moderately high scores at 
follow-up. This change was caused by in-
creases in the moderately low scores of the 
Skills (p = .002) and Knowledge (p = .012) 
subscales to more mid-range scores. There 
was no change in Awareness subscale scores 
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(p = .407), which were very high at both as-
sessment points. Thus, whilst participants may 
have held an ideological stance appropriate for 
working with LGB clients (as indicated by high 
awareness scores), they may not have the 
experience, skills, or knowledge of issues fac-
ing same-sex attracted people required to do 
so most effectively. Both skills and knowledge 
were improved following the workshop, how-
ever there was ample room for further im-
provement 

Knowledge scores as measured by the KAHQ 
also demonstrated significant improvement (p 
< .001). At baseline, participants on average 
answered about half (52.7%) of the items 
correctly and this increased to about two 
thirds (68.1%) of items answered correctly at 
follow-up. 

Not all measures demonstrated significant 

changes. Attitude (IATH) scores (p = .749) 
were high at both baseline and follow-up. 
Thus, as expected, participants demonstrated 
a positive attitude towards LGB people that 
was unaffected by the workshop. In contrast, 
baseline scenario response scores were low, 
with no significant change in scores following 
the workshop (p = .287). When numerical 
coding was applied to short-answer scenario 
responses, the workshop largely failed to ef-
fect any change in the ability to identify heter-
onormativity and its effect on LGB clients. 
However, coding written responses necessarily 
simplifies the data, possibly causing useful 
information to be lost. Examination of 
matched baseline and follow-up responses 
from individual participants highlights that 
some participants indeed modified follow-up 
responses to reflect development in under-
standing workshop concepts. Table 2 presents 
five such instances. 
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Table 1. Descriptive and inferential statistics for baseline and follow-up assessments 
 

 

Variable 
Baseline  
M (SD) 

Follow-Up 
M (SD) 

Baseline 
Range 

Follow-Up 
Range 

t P 

LGB Attitude (IATH) 6.07 (0.94) 6.12 (0.85) 4.44-6.96 4.84-6.84 -0.34 .749 

Behavioural Intention 
(HBSS) 

5.76 (0.66) 6.22 (0.58) 4.71-6.41 5.47-6.94 -3.27 .017 

Therapy Specific 
Items 

4.96 (1.02) 5.90 (0.72) 3.71-6.14 5.00-6.86 -3.31 .016 

Cultural Competence 
(SOCCS) 

4.18 (0.54) 4.77 (0.55) 3.72-5.21 3.90-5.76 -5.62 .001 

Awareness Sub-
scale 

6.86 (0.14) 6.81 (0.18) 6.70-7.00 6.50-7.00 0.89 .407 

Skills Subscale 2.64 (1.32) 3.61 (1.27) 1.36-5.09 1.91-6.09 -5.05 .002 

Knowledge Sub-
scale 

2.95 (0.82) 3.80 (0.62) 1.75-3.88 3.00-4.63 -3.57 .012 

LGB Knowledge (KAHQ) 13.71 
(2.06) 

17.71 
(1.38) 

11.00-
17.00 

16.00-
20.00 

-6.93 <.00
1 

Scenario 17.09 
(2.80) 

19.11 
(4.72) 

14.86-
21.14 

17.14-
27.93 

-1.17 .287 
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The participant in Example 1 initially provided 
a general (though equally valid) response, 
citing ‘general anxiety’ as a cause of the cli-
ent’s agitation. In contrast, their follow-up 
response identified one of the triggers embed-
ded within the scenario, namely the inherent 
heteronormativity within a questionnaire pro-
vided to the client. This indicates some learn-
ing of the implicit manifestations of heterosex-
ism (Braun’s, 2000, ‘heterosexism by omis-
sion’) from the workshop. 

In Example 2, the participant critiqued the 
practitioner’s assumption of the client’s het-
erosexuality, and his response when informed 
otherwise. Whilst the baseline response ac-
cepts the practitioner’s heteronormative as-
sumption and reaction to being corrected, the 
follow-up response clearly identifies the inap-
propriateness of comparing heterosexual and 
same-sex relationships, which minimises or 
denies the significant differences between the 

two in the context of a heteronormative soci-
ety. 

In response to the same question, the partici-
pant in Example 3 took the opportunity to de-
scribe the possible impact on the client. The 
baseline response suggested that it would be 
hard ‘always having to explain you are differ-
ent’, which marks LGB people as ‘different’, 
and implicitly places heterosexuality as the 
norm they deviate from. The follow-up re-
sponse demonstrated understanding of the 
concept of heteronormativity, identifying that 
being ‘forced into difference’ (Raymond, 1992) 
is the product of living in a world shaped by a 
‘heterosexual bias and blindness to other 
forms of sexuality’. 

Examples 4 and 5 examined the stereotypes 
evident within the practitioner’s assumption 
that most gay men are image conscious, and 
that by not matching stereotypes the client 
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Table 2. Sample baseline and follow-up short-answer responses to scenario items 

 

   
Question 

 
Baseline Response 

 
Follow-Up Response 

1 Can you think of some 
reasons why [the client] 
might have been agi-
tated during the ses-

sion? 

Anxiety re: heterosexual 
psychologist, also general 
anxiety seeing a psycholo-

gist. 

General agitation that any client may have 
when visiting a psychologist for the first time. 
Marital status question may have alienated 
[the client] due to its hetero assumption. 

2 What do you think of 
[the practitioner’s] re-

sponse? 

It was fine. 
  

[The practitioner’s] response was somewhat 
inconsiderate, and it wasn’t very sensitive to 
make the comparison between his relationship 
with his wife and [the client’s] relationship 

with his boyfriend. 

3 [the participant dis-
cusses the client’s reac-
tion to the practitioner’s 

assumption] 

…having always to explain 
that you are different. 

years of having to deal with being in a minor-
ity group and interacting with a world that has 
a heterosexual bias and blindness to other 

forms of sexuality. 

4 What stereotype(s) does 
[the practitioner] appear 
to be drawing upon? 

Unsure. That all gay people behave in a similar way 
(that is not like ‘normal’ guys). 

5 As above That being heterosexual is 
normal and that being gay is 

abnormal. 

That all gay men are caught up with body 
image issues, and all gay men are the same 

and not individuals. 
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was therefore ‘just a normal guy’ (i.e., unlike 
his assumptions as to what ‘most gay men’ 
are like). In Example 4 the participant was 
initially unable to identify any of the range of 
stereotypes utilised within the scenario. In 
contrast, the follow-up response identified 
both the problematic usage of the term 
‘normal’ (indicated through quotation marks) 
and the assumption that gay men constitute a 
homogenous group, a stereotype that was 
directly challenged within the workshop. This 
aspect of learning from the workshop was also 
evident Example 5, even though the partici-
pant initially demonstrated a greater aware-
ness of heteronormative stereotypes. 

These five examples highlight that whilst the 
scenario measure did not produce statistically 
significant results, it provided opportunities for 
participants to demonstrate an understanding 
of heteronormativity and heterosexism that 
may be of clinical significance. The observed 
changes were often subtle and difficult to as-
sess using numerical coding and may thus be 
more suited to qualitative analysis, as they 
may nonetheless have a significant impact on 
clients when used in clinical practice. 

Discussion 

This study aimed to test the effectiveness of a 
workshop designed to enhance the ability of 
clinical psychology students to interact with 
LGB clients in a culturally appropriate manner. 
To do so, it was necessary to assess various 
aspects of cultural competence, including be-
havioural and knowledge based aspects, as 
well as practical components, such as using 
scenario responses to assess ability to recog-
nise heteronormativity. 

As predicted, behavioural intention, cultural 
competence and knowledge showed positive 
changes in scores. Despite initial behavioural 
intention scores indicating that participants 
were willing and comfortable about interacting 
and working with LGB clients, these scores still 
demonstrated an improvement at follow-up. 
This effect was more pronounced for items 

that specifically focused on interaction in a 
therapeutic context, with mean changes for 
these items twice that of the overall measure. 
Thus, in terms of developing willingness and 
confidence in interacting with same-sex at-
tracted people, the workshop appears to be 
effective, particularly in relation to clinical 
practice. Of course, it was beyond the scope 
of this study to determine whether these in-
tentions translated into observable behav-
ioural change. 

Participants’ cultural competence also im-
proved following the workshop, although this 
was not true of all subscales of this measure. 
Participants’ awareness of the heteronormativ-
ity exhibited in assumptions and stereotypes 
of non-heterosexuality and their effect on 
same-sex attracted people (Awareness sub-
scale) was consistently high across assess-
ment points, limiting the scope for improve-
ment following the workshop. This sympa-
thetic ideological position on sexuality con-
trasted with lower levels of knowledge and 
skills in working with LGB clients, as measured 
by the remaining subscales.  

At baseline, participants generally rated their 
skills and experience in working with LGB cli-
ents (Skills subscale) as moderately poor, and 
also demonstrated poor knowledge of the dif-
ficulties LGB clients face in accessing psycho-
logical services. Whilst significant improve-
ments were made in both these areas, and 
indeed exhibited the largest improvements 
among the Likert-based measures, mean 
scores for both subscales remained below the 
mid-point of 4 at follow-up assessment. This 
leaves substantial room for improvement in 
these important aspects of working with LGB 
clients. Future workshop versions may address 
this by including more experientially focussed 
exercises, such as role-plays. 

The KAHQ assessed a more general knowl-
edge of LGB-related issues, such as distin-
guishing fact from stereotype, queer culture 
and LGB rights in Australia. Participants’ base-
line responses demonstrated some initial 
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knowledge in these areas (52.7% correct), 
with a significant improvement at follow-up 
(68.1% correct). Whilst this change is promis-
ing, an average of one third incorrect re-
sponses leaves significant room for improve-
ment. 

Notably, these low to moderate cultural com-
petence and knowledge scores occurred de-
spite high attitude scores. This may imply that 
strongly sympathetic attitudes towards LGB 
clients notwithstanding, clinical students may 
not have acquired other skills required for 
working with LGB clients. Thus, an LGB-
positive attitude, whilst necessary, is not suffi-
cient for culturally competent clinical practice 
or for self-confidence in providing it. 

 
The significant changes in behavioural inten-
tion, cultural competence and knowledge 
scores did not necessarily translate into an 
increase in participants’ ability to implement 
these improvements, as is demonstrated by 
the absence of significant change in scenario 
scores. A number of explanations may account 
for this finding, the first being that the work-
shop may not have adequately conveyed ma-
terial in a manner that facilitated engagement 
and understanding of key concepts. For exam-
ple, the workshop focused on how heteronor-
mativity acts to obscure the visibility of non-
heterosexual identities and promotes the uni-
versality of heterosexuality. However, when 
asked why the practitioner may have assumed 
the client was heterosexual, participants gen-
erally responded that this was statistically 
more likely and made no reference to hetero-
normativity (although one participant did de-
scribe a ‘heterosexual mindset’, and other par-
ticipants described heteronormativity in re-
sponses to other items). 
 
Alternatively, the measure itself may not have 
provided participants with adequate opportu-
nity to utilise concepts absorbed during the 
workshop. The scenario was not designed ex-
clusively as an assessment tool, but doubled 
as a learning tool. Thus the dual application of 
the scenario may have unintentionally com-

promised measurement, particularly at the 
follow-up assessment, where learning was no 
longer a relevant function. 
The environment within which participants 
responded to scenario items also requires con-
sideration. Short-answer responses require 
greater intellectual exertion than Likert-based 
responses. Baseline responses were com-
pleted during the workshop, where partici-
pants were exposed to scrutiny from col-
leagues and the researcher, providing motiva-
tion to commit effort to the task. However, 
participants were free from scrutiny during 
follow-up, and may have experienced less mo-
tivation to provide considered, detailed re-
sponses. This explanation is consistent with 
the observation that many of the follow-up 
responses to scenario items were noticeably 
less detailed than at baseline. 
 
Despite non-significant changes in response 
scores, an examination of short-answer re-
sponses identified several instances where 
participants demonstrated acquisition of 
knowledge presented within the workshop. 
This provides some evidence that the work-
shop can impart some learning that is useful 
within a clinical context. 
 
Interpretation of this study should be made 
with reference to the following limitations. 
Without a control group the study was suscep-
tible to a number of threats to internal valid-
ity, particularly expectancy and demand ef-
fects. Whilst the KAHQ and the scenario re-
sponses were included because they should 
be resistant to such effects, scenario re-
sponses did not demonstrate an improvement 
in scores. Future studies must be more care-
fully controlled to allow clear demonstration of 
effectiveness. 
 
Whilst participants’ LGB-positive attitudes 
were of course desirable, this may limit the 
study’s generalisability. Students choosing not 
to attend the workshop may hold less positive 
attitudes, or be indifferent or unsympathetic 
towards same-sex attracted people. Indeed, 
the low level of interest in the workshop may 
indicate that LGB issues are of low importance 
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to a number of students, who thus arguably 
have a greater need to attend. This does not 
deny the possibility of other reasons for non-
participation, including the heavy time com-
mitments required of clinical psychology stu-
dents. A number of students expressed inter-
est in the workshop but cited (mostly study-
related) commitments that prevented atten-
dance. Even so, the workshop has thus only 
been tested for participants already sympa-
thetic to LGB issues, and thus has not been 
able to demonstrate the capacity to engage 
with and achieve effective outcomes for less 
sympathetic students (although alternatively 
less sympathetic students may also have 
greater scope for increases in cultural compe-
tence). 
 
Sample size was a significant limitation. Al-
though the workshop was offered at a range 
of dates and times, few students expressed 
interest in participation. The study’s design 
enabled significant results with a small sam-
ple, however future studies using more rigor-
ous designs will require larger samples, and 
new recruitment strategies should be consid-
ered. Additionally, all participants were fe-
male, and thus results may not generalise to 
male students. This was not an intentional 
feature of this study; no males expressed in-
terest in participation. Participants’ sexual 
identity was not recorded, so neither can it be 
determined if sexuality influenced workshop 
outcomes. 
 
The disappointing level of interest from poten-
tial participants may also be informative about 
the utility of a workshop as an educational 
tool for clinical psychology students. Even a 
highly effective workshop will have little im-
pact if few students attend, and thus re-
searchers and trainers may need to develop 
means to increase workshop participation, 
such as inclusion within coursework or incor-
poration of LGB issues within mainstream ma-
terial. Alternatively, with professional develop-
ment recently becoming mandatory for all APS 
members (Verbyla, 2007), there may be in-
creased incentive or opportunity to conduct 
the workshop for practitioners. 

This study sought to test the utility of a work-
shop designed specifically for clinical psychol-
ogy students to increase their ability to pro-
vide psychological services to same-sex at-
tracted clients in a culturally appropriate man-
ner. Results demonstrate significant improve-
ments in willingness to interact with LGB indi-
viduals and confidence in doing so in a clinical 
context. Low baseline levels of knowledge and 
cultural competence signal a need for such 
workshops and there were significant im-
provements in these areas, although consider-
able room for further improvement remained 
for some aspects of these outcomes. Partici-
pants already held LGB-positive attitudes and 
thus there was little scope for improvement, 
and the lack of significant change in scenario 
responses may be attributable to the failure of 
the workshop to adequately address relevant 
concepts, or to measurement issues.  
 
Whilst the findings of this study are generally 
encouraging, the study’s design does not ex-
clude threats to internal validity, and thus fu-
ture studies should seek to remedy this, and 
also address other issues highlighted in this 
study, such as methods for increasing partici-
pant numbers and diversity, and modifying 
workshop material for a stronger focus on skill 
and confidence acquisition. However, cultural 
competence may be considered an essential 
component of psychological practice, and the 
workshop is a significant development that 
focused on the specific needs of clinical stu-
dents without the time commitment of other 
programs. 
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