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Abstract:

Abstract:

Background & Objectives: Although work is a very important source of livelihood and achieve
tosocial status. At the same time, it can lead to dissatisfaction and deterioration of physical and
mental forces. The workplace consists of physical, psychological and social stimuli, each of
which can be considered a stress factor. One of the factors that affects the behavior and
performance of nurses in the workplace and can affect their efficiency and productivity is the
mental burden of work. The purpose of this study was to evaluate the mental workload of nurses
and its relation to occupational Accidents in nurse's teaching hospitals in Kerman University of
Medical Sciences in 2016-2017.

Method: This is a cross-sectional descriptive-analytic study. The population of this study was all
nurses of teaching hospitals of Kerman University of Medical Sciences and In a randomized
sampling, 285 nurses from these hospitals were surveyed. Data were collected using a
questionnaire consisting of three parts: demographic information form, Task Load Index
Data were analyzed by . Checklist Questionnaire (NASA TLX) and Occupational Accidents

SPSS version 19.

Results: The results showed that the mean and standard deviation of mental workload were 55.55
+ 9100 Which indicates the workload in the In the studied nurses is moderate to high. And in
incident events with sharp objects (96.33%) and skin contact with blood or other body fluids
(95%)Occumed in over 90olo of nurses.The findings of this study showed that of 23 incidents that
were related to nurses'workload, Only 8 cases did not have a statistically significant relationship
And the rest of the items have direct significant relationship. There is a significant relationship
between the workplace of the nurses, position and the age with the work load variable. And in
examining the relationship between demographic variables of nurses and frequency of
occupational accidents, The results showed that the incidence of accidents in married
nurses,employed in the internal wards ,with a supervisory role,age and higher backgrounds was
higher than other groups .

Conclusion: occupational accidents have happened to staff many times. It is necessary to pay
attention to these accidents and planning to prevent them from occurring again. Due to the high
incidence of events such as skin contact with blood and damage to sharp objects, and ... For
personnel, Therefore it is necessary to pay special attention to such events, and arranging the
necessary educational programs to prevent their recurrence .
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